UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

PAINT & PAINT SUPPLIES
RFP 026-2011

VENDORS

PERCENTAGE DISCOUNTS

Pittsburgh Paints

The Sherwin Williams Co.

% off Shelf Price

20%

30%

% off List Price

40%

30%

% off Catalog Price

20%

30%

EXTERIOR OIL BASE ENAMEL HOUSE

PAINT BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
White - 1 gallon Sun Proof 1-45 $25.79 B54W101 SW $17.27
White - 5 gallons Sun Proof 1-45 $122.50 B54W101 SW $86.35
Pastel Colors - 1 gallon Sun Proof 1-45 $25.79 B54W102 SW $17.27
Pastel Colors - 5 gallons Sun Proof 1-45 $122.50 B54W102 SW $86.35
Medium Colors - 1 gallon Sun Proof 1-45 $26.89 B54W102 SW $17.27
Medium Colors - 5 gallons Sun Proof 1-45 $124.50 B54W102 SW $86.35
Deep Colors - 1 gallon Sun Proof 1-45 $26.89 B54W103 SW $17.27
Deep Colors - 5 gallons Sun Proof 1-45 $124.50 B54W103 SW $86.36
INTERIOR OIL BASE ENAMEL HOUSE
PAINT BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
White - 1 gallon Speed Hide 6110XE $21.99 B34W451 SW $15.89
White - 5 gallons Speed Hide 6110XE $105.25 B34W451 SW $79.45
Pastel Colors - 1 gallon Speed Hide 6110X1 $21.99 B34 Series SW $15.89
Pastel Colors - 5 gallons Speed Hide 6110X1 $105.25 B34 Series SW $79.45
Medium Colors - 1 gallon Speed Hide 6110X1 $21.99 B34 Series SW $15.89
Medium Colors - 5 gallons Speed Hide 6110X1 $105.25 B34 Series SW $79.45
Deep Colors - 1 gallon Speed Hide 6110X1 $21.99 B34 Series SW $15.89
Deep Colors - 5 gallons Speed Hide 6110X1 $105.25 B34 Series SW $79.45
INTERIOR PURE WHITE LATEX CEILING
PAINT BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
Flat Latex Paint - 1 gallon Speed Hide 6-70 $15.49 B30W451 SW $13.50
Flat Latex Paint - 5 gallons Speed Hide 6-70 $74.95 B30W451 SW $67.50
INTERIOR LATEX S/G PAINT BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
White - 1 gallon Speed Hide 5-510 $15.49 B31W4451 SW $15.25
White - 5 gallons Speed Hide 5-510 $74.95 B31W4451 SW $75.00
Pastel Colors - 1 gallon Speed Hide 5-510 $15.99 B31 Series SW $15.25
Pastel Colors - 5 gallons Speed Hide 5-510 $76.95 B31 Series SW $75.00
Medium Colors - 1 gallon Speed Hide 5-510 $15.99 B31 Series SW $15.25
Medium Colors - 5 gallons Speed Hide 5-510 $76.95 B31 Series SW $75.00
Deep Colors - 1 gallon Speed Hide 5-510 $15.99 B31W4453 SW $15.25
Deep Colors - 5 gallons Speed Hide 5-510 $76.95 B31W4453 SW $75.00
EXTERIOR ACRYLIC LATEX FLAT PAINT BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
White - 1 gallon Sun Proof 72-45 $19.49 ABW16 SW $18.85
White - 5 gallons Sun Proof 72-45 $95.00 ABW16 SW $94.25
Pastel Colors - 1 gallon Sun Proof 72-45 $19.49 ABW151 SW $18.95
Pastel Colors - 5 gallons Sun Proof 72-45 $95.00 AB6W151 SW $94.25
Medium Colors - 1 gallon Sun Proof 72-45 $19.49 ABW53 SW $18.95
Medium Colors - 5 gallons Sun Proof 72-45 $95.00 ABW53 SW $94.25
Deep Colors - 1 gallon Sun Proof 72-45 $19.49 ABW153 SW $18.95
Deep Colors - 5 gallons Sun Proof 72-45 $95.00 ABW153 SW $94.25
LEAD FREE OIL BASE ENAMEL for
METAL BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
White - 1 gallon UC 94043 $21.99 B54W101 SW $17.27
White - 5 gallons UC 94043 $112.10 B54W101 SW $86.35
Pastel Colors - 1 gallon UC 94043 $21.99 B54W101 SW $17.27
Pastel Colors - 5 gallons UC 94043 $112.10 B54W101 SW $86.35
Medium Colors - 1 gallon UC 94043 $21.99 B54W113 SW $17.27
Medium Colors - 5 gallons UC 94044 $112.10 B54W113 SW $86.35
Deep Colors - 1 gallon UC 94045 $21.99 B54T104 SW $17.27
Deep Colors - 5 gallons UC 94045 $112.10 B54T104 SW $86.35
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VENDORS

Pittsburgh Paints

The Sherwin Williams Co.

LEAD FREE OIL BASE for METAL

BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
SAFETY COLORS
Safety Red - 1 gallon Industrial UC Line $36.95 B54R38 SW $18.99
Safety Red - 5 gallons Industrial UC Line $475.00 6401-44031 SW $94.95
Safety Yellow - 1 gallon Industrial UC Line $27.00 6170005 SW $24.25
Safety Yellow - 5 gallons Industrial UC Line $135.00 6174072 SW $121.25
Safety Orange - 1 gallon Industrial UC Line $27.00 B54R39 SW $24.25
Safety Orange - 5 gallons Industrial UC Line $135.00 640144325 SW $121.25
Safety Blue - 1 gallon Industrial UC Line $27.00 B54W103 SW $18.00
Safety Blue - 5 gallons Industrial UC Line $135.00 B54W103 SW $90.00
Paint Thinner - 1 gallon STX 7003 $12.99 160-0402 Startex $8.50
Paint Thinner - 5 gallons STX 003 $46.99 160-0154 Startex $40.00
Lacquer Thinner - 1 gallon STX 70064 $17.99 160-0204 Startex $12.09
Lacquer Thinner - 5 gallons STX 0007 $64.99 154-4709 Startex $60.45
Paint Remover - 1 gallon STX 7002 $16.75 154-7720 Savogron $21.20
Paint Remover - 5 gallons No Bid 154-7700 Savogron $21.19
INTERIOR, EXTERIOR & METAL
PRIMERS BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
Exterior Primer Water Base - 1 gallon Speed Hide 6-609 $18.99 6006258 SW $17.99
Exterior Primer Water Base - 5 gallons Speed Hide 6-609 $89.95 6006266 SW $89.95
Exterior Primer Oil Base - 1 gallon Seal Grip Int/Ext 17-941 $19.99 6403-48215 SW $15.50
Exterior Primer Oil Base - 5 gallons Seal Grip Int/Ext 17-941 $96.25 640348223 SW $77.50
Interior Water Base - 1 gallon Seal Grip $18.99 B28W601SW $11.99
Interior Water Base - 5gallons Seal Grip $89.99 B28W601SW $59.95
Interior Oil Base - 1 gallon Seal Grip Int/Ext 17-941 $19.99 640348215 SW $15.50
Interior Oil Base - 5 gallons Seal Grip Int/Ext 17-941 $96.25 640348223 SW $77.50
Premium Metal Primer - 1 gallon Speed Hide 6-208 $24.00 E61A40 SW $15.50
Premium Metal Primer - 5 gallons Speed Hide 6-208 $117.45 E61A40 SW $77.50
LEAD FREE TRAFFIC AND ZONE
MARKING FLAT LATEX PAINT BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
White - 1 gallon PPG Zone Line 11-53 $13.99 TM2160 SW $13.89
White - 5 gallons PPG Zone Line 11-53 $69.95 8000-03238 SW $69.45
Yellow - 1 gallon PPG Zone Line 11-54 $13.99 TM2161 SW $15.25
Yellow - 5 gallons PPG Zone Line 11-54 $69.95 8000-03246 SW $73.75
Red- 1 gallon PPG Zone Line 11-56 $19.99 TM2132 SW $23.00
Red - 5 gallons PPG Zone Line 11-56 $99.95 640114666 SW $109.75
Blue - 1 gallon PPG Zone Line 11-55 $19.99 TM2100 SW $13.89
Blue - 5 gallons PPG Zone Line 11-55 $99.95 640114641 SW $69.45
NON-SKID ACRYLIC COATING BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
French Gray - 1 gallon PPG Urethane 3-17 $22.99 6502-02864 SW $27.00
French Gray - 5 gallons PPG Urethane 3-17 $114.95 650202872 SW $130.00
CLEAR WOOD FINISHES BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
Exterior Varnish all Sheens - 1 gallon PPG 41844 27.99 154-5102 Minwax $39.19
Exterior Varnish all Sheens - 5 gallons No Bid 1545100 Minwax $195.00
Interior Varnish all Sheens - 1 gallon PPG 43888 24.99 AB6V391 SW $26.00
Interior Varnish all Sheens - 5 gallons No Bid AB6V391 SW $130.00
Polyurethane Industrial - 1 gallon PPG 43886 26.99 102-1252 SW $26.00
Polyurethane Industrial - 5 gallons No Bid AB6F90 SW $130.00
Lacquer Finish - 1 gallon Speed Hide 77-9110 17.99 T75C15 SW $22.00
Lacquer Finish - 5 gallons Speed Hide 77-9110/5 89.99 T75C15 SW $110.00
Sealer Oil Base - 1 gallon Speed Hide 6-10 23.49 640315909 SW $18.00
Sealer Qil Base - 5 gallons Speed Hide 6-10 $111.00 B26V43 $90.00
Sealer Lacquer - 1 gallon Speed Hide 779100 17.99 T67F006 SW $17.50
Sealer Lacquer - 5 gallons Speed Hide 779100 89.99 T67F006 SW $87.50
Miniwax Stains - 1 gallon PPG Olympic Match 21.99 154-3313 Minwax $13.95
Miniwax Stains - 5 gallons No Bid 07101000 Minwax $69.75
Qil Stains - 1 gallon PPG Olympic 21.99 A49W207 SW $19.50
Qil Stains - 5 gallons No Bid A49W207 SW $97.50
HEAT RESISTANT PAINT ENAMEL BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
Hi Heat Paint Alum - 1 gallon Speed Hide 6-220 $22.99 6311336 SW $23.00
Hi Heat Paint Alum - 5 gallons Speed Hide 6-220 $110.00 6311300 SW $115.00
Hi Heat Paint Colors - 1 gallon No Bid 1883823 SW $95.00
Hi Heat Paint Colors - 5 gallons No Bid 1883800 SW $475.00
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VENDORS Pittsburgh Paints The Sherwin Williams Co.
PAINT BRUSHES FOR LATEX PAINT BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
2" Nylon - all purpose Pro Master 27469 $7.99 1809995 SW $4.15
3" Nylon - all purpose Pro Master 27495 $7.99 1809961 SW $6.30
4" Nylon - all purpose Pro Master 27475 $17.99 1890035 SW $10.20
PAINT BRUSHES FOR ENAMEL FINISHES BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
2" Nature Bristle Pro Vantage 237493 $4.50 1803303 SW $4.95
3" Nature Bristle Pro Vantage 237495 $7.99 1803311 SW $6.95
4" Nature Bristle Pro Master 13500 $16.99 1803329 SW $10.50
ROLLER COVERS - GENERAL PURPOSE -
9" BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
1/4" Nap Poly Roller Cover No Bid 650266034 SW $3.20
3/8" Nap Poly Roller Cover Pro Master 27526 $3.19 1728518 SW $2.59
1/2" Nap Poly Roller Cover Pro Master 27527 $4.99 1728500 SW $2.69
1" Nap Poly Roller Cover Pro Master 27529 $4.99 1734409 SW $3.70
1 1/2" Nap Poly Roller Cover Pro Master 27530 $4.99 1734380 SW $4.59
ROLLER COVERS for OIL BASE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
& INDUSTRIAL PAINTS - 9"
1/4" Nap Poly Roller Cover No Bid 1551464 SW $8.70
1/2" Nap Poly Roller Cover Pro Master 27526 $2.99 1551456 SW $8.25
3/4" Nap Poly Roller Cover Pro Master 27527 $3.99 1551464 SW $8.99
1" Nap Poly Roller Cover Pro Master 27529 $3.99 1806488 SW $9.50
1 1/2" Nap Poly Roller Cover Pro Master 27530 $3.99 1551480 SW $9.75
LATEX PAINT ROLLER COVERS - 9" BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
1/4" Polyblend Cover No Bid 1734380 SW $2.50
1/2" Polyblend Cover PPG 27533 $2.99 1734300 SW $2.50
3/4" Polyblend Cover PPG 27534 $2.99 1734318 SW $2.99
1" Polyblend Cover PPG 27535 $3.99 1734409 SW $3.75
1 1/2" Polyblend Cover PPG 27536 $3.99 1734406 SW $4.25
MINI ROLLERS & KITS BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
4" Foam Whizz Foam WT154060 (2 pack) $4.29 650166226 SW $3.45
6" Foam Whizz Foam WT154064 (2 pack) $4.49 650166301 SW $4.15
4" Woven Whizz Woven WT144316 (2 pack) $4.29 650182694 SW $2.99
6" Woven Whizz Woven WT144540 (2 pack) $4.49 66066283 SW $4.45
Foam with Handle Whizz Frame WT154246 $6.55 680182660 SW $2.60
ROLLER HANDLES & TRAYS BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
9" Paint Tray WBc60181 PP6 $2.79 1709385 SW $2.50
9" Handle - Good Quality MTP00280 PP6 $2.79 1801497 SW $1.75
9" Handle - Better Quality PP627543 $3.99 1712260 SW $6.75
9" Handle - Best Quality WBC66269 $4.99 2432450 SW $8.75
4" Extension Wood Pole PP6MTP00366 $2.79 1731892 SW $1.75
6" Extension Wood Pole PP6 MTP00345 (Finglass) $6.19 1703263 SW $2.85
ABRASIVES BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
Steel Wool 0-0000 No Bid 9513441 HO Max Corp $3.39
Fine Sandpaper 3M 220 MMM9411 (25ctn) $8.95(25 ctn)/$.358 each 1539907 3M $0.40 ea
Coarse Sandpaper 3M 120 MMM88619 (25ctn) $12.49(25 ctn)/$.449each 1539915 3M $0.40 ea
Wet or Dry Metal S/Paper No Bid 1539824 3M $1.25
Floor Sandpaper - 60 grit by ft No Bid 1552110 GKT Corp $2.45
Floor Sandpaper - 80 grit by ft No Bid 1552108 GKT Corp $2.45
Floor Sandpaper - 100 grit by ft No Bid 1552090 GKT Corp $2.45
SPACKLE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
Interior - 1 quart Crawfords CFP31904 $8.99 1516442 SW $3.75
Interior - 1 gallon No Bid 1516000 SW $15.00
Exterior - 1 quart Crawfords CFP31904 $8.99 1518873 SW $11.60
Exterior - 1 gallon No Bid 1518000 SW $54.00
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VENDORS Pittsburgh Paints The Sherwin Williams Co.
MASKING TAPE (ROLL) BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
1/4" No Bid 4048914 Shurtape Tech $0.59
1/2" General Purpose 3/4" $1.69 11534916 Shurtape Tech $0.79
1 General Purpose 71106 $1.79 1534924 Shurtape Tech $1.25
112" General Purpose 1107 $2.69 1534924 Shurtape Tech $1.95
2" General Purpose 1108 $3.49 1722297 Shurtape Tech $2.50
DROP CLOTHS BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
0.05 Plastic Drop - 9" X 12" No Bid 1452240 Polyamerica $0.75
1 Mil. Plastic Drop - 9" X 12" No Bid 1452432 Polyamerica $1.45
Canvas - 9" X 12" Pro Vantage DCM99601 $14.99 9743717 Polyamerica $14.72
Canvas - 12" X 15" Pro Vantage DCM99603 $16.99 1601524 Polyamerica $31.79
MISCELLANEOUS BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
Caulk - Tube Top Gun 200 $1.20 1518273 SW $1.49

One (1) vendor submitted a "No Bid"
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