SECTION I. DAY TRIPS

United Independent School District
Charter Bus Services

RFP_020-2009

VENDORS A&S Fun Tours Cougar Bus Lines LTD Daisy Tours G-Tours Imperial Bus Company Kerrville Bus
DOT #/MC# 880422/385648 1127893/459987-C 397239/226251 1489149/560733 1261610/492765 1167678/463270
BUS FLEET 6 BUSES 16 BUSES 22 BUSES 3 BUSES 6 BUSES 44 BUSES

REGULAR Seat | REGULAR Seat | REGULAR Seat | REGULAR Seat | REGULAR Seat | REGULAR Seat
DESTINATION BUS HANDICAP BUS | CAP. BUS HANDICAP BUS | CAP. BUS *HANDICAP BUS | CAP. BUS HANDICAP BUS | CAP. BUS HANDICAP BUS | CAP. BUS HANDICAP BUS | CAP.
SAN ANTONIO $4,372.52 N/A 49-59 | $1,275.00 N/A 52-58 | $1,508.00 $1,408.00 57/*39| $1,706.00 N/A 55 $1,545.00 N/A 50-55] $1,800.00 $1,800.00 55
CORPUS CHRISTI| $4,461.63 N/A 49.59 | $1,275.00 N/A 52-58 | $1,698.00 $1,562.00 57/*39 | $1,700.00 N/A 55 $1,545.00 N/A 50-55] $1,800.00 $1,800.00 55
BROWNSVILLE $4,681.39 N/A 49.59 | $1,475.00 N/A 52-58 | $1,979.00 $1,820.00 57/*39 | $2,000.00 N/A 55 $1,855.00 N/A 50-55] $1,975.00 $1,975.00 55
MCALLEN $4,290.11 N/A 49.59 | $1,275.00 N/A 52-58 | $1,572.00 $1,446.00 57/*39 | $1,900.00 N/A 55 $1,545.00 N/A 50-55] $1,800.00 $1,800.00 55
KINGSVILLE $4,159.46 N/A 49-59 | $1,275.00 N/A 52-58 | $1,508.00 $1,408.00 57/*39 | $1,740.00 N/A 55 $1,545.00 N/A 50-55] $1,800.00 $1,800.00 55
EAGLE PASS $4,161.47 N/A 49.59 | $1,275.00 N/A 52-58 | $1,508.00 $1,408.00 57/*39| $1,750.00 N/A 55 $1,545.00 N/A 50-55] $1,800.00 $1,800.00 55
AUSTIN $4,907.85 N/A 49-59 | $1,475.00 N/A 52-58 | $2,179.00 $2,005.00 57/*39 | $2,300.00 N/A 55 $2,010.00 N/A 50-55] $2,150.00 $2,150.00 55
NEW BRAUNFELY $4,590.27 N/A 49-59 | $1,375.00 N/A 52-58 | $1,855.00 $1,707.00 57/*39 | $1,900.00 N/A 55 $1,700.00 N/A 50-55] $1,850.00 $1,850.00 55
HOUSTON $5,682.37 N/A 49-59 | $2,200.00 N/A 52-58 | $2,966.00 $2,729.00 57/*39 | $3,100.00 N/A 55 $2,680.00 N/A 50-55] $3,160.00 $3,160.00 55
DALLAS $6,207.65 N/A 49-59 | $2,400.00 N/A 52-58 | $3,525.00 $3,243.00 57/*39 | $3,500.00 N/A 55 $3,090.00 N/A 50-55 ] $3,600.00 $3,600.00 55
DEL RIO $4,528.63 N/A 49-59 | $1,375.00 N/A 52-58 | $1,787.00 $1,644.00 57/*39 | $1,780.00 N/A 55 $1,680.00 N/A 50-55] $1,800.00 $1,800.00 55
UVALDE $4,209.71 N/A 49-59 | $1,275.00 N/A 52-58 | $1,508.00 $1,408.00 57/*39| $1,700.00 N/A 55 $1,545.00 N/A 50-55] $1,800.00 $1,800.00 55
SECTION Il. OVERNIGHT TRI

A&S Fun Tours

REGULAR Seat | REGULAR Seat | REGULAR Seat | REGULAR Seat | REGULAR Seat | REGULAR Seat
DESTINATION BUS HANDICAP BUS | CAP. BUS HANDICAP BUS | CAP. BUS HANDICAP BUS | CAP. BUS HANDICAP BUS | CAP. BUS HANDICAP BUS | CAP. BUS **HANDICAP BUS | CAP.
SAN ANTONIO $4,372.52 N/A 49-59 | $1,775.00 N/A 52-58 | $2,838.00 $2,610.00 57/*39 | $2,500.00 N/A 55 $2,200.00 N/A 50-55 | $3,000.00 $3,000.00 55
CORPUS CHRISTI| $4,461.63 N/A 49.59 | $1,775.00 N/A 52-58 | $2,838.00 $2,610.00 57/*39 | $2,500.00 N/A 55 $2,200.00 N/A 50-55 | $3,000.00 $3,000.00 55
BROWNSVILLE $4,681.39 N/A 49.59 | $1,975.00 N/A 52-58 | $2,838.00 $2,610.00 57/*39 | $2,600.00 N/A 55 $2,250.00 N/A 50-55] $3,075.00 $3,075.00 55
MCALLEN $4,290.11 N/A 49.59 | $1,775.00 N/A 52-58 | $2,838.00 $2,610.00 57/*39 | $2,600.00 N/A 55 $2,200.00 N/A 50-55 | $3,000.00 $3,000.00 55
KINGSVILLE $4,159.46 N/A 49-59 | $1,775.00 N/A 52-58 | $2,838.00 $2,610.00 57/*39 | $2,500.00 N/A 55 $2,200.00 N/A 50-55 | $3,000.00 $3,000.00 55
EAGLE PASS $4,161.47 N/A 49.59 | $1,775.00 N/A 52-58 | $2,838.00 $2,610.00 57/*39 | $2,600.00 N/A 55 $2,200.00 N/A 50-55 | $3,000.00 $3,000.00 55
AUSTIN $4,907.85 N/A 49-59 | $1,975.00 N/A 52-58 | $2,838.00 $2,610.00 57/*39 | $2,700.00 N/A 55 $2,300.00 N/A 50-55 | $3,000.00 $3,000.00 55
NEW BRAUNFELY $4,590.27 N/A 49-59 | $1,875.00 N/A 52-58 | $2,838.00 $2,610.00 57/*39 | $2,600.00 N/A 55 $2,250.00 N/A 50-55 | $3,000.00 $3,000.00 55
HOUSTON $5,682.37 N/A 49-59 | $2,700.00 N/A 52-58 | $2,966.00 $2,728.00 57/*39 | $3,000.00 N/A 55 $3,000.00 N/A 50-55] $3,160.00 $3,160.00 55
DALLAS $6,207.65 N/A 49-59 | $2,900.00 N/A 52-58 | $3,525.00 $3,243.00 57/*39 | $3,700.00 N/A 55 $3,500.00 N/A 50-55 | $3,600.00 $3,600.00 55
DEL RIO $4,528.63 N/A 49-59 | $1,875.00 N/A 52-58 | $2,838.00 $2,610.00 57/*39 | $2,600.00 N/A 55 $2,250.00 N/A 50-55 | $3,000.00 $3,000.00 55
UVALDE $4,209.71 N/A 49-59 | $1,775.00 N/A 52-58 | $2,838.00 $2,610.00 57/*39| $2,500.00 N/A 55 $2,200.00 N/A 50-55] $3,000.00 $3,000.00 55
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United Independent School District

Charter Bus Services

SECTION |. D/ REP 020-2009
VENDORS OGA Charters OK Tours Quality Tour Tornado Tours Zima Real Bus Line
DOT #/MC# 1843796/672580 570178/277375 658912/308887 991034 1764020/644733
BUS FLEET 6 BUSES 16 BUSES 5 BUSES 2 BUSES 10 BUSES
REGULAR Seat | REGULAR Seat | REGULAR Seat | REGULAR Seat | REGULAR Seat
DESTINATION BUS HANDICAP BUS | CAP. BUS HANDICAP BUS | CAP. BUS HANDICAP BUS | CAP. BUS HANDICAP BUS | CAP. BUS HANDICAPBUS | CAP.
SAN ANTONIO $1,500.00 $1,650.00 50-57 | $1,495.00 N/A 55 or 56| $3,433.00 N/A 55 $1,280.00 N/A 52 $1,350.00 N/A 48-51
CORPUS CHRISTI| $1,350.00 $1,500.00 50-57 | $1,495.00 N/A 55 or 56| $3,350.00 N/A 55 $1,280.00 N/A 52 $1,350.00 N/A 48-51
BROWNSVILLE $1,400.00 $1,550.00 50-57 | $1,645.00 N/A 55 or 56| $3,790.00 N/A 55 $1,500.00 N/A 52 $1,550.00 N/A 48-51
MCALLEN $1,300.00 $1,450.00 50-57 | $1,645.00 N/A 55 or 56| $3,398.00 N/A 55 $1,280.00 N/A 52 $1,350.00 N/A 48-51
KINGSVILLE $1,300.00 $1,450.00 50-57 | $1,445.00 N/A 55 or 56| $3,223.00 N/A 55 $1,280.00 N/A 52 $1,350.00 N/A 48-51
EAGLE PASS $1,400.00 $1,550.00 50-57 | $1,495.00 N/A 55 or 56| $3,195.00 N/A 55 $1,280.00 N/A 52 $1,350.00 N/A 48-51
AUSTIN $1,800.00 $1,950.00 50-57 | $1,795.00 N/A 55 or 56| $3,979.00 N/A 55 $1,500.00 N/A 52 $1,650.00 N/A 48-51
NEW BRAUNFELY $1,500.00 $1,650.00 50-57 | $1,545.00 N/A 55 or 56| $3,678.00 N/A 55 $1,350.00 N/A 52 $1,600.00 N/A 48-51
HOUSTON $1,800.00 $1,950.00 50-57 | $2,345.00 N/A 55 or 56| $4,553.00 N/A 55 $2,100.00 N/A 52 $2,200.00 N/A 48-51
DALLAS $2,200.00 $2,350.00 50-57 | $3,345.00 N/A 55 or 56| $5,337.00 N/A 55 $2,800.00 N/A 52 $2,800.00 N/A 48-51
DEL RIO $1,500.00 $1,650.00 50-57 | $1,545.00 N/A 55 or 56| $3,580.00 N/A 55 $1,350.00 N/A 52 $1,550.00 N/A 48-51
UVALDE $1,600.00 $1,750.00 50-57 | $1,445.00 N/A 55 or 56| $3,258.00 N/A $55.00 | $1,280.00 N/A 52 $1,200.00 N/A 48-51
SECTION Il. OVE
Quality Tour Tornado Tours Zima Real Bus Line
REGULAR Seat | REGULAR Seat | REGULAR Seat | REGULAR Seat | REGULAR Seat

DESTINATION BUS HANDICAP BUS | CAP. BUS HANDICAP BUS | CAP. BUS HANDICAP BUS | CAP. BUS HANDICAP BUS | CAP. BUS HANDICAP BUS | CAP.
SAN ANTONIO $2,000.00 $2,100.00 50-57 | $1,695.00 N/A 550r56| $3,608.00 N/A 55 $1,900.00 N/A 52 $1,800.00 N/A 48-51
CORPUS CHRISTI| $1,850.00 $1,950.00 50-57 | $1,695.00 N/A 550r56| $3,531.00 N/A 55 $1,900.00 N/A 52 $1,800.00 N/A 48-51
BROWNSVILLE $1,900.00 $2,000.00 50-57 | $1,795.00 N/A 550r56| $3,965.00 N/A 55 $2,000.00 N/A 52 $2,050.00 N/A 48-51
MCALLEN $1,800.00 $1,900.00 50-57 | $1,845.00 N/A 550r56| $3,573.00 N/A 55 $1,900.00 N/A 52 $1,800.00 N/A 48-51
KINGSVILLE $1,800.00 $1,900.00 50-57 | $1,645.00 N/A 550r56| $3,398.00 N/A 55 $1,900.00 N/A 52 $1,800.00 N/A 48-51
EAGLE PASS $1,900.00 $2,000.00 50-57 | $1,645.00 N/A 550r56| $3,370.00 N/A 55 $1,900.00 N/A 52 $1,800.00 N/A 48-51
AUSTIN $2,300.00 $2,400.00 50-57 | $2,045.00 N/A 550r56 | $4,154.00 N/A 55 $2,000.00 N/A 52 $2,150.00 N/A 48-51
NEW BRAUNFELY $2,000.00 $2,100.00 50-57 | $1,745.00 N/A 550r56| $3,853.00 N/A 55 $2,000.00 N/A 52 $2,100.00 N/A 48-51
HOUSTON $2,300.00 $2,400.00 50-57 | $2,545.00 N/A 550r56 | $4,728.00 N/A 55 $2,500.00 N/A 52 $2,700.00 N/A 48-51
DALLAS $2,700.00 $2,800.00 50-57 | $3,545.00 N/A 550r56| $5,512.00 N/A 55 $3,000.00 N/A 52 $3,300.00 N/A 48-51
DEL RIO $2,000.00 $2,100.00 50-57 | $1,745.00 N/A 550r56| $3,755.00 N/A 55 $2,000.00 N/A 52 $1,800.00 N/A 48-51
UVALDE $2,100.00 $2,200.00 50-57 | $1,645.00 N/A 550r56| $3,433.00 N/A 55 $1,900.00 N/A 52 $1,700.00 N/A 48-51
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United Independent School District
Charter Bus Services

RFP 020-2009

SECTION lIl. RESERVED DATES FOR UISD - Football A&S Fun Tours | Cougar Bus Lines, LTD Daisy Tours G-Tours Imperial Bus Company Kerrville Bus Co.
ALEXANDER HIGH SCHOOL SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT
DATES DESTINATION QTY. CAPACITY PRICE |CAPACITY] PRICE CAPACIT PRICE CAPACIT PRICE |CAPACITY| PRICE CAPACIT PRICE
Friday, August 28, 2009 Corpus Christi, TX 2 49-59 | $4,461.63 52-58 $2,550.00 57 $1,698.00 55 $1,530.00 50-55 $1,545.00 55 $1,800.00
Friday, September 11, 2009 Donna, TX 2 49-59 |[$4,371.18 52-58 $2,550.00 57 $1,766.00 55 $1,710.00 50-55 $1,545.00 55 $1,800.00
Friday, September 25, 2009 DEL RIO, TX 2 49-59 | $4,528.63 52-58 $2,750.00 57 $1,787.00 55 $1,530.00 50-55 $1,680.00 55 $1,800.00
Friday, October 09, 2009 San Antonio, TX 2 49-59 | $4,372.52 52-58 $2,550.00 57 $1,508.00 55 $1,530.00 50-55 $1,545.00 55 $1,800.00
Friday, October 30, 2009 Eagle Pass, TX 2 49-59 |[$4,161.47 52-58 $2,550.00 57 $1,508.00 55 $1,575.00 50-55 $1,545.00 55 $1,800.00
LYNDON B. JOHNSON HIGH SCHOOL

DATES DESTINATION QTY.

Friday, September 25, 2009 Tuloso, TX 2 49-59 | $3,232.13 52-58 $2,550.00 57 $1,698.00 55 $1,530.00 No Bid No Bid 55 $4,110.40
Friday, October 09, 2009 Corpus Christi, TX 2 49-59 | $4,461.63 52-58 $2,550.00 57 $1,698.00 55 $1,710.00 50-55 $1,545.00 55 $1,800.00
Friday, October 16, 2009 Calallen, TX 2 49-59 No Bid 52-58 $2,550.00 57 $16,998.00 55 $1,530.00 50-55 $1,545.00 55 $1,800.00
UNITED HIGH SCHOOL

DATES DESTINATION QTY.

Friday, August 28, 2009 San Antonio, TX 2 49-59 |[$4,372.52 52-58 $2,550.00 57 $1,508.00 55 $1,530.00 50-55 $1,545.00 55 $1,800.00
Friday, September 04, 2009 Corpus Christi, TX 2 No Bid No Bid 52-58 $2,550.00 57 $1,698.00 55 $1,530.00 50-55 $1,545.00 55 $1,800.00
Friday, October 02, 2009 Eagle Pass, TX 2 49-59 |[$4,161.47 52-58 $2,550.00 57 $1,508.00 55 $1,575.00 50-55 $1,545.00 55 $1,800.00
Friday, October 23, 2009 DEL RIO, TX 2 49-59 | $4,528.63 52-58 $2,750.00 57 $1,787.00 55 $1,602.00 50-55 $1,680.00 55 $1,800.00
UNITED SOUTH HIGH SCHOOL

DATES DESTINATION QTY.

Friday, September 04, 2009 Corpus Christi, TX 2 No Bid No Bid 52-58 $2,550.00 57 $1,698.00 55 $1,530.00 50-55 $1,545.00 55 $1,800.00
Friday, October 23, 2009 San Antonio, TX 2 49-59 |[$4,372.52 52-58 $2,550.00 57 $1,508.00 55 $1,530.00 50-55 $1,545.00 55 $1,800.00
Saturday, October 31, 2009 Eagle Pass, TX 2 49-59 |[$4,161.47 52-58 $2,550.00 No Bid No Bid 55 $1,575.00 50-55 $1,545.00 55 $1,800.00

*DNMS - Does Not Meet Specifications
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United Independent School District
Charter Bus Services
RFP 020-2009

SECTION lll. RESERVED DATES FOR UISD - Football OGA Charters OK Tours Quality Tours Tornado Tours Zima Real Bus Lines
ALEXANDER HIGH SCHOOL SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT
DATES DESTINATION QTY. JCAPACIT PRICE |CAPACITY| PRICE |CAPACIT PRICE |CAPACITY| PRICE |JCAPACIT PRICE
Friday, August 28, 2009 Corpus Christi, TX 2 50-57 $1,300.00 550r56 | $1,495.00 55 $3,430.00 52 $1,280.00 48-51 $1,350.00
Friday, September 11, 2009 Donna, TX 2 50-57 $1,300.00 550r56 | $1,600.00 55 $3,543.00 52 $1,280.00 48-51 $1,350.00
Friday, September 25, 2009 DEL RIO, TX 2 50-57 $1,400.00 550r56 | $1,545.00 55 $3,655.00 52 $1,350.00 48-51 $1,550.00
Friday, October 09, 2009 San Antonio, TX 2 50-57 $1,400.00 550r56 | $1,495.00 55 $3,508.00 52 $1,280.00 48-51 $1,350.00
Friday, October 30, 2009 Eagle Pass, TX 2 50-57 $1,300.00 550r56 | $1,495.00 55 $3,270.00 52 $1,280.00 48-51 $1,350.00
LYNDON B. JOHNSON HIGH SCHOOL

DATES DESTINATION QTY.

Friday, September 25, 2009 Tuloso, TX 2 50-57 $1,300.00 550r56 | $1,650.00 55 $3,277.00 52 $1,280.00 48-51 $1,350.00
Friday, October 09, 2009 Corpus Christi, TX 2 50-57 $1,300.00 550r56 | $1,495.00 55 $3,430.00 52 $1,280.00 48-51 $1,350.00
Friday, October 16, 2009 Calallen, TX 2 50-57 $1,300.00 550r56 | $1,475.00 55 $3,361.00 52 $1,280.00 48-51 $1,350.00
UNITED HIGH SCHOOL

DATES DESTINATION QTY.

Friday, August 28, 2009 San Antonio, TX 2 50-57 $1,400.00 550r56 | $1,495.00 55 $3,508.00 52 $1,280.00 48-51 $1,350.00
Friday, September 04, 2009 Corpus Christi, TX 2 50-57 $1,300.00 550r56 | $1,495.00 55 $3,430.00 52 $1,280.00 48-51 $1,350.00
Friday, October 02, 2009 Eagle Pass, TX 2 50-57 $1,300.00 550r56 | $1,495.00 55 $3,270.00 52 $1,280.00 48-51 $1,350.00
Friday, October 23, 2009 DEL RIO, TX 2 50-57 $1,400.00 550r56 | $1,545.00 55 $3,655.00 52 $1,350.00 48-51 $1,550.00
UNITED SOUTH HIGH SCHOOL

DATES DESTINATION QTY.

Friday, September 04, 2009 Corpus Christi, TX 2 50-57 $1,300.00 550r56 | $1,495.00 55 $3,430.00 52 $1,280.00 48-51 $1,350.00
Friday, October 23, 2009 San Antonio, TX 2 50-57 $1,400.00 550r56 | $1,495.00 55 $3,508.00 52 $1,280.00 48-51 $1,350.00
Saturday, October 31, 2009 Eagle Pass, TX 2 50-57 $1,300.00 550r56 | $1,495.00 55 $3,270.00 52 $1,280.00 48-51 $1,350.00

*DNMS - Does Not Meet Specifications
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
CHARTER BUS SERVICE
RFP 020-2009

SECTION Ill. RESERVED DATES FOR UISD - Band Cougar Bus Lines, LTD Daisy Tours Imperial Bus Company| Kerrville Bus Co. OK Tours Tornado Tours Zima Real Bus Line
ALEXANDER HIGH SCHOOL SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT SEATING UNIT
DATES DESTINATION QTY. CAPACITY PRICE CAPACITY PRICE CAPACITY PRICE CAPACITY PRICE CAPACITY PRICE CAPACITY PRICE CAPACITY PRICE
Friday, September 11, 2009 Donna, TX 6 52-58 $1,275.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55 $1,800.00 | 550r56 | $1,600.00 52 $1,280.00 | 48-51 | $1,350.00
Friday, September 25, 2009 Del Rio, TX 6 52-58 $1,375.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55 $1,800.00 | 550r56 | $1,545.00 52 $1,350.00 | 48-51 | $1,550.00
Friday, October 09, 2009 San Antonio, TX 6 52-58 $1,275.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55 $1,800.00 | 550r56 | $1,495.00 52 $1,280.00 | 48-51 | $1,350.00
Saturday, October 17, 2009 Corpus Christi, TX 6 52-58 $1,275.00 No Bid No Bid 50-55 $1,545.00 55 $1,800.00 | 550r56 | $1,495.00 52 $1,280.00 | 5148- [ $1,350.00
Friday, October 30, 2009 Eagle Pass, TX 6 52-58 $1,275.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55 $1,800.00 | 550r56 | $1,495.00 52 $1,280.00 | 48-51 | $1,350.00
Saturday, October 31, 2009 Conroe, TX 6 52-58 $2,300.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55 $3,300.00 | 550r56 | $1,495.00 52 $2,300.00 | 48-51 | $2,500.00
LYNDON B. JOHNSON HIGH SCHOOL

DATES DESTINATION QTY.

Friday, September 25, 2009 Corpus Christi, TX 3 52-58 $1,275.00 57 $1,577.00 No Bid No Bid 55 $1,800.00 | 550r56 | $1,495.00 52 $1,280.00 | 48-51 | $1,350.00
Friday, October 09, 2009 Corpus Christi, TX 3 52-58 $1,275.00 57 $1,577.00 No Bid No Bid 55 $1,800.00 | 550r56 | $1,495.00 52 $1,280.00 | 48-51 | $1,350.00
Saturday, October 10, 2009 Corpus Christi, TX 3 52-58 $1,275.00 57 $1,577.00 50-55 $1,545.00 55 $1,800.00 | 550r56 | $1,495.00 52 $1,280.00 | 48-51 | $1,350.00
Thursday, October 15, 2009 Corpus Christi, TX 3 52-58 $1,275.00 57 $1,577.00 50-55 $1,545.00 55 $1,800.00 | 550r56 | $1,495.00 52 $1,280.00 | 48-51 | $1,350.00
Saturday, October 17, 2009 Corpus Christi, TX 3 52-58 $1,275.00 57 $1,577.00 50-55 $1,545.00 55 $1,800.00 | 550r56 | $1,495.00 52 $1,280.00 | 48-51 | $1,350.00
UNITED HIGH SCHOOL

DATES DESTINATION QTY.

Friday, September 04, 2009 Corpus Christi, TX 5 52-58 $1,275.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55 $1,800.00 | 550r56 | $1,495.00 52 $1,280.00 | 48-51 | $1,350.00
Friday, October 02, 2009 Eagle Pass, TX 5 52-58 $1,275.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55 $1,800.00 | 550r56 | $1,495.00 52 $1,280.00 | 48-51 | $1,350.00
Saturday, October 10, 2009 McAllen, TX 5 52-58 $1,275.00 No Bid No Bid 50-55 $1,545.00 55 $1,800.00 | 550r56 | $1,495.00 52 $1,280.00 | 48-51 | $1,350.00
Friday, October 23, 2009 Del Rio, TX 5 52-58 $1,375.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55 $1,800.00 | 550r56 | $1,545.00 52 $1,350.00 | 48-51 | $1,550.00
Saturday, October 17, 2009 Corpus Christi, TX 5 52-58 $1,275.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55 $1,800.00 | 550r56 | $1,495.00 52 $1,280.00 | 48-51 | $1,350.00
Saturday, October 31, 2009 Houston, TX 5 52-58 $2,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55 $3,160.00 | 550r56 | $1,495.00 52 $2,100.00 | 48-51 | $2,200.00
UNITED SOUTH HIGH SCHOOL

DATES DESTINATION QTY.

Friday, September 04, 2009 Corpus Christi, TX 4 52-58 $1,275.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55 $1,800.00 | 550r56 | $1,495.00 52 $1,280.00 | 48-51 | $1,350.00
Saturday, October 10, 2009 Corpus Christi, TX 4 52-58 $1,275.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55 $1,800.00 | 550r56 | $1,495.00 52 $1,280.00 | 48-51 | $1,350.00
Saturday, October 17, 2009 Corpus Christi, TX 4 52-58 $1,275.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55 $1,800.00 | 550r56 | $1,495.00 52 $1,280.00 | 48-51 | $1,350.00
Friday, October 23, 2009 San Antonio, TX 4 52-58 $1,275.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55 $1,800.00 | 550r56 | $1,495.00 52 $1,280.00 | 48-51 | $1,350.00
Saturday, October 31, 2009 Eagle Pass, TX 4 52-58 $1,275.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 55 $1,800.00 | 550r56 | $1,495.00 52 $1,280.00 | 48-51 | $1,350.00
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