UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
PLUMBING SUPPLIES
RFP 013-2013

VENDORS

Clark Hardware

Marks Plumbing Parts

SECTION I: PERCENTAGE DISCOUNTS % DISCOUNT % DISCOUNT
% OFF CATALOG PRICE 10-86% 0%
% OFF LIST PRICE 10-86% 20%
% OFF SHELF PRICE 10-86% 0%

SECTION II: GENERAL LINE ITEMS UNIT Iltem # UNIT COST Item # UNIT COST

BOWL WAX EACH F240 $0.83 26491 $1.53
PVC CEMENT GREY 1 QT. EACH F1061 $14.97 no bid
PVC CEMENT REGULAR 1 QT. EACH F1057 $6.75 13306 $13.48
PVC PRIMER 1 QT. EACH F1070 $7.20 13305 $8.46
CHICAGO LAVATORY SINGLE FAUCET EACH C3262 $83.44 6927 $153.11
URINAL SPONGE GASKET EACH F47 $0.89 9195 $0.99
SLOAN O RINGS EACH C1032 $0.72 642 $0.49
POLYFLEX SUPPLY 1/2 X 3/8 EACH C654 $3.98 8702 $2.91
RECTORSEAL #5 ONE PINT EACH F257 $13.95 4985 $22.40
LAVATORY STRAINER GRID 1 1/4" EACH C1536 $10.75 4425 $14.19
P TRAP 1 1/4" CHROME 17 GAUGE EACH C251 $13.11 4477 $21.17
P TRAP 1 1/2" CHROME 17 GAUGE EACH $14.95 4478 $22.68
HOSE BIBB 1/2" EACH C427 $6.29 13371 $10.45
HOSE BIBB 3/4" EACH C428 $6.59 13372 $10.90
RELIEF VALVE URINAL SLOAN EACH C1029 $5.54 6209 $4.35
RELIEF VALVE TOILET SLOAN EACH C1028 $4.54 6208 $4.35
WASHER SET SLOAN A156AA EACH C1024 $9.50 6220 $15.36
LAVATORY FLAT WASHER SET (CAN) EACH F106 $12.00
COIL TUBING COPPER 1/4" COIL A362 $34.49 no bid
COIL TUBING COPPER 3/8" COIL A364 $51.82
PVC TOILET FLANGE FLOOR 3" TO 4" EACH Al54 $6.25 9801 $7.15
STOP REPAIR KIT 1"SLOAN EACH C646 $8.39 6330 $12.43
TOILET BRASS BOLT 1/4" EACH F2005 $0.72 9130 $2.45
TOILET SEAT ELONGATED OPEN FRONT EACH B120 $16.38 9100 $25.25
VACUUM BREAKER KIT SLOAN EACH C1026 $3.72 6215 $2.98
RAINBIRD BUBBLER 1/2" EACH A1874 $0.90
WIRE NUT CONNECTORS PRO FILLED EACH A1926 $11.12
DIAPHRAM RICHDALE 1" EACH A2277 $6.30 no bid
DIAPHRAM WEATHERMATIC 1 1/2" EACH 56099 $18.67
DIAPHRAM WEATHERMATIC 2" EACH [S09213 $40.98
ELBOW PVC 2" SCHEDULE 40 EACH A405 $0.83 98045 $1.97
ELBOW PVC 3/4" SCHEDULE 40 EACH A401 $0.18 98041 $0.37
ELBOW PVC 1" SCHEDULE 40 EACH A402 $0.30 98042 $0.67
SPRINKLER HEAD RAINBIRD 1800 EACH A1834 $1.34
SPRINKLER HEAD HUNTER PGP 3/4" EACH A1843 $11.11
PLASTIC VALVE BOX ROUND 10" EACH F5 §7.21
PLASTIC VALVE BOX ROUND 6" EACH F3 $2.89
VALVE RICHDALE 2" EACH A2139 $82.73
VALVE WEATHERMATIC 2" EACH A2389 $104.91
VALVE WEATHERMATIC 1 1/2" EACH A3102 $69.00
WEATHERMATIC SOLENOID 24 VOLTS (SPRINKLERS) EACH 52630 $42.00
WEATHERMATIC SOLENOID 12 VOLTS (SPRINKLERS) EACH $48.00 no bid
PLASTIC NIPPLE CUTOFF 1/2"X 6" EACH A2187 $0.47
PLASTIC NIPPLE CUTOFF 3/4" X 6" EACH A2203 $0.68
PIPE PVC 1/2 " X 20' SCHEDULE 40 EACH A5 $3.85
PIPE PVC 1" X 20' SCHEDULE 40 EACH A7 $7.30
PIPE PVC 3/4" X 20' SCHEDULE 40 EACH A6 $5.12
PIPE PVC 2" X 20' SCHEDULE 40 EACH Al0 $14.82
LID FOR 10" ROUND PLASTIC VALVE BOX EACH F6 $5.79
LID FOR 6" ROUND PLASTIC VALVE BOX EACH FA7 $1.92

Notes

Catalog available online




