

United Independent School District
District Wide HVAC Filters
RFP 005-2011

Advance Filtration Products, LLC		Aire Filter Products		Brookaire Company	
Percentage Discount off List/Catalog	30%	Percentage Discount off List/Catalog	No Bid	Percentage Discount off List/Catalog	No Bid

Filters First		Joe W Fly Co. Inc Option A		Joe W Fly Co. Inc Option B	
Percentage Discount off List/Catalog	20%	Percentage Discount off List/Catalog	25%	Percentage Discount off List/Catalog	25%

Florence Filters Corp		Gulf Coast Paper Co. Inc		Insko Distributing	
Percentage Discount off List/Catalog	55%	Percentage Discount off List/Catalog	No Bid	Percentage Discount off List/Catalog	50%

Motion Industries		R & M Refrigeration Supply Inc		Sexuar Interline Brands	
Percentage Discount off List/Catalog	No Bid	Percentage Discount off List/Catalog	40%	Percentage Discount off List/Catalog	25%

United Independent School District
District Wide HVAC Filters
RFP 005-2011

Type 2 Filter			Advance Filtration Products, LLC			Type 2 Filter			Aire Filter Products		
Size in Inches	Unit Price	Est. Annual	Annual Price	Size in Inches	Unit Price	Est. Annual	Annual Price				
8 x 16 x 1	\$4.30	12	\$51.60	8 x 16 x 1	\$3.04	12	\$36.48				
12 X 12 X 1	\$4.30	12	\$51.60	12 X 12 X 1	\$2.44	12	\$29.28				
12 X 24 X 1	\$2.80	84	\$235.20	12 X 24 X 1	\$1.99	84	\$167.16				
12 X 30 X 1	\$7.60	84	\$638.40	12 X 30 X 1	\$3.74	84	\$314.16				
13 X 19 X 1	\$6.70	24	\$160.80	13 X 19 X 1	\$3.74	24	\$89.76				
14 X 24 X 1	\$4.22	36	\$151.92	14 X 24 X 1	\$2.58	36	\$92.88				
14 X 25 X 1	\$3.50	180	\$630.00	14 X 25 X 1	\$2.04	180	\$367.20				
15 X 20 X 1	\$3.06	516	\$1,578.96	15 X 20 X 1	\$1.99	516	\$1,026.84				
15 X 20 X 2	\$3.14	18540	\$58,215.60	15 X 20 X 2	\$2.41	18540	\$44,681.40				
15-7/8 X 15-7/8 X 2	\$7.22	48	\$346.56	15-7/8 X 15-7/8 X 2	\$2.89	48	\$138.72				
16 X 20 X 1	\$2.70	696	\$1,879.20	16 X 20 X 1	\$1.89	696	\$1,315.44				
16 X 20 X 2	\$3.25	17664	\$57,408.00	16 X 20 X 2	\$1.99	17664	\$35,151.36				
16 X 22 X 2	\$6.00	96	\$576.00	16 X 22 X 2	\$3.42	96	\$328.32				
16 X 24 X 1	\$3.78	12	\$45.36	16 X 24 X 1	\$2.84	12	\$34.08				
16 X 24 X 2	\$3.78	384	\$1,451.52	16 X 24 X 2	\$2.14	384	\$821.76				
16 X 25 X 1	\$3.32	9960	\$33,067.20	16 X 25 X 1	\$1.99	9960	\$19,820.40				
16 X 25 X 2	\$3.94	14196	\$55,932.24	16 X 25 X 2	\$2.29	14196	\$32,508.84				
16 X 30 X 1	\$9.50	3444	\$32,718.00	16 X 30 X 1	\$3.74	3444	\$12,880.56				
16 X 31 X 1	\$9.80	24	\$235.20	16 X 31 X 1	\$4.22	24	\$101.28				
17 X 21½ X 1	\$6.90	12	\$82.80	17 X 21½ X 1	\$3.28	12	\$39.36				
18 X 18 X 1	\$6.17	24	\$148.08	18 X 18 X 1	\$2.75	24	\$66.00				
18 X 25 X 1	\$4.17	48	\$200.16	18 X 25 X 1	\$2.99	48	\$143.52				
18 X 30 X 1	\$10.34	288	\$2,977.92	18 X 30 X 1	\$4.02	288	\$1,157.76				
20 X 20 X 1	\$3.36	3456	\$11,612.16	20 X 20 X 1	\$2.02	3456	\$6,981.12				
20 X 20 X 2	\$3.75	7752	\$29,070.00	20 X 20 X 2	\$2.29	7752	\$17,752.08				
20 X 21½ X 1	\$6.00	312	\$1,872.00	20 X 21½ X 1	\$4.21	312	\$1,313.52				
20 X 22 X 1	\$6.00	12	\$72.00	20 X 22 X 1	\$3.99	12	\$47.88				
20 X 24 X 1	\$4.00	12	\$48.00	20 X 24 X 1	\$2.74	12	\$32.88				
20 X 25 X 1	\$3.96	492	\$1,948.32	20 X 25 X 1	\$2.39	492	\$1,175.88				
20 X 25 X 2	\$4.57	7752	\$35,426.64	20 X 25 X 2	\$2.54	7752	\$19,690.08				
20 X 30 X 1	\$8.50	24	\$204.00	20 X 30 X 1	\$3.11	24	\$74.64				
20 X 30 X 2	\$9.50	156	\$1,482.00	20 X 30 X 2	\$4.24	156	\$661.44				
24 X 24 X 1	\$4.50	144	\$648.00	24 X 24 X 1	\$2.84	144	\$408.96				
24 X 24 X 2	\$5.13	228	\$1,169.64	24 X 24 X 2	\$2.99	228	\$681.72				
25 X 25 X 1	\$4.98	12	\$59.76	25 X 25 X 1	\$3.13	12	\$37.56				
30 X 35 X 1	\$16.00	24	\$384.00	30 X 35 X 1	\$6.24	24	\$149.76				
Est. Annual Total			\$332,778.84	Est. Annual Total			\$200,320.08				

United Independent School District
District Wide HVAC Filters
RFP 005-2011

Type 2 Filter			Brookaire Company		Type 2 Filter			Filters First	
Size in Inches	Unit Price	Est. Annual	Annual Price	Size in Inches	Unit Price	Est. Annual	Annual Price	Est. Annual Total	Annual Price
8 x 16 x 1	\$2.39	12	\$28.68	8 x 16 x 1	\$3.72	12	\$44.64		
12 X 12 X 1	\$2.26	12	\$27.12	12 X 12 X 1	\$3.31	12	\$39.72		
12 X 24 X 1	\$2.14	84	\$179.76	12 X 24 X 1	\$2.87	84	\$241.08		
12 X 30 X 1	\$4.90	84	\$411.60	12 X 30 X 1	\$4.76	84	\$399.84		
13 X 19 X 1	\$4.75	24	\$114.00	13 X 19 X 1	\$4.96	24	\$119.04		
14 X 24 X 1	\$3.59	36	\$129.24	14 X 24 X 1	\$4.86	36	\$174.96		
14 X 25 X 1	\$3.16	180	\$568.80	14 X 25 X 1	\$3.15	180	\$567.00		
15 X 20 X 1	\$2.46	516	\$1,269.36	15 X 20 X 1	\$2.89	516	\$1,491.24		
15 X 20 X 2	\$3.07	18540	\$56,917.80	15 X 20 X 2	\$3.40	18540	\$63,036.00		
15-7/8 X 15-7/8 X 2	\$4.32	48	\$207.36	15-7/8 X 15-7/8 X 2	\$4.38	48	\$210.24		
16 X 20 X 1	\$2.11	696	\$1,468.56	16 X 20 X 1	\$2.78	696	\$1,934.88		
16 X 20 X 2	\$2.57	17664	\$45,396.48	16 X 20 X 2	\$3.27	17664	\$57,761.28		
16 X 22 X 2	\$5.00	96	\$480.00	16 X 22 X 2	\$6.67	96	\$640.32		
16 X 24 X 1	\$4.08	12	\$48.96	16 X 24 X 1	\$4.18	12	\$50.16		
16 X 24 X 2	\$3.39	384	\$1,301.76	16 X 24 X 2	\$4.18	384	\$1,605.12		
16 X 25 X 1	\$2.44	9960	\$24,302.40	16 X 25 X 1	\$3.02	9960	\$30,079.20		
16 X 25 X 2	\$3.02	14196	\$42,871.92	16 X 25 X 2	\$3.68	14196	\$52,241.28		
16 X 30 X 1	\$4.47	3444	\$15,394.68	16 X 30 X 1	\$5.02	3444	\$17,288.88		
16 X 31 X 1	\$7.19	24	\$172.56	16 X 31 X 1	\$6.67	24	\$160.08		
17 X 21½ X 1	\$5.47	12	\$65.64	17 X 21½ X 1	\$6.00	12	\$72.00		
18 X 18 X 1	\$4.09	24	\$98.16	18 X 18 X 1	\$4.65	24	\$111.60		
18 X 25 X 1	\$4.51	48	\$216.48	18 X 25 X 1	\$3.50	48	\$168.00		
18 X 30 X 1	\$4.53	288	\$1,304.64	18 X 30 X 1	\$3.31	288	\$953.28		
20 X 20 X 1	\$2.35	3456	\$8,121.60	20 X 20 X 1	\$3.05	3456	\$10,540.80		
20 X 20 X 2	\$3.14	7752	\$24,341.28	20 X 20 X 2	\$3.76	7752	\$29,147.52		
20 X 21½ X 1	\$3.58	312	\$1,116.96	20 X 21½ X 1	\$6.67	312	\$2,081.04		
20 X 22 X 1	\$4.29	12	\$51.48	20 X 22 X 1	\$4.65	12	\$55.80		
20 X 24 X 1	\$4.65	12	\$55.80	20 X 24 X 1	\$3.55	12	\$42.60		
20 X 25 X 1	\$2.63	492	\$1,293.96	20 X 25 X 1	\$3.39	492	\$1,667.88		
20 X 25 X 2	\$3.67	7752	\$28,449.84	20 X 25 X 2	\$4.34	7752	\$33,643.68		
20 X 30 X 1	\$4.51	24	\$108.24	20 X 30 X 1	\$4.69	24	\$112.56		
20 X 30 X 2	\$4.95	156	\$772.20	20 X 30 X 2	\$6.51	156	\$1,015.56		
24 X 24 X 1	\$3.13	144	\$450.72	24 X 24 X 1	\$3.97	144	\$571.68		
24 X 24 X 2	\$3.80	228	\$866.40	24 X 24 X 2	\$4.97	228	\$1,133.16		
25 X 25 X 1	\$4.54	12	\$54.48	25 X 25 X 1	\$4.36	12	\$52.32		
30 X 35 X 1	\$10.86	24	\$260.64	30 X 35 X 1	\$14.33	24	\$343.92		
	Est. Annual Total		\$258,919.56		Est. Annual Total		\$309,798.36		

United Independent School District
District Wide HVAC Filters
RFP 005-2011

Type 2 Filter	Joe W Fly Co. Inc Option A	Type 2 Filter	Joe W Fly Con. Inc. Option B				
Size in Inches	Unit Price	Est. Annual	Annual Price	Size in Inches	Unit Price	Est. Annual	Annual Price
8 x 16 x 1	\$4.75	12	\$57.00	8 x 16 x 1	\$3.75	12	\$45.00
12 X 12 X 1	\$4.47	12	\$53.64	12 X 12 X 1	\$3.18	12	\$38.16
12 X 24 X 1	\$3.89	84	\$326.76	12 X 24 X 1	\$3.18	84	\$267.12
12 X 30 X 1	\$5.75	84	\$483.00	12 X 30 X 1	\$4.25	84	\$357.00
13 X 19 X 1	\$5.99	24	\$143.76	13 X 19 X 1	\$3.99	24	\$95.76
14 X 24 X 1	\$5.85	36	\$210.60	14 X 24 X 1	\$3.13	36	\$112.68
14 X 25 X 1	\$4.15	180	\$747.00	14 X 25 X 1	\$3.20	180	\$576.00
15 X 20 X 1	\$3.99	516	\$2,058.84	15 X 20 X 1	\$3.20	516	\$1,651.20
15 X 20 X 2	\$4.25	18540	\$78,795.00	15 X 20 X 2	\$3.20	18540	\$59,328.00
15-7/8 X 15-7/8 X 2	\$6.89	48	\$330.72	15-7/8 X 15-7/8 X 2	\$5.69	48	\$273.12
16 X 20 X 1	\$3.89	696	\$2,707.44	16 X 20 X 1	\$2.99	696	\$2,081.04
16 X 20 X 2	\$3.39	17664	\$59,880.96	16 X 20 X 2	\$3.05	17664	\$53,875.20
16 X 22 X 2	\$8.29	96	\$795.84	16 X 22 X 2	\$5.89	96	\$565.44
16 X 24 X 1	\$5.15	12	\$61.80	16 X 24 X 1	\$3.40	12	\$40.80
16 X 24 X 2	\$5.15	384	\$1,977.60	16 X 24 X 2	\$3.89	384	\$1,493.76
16 X 25 X 1	\$4.00	9960	\$39,840.00	16 X 25 X 1	\$3.15	9960	\$31,374.00
16 X 25 X 2	\$4.39	14196	\$62,320.44	16 X 25 X 2	\$3.40	14196	\$48,266.40
16 X 30 X 1	\$6.15	3444	\$21,180.60	16 X 30 X 1	\$3.35	3444	\$11,537.40
16 X 31 X 1	\$7.99	24	\$191.76	16 X 31 X 1	\$4.99	24	\$119.76
17 X 21½ X 1	\$7.25	12	\$87.00	17 X 21½ X 1	\$4.49	12	\$53.88
18 X 18 X 1	\$5.79	24	\$138.96	18 X 18 X 1	\$3.69	24	\$88.56
18 X 25 X 1	\$4.59	48	\$220.32	18 X 25 X 1	\$3.59	48	\$172.32
18 X 30 X 1	\$6.75	288	\$1,944.00	18 X 30 X 1	\$4.99	288	\$1,437.12
20 X 20 X 1	\$4.05	3456	\$13,996.80	20 X 20 X 1	\$3.15	3456	\$10,886.40
20 X 20 X 2	\$4.49	7752	\$34,806.48	20 X 20 X 2	\$3.40	7752	\$26,356.80
20 X 21½ X 1	\$7.99	312	\$2,492.88	20 X 21½ X 1	\$4.89	312	\$1,525.68
20 X 22 X 1	\$5.99	12	\$71.88	20 X 22 X 1	\$4.89	12	\$58.68
20 X 24 X 1	\$4.69	12	\$56.28	20 X 24 X 1	\$3.59	12	\$43.08
20 X 25 X 1	\$4.59	492	\$2,258.28	20 X 25 X 1	\$3.49	492	\$1,717.08
20 X 25 X 2	\$5.29	7752	\$41,008.08	20 X 25 X 2	\$3.89	7752	\$30,155.28
20 X 30 X 1	\$5.89	24	\$141.36	20 X 30 X 1	\$3.99	24	\$95.76
20 X 30 X 2	\$7.89	156	\$1,230.84	20 X 30 X 2	\$7.29	156	\$1,137.24
24 X 24 X 1	\$5.15	144	\$741.60	24 X 24 X 1	\$3.89	144	\$560.16
24 X 24 X 2	\$6.10	228	\$1,390.80	24 X 24 X 2	\$4.29	228	\$978.12
25 X 25 X 1	\$5.89	12	\$70.68	25 X 25 X 1	\$4.29	12	\$51.48
30 X 35 X 1	\$8.89	24	\$213.36	30 X 35 X 1	\$7.89	24	\$189.36
	Est. Annual Total		\$373,032.36		Est. Annual Total		\$287,604.84

United Independent School District
District Wide HVAC Filters
RFP 005-2011

Type 2 Filter			Florence Filters Corp			Type 2 Filter			Gulf Coast Paper Co. Inc		
Size in Inches	Unit Price	Est. Annual	Annual Price	Size in Inches	Unit Price	Est. Annual	Annual Price				
8 x 16 x 1	\$4.07	12	\$48.84	8 x 16 x 1	\$3.41	12	\$40.92				
12 X 12 X 1	\$3.61	12	\$43.32	12 X 12 X 1	\$3.11	12	\$37.32				
12 X 24 X 1	\$3.14	84	\$263.76	12 X 24 X 1	\$2.20	84	\$184.80				
12 X 30 X 1	\$5.20	84	\$436.80	12 X 30 X 1	\$4.07	84	\$341.88				
13 X 19 X 1	\$4.80	24	\$115.20	13 X 19 X 1	\$3.88	24	\$93.12				
14 X 24 X 1	\$5.31	36	\$191.16	14 X 24 X 1	\$4.06	36	\$146.16				
14 X 25 X 1	\$3.43	180	\$617.40	14 X 25 X 1	\$3.66	180	\$658.80				
15 X 20 X 1	\$3.16	516	\$1,630.56	15 X 20 X 1	\$3.51	516	\$1,811.16				
15 X 20 X 2	\$3.71	18540	\$68,783.40	15 X 20 X 2	\$4.08	18540	\$75,643.20				
15-7/8 X 15-7/8 X 2	\$4.78	48	\$229.44	15-7/8 X 15-7/8 X 2	\$6.30	48	\$302.40				
16 X 20 X 1	\$3.04	696	\$2,115.84	16 X 20 X 1	\$2.27	696	\$1,579.92				
16 X 20 X 2	\$3.58	17664	\$63,237.12	16 X 20 X 2	\$3.05	17664	\$53,875.20				
16 X 22 X 2	\$6.72	96	\$645.12	16 X 22 X 2	\$6.96	96	\$668.16				
16 X 24 X 1	\$4.48	12	\$53.76	16 X 24 X 1	\$4.65	12	\$55.80				
16 X 24 X 2	\$4.57	384	\$1,754.88	16 X 24 X 2	\$3.34	384	\$1,282.56				
16 X 25 X 1	\$3.37	9960	\$33,565.20	16 X 25 X 1	\$2.45	9960	\$24,402.00				
16 X 25 X 2	\$4.11	14196	\$58,345.56	16 X 25 X 2	\$3.40	14196	\$48,266.40				
16 X 30 X 1	\$5.61	3444	\$19,320.84	16 X 30 X 1	\$5.35	3444	\$18,425.40				
16 X 31 X 1	\$7.47	24	\$179.28	16 X 31 X 1	\$5.67	24	\$136.08				
17 X 21½ X 1	\$7.47	12	\$89.64	17 X 21½ X 1	\$5.48	12	\$65.76				
18 X 18 X 1	\$5.20	24	\$124.80	18 X 18 X 1	\$3.72	24	\$89.28				
18 X 25 X 1	\$3.91	48	\$187.68	18 X 25 X 1	\$3.93	48	\$188.64				
18 X 30 X 1	\$6.20	288	\$1,785.60	18 X 30 X 1	\$5.41	288	\$1,558.08				
20 X 20 X 1	\$3.40	3456	\$11,750.40	20 X 20 X 1	\$2.48	3456	\$8,570.88				
20 X 20 X 2	\$4.21	7752	\$32,635.92	20 X 20 X 2	\$3.46	7752	\$26,821.92				
20 X 21½ X 1	\$7.47	312	\$2,330.64	20 X 21½ X 1	\$5.81	312	\$1,812.72				
20 X 22 X 1	\$5.20	12	\$62.40	20 X 22 X 1	\$5.73	12	\$68.76				
20 X 24 X 1	\$3.88	12	\$46.56	20 X 24 X 1	\$3.96	12	\$47.52				
20 X 25 X 1	\$3.79	492	\$1,864.68	20 X 25 X 1	\$2.70	492	\$1,328.40				
20 X 25 X 2	\$4.86	7752	\$37,674.72	20 X 25 X 2	\$3.89	7752	\$30,155.28				
20 X 30 X 1	\$5.12	24	\$122.88	20 X 30 X 1	\$5.89	24	\$141.36				
20 X 30 X 2	\$7.29	156	\$1,137.24	20 X 30 X 2	\$7.64	156	\$1,191.84				
24 X 24 X 1	\$4.43	144	\$637.92	24 X 24 X 1	\$2.90	144	\$417.60				
24 X 24 X 2	\$5.49	228	\$1,251.72	24 X 24 X 2	\$4.18	228	\$953.04				
25 X 25 X 1	\$4.75	12	\$57.00	25 X 25 X 1	\$4.36	12	\$52.32				
30 X 35 X 1	\$14.00	24	\$336.00	30 X 35 X 1	\$11.33	24	\$271.92				
Est. Annual Total			\$343,673.28	Est. Annual Total			\$301,686.60				

United Independent School District
District Wide HVAC Filters
RFP 005-2011

Type 2 Filter			Inesco Distributin			Type 2 Filter			Motion Industries		
Size in Inches	Unit Price	Est. Annual	Annual Price	Size in Inches	Unit Price	Est. Annual	Annual Price				
8 x 16 x 1	\$3.05	12	\$36.60	8 x 16 x 1	\$3.97	12	\$47.64				
12 X 12 X 1	\$3.25	12	\$39.00	12 X 12 X 1	\$2.47	12	\$29.64				
12 X 24 X 1	\$2.95	84	\$247.80	12 X 24 X 1	\$2.99	84	\$251.16				
12 X 30 X 1	\$4.49	84	\$377.16	12 X 30 X 1	\$5.01	84	\$420.84				
13 X 19 X 1	\$4.49	24	\$107.76	13 X 19 X 1	\$4.35	24	\$104.40				
14 X 24 X 1	\$2.95	36	\$106.20	14 X 24 X 1	\$2.89	36	\$104.04				
14 X 25 X 1	\$2.85	180	\$513.00	14 X 25 X 1	\$3.36	180	\$604.80				
15 X 20 X 1	\$2.85	516	\$1,470.60	15 X 20 X 1	\$3.09	516	\$1,594.44				
15 X 20 X 2	\$3.15	18540	\$58,401.00	15 X 20 X 2	\$3.23	18540	\$59,884.20				
15-7/8 X 15-7/8 X 2	\$5.29	48	\$253.92	15-7/8 X 15-7/8 X 2	\$5.20	48	\$249.60				
16 X 20 X 1	\$2.57	696	\$1,788.72	16 X 20 X 1	\$2.69	696	\$1,872.24				
16 X 20 X 2	\$3.15	17664	\$55,641.60	16 X 20 X 2	\$2.93	17664	\$51,755.52				
16 X 22 X 2	\$5.29	96	\$507.84	16 X 22 X 2	\$6.29	96	\$603.84				
16 X 24 X 1	\$3.36	12	\$40.32	16 X 24 X 1	\$2.89	12	\$34.68				
16 X 24 X 2	\$3.69	384	\$1,416.96	16 X 24 X 2	\$3.41	384	\$1,309.44				
16 X 25 X 1	\$2.81	9960	\$27,987.60	16 X 25 X 1	\$3.04	9960	\$30,278.40				
16 X 25 X 2	\$3.69	14196	\$52,383.24	16 X 25 X 2	\$3.31	14196	\$46,988.76				
16 X 30 X 1	\$5.55	3444	\$19,114.20	16 X 30 X 1	\$5.51	3444	\$18,976.44				
16 X 31 X 1	\$5.55	24	\$133.20	16 X 31 X 1	\$5.51	24	\$132.24				
17 X 21½ X 1	\$5.55	12	\$66.60	17 X 21½ X 1	\$5.01	12	\$60.12				
18 X 18 X 1	\$5.55	24	\$133.20	18 X 18 X 1	\$5.01	24	\$120.24				
18 X 25 X 1	\$3.19	48	\$153.12	18 X 25 X 1	\$5.01	48	\$240.48				
18 X 30 X 1	\$5.55	288	\$1,598.40	18 X 30 X 1	\$5.88	288	\$1,693.44				
20 X 20 X 1	\$2.85	3456	\$9,849.60	20 X 20 X 1	\$3.07	3456	\$10,609.92				
20 X 20 X 2	\$3.69	7752	\$28,604.88	20 X 20 X 2	\$3.31	7752	\$25,659.12				
20 X 21½ X 1	\$5.55	312	\$1,731.60	20 X 21½ X 1	\$5.51	312	\$1,719.12				
20 X 22 X 1	\$5.55	12	\$66.60	20 X 22 X 1	\$5.51	12	\$66.12				
20 X 24 X 1	\$3.16	12	\$37.92	20 X 24 X 1	\$3.37	12	\$40.44				
20 X 25 X 1	\$3.16	492	\$1,554.72	20 X 25 X 1	\$3.31	492	\$1,628.52				
20 X 25 X 2	\$4.00	7752	\$31,008.00	20 X 25 X 2	\$3.80	7752	\$29,457.60				
20 X 30 X 1	\$5.55	24	\$133.20	20 X 30 X 1	\$3.53	24	\$84.72				
20 X 30 X 2	\$5.79	156	\$903.24	20 X 30 X 2	\$5.51	156	\$859.56				
24 X 24 X 1	\$3.45	144	\$496.80	24 X 24 X 1	\$3.64	144	\$524.16				
24 X 24 X 2	\$3.50	228	\$798.00	24 X 24 X 2	\$4.03	228	\$918.84				
25 X 25 X 1	\$3.95	12	\$47.40	25 X 25 X 1	\$4.32	12	\$51.84				
30 X 35 X 1	\$7.39	24	\$177.36	30 X 35 X 1	\$11.76	24	\$282.24				
Est. Annual Total			\$297,927.36	Est. Annual Total			\$289,258.80				

United Independent School District
District Wide HVAC Filters
RFP 005-2011

Type 2 Filter	R & M Refrigeration Supply	Est.	Annual Price	Type 2 Filter	Sexuar dba Interline Brands	Est.	Annual Price
Size in Inches	Unit Price	Annual	Annual Price	Size in Inches	Unit Price	Annual	Annual Price
8 x 16 x 1	\$3.71	12	\$44.52	8 x 16 x 1	\$3.52	12	\$42.24
12 X 12 X 1	\$2.89	12	\$34.68	12 X 12 X 1	\$3.52	12	\$42.24
12 X 24 X 1	\$2.19	84	\$183.96	12 X 24 X 1	\$3.87	84	\$325.08
12 X 30 X 1	\$5.19	84	\$435.96	12 X 30 X 1	\$3.69	84	\$309.96
13 X 19 X 1	\$4.95	24	\$118.80	13 X 19 X 1	\$3.62	24	\$86.88
14 X 24 X 1	\$3.45	36	\$124.20	14 X 24 X 1	\$3.69	36	\$132.84
14 X 25 X 1	\$2.59	180	\$466.20	14 X 25 X 1	\$4.06	180	\$730.80
15 X 20 X 1	\$2.51	516	\$1,295.16	15 X 20 X 1	\$3.87	516	\$1,996.92
15 X 20 X 2	\$3.20	18540	\$59,328.00	15 X 20 X 2	\$3.89	18540	\$72,120.60
15-7/8 X 15-7/8 X 2	\$5.46	48	\$262.08	15-7/8 X 15-7/8 X 2	\$5.72	48	\$274.56
16 X 20 X 1	\$2.16	696	\$1,503.36	16 X 20 X 1	\$3.81	696	\$2,651.76
16 X 20 X 2	\$2.66	17664	\$46,986.24	16 X 20 X 2	\$3.81	17664	\$67,299.84
16 X 22 X 2	\$6.50	96	\$624.00	16 X 22 X 2	\$5.71	96	\$548.16
16 X 24 X 1	\$4.09	12	\$49.08	16 X 24 X 1	\$3.69	12	\$44.28
16 X 24 X 2	\$4.17	384	\$1,601.28	16 X 24 X 2	\$4.09	384	\$1,570.56
16 X 25 X 1	\$2.33	9960	\$23,206.80	16 X 25 X 1	\$3.96	9960	\$39,441.60
16 X 25 X 2	\$2.96	14196	\$42,020.16	16 X 25 X 2	\$4.25	14196	\$60,333.00
16 X 30 X 1	\$3.11	3444	\$10,710.84	16 X 30 X 1	\$3.67	3444	\$12,639.48
16 X 31 X 1	\$6.95	24	\$166.80	16 X 31 X 1	\$6.49	24	\$155.76
17 X 21½ X 1	\$6.24	12	\$74.88	17 X 21½ X 1	\$3.69	12	\$44.28
18 X 18 X 1	\$4.74	24	\$113.76	18 X 18 X 1	\$3.69	24	\$88.56
18 X 25 X 1	\$2.88	48	\$138.24	18 X 25 X 1	\$4.13	48	\$198.24
18 X 30 X 1	\$5.80	288	\$1,670.40	18 X 30 X 1	\$3.76	288	\$1,082.88
20 X 20 X 1	\$2.33	3456	\$8,052.48	20 X 20 X 1	\$4.07	3456	\$14,065.92
20 X 20 X 2	\$3.00	7752	\$23,256.00	20 X 20 X 2	\$4.24	7752	\$32,868.48
20 X 21½ X 1	\$6.04	312	\$1,884.48	20 X 21½ X 1	\$3.67	312	\$1,145.04
20 X 22 X 1	\$4.74	12	\$56.88	20 X 22 X 1	\$3.67	12	\$44.04
20 X 24 X 1	\$2.78	12	\$33.36	20 X 24 X 1	\$4.25	12	\$51.00
20 X 25 X 1	\$2.63	492	\$1,293.96	20 X 25 X 1	\$4.19	492	\$2,061.48
20 X 25 X 2	\$3.96	7752	\$30,697.92	20 X 25 X 2	\$4.74	7752	\$36,744.48
20 X 30 X 1	\$2.97	24	\$71.28	20 X 30 X 1	\$4.30	24	\$103.20
20 X 30 X 2	\$4.00	156	\$624.00	20 X 30 X 2	\$7.17	156	\$1,118.52
24 X 24 X 1	\$2.93	144	\$421.92	24 X 24 X 1	\$4.58	144	\$659.52
24 X 24 X 2	\$3.76	228	\$857.28	24 X 24 X 2	\$4.78	228	\$1,089.84
25 X 25 X 1	\$3.38	12	\$40.56	25 X 25 X 1	\$4.97	12	\$59.64
30 X 35 X 1	\$11.44	24	\$274.56	30 X 35 X 1	\$6.95	24	\$166.80
	Est. Annual Total		\$258,724.08		Est. Annual Total		\$352,338.48

United Independent School District
District Wide HVAC Filters
RFP 005-2011

Type 2 Filter Size in Inches	Unit Price	Belco Supply	
		Est. Annual	Annual Price
8 x 16 x 1	\$3.50	12	\$42.00
12 X 12 X 1	\$2.08	12	\$24.96
12 X 24 X 1	\$2.17	84	\$182.28
12 X 30 X 1	\$4.78	84	\$401.52
13 X 19 X 1	\$3.58	24	\$85.92
14 X 24 X 1	\$2.84	36	\$102.24
14 X 25 X 1	\$2.27	180	\$408.60
15 X 20 X 1	\$2.18	516	\$1,124.88
15 X 20 X 2	\$2.42	18540	\$44,866.80
15-7/8 X 15-7/8 X 2	\$4.13	48	\$198.24
16 X 20 X 1	\$1.90	696	\$1,322.40
16 X 20 X 2	\$2.11	17664	\$37,271.04
16 X 22 X 2	\$5.58	96	\$535.68
16 X 24 X 1	\$2.00	12	\$24.00
16 X 24 X 2	\$2.94	384	\$1,128.96
16 X 25 X 1	\$2.10	9960	\$20,916.00
16 X 25 X 2	\$2.40	14196	\$34,070.40
16 X 30 X 1	\$4.96	3444	\$17,082.24
16 X 31 X 1	\$4.96	24	\$119.04
17 X 21½ X 1	\$4.78	12	\$57.36
18 X 18 X 1	\$2.80	24	\$67.20
18 X 25 X 1	\$3.01	48	\$144.48
18 X 30 X 1	\$5.04	288	\$1,451.52
20 X 20 X 1	\$2.12	3456	\$7,326.72
20 X 20 X 2	\$2.41	7752	\$18,682.32
20 X 21½ X 1	\$7.19	312	\$2,243.28
20 X 22 X 1	\$7.19	12	\$86.28
20 X 24 X 1	\$3.11	12	\$37.32
20 X 25 X 1	\$2.39	492	\$1,175.88
20 X 25 X 2	\$2.77	7752	\$21,473.04
20 X 30 X 1	\$3.59	24	\$86.16
20 X 30 X 2	\$4.31	156	\$672.36
24 X 24 X 1	\$2.80	144	\$403.20
24 X 24 X 2	\$3.06	228	\$697.68
25 X 25 X 1	\$3.36	12	\$40.32
30 X 35 X 1	\$10.99	24	\$263.76
Est. Annual Total			\$214,816.08