RFP 004-2009 Automotive Lifts and Equipment for United High School Auto Shop
Revised Tabulation

Vendors

Affordable Auto Equipment Inc.

Arnold Oil Company

Carl Turner Equipment

Myers Tire Supply

Midwest Technology

PSI

Northstar Equipment

Description

Est. Qty

Price

Extension

Model
Proposed

Price

Extension

Model
Proposed

Price

Extension

Model
Proposed

Price

Extension

Model
Proposed

Price

Extension

Model
Proposed

Price

Extension

Model
Proposed

Price

Extension

Model
Proposed

-

4-Post Complete
True Alignment
w/8LBs Center
Rolling Jack Ref:
Hunter L421

$20,592.00

$20,592.00

As Specified

$18,687.00

$18,687.00

As Specified

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$18,762.00

$18,762.00

Hunter L421-
43

$17,550.00

$17,550.00

As Specified

~

4-Post Service Lift
with 2 Center
Sliding Jack 8 Lbs
(#5100077)

Ref: Rotary
SMO14L

$7,525.00

$7,525.00

HD-14X Blue

$10,812.00

$10,812.00

As Specified

$11,552.00

$11,552.00

As Specified

$11,912.00

$11,912.00

As Specified

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$6,760.28

$6,760.28

As Specified

$7,900.00

$7,900.00

Challenger

w

2-Post Surface
Mount
Symmetrical Lift
Ref: Rotary
SPO12

$5,145.00

$5,145.00

XPR-12C
Blue

$5,885.00

$5,885.00

As Specified

$6,345.00

$6,345.00

As Specified

$6,267.00

$6,267.00

As Specified

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$6,868.00

$6,868.00

As Specified

$5,500.00

$5,500.00

Challenger

IS

2-Post Surface
Mount
'Symmetrical Lift
Ref: Rotary
SPO10

$3,245.00

$3,245.00

XPR-10CX
Blue

$4,040.00

$4,040.00

As Specified

$4,547.00

$4,547.00

As Specified

$3,912.00

$3,912.00

As Specified

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$4,075.00

$4,075.00

As Specified

$3,395.00

$3,395.00

Challenger

@

2-Post Surface
Mount
Asymmetrical Lift
Ref: Rotary
SPOAL0

$3,250.00

$3,250.00

XPR-10ACX
Blue

$4,040.00

$4,040.00

As Specified

$4,547.00

$4,547.00

As Specified

$3,912.00

$3,912.00

As Specified

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$4,075.00

$4,075.00

As Specified

$3,395.00

$3,395.00

Challenger

Stick Welding
Package Ref:
Miller Dialarc 250
AC/DC

$2,049.00

$6,147.00

As Specified

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1,338.62

$4,015.86

Miller 907-017

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1,825.00

$5,475.00

As Specified

6/

>

Running Gear for
stick welder Ref:
041-580

$330.00

$990.00

As Specified

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$257.40

$772.20

As Specified

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$355.00

$1,065.00

As Specified

6!

@

Accesory Kit for
Welder

NO Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Industrial Duty
Avrasive Blast
Cabinet

Ref: Dee Blast
Model 50

$1,989.00

$1,989.00

[ALC40413

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$3,744.00

$3,744.00

Dee Blast
DB050

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$4,070.00

$4,070.00

As Specified

Coolant System
Service Center
Ref: Viper Coolant
System Service
Center
VPRAF325

$1,945.00

$1,945.00

As Specified

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1,925.00

$1,925.00

As Specified

$2,150.00

$2,150.00

GloPyn
Rawac3

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$1,525.00

$1,525.00

Robinaircool
tech 75700

$2,100.00

$2,100.00

As Specified

Disc Drum Lathe
Package

Ref: Hunter
BL505D-AB & 20-
1667-1
QuickChuck Level
I

$7,449.00

$7,449.00

As Specified

$6,580.00

$6,580.00

As Specified

$5,690.00

$5,690.00

Ammco Lathe
Pack

$5,728.00

$5,728.00

Ammco
4000B-SP
wiKit

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$6,843.43

$6,843.43

Hunter
BL505D-
AB&20-1667-
1

$6,400.00

$6,400.00

As Specified

1

)

Portable Welder
Ref:Hobart
Handler 125

$711.00

$711.00

FPW 1444-
0308

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$450.00

$450.00

As Specified

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$280.14

$280.14

As Specified

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$380.00

$380.00

As Specified

1

=

Hand Held
Diagnostic
Machine for Scan,
Gas, and Scope
with Heavy Duty
Quandacd it and

$7,415.00

$7,415.00

As Specified

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

DNMS

DNMS

DNMS

$6,848.00

$6,848.00

oTC-
3780,3864,34
21-94,3421-
54

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$8,788.75

$8,788.75

As Specified

$5,990.00

$5,990.00

As Specified

12

Upgrade Software
Alignment Kit

Ref: Hunter #20-
2177-1

$4,333.00

$4,333.00

As Specified

$3,750.00

$3,750.00

As Specified

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$3,770.00

$3,770.00

As Specified

$3,600.00

$3,600.00

As Specified

13

Wall Mounts
Sensor Camera
Kit

Ref: Hunter #H-
S401WM

$11,600.00

$11,600.00

As Specified

$10,271.00

$10,271.00

As Specified

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$10,407.00

$10,407.00

As Specified

$10,100.00

$10,100.00

As Specified

* One Vendor submitted a “No Bid on the items listed above




