I. CLASSROOM FURNITURE

RFP 001-2009
Furniture & Equipment for United High School

VENDOR INDECO J.R. Inc. Medco Rocky Duron & Associates Texas Furniture Source School Specialty A.Bargas & Associates Commercial Concepts Espacios, LLC. South Texas School Furniture
ITEM ITEM EST- Unit Price Extension Total Unit Price Extension Unit Price | Extension | Unit Price Extension Total Unit Price Extension Total Unit Price Extension Total Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Total Unit Price Extension Unit Price EXT. TOTAL
w.Inst. w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. w.Inst. w.Inst. w.Inst. Total w. Inst. w. Inst. Total w. Inst.
NO. DESCRIPTION QTy

1 |[Teacher's Desk Hon 88251 187 252.64 |S 4724368 | 26651 S 49,837.37] NOBid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid 253.65 | $ 47,432.55| NOBid No Bid NO Bid NO Bid DNMR DNMR 27631 | $ 51,669.97 519.00| $ 97,053.00
3 |Teacher's Chair Hon 5901 187 66.69 S 12,471.03 73.70 $ 13,781.90 | NOBid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid 68.69 $ 12,845.03] NO Bid No Bid NO Bid NO Bid DNMR DNMR 79.84 $  14,930.08 88.00| $ 16,456.00
4 [Computer Desk ABC CF06 72x30 2 317.29 |$ 634.58 | 404.15 |$ 808.30 | NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid No Bid NO Bid NO Bid DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 368.00( $ 736.00
5 |Computer Desk ABC CF04 48x30 105 286.78 [S 30,111.90 | 269.96 [$ 28,345.80] NOBid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid No Bid NO Bid NO Bid DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 286.00| $ 30,030.00
6 [File Cabinet-letter Hon 314P 187 12397 |S$ 23,18239] 127.11 |$ 23,769.57 | NOBid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid 12598 | $ 23,558.26 | NOBid No Bid NO Bid NO Bid DNMR DNMR 148.68 | $ 27,803.16 200.00| $ 37,400.00
7 |Storage Cabinet Hon SC2472 20 267.84 |$ 5,356.80 ] 279.10 [$ 5582.00] NOBid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid 267.85 | S 5,357.00 | NOBid No Bid NO Bid NO Bid DNMR DNMR 264.99 | $ 5,299.80 357.00| $ 7,140.00
8 |Bookcase Basyx 3726T 187 190.50 (S 35623.50 ] 203.57 |$ 38,067.59 | NOBid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid 191.98 | $ 35,900.26 | NO Bid No Bid NO Bid NO Bid DNMR DNMR 190.84 | $ 35,687.08 218.00( $ 40,766.00
9 |Student Combo Virco 3400BR 3195 90.00 S 287,550.00 | 108.75 |$ 347,456.25] NO Bid NO Bid 152.16 | S 486,151.20 | NO Bid NO Bid 100.11 | $ 319,851.45| 11098 |$ 354,581.10 ] DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 90.00( $ 287,550.00
10 |ADA Student Desk scholarcraft 210 60 70.05 $ 4,203.00 | 114.66 |S 6,879.60 ] NOBid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid 98.28 $ 5,896.80 | DNMS DNMS DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 73.00( $ 4,380.00
11 |Student Chairs 18" Virco 3018 1500 42.61 $  63,915.00 48.18 $ 72,270.00 | NOBid NO Bid 71.50 $ 107,250.00 | NO Bid NO Bid 47.98 $  71,970.00 53.03 $ 79,545.00 | DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 39.00| $ 58,500.00
12 |Stool ABC 0802 692 47.46 S 3284232 50.08 $ 34,655.36 | DNMS DNMS NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid DNMS DNMS 43.85 $ 30,344.20 | DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 36.00| $ 24,912.00
13 |Study Carrels Virco 8724365C 11 22338 |$ 2,457.18 ] 239.22 [$ 2,631.42] NOBid NO Bid 454.36 | $ 4,997.96 | NO Bid NO Bid 216.59 | $ 2,382.49 | NO Bid NO Bid DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 265.00| $ 2,915.00

DNMR = Does not meet requirements
DNMS = Does not meet specifications

All or None Pricing
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Il. Miscellaneous Furniture

RFP 001-2009
Furniture & Equipment for United High School

VENDOR J.R. Inc. Gaylord Bros. Audio Visual Aids Rocky Duron & Associatg Texas Furniture Source School Specialty Commercial Concepts Espacios, LLC. South Texas School Furniture
ITEM ITEM EST. | Unit Price | Extension [QUnit Price| Extension JUnitPrice| Extension [JUnitPrice| Extension | Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price | Extension JUnit Price | Extension [ Unit Price Extension
NO. DESCRIPTION QTY | w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total
1 |Overhead Projector Cart Bretford A2642 | 2 12944 | S 25888 $185.43 | S 370.86 | $ 122.00 | S 244.00 ] NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid $ 169.14 | S 338.28 DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid $ 107.00 | $ 214.00
2 |AV Presentation Cart Balt 89842 167 | 223.83 | $37,380.28 | NO Bid No Bid $179.00 | $29,893.00 | $284.29 | $ 47,477.00 | NO Bid NO Bid $ 18177 | $ 30,355.59 | DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid $ 203.00 | $ 33,901.00
3 |Folding Chairs Hon FCO1 1000 16.25 $16,248.60 | S 24.88 | $24,882.50 | NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid $ 1565|$ 1565000 S 16.48 | S 16,480.00 DNMR DNMR $ 16.87 | $16,870.00 | $ 17.00 | $ 17,000.00
4 |Chair Truck Virco HCT60472 12 354.96 | S 4,259.52 | $349.69 | $ 4,196.28 | NO Bid NO Bid $495.00 | $ 5,940.00 NO Bid NO Bid DNMS DNMS DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid $ 500.00 | $ 6,000.00

DNMR = Does not meet requirements

All or none pricing
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IV. Administration Furniture

RFP 001-2009
Furniture & Equipment for United High School

VENDOR J.R. Inc. Rocky Duron & Associates Texas Furniture Source School Specialty Commercial Concepts Espacios, LLC. South Texas School Furniture

ITEM ITEM EST. Unit Price ) Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price ) Unit Price .

w.Inst. Extension Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Extension Total w.Inst. Extension Total
NO. DESCRIPTION Qry

1 |Executive Desk 72" Hon 94271 1 666.31 S 666.31 NO Bid NO Bid 632.22 S 632.22 NO Bid No Bid 727.29 | $ 727.29) 727.29 | $ 727.29 | 810.00 | $ 810.00
2 |Executive Desk 66" Hon 94276 17 646.83 S 10,996.11 NO Bid NO Bid 615.54 S 10,464.18 NO Bid No Bid 707.91 | $ 12,034.47] 70791 |$ 12,034.47 | 788.00 |$ 13,396.00
3 |Executive Desk 60" Hon 94251 20 627.11 S 12,542.20 NO Bid NO Bid 595.72 S 11,914.40 NO Bid No Bid 686.06 | $ 13,721.20] 686.06 | S 13,721.20 | 764.00 |$ 15,280.00
4 |Bookcase Hon 1984 40 228.87 S 9,154.80 NO Bid NO Bid 215.65 S 8,626.00 NO Bid No Bid 134.82 [ $ 5,392.80] NOBid NO Bid 121.00 | $ 4,840.00
5 |Left/Right Desk w. Right/Left Return 5 919.09 S 4,595.45 NO Bid NO Bid 877.49 S 4,387.45 NO Bid No Bid 1005.18 | $  5,025.90 | 1005.18 | $ 5,025.90 | 1119.00 | $ 5,595.00
7 |Executive High Back Chair Hon 2091 1 166.34 S 166.34 NO Bid NO Bid 156.09 S 156.09 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR 162.2 S 162.20 | 202.00 | $ 202.00
8 |Managerial Mid Back Chair Hon 2092 | 61 158.90 S 9,692.90 NO Bid NO Bid 149.07 S 9,093.27 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR 15245 | $ 9,299.45] 193.00 |$ 11,773.00
9 [Secretarial Chairs Hon 7701 18 105.32 S 1,895.76 NO Bid NO Bid 99.03 S 1,782.54 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR 107.88 | $ 1,941.84) 127.00 | $ 2,286.00
10 [Guest Chairs Hon 2093 70 129.13 S 9,039.10 NO Bid NO Bid 120.99 S 8,469.30 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR 124.8 S 8,736.00| 156.00 |$ 10,920.00
11 |Lateral File Hon 94223 1 383.27 S 383.27 NO Bid NO Bid 364.97 S 364.97 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR 43228 | $ 432.28 ] 466.00 | $ 466.00
12A [Conference Table 144" Hongo614/81227 1 517.71 S 517.71 NO Bid NO Bid 489.61 S 489.61 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 2288.00 | $ 2,288.00
12B [Conference Table 120" Hon 80613/81226 | 2 481.62 S 963.24 NO Bid NO Bid 455.20 S 910.40 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 2045.00 | $ 4,090.00
13 [Conference Table 72" Hon 1 342.59 S 342.59 NO Bid NO Bid 319.43 S 319.43 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 1058.00 | $ 1,058.00
14 |Round Tables Virco MT48R 14 431.39 S 6,039.46 703.71 $  9,852.00 NO Bid No Bid NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 485.00 | $ 6,790.00
15 |Stacking Chairs Virco 8925 84 39.71 S 3,335.64 46.50 S 3,906.00 NO Bid No Bid 37.68 3,165.12 | DNMR DNMR NO Bid NO Bid 55.00 S 4,620.00
16 |Rectangular Activity Table Hon Esr3s72L | 18 161.10 S 2,899.80 NO Bid NO Bid 153.85 S 2,769.30 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR 173.82 | $ 3,128.76 | 183.00 | $ 3,294.00
17 [Reception Chairs Hon 2111 17 169.69 S 2,884.73 NO Bid NO Bid 159.25 S 2,707.25 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR 14858 | $ 2,525.86 ] 183.00 | $ 3,111.00
18 |File Cabinet-Legal Hon 314 65 145.23 S 9,439.95 NO Bid NO Bid 144.32 S 9,380.80 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR 14868 | $ 9,664.20 | 229.00 |$ 14,885.00
19 [Fire Proof File Cabinet-Legal Hon54cP | 7 1436.59 |$  10,056.13 NO Bid NO Bid 130826 | $  9,157.82 NO Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR 1184.35 | $ 8,290.45 | 1409.00 | $ 9,863.00

DNMR = Does not meet requirements

All or none pricing

Page 3 of 9




V. Cafeteria Furniture

RFP 001-2009
Furniture & Equipment for United High School

VENDOR J.R. Inc. School Specialty South Texas School Furniture
ITEM ITEM EST. Unit Price . Unit Price . Unit Price Extension
y— Extension Total wInst. Extension Total wInst. Total
NO. DESCRIPTION Qry
1 [Cafeteria Table KIUF126PRCHPY 75 1281.82( S  96,136.50 DNMS DNMS DNMS DNMS
2 |ADA Cafeteria Table kiwAUF126PRCHPY 3 1224.40( $ 3,673.20 DNMS DNMS DNMS DNMS
3 |Picnic Table Wecoat TSRC4-4SM 23 863.39] $ 19,857.97 867.04 S 19,941.92 805.00 S 18,515.00
4 |ADA Picnic Table 1 663.80| S 663.80 697.44 S 697.44 620.00 S 620.00

DNMS = Does not meet specifications
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VI. Nurses Equipment

RFP 001-2009

Furniture & Equipment for United High School

VENDOR J.R. Inc. Medco A.Bargas & Associates School Specialty South Texas School Furniture
ITEM ITEM EST. o . . . . . o . . .
Unit Price Extension Unit Price | Extension | Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total
NO. DESCRIPTION Qry
1 First Aid Couch Royal 5 353.86| S 1,769.30 318.00( $ 1,590.00 S 2,068.55 288.98| S 1,444.90 317.00( $ 1,585.00
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VII. Library Furniture

RFP 001-2009
Furniture & Equipment for United High School

VENDOR J.R. Inc. South Texas School Furniture | Texas Furniture Source Commercial Concepts Espacios, LLC.
ITEM ITEM EST. Unit Price . Unit Price . Unit Price | Extension Unit Price Extension | Unit Price| Extension
w.Inst. Extension Total w.lInst. Extension Total w.lInst. Total w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total
NO. DESCRIPTION Qry
1 |[Double Face Mobile Book Shelving 12 804.60| S 9,655.20 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2A |Double & Single Face Shelving w/backs| 9 1073.72 S 9,663.48 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2B |Double & Single Face Shelving w/backs| 51 942.64( S  48,074.64 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid DNMR DNMR No Bid No Bid
2C |Double & Single Face Shelving w/backs| 6 668.88| S 4,013.28 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2D |Double & Single Face Shelving w/backs| 11 610.88| S 6,719.68 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2E |Double & Single Face Shelving w/backs| 2 1026.16| S 2,052.32 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2F |Double & Single Face Shelving w/backs| 2 968.16| S 1,936.32 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2G |Double & Single Face Shelving w/backs| 1 808.08| S 808.08 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2H |Double & Single Face Shelving w/backs| 1 246.64| S 246.64 | DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 [Wood Student Chair 18" 180 118.68[ S  21,362.40 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4A [Rectangular Reading Table 36x72x29 29 503.00{ S 14,587.00 ] DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4B [Rectangular Reading Table 36x72x32 2 503.00| $ 1,006.00 | DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4C |Rectangular Reading Table 18x72x29 2 503.00| S 1,006.00 | DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 |]Atlas Case 1 990.20| $ 990.20 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6A |Computer Tables 30x30x29 Option A 24 601.60/ S 14,438.40 ] DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6B |Computer Tables ADA 30X30x32 OptA| 1 601.60| S 601.60 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7A |Computer Tables 30x30x29 Option B 4 775.60| S 3,102.40 ] DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7B |Computer Tables ADA 30x30x32 Opt B 1 775.60| S 775.60 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7C |Computer Tables 30x60x29 10 775.60| S 7,756.00 ] DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8A |Reading Area Seating Single Seat 6 319.37| S 1,916.22 367.00 S 2,202.00] 285.45 |$ 1,712.70 No Bid No Bid 361.98 $2,171.88
8B |Reading Area Seating Two Seat 2 558.69| S 1,117.38 | 642.00 | $ 1,284.00 | 501.05 |$ 1,002.10 No Bid No Bid 694.78 | $1,389.56
9A |Reading Area Tables Hon 80191 1 142.10( $ 142.10 160.00 S 160.00 133.78 | $ 133.78 No Bid No Bid 17398 | S 173.98
9B |Reading Area Tables Hon 80192 2 123.27( $ 246.54 ] 138.00 | S 276.00] 115.83 [ S 231.66 No Bid No Bid 155.31 | $ 310.62
10 |Book Truck 3 255.71| S 767.13 | 555.00 S 1,665.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 |Task Chairs 2 80.77| S 161.54 96.00 S 192.00 76.36 S 152.72 No Bid No Bid 86.23 S 172.46
12A [Circulation Desk-Triangular corner 2 486.76| S 973.52 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12B [Circulation -Free Standing Book Return| 1 627.12| S 627.12 | DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12C [Circulation-Depressible Book Truck 1 909.00| $ 909.00 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12E |Circulation-Hinged door shelving 2 841.72| S 1,683.44 | DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12F |Circulation-Open shelving unit 1 678.16| S 678.16 | DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12G |Circulation-Drawer&Shelve Unit 1 881.16| S 881.16 | DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12H |Circulation-Free Standing Desk 1 729.20( S 729.20 DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12| (Circulation-Charging Desk 1 1244.24| S 1,244.24 | DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

DNMR = Does not meet requirements
DNMS = Does not meet specifications
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RFP 001-2009

Furniture & Equipment for United High School
VIIl. Magnet Furniture

VENDOR Tech Lab System
ITEM ITEM EST.| Unit Price Extension
NO. DESCRIPTION QTY| w.Inst. Total
1 [Heavy Duty Work Steel Table 16 | $1,558.75 | S 24,940.00
Portable Drawing Boards 50 No Bid No Bid
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IX. Art & Graphic Furniture

RFP 001-2009
Furniture & Equipment for United High School

VENDOR J.R. Inc. Gaylord Bros. School Specialty
ITEM ITEM EST. o . . . o .
Unit Price| Extension [Unit Price| Extension | Unit Price| Extension
w.lInst. Total w.Inst. Total w.lInst. Total
NO. DESCRIPTION Qry
1 |Drafting Tables Fleetwood 44.633( 116 | 321.56 | $37,301.15| No Bid No Bid 459.09 | $ 53,254.44
2 |Art Cabinet Smith System 09450 4 364.72 | S 1,458.88 ( No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 |Art Drying Rack Bailey Ceramic Suj 16 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 306.82 | S 4,909.12
4 |All Around Cart Edsal Manufacturi| 4 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 88.07 S 352.28
5 |20-trays Tote cart with trays - Fleq 4 608.35 | S 2,433.40 | No Bid No Bid 647.73 | $ 2,590.92
6 |Pottery Model J Kick Wheel 3 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 |Steel Flat File Unit - Safco 4 2021.57 | $ 8,086.27 DNMS DNMS 1511.44 | S 6,045.76
8 |Free Standing Vinyl Floor Rack- M| 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 |30 Pocket Metal Magazine Racks-f 1 No Bid No Bid DNMS DNMS 22132 | S 221.32
10 |Wall Mount Paper Roll Dispenser-| 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

DNMS = Does not meet specifications
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RFP 001-2009

Furniture & Equipment for United High School

X. Sewing Furniture

VENDOR J.R. Inc. School Specialty
ITEM ITEM EST. Unit Price | Extension | Unit Price | Extension

NO. DESCRIPTION Qry w.Inst. Total w.Inst. Total

1 |Janome Sewing Machine 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 |Sewing Machine Flatbet Cabinet | 25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 |Serger/Threading Machine 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 |Cabinet with Large Tote Tray Cab| 5 1233.96 | $S6,169.81 | 1255.68 6278.4

5 |Demonstration Table with Mirror| 1 660.76 | S 660.76 DNMS DNMS

6 [Cooking Demonstrator 1 1175.16 | $1,175.16 DNMS DNMS
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