United Independent School District
Small Engine Parts & Supplies
RFP 015-2015

Vendor Neuhaus LCO
Description of Service by Equipment Type % D:,s:r(z:nt ) Labor Rate
“Snapper” Riding Mowers and Push Mowers. N/A
“John Deere” Ride on Mowers, Weed Eaters, and Leaf Blowers 0-10% | $30-$70
“SCAG” Tiger Ride on Mowers. N/A
“STIHT” Chainsaws 0-10% | $30-$70
“Echo” Weed Eaters, Power Pruners, and Leaf Blowers N/A
Other Equipment Parts and Supplies 0% | $30-$70
Response Time for Repairs No response
Warranty on Labor for Repairs 30 days
Warranty on Parts 30 days
Do you charge for inspecting equipment and or providing repair/parts estimates? No
example: by the hour, by machine, by estimate, etc.) Also, add whether you
Pickup / Delivery Charges (if any): No pick up
UNIT PROPOSED
DESCRIPTION |[EQUIPMENT / BRAND ITEM # UNIT OF MEASURE PRICE BRAND
Spark Plug ECCO Brush Cutter | 15901010630 EA No Bid
Air Filter ECCO Brush Cutter | A226000360 EA No Bid
Carburetor ECCO Brush Cutter | A021001170 EA No Bid
Grommet Fuel | ECCO Brush Cutter | 13211555930 EA No Bid
Fuel Filter ECCO Brush Cutter | 13120519830 EA No Bid
Vent Assembly | ECCO Brush Cutter | A356000030 EA No Bid
Cap Assembly | ECCO Brush Cutter 1310045530 EA No Bid
Drum Clutch ECCO Brush Cutter | A556000181 EA No Bid
AsC;::\:EIy ECCO Brush Cutter | P021002481 EA No Bid
Afézr;egly ECCO Brush Cutter | A051000190 EA No Bid
Spring Rewind | ECCO Brush Cutter | 17722006310 EA No Bid
Shield
Assembly, ECCO Brush Cutter | 69900023530 EA No Bid
Metal
Throttle Cable | ECCO Brush Cutter | U430000340 EA No Bid
Ignition Switch ECCO Brush Cutter | A440000240 EA No Bid
Hook Assembly ECCO Blower 30120005230 EA No Bid
Air Filter ECCO Blower 13030508360 EA No Bid
Carburetor ECCO Blower A021000810 EA No Bid
Spark Plg - ECCOBlower | 15901019380 EA No Bid
Thr()ltTIeMCOgrr::rol ECCO Blower 900109 EA No Bid
Carburetor ECCO Blower A021001870 EA No Bid
Air Filter ECCO Blower A226000410 EA No Bid
Fuel Pump ECCO Power Pruner | 12318139130 EA No Bid
Carburetor ECCO Power Pruner | A021001200 EA No Bid
Guide Bar ECCO Power Pruner | 12A0CD3744 EA No Bid
Chain ECCO Power Pruner M91UX44G EA No Bid
Tune Up Kit ECCO Power Pruner 90074 EA No Bid
Spark Plug John Deere Tractor M138938 EA $5.84
Qil Filter John Deere Tractor AM107423 EA $8.52
Fuel Filter John Deere Tractor AM116304 EA $6.37
Belt John Deere Tractor TCU16036 EA $120.36




DESCRIPTION | EQUIPMENT/ BRAND ITEM# UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PROPOSED
PRICE BRAND
Switch PTO John Deere Tractor AM118802 EA $31.78
V Belt John Deere Tractor TCU16026 EA $33.31
Spindle John Deere Tractor TCA51058 EA $202.76
Deflector John Deere Tractor M134305 EA $8.29
Blade John Deere Tractor TCU15882 EA $26.56
Cap John Deere Tractor M135582 EA $6.52
V Belt John Deere Tractor TCU16495 EA $65.61
Wheel Kit John Deere Tractor AM133602 EA $23.30
Guard John Deere Tractor AM128244 EA $87.43
IQ;;:ES&/ John Deere Tractor MIU11747 EA $13.89
Air Filter
Secondary John Deere Tractor MIU11748 EA $13.89
V Belt John Deere Tractor TCU26910 EA $104.29
Oil ECCO Weed-eater 10W40 EA No Bid
Weed-eaer | Eccoweed-eater | 21560070 EA No Bid
Wef_?r;zater ECCO Weed-eater 9302227 RLL $56.99 795711128159
Weed-ealer | £oco weed-eater | X472000050 EA No Bid
Head cap
Two Cycle Oil ECCO Weed-eater 7813198015 EA $2.59 795711346294




