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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

RFP 2014-084
District Wide Publications

I Love Laredo Laredo Morning Times Region IV
Vendors Adams Printing Co. RapidPrint r -
. . . . . . Option 2-See  [Option 3-
Option 1-See Notes Option 3-See Notes Option 1-See Notes | Option 2-See Notes | Option 3-See Notes Option 1-See Notes
Notes See Notes
Description ESL. . . . N : z i i i
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Brochures - Department Brochures, Program Brochures, etc.
*8.5x11
. )
*E“:: ;"0;0" Both Sides 500 $350.00 $200.00 NA No Bid NA NA $225.00 $1,192.00 NA NA
ull Blee
*Tri-Fold Brochure Format
*100 Ib Gloss Book with aqueous coating both sides
Flyers - For Departments and Programs, etc. 500 $230.00 $160.00 $210.00 $315.00
*8.5X11
* ; .
Full Color on Both Sides 1000 $280.00 $190.00 NA No Bid NA NA $240.00 $418.00 NA NA
*Full Bleed
*100Ib Gloss Book with aqueous coating both sides 5000 $800.00 $500.00 $750.00 $844.00
Flyers - For Departments and Programs, etc. 500 $520.00 $320.00 $550.00 $463.00
*11x17
:E“:: ;:"";0” Both Sides 1000 $640.00 $350.00 NA No Bid NA NA $600.00 $725.00 NA NA
ull Blee
. ) ) .
100Ib Gloss Book with aqueous coating both sides 5000 $1,180.00 $910.00 $1,350.00 $1,570.00
fzsgafds 500 $480.00 $85.00 $90.00 $123.00
X
N !
*E“:: g;"";m Both Sides 1000 $680.00 $100.00 NA No Bid NA NA $110.00 $211.00 NA NA
ull Blee
*15.]
15-Pt. Card Stock 2500 $880.00 $140.00 $175.00 $486.00
*Gloss Finish
::5;“"" 500 $90.00 $80.00 $85.00 $87.00
X
. )
Full Color on One Side 1000 $130.00 $95.00 NA No Bid NA NA $100.00 $144.00 NA NA
*Full Bleed
* -|
15-Pt. Card Stock 2500 $180.00 $135.00 $150.00 $323.00
*Gloss Finish
:o;tcards - Birthday 500 $110.00 $95.00 $120.00 $117.00
X
. :
*Eu:: g:)"’;"” Both Sides 1000 $150.00 $110.00 NA No Bid NA NA $130.00 $208.00 NA NA
ull Blee
*15.]
15-Pt. Card Stock 2500 $250.00 $200.00 $225.00 $483.00
*Gloss Finish
:075“3“’5 - Birthday 500 $110.00 $90.00 $115.00 $83.00
X
" )
*EU:: g|°'°;°n One Side 1000 $150.00 $105.00 NA No Bid NA NA $120.00 $142.00 NA NA
ui ee
*15.|
15-Pt. Fa.rd Stock 2500 $250.00 $195.00 $200.00 $322.00
*Gloss Finish
Postcards 500 $290.00 $205.00 $240.00 $225.00
*8.5x11
. )
*Eu:: ;)'0;0" Both Sides 1000 $350.00 $250.00 NA No Bid NA NA $280.00 $416.00 NA NA
ull Blee
*15.]
15-Pt. Card Stock 2500 $650.00 $360.00 $600.00 $1,007.00
*Gloss Finish




UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
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District Wide Publications

| Love Laredo Laredo Morning Times Region IV
Vendors Adams Printing Co. RapidPrint - -
. . N . . . Option 2-See Option 3-
Option 1-See Notes Option 3-See Notes Option 1-See Notes | Option 2-See Notes [ Option 3-See Notes Option 1-See Notes
Notes See Notes
- Est.
Description .
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Posters 250 No Bid $250.00 No bid $93.00
*11x17
*Full Color 500 $450.00 $305.00 NA No Bid NA NA $600.00 $174.00 NA NA
*Full Bleed
*
100# Gloss Baok 1000 $550.00 $350.00 $700.00 $337.00
*Gloss Finish
Posters 250 No Bid $400.00 $550.00 $810.00
*18x24
*Full Color .
500 $700.00 $525.00 NA No Bid NA NA $1,000.00 $842.00 NA NA
*Full Bleed
*
100# Gloss Book 1000 $950.00 $650.00 $1,750.00 $907.00
*Gloss Finish
Birthday Card
*8.5x11 500 $480.00 $205.00 $500.00 $307.00
* Full Color Front and Back NA NA
* Card Stock, Folded in half
* 67H# 1,000 $680.00 $250.00 NA No Bid NA NA $650.00 $599.00
2,500 $880.00 $360.00 $1,000.00 $1,474.00
NA NA
5,000 $1,180.00 $550.00 $1,600.00 $2,932.00
4 Pages - $980
Programs/Calendar - Employee Banquet, Administrative Calendar, etc. *(see notes) 4 Pages - $654 4 Pages - $654
*Cover and Back Cover 100# UV Coating 500 No Bid 8 Pages - $1,120 8 Pages- $935 8 Pages- $935
*60# or 80# Gloss Text 24 Pages - $1,800 24 Pages- $2,043 | 24 Pages- $2,043
*Saddle Stitched 36 Pages - $2,625 NA No Bid NA NA No bid 36 Pages- $2,875 | 36 Pages- $2,875 NA
*Full Color 4 Pages - $1,200 4 Pages-$1,785 4 Pages-$1,794
*Full Bleed 1000 No Bid 8 Pages - $1,300 8 Pages-$1,997 8 Pages-$2,005
*8.5x11 (8 3/8 x 10 7/8 is acceptable) 24 Pages - $2,500 24 Pages-$3,699 24 Pages-$3,757
*4 pages, 8 pages, 24 pages & 36 pages. Please Quote each. 36 Pages - $3,500 36 Pages-$5,101 | 36 Pages-$5,591
MagaZ|ne - PalrenF Connection (DISle'ICl will print this on average 3 4 Pages - No Bid 4 Pages - $2,150 4 Pages- $2,475 |4 pages-1,785 4 Pages-§7,097
times/year) District reserves the right to change frequency. **(see notes)
*Cover and Back Cover 100# UV Coating 8 Pages - $3,600 8 Pages - $3,675 8 Pages - $4,300 |8 Pages-$2,630 8 Pages-$9,398
*60#, 80# or 45# Gloss Text 20,000 No Bid 24 Pages - $8,200 No Bid 24 Pages - $8,300 | 24 Pages - $9,280 |24 Pages-$5,625 24 Pages-$13,290
32 Pages- No Bid 32 Pages- $9,500 32 Pages- $11,650 |32 Pages- $6,475 32 Pages-$14,763
36 Pages - $11,000 36 Pages - $10,200 | 36 Pages - $11,600 |36 Pages-$7,935 36 Pages-$15,050
44 Pages-$16,988 44 Pages-$10,850 | 44 Pages-$14,050 |44 Pages-$10,125 44 Pages- $19,069
*Saddle Stitched 48 Pages-$17,500 48 Pages-$10,600 | 48 Pages-$14,100 |48 Pages-$9,800 48 Pages- $19,469
*Full Color 4 Pages - No Bid No Bid 4 Pages - $2,250 4 Pages - $2,600 |4 Pages-$1,850 4 Pages-$8,528
*Full Bleed; collate, stitch, fold and trim 8 Pages - $3,900 No Bid 8 Pages - $3,850 8 Pages - $4,500 |8 Pages-$2,735 8 Pages- $10,055
*8.5x11 (8 3/8 x 10 7/8 is acceptable) 24 Pages - $8,850 No Bid 24 Pages - $8,700 | 24 Pages - $9,750 |24 Pages-$5,855 24 Pages-$13,914
32 Pages- No Bid No Bid 32 Pages-$9,950 32 Pages-$12,100 |32 Pages-$6,875 . 32 Pages-$15,645 X .
22,000 No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid
36 Pages - $13,500 $12,020.00 36 Pages -$10,650 | 36 Pages -$12,150 (36 Pages-$8,200 36 Pages- $15,853
44 Pages-$18,000 $13,925.00 44 Pages-$11,320 44 Pages-$14,250 |44 Pages-$10,200 44 Pages- $20,437
48 Pages-$19,000 $14,775.00 48 Pages-$11,075 48 Pages-$14,350 |48 Pages-$9,850 48 Pages- $20,891
*Number of Pages: 4 pages, 8 Pages, 24 Pages, 32 pages, 36 Pages.
4 Pages - No Bid 4 Pages - $2,350 4 Pages - $2,750 |4 Pages-$1,920 4 Pages-$9,048
8 Pages - $4,100 8 Pages - $4,025 8 Pages - $4,725 |8 Pages-$2,890 8 Pages-$10,698
24 Pages - $9,300 24 Pages - $9,150 | 24 Pages - $10,275 |24 Pages-$6,190 24 Pages-$14,627
24000 No Bid 32 Pages- No Bid No Bid 32 Pages- $10,550 | 32 Pages-$12,450 |32 Pages-$7,290 32 Pages-$16,547

*Design: Camera ready (PDF Document)

36 Pages - $14,400

44 Pages-$19,000

48 Pages-$20,025

36 Pages - $11,250

36 Pages -$12,850

36 Pages-$8,675

44 Pages-$11,975

44 Pages-$14,450

44 Pages-$10,300

48 Pages-$11,750

48 Pages-$14,550

48 Pages-$9,925

36 Pages-$16,690

44 Pages- $21,778

48 Pages- $22,395
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Vendors Adams Printing Co. RapidPrint Option 2-5ee _|option 3-
Option 1-See Notes Option 3-See Notes Option 1-See Notes | Option 2-See Notes [ Option 3-See Notes Option 1-See Notes
Notes See Notes
Description Est.
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Directory/Booklets - (Phone Directory, Bus Routes, etc.) 4 Pages-$56
*70Ib white paper (not glossy) 500 8 Pages-$124
12 Pages-$168
;Saddle Stitched No Bid No Bid NA No Bid NA NA No bid 58 Pages 5691 NA NA
Black Ink 4 Pages-$77
*11x17 Folded to 8.5x11 700 8 Pages-$170
12 Pages-$231
*4 pages, 8 pages, 12 pages and 58 pages (Final Size 8.5x11) 58 Pages-$963
Tickets - (Graduation... etc.)
*2.25x5.5
*
“Full Color 32,000 No Bid No Bid NA No Bid NA NA *$560 (per campus) $5,025.00 NA NA
1 side only
*Numbered
*15pt card stock
Tickets - ( Employee Banquet, etc.)
*4x5
*
Full Color 5,000 No Bid No Bid NA No Bid NA NA $350.00 No Bid NA NA
1 side only
*Numbered
*15pt card stock
Graduation Booklets 20 Pages - $3,000 20 Pages-$3764 20 Pages-$4,365
4,000 24 Pages -$3,225 24 Pages- $5041 24 Pages-$4,835
*5.5x8.5 28 Page - $3,450 28 Pages- $5233 28 Pages-$5,582
*Cover and Back Cover 100# UV Coating 20 Pages - $3,525 20 Pages-$4251 20 Pages-$5,037
6,000 24 Pages - $3,725 24 Pages-$5616 24 Pages-$5,500
*Full Color . 28 Page - $4,025 . 28 Pages-$5876 28 Pages-$6,312
*Full Bleed No Bid 20 Pages - $4,500 NA No Bid NA NA 20 Pages-$4558 20 Pages-$5,741 NA NA
8,000 24 Pages - $4,950 24 Pages-$5988 24 Pages-$6,162
*Inside Pages: 60# Gloss Text 28 Page -$5,150 28 Pages-$6342 28 Pages-$7,003
20 Pages - $4,900 20 Pages-$4932 20 Pages-$6,406
*Saddle Stitched 10,000 24 Pages -$5,000 24 Pages-$6420 24 Pages-$6,831
*20 Pages, 24 Pages, 28 Pages. 28 Page -$5,500 28 Pages-$6865 28 Pages-$7,777
Activity Book (2nd Graders)
*60lb White Paper (not Glossy)
*Spiral Binding
*Black Ink
*8.5x11 6,000 No Bid No Bid NA No Bid NA NA No Bid $26,909.00 NA NA
*100 Pages
*Print one sided, pages are different copy, plastic wire, covers are any
color so long as is it color, covers are printed (cover will be on
cardstock; color on white cardstock).
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Description ESL,
Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

Bookmarks
*2x6 $93.00 $135.00 $247.00
*15pt card stock 1,000 No Bid NA No Bid NA NA NA NA
*UV Coating
*Full Color on Both Sides $210.00 $295.00
*Full Bleed 5,000 $688.00
Newsprint Tabloid Publication Full color tabloid 12 Pages - $900 12 Pages- $2,000
Will provide camera ready layout 16 Pages - $1,600 16 Pages - $2,500
*Size: (11.25 x 11.5) approximately 5000 24 Pages -$1,800 NA 24 Pages - $3,000
* Printed area (10 x 10.5) ’ 28 Pages-$2,000 *28 Pages - $3,500
*No Saddle Stitched 32 Pages-$2,600 32 Pages-$4,000

36 Pages- $3,000 **36 Pages - $4,500

12 Pages-$1,500 12 Pages-$2,500
*12 pages, 16 pages, 24 pages, 28 pages, 32 pages, 36 pages. Please 16 Pages- $1,800 16 Pages-$3,000
Quote Each. . .

10,000 ) 24 Pages- $2,500 NA 24 Pages- $3,500 . X
No Bid 28 Pages-$3,500 *28 Pages- $4,000 NA NA No bid No Bid NA NA

32 Pages- $4,000 32 Pages- $4,500

36 Pages- $5,500 **36 Pages- $5,000

12 Pages-$2,500 12 Pages -$3,000

16 Pages - $3,000 16 Pages- $3,500

15,000 24 Pages - $6,000 NA 24 Pages-$4,000

28 Pages-$6,600

32 Pages - $7,000

36 Pages- $9,000

*28 Pages- $4,500

32 Pages-$5,000

36 Pages-$5,500

Notes:

*Bid only 60# for Programs/Calendars. **Bid only

on Option 1 60# and Option #3 for 45# certain
pages on Magazine-Parent Connection, $500 will

be charge after 52 pages since the increments are

every 4 pages.

Newsprint Tabloid= *On 28 pages.-6 pgs. Would run black and
white. ** On 36 pages.-10 pgs. Would run black and white.
Reference Magazine-Parent Connection: Options 1 is 60#,
Option 2 is 80# and Option 3 is 45# Gloss Text. For additional
pricing for increments of 4 pages is $200 per quantity on the
Magazine Parent Connection.

*32,000(8,000 per
campus/.07 ea=$560
per campus

Programs Quoted on 60# & 80 #. Quoted on the 60#
& 45# on Magazine Parent Connection.

One (1) Vendor withdrew his bid.

Please Note: On Magazine-Parent Connection Magazine the following stand for : Option 1-60# Gloss Text, Option 2- 80# Gloss Text and Option 3-45#

Gloss Text.




