United Independent School District
RFP 2014-076 Windows Tablets, Accessories and Services
Tabulation (BAFO)

Austin Mac Repair LLC

CDW Government LLC

Netsync Network Solutions

Sequel Data Systems

Est Brand & Unit Price for Brand & | Unit Price for Brand & Model Unit Price for Brand & | Unit Price for
Section 1 — Tablets Quam.:it Unit Price Total Model Replacement | Unit Price Total Model Replacement | Unit Price Total Pro ose: € Replacement | Unit Price Total Model Replacement
v Proposed Battery Proposed Battery rop Battery Proposed Battery
Windows Tablet HP Elite1000 Lenovo TP HP ElitePad HP Elite
682.99 657,036.38 119.99 581.40 559,306.80 633.24 609,176.88 90.95 588.25 565,896. X
64 GB 962 s $ G2 $ 3 $ 10 s $ 1000 64gb $ $ $ 50 Pad 1000 $90.00
lite1000 Since | d |
HP Elit L TP . HP EliteP HP Elit
Windows Tablet 128 GB 962 | $968.99 | $932,168.38 te $119.99 | $622.20 | $598,556.40 | MOV '"| productis | $716.88 | $689,638.56 freva $90.95 | $672.82 | $647,252.84 € 1 490,00
G2 10 t00 new 1000 128gh Pad 1000
Windows Hybrid Tablet 64 | - gg No Bid Saso00 | saazsssoo | e | e | Geras | srasesnsa |PPPOR40L e | sr0as | sermoonso |PPPR|
GB : e TP11le | determined : =R 64gb : S 410
Windows Hybrid Tablet 128 HP Pro X2 410 *Lenovo HP Pro X2 410 HP Pro X2
799.54 769,157.48 N/A 510.00 490,620.00 799.68 769,292.16 N/A 740.86 712,707.32
GB 962 3 $ 128gb / s $ TP 11e 3 $ 128gb / $ $ 410 N/A
Windows Convertible 962 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tablet 64 GB
L
Windows C tibl HP Elitebook 590780 | 5873,303.60 320\;0 5254.00 HP Elitebook HP
indows tonvertivle 962 |$1,324.06($1,273,745.72 'teboOK  ¢120.19 g $1,021.02 | $982,221.24 RO 12019 | $1,035.71| $996,353.02 | Revolve | $119.00
Tablet 128 GB Revolve 810 Lenovo Revolve 810
$1,122.00 |$1,079,364.00 Helix $209.00 810 G2
* Missing rear facing camera
section 2.7 Es". Unit Price Total Brand and Model Proposed | Unit Price Total Brand and Model Unit Price Total Brand and Model Proposed | Unit Price Total Brand and Model
Accessories Quantity Proposed Proposed
Expansion Jacket with
Jacket Battery for Windows 962 $144.99 | $139,480.38 Elite Pad P2A23UTHABA $40.80 $39,249.60 . $99.56 $95,776.72 HP $101.11 $97,267.82 HP H4J85AA
tablet Lenovo TP 10 Protective
Case - extra battery not
available
Productivi
roductivity Jacket for 962 | $246.99 | $237,604.38 HP $40.80 | $39,249.60 $153.47 | $147,638.14 HP $154.61 | $148,734.82 HP D6554AA
Windows Tablet
Lenovo KYB / Mouse for
Bluetooth Keyboard for 962 | $55.99 | $53,862.38 | HPSlimH4Q44AAHABA | $81.60 | $78,499.20 vo KYB / Mou $28.84 | $27,744.08 HP $2087 | $28,734.94 HP HAQ44AA
Windows Tablet TP
Slim Bluetooth Mouse 962 $27.99 $26,926.38 HP FJS92UTHABA $18.36 $17,662.32 Lenovo BT Mouse $16.48 $15,853.76 HP $17.49 $16,825.38 HP F3J92AA
3 Brand
Section 3 - Carts Est 3 Unit Price Total Brand and Model Proposed|] Unit Price Total rand and Model Unit Price Total Brand and Model Proposed | Unit Price Total Brand and Model
Quantity Proposed Proposed
$1,257.00 | $46,509.00 JAR M-D - 3030
Power Cart to house a Datamation Charge Cart
minimum of 30 Windows 37 $1,699.99| $62,899.63 Ergotron 24-302-085 $1,275.00 $47,175.00 32U $950.00 $35,150.00 Anthro TAB30VSSPW4
Tablets /Hybrid
$1,526.00 | $56,462.00 ERGOTRON 24-302-085
Section 4 — Warranty Qu::;ity Unit Price Total Notes Unit Price Total Notes Unit Price Total Notes Unit Price Total Notes
$153.00 $0.00 Think Pad 10 $151.84 $146,677.44 Elite Pad. $151.98 $146,812.68 Elite Pad.
3 year Accidental
Damage Protection 966 $97.97 $94,639.02 | Covers any windows tablet | $137.70 $0.00 Think Pad 11e $159.88 $154,444.08 Pro X2 $160.02 | $154,579.32 Pro X2
Warranty
$153.00 $0.00 Think Pad Yoga / Helix $77.50 $74,865.00 Revolve $75.24 $72,681.84 Revolve




