United Independent School District
Band Equipment
RFP 2014-065

VENDOR Alamo Music Center, Inc. Brooks Mays Music
BRAND /MODEL
ITEM MODEL/ DESCRIPTION EST uisb EXT. ETA PROPOSED; If left blank we will uisb EXT. ETA BRAND /MODEL PROPOSED;
QrTy PRICE assume you are bidding the specified PRICE If left blank we will assume you are bidding
model the specified model
1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 No Bid $1,650.00 $1,650.00 30 Days
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 $250.00 $1,000.00 14 Days
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H OR Equal 2 $1,214.00| $2,428.00 14 Days | $600.00 $1,200.00 14 Days
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 7 Days
5 FOX BASSOON REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 No Bid $3,000.00 $3,000.00 7 Days
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 $500.00 $2,000.00 7 Days
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 $695.00 $1,390.00 14 Days $675.00 $1,350.00 7 Days
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 $1,455.00 $1,455.00 14 Days $1,400.00 $1,400.00 7 Days
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 No Bid $2,500.00 $5,000.00 7 Days BC147C
10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 $2,990.00 $2,990.00 7 Days Ridenour BCC147BB
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 $1,619.00 $3,238.00 14 Days $1,500.00 $3,000.00 7 Days Selmer 52TG
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 $935.00 $2,805.00 14 Days YAS-200-ADI! $800.00 $2,400.00 7 Days Selmer AS600
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 $1,181.00 $2,362.00 14 Days $900.00 $1,800.00 7 Days Erich DY23TS
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 $3,895.00 $3,895.00 21 Days $3,300.00 $3,300.00 10 Days Selmer BS500
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 Il OR EQUAL 4 $571.00 $2,284.00 21 Days $525.00 $2,100.00 45 Days Bach CR300
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180537 OR EQUAL 2 $2,105.00 $4,210.00 21 Days $2,000.00 $4,000.00 7 Days
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 $1,948.00 $1,948.00 21 Days $2,000.00 $2,000.00 30 Days
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 $2,571.00 $2,571.00 21 Days $2,550.00 $2,550.00 30 Days
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 $1,239.00 $1,239.00 21 Days $1,450.00 $1,450.00 30 Days King 627
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 $1,801.00 $1,801.00 21 Days $1,800.00 $1,800.00 21 Days King 22805
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 $441.00 $882.00 21 Days $440.00 $880.00 21 Days
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 $2,235.00 $4,470.00 21 Days $2,300.00 $4,600.00 21 Days
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,235.00 $4,470.00 21 Days $2,300.00 $4,600.00 21 Days
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,235.00 $4,470.00 21 Days $2,300.00 $4,600.00 7 Days
25 CERVENY TUBA REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $4,498.00 $4,498.00 30 Days
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 $2,411.00 $4,822.00 21 Days $1,800.00 $3,600.00 10 Days F. Schmidt F3VT
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 $3,468.00 $6,936.00 21 Days $3,475.00 $6,950.00 30 Days
28 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 $4,861.00 $4,861.00 21 Days $4,950.00 $4,950.00 30 Days
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 $5,675.00 $5,675.00 21 Days $5,950.00 $5,950.00 30 Days
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 $965.00 $965.00 21 Days $965.00 $965.00 14 Days
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 $219.00 $1,314.00 21 Days $200.00 $1,200.00 7 Days Cadence CBK2002
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 No Bid $777.00 $1,554.00 30 Days New Model #30
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME (OR EQUAL) 2 $864.00 $1,728.00 30 Days Digimet Ill
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 Il OR EQUAL 1 $3,475.00 $3,475.00 30 Days
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United Independent School District
Band Equipment
RFP 2014-065

VENDOR DF Music Enterprises Frederic H. Weiner, Inc.
BRAND /MODEL
ITEM MODEL/ DESCRIPTION EST uisb EXT. ETA PROPOSED; If left blank we will uisb EXT. ETA BRAND /MODEL PROPOSED;
Qry PRICE assume you are bidding the specified PRICE If left blank we will assume you are bidding
model the specified model
1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 No Bid
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 $149.00| $596.00| 5-10 Days No Bid
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H OR Equal 2 No Bid
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 $1,310.00 $1,310.00[ 5-10 Days $3,300.00 $3,300.00 As p/Mfcturer
5 FOX BASSOON REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 $2,215.00 $2,215.00| 5-10 Days $3,800.00) $3,800.00| As p/Mfcturer
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 $149.00 $596.00 5-10 Days No Bid
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 No Bid $625.00 $1,250.00 As p/Mfcturer
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 $1,291.00 $1,291.00[ 5-10 Days $1,465.00 $1,465.00[ As p/Mfcturer
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 $1,291.00 $2,582.00| 5-10 Days
10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 No Bid
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 $610.00 $1,220.00[ 5-10 Days #IP045G
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 $397.00 $1,191.00[ 5-10 Days #JP041G No Bid
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 $681.00 $1,362.00] 5-10 Days #1P042G
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 $1,924.00 $1,924.00[ 5-10 Days #]P044
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 Il OR EQUAL 4 $218.00 $872.00| 5-10 Days #JP0715
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180S37 OR EQUAL 2 $1,436.00 $2,872.00| 5-10 Days #JP351SWS $2,158.00 $4,316.00(  As p/Distr.
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 $1,264.00 $1,264.00] 5-10 Days #IP271SWS $1,999.00 $1,999.00[ As p/Distr.
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 $1,831.00 $1,831.00[ 5-20 Days #JP261NR2TH $2,572.00 $2,572.00| As p/Mfcturer
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 $592.00 $592.00| 5-10 Days #JP074 No Bid
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 $1,128.00 $1,128.00[ 5-10 Days #JP17412S
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 $275.00 $550.00| 5-10 Days #JP131R $436.00 $872.00| As p/Mfcturer
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 $1,364.00 $2,728.00[ 5-10 Days #JP331RATH $2,298.00 $4,596.00| As p/Mfcturer
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 $1,364.00 $2,728.00] 5-10 Days #JP331RATH $2,298.00 $4,596.00| As p/Mfcturer
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 $1,474.00 $2,948.00[ 5-10 Days #JP332RATH $2,298.00 $4,596.00| As p/Mfcturer
25 CERVENY TUBA REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 $1,681.00 $3,362.00| 5-10 Days #JP078
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 $2,875.00 $5,750.00[ 10-30 Days #6478F
28 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 $3,140.00 $3,140.00[ 10-30 Days #6478L
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 $3,870.00 $3,870.00[ 10-30 Days #6478S
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME (OR EQUAL) 2
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 Il OR EQUAL 1
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United Independent School District
Band Equipment
RFP 2014-065

VENDOR Hillje Music Centers, LLC Hermes Music
BRAND /MODEL
ITEM MODEL/ DESCRIPTION EST uisb EXT. ETA PROPOSED; If left blank we will uisb EXT. ETA BRAND /MODEL PROPOSED;
Qry PRICE assume you are bidding the specified PRICE If left blank we will assume you are bidding
model the specified model
1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 $1,749.00 $1,749.00[ 2-3 Weeks No Bid
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 $269.00 $1,076.00[ 2-3 Weeks $368.98 $1,475.92 30 Days Antigua Winds FL3210
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H OR Equal 2 $1,189.00 $2,378.00[ 2-3 Weeks $1,434.95 $2,869.90 30 Days Antigua Winds FL4430B
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 $1,499.95 $1,499.95 30 Days Antigua Winds OB3410
5 FOX BASSOON REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 No Bid $2,399.95 $2,399.95 30 Days Antigua Winds BA3210
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 No Bid
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 $699.00 $1,398.00[ 1-2 Weeks $919.95 $1,839.90 30 Days Antigua Winds CL3230S
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 $1,394.00 $1,394.00[ 2-3 Weeks $1,359.95 $1,359.95 30 Days Antigua Winds CL3511
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 No Bid No Bid
10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 $3,479.00 $3,479.00[ 2-3 Weeks
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 $1,589.00 $3,178.00[ 1-2 Weeks $1,794.95[ $3,589.90 30 Days Antigua Winds AS6200VLG
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 $899.00 $2,697.00 1 Week $949.95 $2,849.85 30 Days Antigua Winds AS3220LQ
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 $1,129.00 $2,258.00 1 Week $1,249.95 $2,499.90 30 Days Antigua Winds TS3220LQ
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 $3,944.00 $3,944.00[ 1-2 Weeks $3,449.95 $3,449.95 30 Days Antigua Winds BS4240LQ
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 Il OR EQUAL 4 $569.00 $2,276.00[ 2-3 Weeks
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180537 OR EQUAL 2 $1,949.00 $3,898.00[ 2-3 Weeks No Bid
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 $1,899.00 $1,899.00[ 2-3 Weeks
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 $2,379.00 $2,379.00[ 2-3 Weeks
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 $1,219.00 $1,219.00[ 1-2 Weeks $1,099.95 $1,099.95 30 Days Antigua Winds EP3521SL
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 $1,789.00 $1,789.00[ 1-2 Weeks $1,599.95 $1,599.95 30 Days Antigua Winds EP3521SL
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 $419.00 $838.00] 2-3 Weeks
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 $2,179.00 $4,358.00[ 2-3 Weeks
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,179.00 $4,358.00[ 2-3 Weeks
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,179.00 $4,358.00] 2-3 Weeks
25 CERVENY TUBA REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid No Bid
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 $2,384.00 $4,619.00[ 1-2 Weeks
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 $3,239.00 $6,478.00[ 2-3 Weeks
28 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 $4,619.00 $4,619.00[ 2-3 Weeks
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 $5,559.00 $5,559.00[ 2-3 Weeks
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 $169.95| $1,019.70 30 Days
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 No Bid
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME (OR EQUAL) 2
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 Il OR EQUAL 1
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United Independent School District
Band Equipment
RFP 2014-065

VENDOR JW Pepper Lone Star Precussion
BRAND /MODEL
ITEM MODEL/ DESCRIPTION EST uIsD EXT. ETA PROPOSED; If left blank we will uIsD EXT. ETA BRAND /MODEL PROPOSED;
Qry PRICE assume you are bidding the specified PRICE If left blank we will assume you are bidding
model the specified model
1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H OR Equal 2
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1
5 FOX BASSOON REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2
10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 Il OR EQUAL 4 No Bid
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180537 OR EQUAL 2
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 Catalog Pricing
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2
25 CERVENY TUBA REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2
28 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 $945.70 $945.70 7-21 Days
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 $219.70 $1,318.20 7-21 Days
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 $1,347.50 $1,347.50[  14-90 Days CB703CS7
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 $515.00 $515.00|7-21 Days
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME (OR EQUAL) 2 No Bid
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 || OR EQUAL 1
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United Independent School District
Band Equipment
RFP 2014-065

VENDOR Midwest Musical Instruments Melhart Music Center
BRAND /MODEL
ITEM MODEL/ DESCRIPTION EST uisb EXT. ETA PROPOSED; If left blank we will uIsD EXT. ETA BRAND /MODEL PROPOSED;
Qrty PRICE assume you are bidding the specified PRICE If left blank we will assume you are bidding
model the specified model
1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 No Bid
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 No Bid $229.00| $916.00| IMM
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H OR Equal 2 No Bid
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 $3,075.00 $3,075.00 15 Days $1,995.00 $1,995.00 IMM
5 FOX BASSOON REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 $3,650.00 $3,650.00 60 days $2,495.00 $2,495.00 IMM
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 No Bid No Bid
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 $650.00 $1,300.00 15 Days $695.00| $1,390.00| IMM
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 $1,360.00 $1,360.00 15 Days No Bid
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 $1,350.00| $2,700.00| IMM
10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 No Bid
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 No Bid $895.00| $2,685.00| IMM
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 No Bid
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 $4,030.00 $4,030.00 IMM
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 Il OR EQUAL 4 $560.00 $2,240.00 IMM
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180S37 OR EQUAL 2 $1,907.00 $3,814.00 15 Days
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 $1,853.00 $1,853.00 15 Days
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 $2,328.00 $2,328.00 15 Days No Bid
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 $409.00 $818.00 15 Days $295.00| $590.00| IMM Adamson ATB-300
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 $2,128.00 $4,256.00 15 Days
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,128.00 $4,256.00 15 Days
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,128.00 $4,256.00 15 Days
25 CERVENY TUBA REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 No Bid
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 $3,159.00 $6,318.00 15 Days
28 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 $4,509.00 $4,509.00 15 Days
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 $5,423.00 $5,423.00 15 Days
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 $150.00 $900.00 IMM MAYPEX MK32P
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 $1,495.00 $1,495.00 IMM Melhart MPCBD4018
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 No Bid
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME (OR EQUAL) 2
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 || OR EQUAL 1
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United Independent School District

Band Equipment

RFP 2014-065

VENDOR Music & Arts Center National Educational Music Company
BRAND /MODEL
ITEM MODEL/ DESCRIPTION EST uIsD EXT. ETA PROPOSED; If left blank we will uIsD EXT. ETA BRAND /MODEL PROPOSED;
Qry PRICE assume you are bidding the specified PRICE If left blank we will assume you are bidding
model the specified model
1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 $1,491.00 $1,491.00] 20-30 Days 1yr. Mfg. Warr.
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 $211.20 $844.80 5-7 Days 1yr. Mfg. Warr.
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H OR Equal 2 No Bid $1,159.00 $2,318.00| 20-30 Days 5 yr. Mfg. Warr.
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 $3,040.00| $3,040.00| 30-60 Days 1yr. Mfg. Warr.
5 FOX BASSOON REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 $3,611.30 $3,611.30] 30-60 Days 2 yr. Mfg. Warr.
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 $260.00| $1,040.00|10-14 Days | Jupiter 635N / 1 yr warranty No Bid
A.) Buffet E-11 Nickel Pltd.
A.)$641.70 |[A.)$1283.40 [A.) 7-10 Days B.)|Keys (Not Made in Slv. Plated)
7 [BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 No Bid B.)$832.75 |B.)$ 1665.50 |10-20 Days B.) Buffet E12F Silver Plated
Keys 5 yr. Mfg. Warr.
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 $1,356.50 $1,356.50) 10-20 Days 5 yr. Mfg. Warr.
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 $1,203.00| $2,406.00| 30 Days Jupiter 675N / 1 yr warranty $1,199.00) $2,398.00( 10-20 Days Jupiter 675N / Syr. Mfg. Warr.
10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 $3,385.45 $3,385.45 20-45 Days 5 yr. Mfg. Warr.
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 $1,545.50 $3,091.00[ 10-15 Days #YAS480/5 yr. Mfg. Warr.
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 $900.00 $2,700.00) 7-10 Days #YAS26/5 yr. Mfg. Warr.
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 $1,234.50 $2,469.00 7-10 Days #YTS26/5 yr. Mfg. Warr.
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 $3,839.75 $3,839.75 10-20 Days 5 yr. Mfg. Warr.
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 Il OR EQUAL 4 $461.85 $1,847.40| 20-30 Days YCR-2310111/5 yr. Mfg. Warr.
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180S37 OR EQUAL 2 $1,902.45 $3,804.90) 7-10 Days 2 yr. Mfg. Warr.
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 $1,848.95 $1,848.95| 20-45 Days 2 yr. Mfg. Warr.
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 $2,376.95 $2,376.95 20-45 Days #H-379/2 yr. Mfg. Warr.
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 $1,182.75 $1,182.75| 10-20 Days 5 yr. Mfg. Warr.
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 No Bid $1,744.70) $1,744.70) 10-20 Days 5 yr. Mfg. Warr.
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 $407.50 $815.00 7-10 Days 5 yr. Mfg. Warr.
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 $2,124.15 $4,248.30| 20-45 Days 2 yr. Mfg. Warr.
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,124.15 $4,248.30[ 20-45 Days 2 yr. Mfg. Warr.
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,124.15 $4,248.30| 20-45 Days 2 yr. Mfg. Warr.
25 CERVENY TUBA REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 $2,321.75 $4,643.50| 20-30 Days 5 yr. Mfg. Warr.
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 $3,213.25 $6,426.50( 30-45 Days 2 yr. Mfg. Warr.
28 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 $4,586.00 $4,586.00| 30-60 Days 2 yr. Mfg. Warr.
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 $5,514.35 $5,514.35 30-60 Days 2 yr. Mfg. Warr.
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 $845.50 $845.50| 20-30 Days 2 yr. Mfg. Warr.
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 $140.15 $840.90 20-30 Days PK900C/1 yr. Mfg. Warr.
55 [vAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL . | 120300 $1,203.00060-90 Days a:f:;z:faels/ S-2yr No Bid
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 $500.90| $500.90| 20-30 Days 5 yr. Mfg. Warr.
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 No Bid
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME (OR EQUAL) 2 No Bid
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 Il OR EQUAL 1
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United Independent School District
Band Equipment
RFP 2014-065

VENDOR Peripole, Inc. Steve Weiss
BRAND /MODEL
ITEM MODEL/ DESCRIPTION EST uIsD EXT. ETA PROPOSED; If left blank we will uIsD EXT. ETA BRAND /MODEL PROPOSED;
QrTy PRICE assume you are bidding the specified PRICE If left blank we will assume you are bidding
model the specified model
GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H OR Equal 2
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1
5 FOX BASSOON REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2
10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1
11 |YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3
13 |YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1
15  |YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 Il OR EQUAL 4 No Bid
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180S37 OR EQUAL 2
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1
19  ]YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 Catalog Pricing
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2
25  |CERVENY TUBA REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2
28 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 $887.00 $0.00 15 Days
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 $144.00 $0.00 15 Days
32 |YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 $1,092.00 $0.00 15 Days
33 |YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 $518.00  $0.00 15 Days e e
34  |MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME (OR EQUAL) 2 No Bid
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 Il OR EQUAL 1
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United Independent School District
Band Equipment
RFP 2014-065

VENDOR Sweet Pipes The Band Shop
BRAND /MODEL
ITEM MODEL/ DESCRIPTION EST uIsD EXT. ETA PROPOSED; If left blank we will uisb EXT. ETA BRAND /MODEL PROPOSED;
Qry PRICE assume you are bidding the specified PRICE If left blank we will assume you are bidding
model the specified model

1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 $2,400.00 $2,400.00[  7-10 Days
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 $389.00 $1,556.00 7-10 Days
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H OR Equal 2 $2,043.00 $4,086.00[  7-10 Days
4 |FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 $3,490.00) $3,490.00]  7-10 Days
5 FOX BASSOON REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 $4,100.00 $4,100.00[  7-10 Days
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 No Bid
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 $1,899.00 $3,798.00[  7-10 Days
8 SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 $1,750.00 $1,750.00 7-10 Days
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 No Bid
10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 $3,890.00 $3,890.00 7-10 Days
11 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 $2,300.00 $4,600.00[  7-10 Days
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 $1,900.00 $5,700.00 7-10 Days
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 $2,000.00 $4,000.00[  7-10 Days
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 $5,200.00 $5,200.00 7-10 Days
15 YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 Il OR EQUAL 4 $1,296.00 $5,184.00[  7-10 Days
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180537 OR EQUAL 2 $2,100.00 $4,200.00 7-10 Days
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 $1,900.00 $1,900.00[  7-10 Days
18 HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 Catalog Pricing $2,400.00 $2,400.00 7-10 Days
19 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 $1,800.00 $1,800.00[  7-10 Days
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 $2,487.00 $2,487.00 7-10 Days
21 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 $459.00 $918.00 7-10 Days
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 $2,200.00 $4,400.00 7-10 Days
23 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,200.00 $4,400.00[  7-10 Days
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,200.00 $4,400.00{7-10 Days

25 CERVENY TUBA REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 No Bid
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 $3,313.00 $6,626.00 7-10 Days
27 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 $3,300.00 $6,600.00[  7-10 Days
28 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 $4,781.00 $4,781.00 7-10 Days
29 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 $5,750.00 $5,750.00[  7-10 Days
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 7-10 Days
31 PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK800 OR EQUAL 6 $289.00 $1,734.00[  7-10 Days
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 $1,550.00 $1,550.00 7-10 Days
33 YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 $699.00 $699.00 7-10 Days
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 $850.00 $1,700.00 7-10 Days
35 DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME (OR EQUAL) 2 No Bid
36 PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 || OR EQUAL 1
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United Independent School District

Band Equipment
RFP 2014-065

VENDOR Washington Music Center Inc. Woodwind & Brasswind
EST | UISD BRAND /MODEL UISD BRAND JWUDEL PROPUSED; ]
ITEM MODEL / DESCRIPTION ary | erice EXT. ETA PROPOSED; i ieft bank we il |  PRICE EXT. ETA et e
1 GEMEINHARDT PICCOLO REF; 4WSSK or Equal 1 $1,672.00 $1,672.00] 30 Days $1,708.00 $1,708.00 30 Days
2 GEMEINHARDT FLUTE REF: 2SP or Equal 4 $243.00 $972.00] 30 Days $220.00 $880.00|  5-7 Days
3 YAMAHA FLUTE YFL-461H OR Equal 2 $1,160.00 $2,320.00( 30 Days $1,225.00 $2,450.00 30 Days
4 FOX OBOE REF: 330 or Equal 1 $3,096.00 $3,096.00] 30 Days $3,125.00 $3,125.00 30 Days
5 FOX BASSOON REF: FOX 51 or Equal 1 $3,675.00) $3,675.00) 30 Days $3,710.00 $3,710.00 30 Days
6 RIDENOUR Bb CLARINET REF: TR 147 or Equal 4 $260.00 $1,040.00| 30 Days Jupiter 635N No Bid
7 BUFFET Bb CLARINET REF: E11 or Equal 2 $851.00 $1,702.00| 30 Days E12F BC2512F20
8  |SELMER BASS CLARINET REF: 1430P or Equal 1 $1,361.00 $1,361.00] 30 Days $1,470.00]  $1,470.00] 30 Days 1430LP (New Model)
9 RIDENOUR BASS CLARINET REF: BC 147 or Equal 2 $1,205.00 $2,410.00[ 30 Days Jupiter 375N No Bid
10 VITO CONTRA- BASS CLARINET REF: 7182 or Equal 1 $3,396.00 $3,396.00) 30 Days $3,674.00| $3,674.00) 30 Days
11 |YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS475 or Equal 2 $1,548.00 $3,096.00( 30 Days YAS480 $1,625.00 $3,250.00]  5-30 Days YAS-480 (New Model)
12 YAMAHA ALTO SAXOPHONE REF: YAS-23 or Equal 3 $807.00 $2,421.00| 30 Days YAS26 $950.00 $2,850.00 5-30 Days YAS-26 (New Model)
13 YAMAHA TENOR SAX REF: YTS-23 or Equal 2 $1,018.00) $2,036.00) 30 Days YTS26 $1,193.00) $2,386.00 5-30 Days YTS-26 (New Model)
14 YAMAHA BARITONE SAX REF: YBS-52 or EQUAL 1 $3,845.00) $3,845.00) 30 Days $4,035.00 $4,035.00) 5-30 Days
15  |YAMAHA CORNET REF: YCR-2310 Il OR EQUAL 4 $546.00 $2,184.00( 30 Days $590.00! $2,360.00|  30-45 Days YCR-23010 111 S (New Model)
16 BACH TRUMPET REF: BACH 180S37 OR EQUAL 2 $1,908.00 $3,816.00) 30 Days $2,070.00) $4,140.00| 5-14 Days
17 BACH CORNET REF: BACH 181 ML OR EQUAL 1 $1,855.00) $1,855.00) 30 Days $2,010.00 $2,010.00[ 30-60 Days
18  |HOLTON FRENCH HORN REF: HOLTON 379 OR EQUAL 1 $2,384.00 $2,384.00] 30 Days $2,580.00 $2,580.00]  7-30 Days
19  |YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-201 OR EQUAL 1 $1,184.00 $1,184.00] 30 Days $1,245.00 $1,245.00]  7-30 Days
20 YAMAHA EUHPHONIUM REF: YEP-321S OR EQUAL 1 $1,747.00) $1,747.00) 30 Days $1,835.00) $1,835.00) 7-30 Days
21  |BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH TB301 OR EQUAL 2 $408.00 $816.00] 30 Days $444.00 $888.00|  7-30 Days
22 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 BO OR EQUAL 2 $2,131.00] $4,262.00) 30 Days $2,305.00) $4,610.00| 7-30 Days
23 |BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 36 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,131.00 $4,262.00] 30 Days $2,305.00 $4,610.00]  7-30 Days
24 BACH TENOR TROMBONE REF: BACH 42 B OR EQUAL 2 $2,131.00] $4,262.00| 30 Days $2,305.00 $4,610.00| 7-30 Days
25 CERVENY TUBA REF: CBB 681-4 OR EQUAL 1 $4,322.00| $4,322.00) 30 Days CBB6814lII-0 $4,596.00 $4,596.00 7-30 Days CBB681411-0
26 YAMAHA TUBA REF: YBB - 105WC OR EQUAL 2 $2,325.00) $4,650.00) 30 Days $2,480.00) $4,960.00) 7-30 Days
27  |KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2370W OR EQUAL 2 $3,224.00 $6,448.00] 30 Days $3,490.00 $6,980.00]  7-30 Days
28 KING SOUSAPHONE REF: KING 2350W OR EQUAL 1 $4,601.00| $4,601.00| 30 Days $4,990.00 $4,990.00| 30-45 Days
29  |KING SOUSAPHONE REF: 2350WSP OR EQUAL 1 $5,532.00 $5,532.00( 30 Days $5,990.00 $5,990.00|  30-60 Days
30 MUSSER ORCH BELLS REF: MUSSER M645 OR EQUAL 1 $848.00 $848.00 30 Days $890.00 $890.00 7-30 Days
31  |PEARL PERCUSSION KITS REF: PK80O OR EQUAL 6 $160.00 $960.00] 30 Days PK900C No Bid
32 YAMAHA CON BASS DRUM REF: CB640BFS7 OR EQUAL 1 $1,308.00 $1,308.00) 30 Days Ludwig LECB40X7-WF
33 |YAMAHA GLOCKENSPIEL REF: YG-250 OR EQUAL 1 $501.00! $501.00] 30 Days $530.00] $530.00]  7-30 Days
34 MC ADAMS METRONOME REF: 20X OR EQUAL 2 $825.00 $1,650.00) 30 Days No Bid
35  |DIGIMET DIGITAL METRONOME (OR EQUAL) 2 $750.00 $1,500.00( 30 Days
36  |PETERSONS STROBE TUNER REF: CS5000 Il OR EQUAL 1 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 30 Days $3,335.00]  $3,335.00]  7-30 Days

Two (2) Vendors submit a No Bid
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