UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

ARCHITECTURAL SIGNS
RFP 043-2015

SECTION I: PERCENTAGE DISCOUNTS
% OFF CATALOG PRICE 20% 0% 10% 0% 10% 0% 0%
% OFF LIST PRICE 20% 0% 10% 0% 10% 0% 0%
% OFF SHELF PRICE 20% 0% 0% 0% 10% 0% 0%
SECTION Il: MESSAGE MARQUEE AND LETTERINGS:
DESCRIPTION SIZE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Stop sign: Diamond grade , 2 layers of of
reflecting sheeting. 1st. layer of reflective
grade 3990, 2nd. Layer consisting in Electro 30" Oct. $97.80 $147.00 $194.62 $43.13 $37.00 $49.13 $63.15
cut easy-film red serires 1172" "no silkscreen"
Aluminum 0.080 tickness
Stop sign: Diamond grade , 2 layers of of
reflecting sheeting. 1st. layer of reflective
grade 3990, 2nd. Layer consisting in Electro 24" Oct. $63.00 $127.00 $132.57 $27.60 $35.00 $34.39 $40.52
cut easy-film red serires 1172" "no silkscreen"
Aluminum 0.080 tickness
Post 12 GA 11FT, galvanized $23.00 $19.90 $55.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.68
U-Clamp extruded Aluminum for post $7.50 $8.70 $3.25 $3.95
No parking RSA. 24" sQ. $39.74 $29.00 $143.10 $22.00 $35.00 $26.36 $26.94
Reserved Parking B/W HIP RSA 12" x 18" $15.00 $22.00 $32.09 $8.25 $16.00 $9.89 $9.77
No parking/Buses Only R/W HIP RSA 18" x 24" $27.00 $22.00 $64.46 $16.50 $29.00 $19.77 $19.02
No parking/Buses Only R/W HIP RSA 12'x 18" $15.00 $22.00 $64.46 $8.25 $16.00 $9.89 $9.77
No parking/Fire Lane R/W HIP RSA 12'x 18" $15.00 $22.00 $32.09 $8.25 $16.00 $9.89 $9.77
No Left Turn RSA 24" SQ $39.74 $29.00 $138.22 $22.00 $35.00 $26.36 $26.94
One Way left arrow RSA 36" x 12" $27.00 $39.00 $65.76 $16.50 $31.00 $19.77 $19.02
One Way right arrow RSA 36" x 12" $27.00 $39.00 $65.76 $16.50 $31.00 $19.77 $19.02
Buses Only B/W RSA 12" x 18" $15.00 $22.00 $64.46 $8.25 $16.00 $9.89 $9.77
Bus Drop Off R/W RSA 18" x 24" $27.00 $29.00 $64.46 $16.50 $29.00 $19.77 $19.02
Visitor Parking G/W HIP RSA 12" x 18" $15.00 $22.00 $39.14 $8.25 $16.00 $9.89 $9.77
Entrance Only B/W RSA 12" x 18" $15.00 $22.00 $64.46 $8.25 $16.00 $9.89 $9.77
Exit Only B/W RSA 12" X 18" $15.00 $22.00 $64.46 $8.25 $16.00 $9.89 $9.77
Do Not Enter R/W HIP RSA 18" x 12" $15.00 $29.00 $64.46 $8.25 $16.00 $9.89 $9.77
Drug Zone Free B/W RSA 24" sQ. $39.74 $29.00 $143.10 $22.00 $35.00 $26.36 $25.36
Speed Limit 10 MPH B/W HIP RSA 18" x 24" $27.00 $29.00 $102.54 $16.50 $29.00 $19.77 $19.02
Watch for Children B/W HIP RSA 24" sQ. $39.74 $35.00 $143.10 $22.00 $35.00 $26.36 $25.36
Do Not Enter RSA 30" sQ. $42.75 $37.00 $143.10 $34.38 $37.00 $41.19 $39.63
Staff Entrance B/W RSA 30" sQ. $105.63 $32.00 $143.10 $34.38 $37.00 $41.19 $39.63
Wrong Way RSA 30" x 18" $33.40 $30.00 $102.54 $20.63 $31.00 $24.71 $23.78
No Cell Phone B/W RSA 24" x 42" $134.00 $37.00 $143.10 $38.50 No Bid $46.13 $44.38
We bid 12'-2 3/8" OD
Post 16 Gauge. We
bid Vulcan Post
Clamp-Item number
222491-501 which is
Notes: 5_19 more, lower supplied in packs of
price for each. 2. We bid high
intensity sheeting on
signs to meet the 10
yr. warranty
specifications.




