UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
FOOD BAGGING SUPPLIES
RFP NO. 2014-100

VENDORS
Ekon-Pac, Inc. Flavorseal, LLC M & Q Packaging Corporation Plascon Packaging Inc.
SECTION | - BAGS
BREAD BAGS UNIT (CASE) PRICE EXT.PRICE UNIT (CASE) PRICE EXT.PRICE UNIT (CASE) PRICE EXT.PRICE UNIT (CASE) PRICE EXT.PRICE
Polyprogylene Clear Bags Unprinted
1 |100| cs |22 x18"-4Bgx 001 $62.00 $6,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Wicket pack poly bags
1000 ct. / CTN or equal
FLAVOR SEAL BAGS
Flavorseal bags or Equal $97.00 $60.35
2 | 25 | cs R X18, Barier | Clipped No Bid No Bid $1,940.00 $98.50 $1,970.00 250ct/40cs $2,414.00
Cold-100 F, Hot + 250 F 500/ct 500ct/20 boxes Plascon Item#
4.5 Mil., 400 CT./ CS or Equal 1045-18-5105-CL
Flavorseal bags or Equal $71.80
10" x 24" (1 gal), Barrier | Clipped, . . $116.00 250ct/40cs
3| 25| Cs Cold-100 F. Hot * 250 F No Bid No Bid $96.00 $2,400.00 20001/20 boxe $2,320.00 Plascon ltem# $2,872.00
4.5 Mil., 400 CT./ CS or Equal 1045-24-5105-CL
Flavorseal bags or Equal $83.28
10" x 30" (2 gal), Barrier | Clipped . . $109.20 250ct/160cs
4 [100| CS Cold-100 F. Hot * 250 F No Bid No Bid $112.80 $11,280.00 $10,920.00 Plascon llem# $13,324.00
4.5 Mil., 400 CT./ CS or Equal 1045-30-5105-CL
Cold Bags or Equal
5| 75 | CS |Non Vent6"x 8" $90.00 $6,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5000 ct. / CS or Equal
Pergentage of Discount on items that are 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid
not listed above
SECTION Il - SUPPLIES: SPOOLS, TIES, & CLIPS
Plas-Ties
Part #312B ir Equal . . . . . . . .
1 5 CS 2000 x 5/32" per rol No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 rolls per case
Label Tape for Kiwi Model #T105 or Equal 23.00 $111.12
2 | 15 | CS (25" TYVEK Label Tape No Bid No Bid $123. $1,845.00 No Bid No Bid per rl/12rl per case $1,666.80
12 Rolls / CS per case (PC)TZ411-P
Tie-Matic Machine Spools #312 or Equa
3 5 [UNITS5/32" width x 2000’ ; One 24 Gauge wire No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4800 Closures / SPL
C & K Clips #CL4100H or Equa $400.00
Soup Clips . . . . 25,000 per case
4 |10 | CS 24.960/ CS No Bid No Bid $443.75 $4,437.50 No Bid No Bid Plascon ltem 4 $4,000.00
TZ411-P
Percentage of Discount on items that are 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid
not listed above




