
20% 0% 25%

20% 0% 25%

I.) MIDWEST TIME  CLOCKS EQUIPMENT

PROPOSED
 ITEM CODE #

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

20-A300 MASTER BOGEN CLOCK DBM-300 115 VOLTS $416.00

20-DBM300 MASTER BOGEN CLOCK DBM-300 24 VOLTS $416.00

20-DBRM300 MASTER BOGEN CLOCK DRMC-300 24 VOLTS RS-485 OUTPUT BUS $422.00

20-DSC300115 SECONDARY CLOCKS DSC 300 115VOLTS, 115V CORRECTION $254.00

20-DSC115-24 SECONDARY CLOCKS DSC 300 115VOLTS, 24V CORRECTION $254.00

20-DSC30024 SECONDARY CLOCKS DSC 300 24VOLTS, 24V CORRECTION $254.00

20-DRC30024 SECONDARY CLOCKS DRC 300 24VOLTS 485 CORRECTABLE $254.00

20-DRC115-485 SECONDARY CLOCKS DRC 300 115VOLTS 485 CORRECTABLE $254.00

20-DD300K DD300K DOUBLE MOUNTING BRACKET FOR DIGITAL CLOCKS $80.00

20-CLKPLT 12INCH METAL MOUNTING PLATE FOR DIGITAL CLOCKS $35.00

20-STI9632 STI-9632 CLOCK DAMAGE STOPPER 16.5INCH $58.00 $33.69

20-STI9740 STI-9740 EXIT SIGN DAMAGE STOPPER $76.00 $45.50

20-AC300 AC300 WEATHERPROOF CLOCK COVER  FOR DIGITAL CLOCKS NO BID

20-PB111A POWER SUPPLY 24VAC 8Amp  MOD: PB-111A $208.00

20-288003 AMERICAN TIME & SIGNAL UNIVERSAL MOTOR CLOCK 110Vac MOD:288003 $150.00

II.) NOTIFIER FIRE ALARM EQUIPMENT

PROPOSED
 ITEM CODE #

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

21-NFS320 NOTIFIER ONYX NFS-320 ADDRESSABLE FIRE PANEL $2,557.00

21-NFS640 NOTIFIER ONYX NFS-640 ADDRESSABLE FIRE PANEL $3,445.00

21-FW50 NOTIFIER FIREWARDEN-50  SMALL ADDRESSABLE FIRE PANEL $925.00

21-ANBG12LX NOTIFIER ADDRESSABLE PULL STATION NBG-12LX $119.00

21-FSB200 FSB-200 INTELLIGENT BEAM SMOKE DET. $1,350.00

21-FSB200S FSB-200S INTELLIGENT BEAM SMOKE DET. W/SESITIVITY TEST $1,550.00

21-FNH190 FST-851H 190F HIGH THERMAL DETECTOR $73.00

21-FNH135 FST-851 THERMAL DETECTOR 135F $73.00

21-SDH751 FSH-751 HARSH PHOTO DETECTOR $366.00

21-B710HD B710HD BASE FOR FSH-751ONLY $65.00

21-FNB710 B710LPBP LOW-PROFILE BASE PACK OF TEN $141.00

21-FSP851 FSP-851LOW PROFILE PHOTOELECTRIC DETECTOR $103.00

21-FSI851 FSI-851LOW PROFILE IONIZATION DETECTOR $103.00

21-FST851R FST-851R FIXED AND RATE OF RISE THERMAL DETECTOR $73.00

21-FSP851T FSP-851T PHOTOELECTRIC WITH THERMAL DETECTOR $127.00

21-FSD751 FSD-751PL PHOTOELECTRIC DUCT DETECTOR WITH HOUSING NO BID

21-FMM1 FMM-1 MONITOR MODULE $83.00

21-FCM1 FCM-1 CONTROL MODULE $109.00

21-FMM101 FMM-101 MINI MONITOR MODULE $69.00 $52.75

21-AFRM1 FRM-1 RELAY MODULE $103.00 NO BID

21-LCD80 LCD-80 REMOTE DISPLAY/CONTROL $890.00 $339.00

21-FDU80 FDU-80 DISPLAY UNIT 80-CHARACTERS $585.00

21-NCA640 NCA 640 CHARACTER DISPLAY $1,587.00

21-KDMR2 NOTIFIER PROGRAMMER MOD: KDM-R2 $1,087.00

21-AMM21 NOTIFIER VOICE EVAC. AMP MODULE MOD: ACC-AAM21 $334.00

21-VE21 NOTIFIER VOICE EVACUATION PANEL 25/50 $2,305.00

21-CDTOOL VERI-FIRE-TCD VERIFIRE TOOL CD-ROOM AND CABLE $416.00

21-LEM320 LEM-320 LOOP EXPANDER MODULE (SLC#2) $1,224.00

21-FCPS24 POWER SUPPLY NOTIFIER FCPS-24S8 $590.00

INSTALLATION COST PER MAN HOUR $48.00
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Percentage Discount off List Price

Novastar

Laredo Alarm M-1 Networks

NO BID

NO BID
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III.) FIRE LITE EQUIPMENT

PROPOSED
 ITEM CODE #

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

22-MS9200 FIRE ALARM PANEL MS-9200UDLS $1,270.00 $679.00

22-MS9600 FIRE ALARM PANEL MS-9600LS(E) $2,550.00 $1,390.00

22-LCD80 ANNUNCIATOR LCD-80F $580.00 $385.00

22-FLAD355 SMOKE/HEAT ADAPT DETECTOR AD355(A) $102.00 $62.00

22-FFASD355 SMOKE DETECTOR SD355 $90.00 $53.00

22-FLSD355T SMOKE/HEAT DETECTOR SD355T $97.00 $57.00

22-FLH355R HEAT DETECTOR H355R $86.00 $53.00

22-FLH355HT HEAT DETECTOR HIGH TEMPERATURE H355HT $88.00 $54.00

22-FFAH1350 HEAT DETECTOR H355 $86.00 $52.00

22-FLDD350 DUCT DETECTOR D355PL $260.00 $155.00

22-FLBEAM INTELLIGENT BEAM S.D. MOD:BEAM355 $1,120.00 $630.00

22-FLBEAM355S INTELLIGENT BEAM S.D. MOD:BEAM355S $1,250.00 $670.00

22-FLMMF MINI MONITOR MODULE MMF-301 $67.00 $42.00

22-FLCRF RELAY MODULE CRF-300 $105.00 $59.00

22-FLCMF CONTROL MODULE CMF-300 $105.00 $59.00

22-BG12LX PULL STATION BG-12LX $120.00 $68.00

22-FLSLC2 FIRE LITE SLC-2LS BOARD FOR MS-9600UD $2,080.00 $400.00

22-FL24FS6 POWER SUPPLY MOD: FCPS-24FS6 $530.00 $276.00

22-FL24FS8 POWER SUPPLY MOD: FCPS-24FS8 $590.00 $325.00

22-FLVE2550 VOICE EVAC. SYSTEM ACC-25/50 $2,305.00 $1,309.00

22-RTS451KEY DUCT DETECTOR TEST SWITCH MOD:RTS451KEY $68.00

Installation cost for fire lite fire alarm equipment per man hour $48.00

IV.) DMP SECURITY ALARM EQUIPMENT

PROPOSED
 ITEM CODE #

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

23-DMP100 INTRUSION PANEL XR100 $588.00

23-AP500 INTRUSION PANEL XR500 $692.00

23-A7901 790 LCD KEYPAD W/EXPANDER $242.00

23-DMP690 690 LCD KEYPAD $191.00

23-AC1386 1386/10 DMP CARDS FOR ACCESS CONTROL $125.00

23-A7073 7073A EASY ENTRY KEYPAD $452.00

23-DMP777 777 PLASTIC PROTECTIVE COVER FOR ALL LCD KEYPADS $135.00

23-DMP696 696 KEYPAD BACK BOX $33.00

23-DMP711 EXPANDER 711 SINGLE POINT $46.00

23-ADMP714 EXPANDER 714  FOUR POINTS $91.00

23-EP715 EXPANDER 715 FOUR POINTS $115.00

23-DMP708 708 BUS EXTENDER $525.00

23-A710 710 SPLITTER/REPEATER $80.00

23-DMP71416 714-16  SIXTEEN POINT $334.00

23-ADMP733 733 INTERFACE WIEGAND NO BID

23-DMP734 734 INTERFACE WIEGAND $175.00

23-DMP716 DMP 716 OUTPUT EXPANSION MODULE $151.00

23-DMP461 461 ADAPTOR CARD $120.00

23-DMP462N 462N NETWORK INTERFACE CARD $151.00

23-DMP472 472 INOVONICS INTERFACE $120.00

23-A481 481 LX BUS INTERFACE $103.00

23-DMP893A 893A DUAL PHONE LINE MODULE $126.00

23-DMPSCS105 SCS-105 MODEM $595.00

23-DMPLINK REMOTE LINK SOFTWARE $180.00

23-DMP395 DMP SCS-105 CABLE MOD:395 $40.00

23-DMP1101 DMP WIRELESS DOOR SENSOR MOD:1101 $80.00

23-DMP1125 DMP WIRELESS MOTION SENSOR MOD: 1125-W $263.00

23-DMP1129 DMP WIRELESS GLASSBREAKAGE MOD: 1129-W $252.00

23-DMP1100 DMP WIRELESS RECEIVER MOD:1100X-W $169.00

Novastar

NO BID

NO BID

Laredo Alarm M-1 NetworksVENDORS

VENDORS NovastarLaredo Alarm M-1 Networks

NO BID

NO BID
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V.) BOGEN PUBLIC ADDRESS EQUIPMENT

PROPOSED
 ITEM CODE #

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

24-AMC512A BOGEN POWER SUPPLY MC512 $190.00

24-AMC2626B BOGEN POWER SUPPLY MC2626A $254.00

24-MCAPI BOGEN EXTERNAL AUDIO INPUT MCAPI $280.00

24-RACK42 BOGEN P.A. RACK 42INCH $870.00

24-RACK61 BOGEN P.A. RACK 61INCH $1,200.00

24-MCRMF BOGEN MCRMF CARD CAGE ASSEMBLY $1,150.00

24-MCPCA2 BOGEN MCPCA2 PROCESSOR CARD $955.00

24-MCACB BOGEN MCACB ANALOG CARD $660.00

24-MCSC BOGEN MCSC STATION CARD $700.00

24-MCTC BOGEN MCTC TELEPHONE INTERFACE CARD $818.00

24-MCRC BOGEN MCRC RELAY CARD $700.00

24-MCRMF BOGEN MCRM RELAY MODULE $1,150.00

24-MCMF BOGEN MCMF CARD FRAME WALL MOUNTED $818.00

24-MCDS3 BOGEN MCDS4 ADMIN. DISPLAY TELEPHONE $750.00

24-BPA60 BOGEN POWER AMPLIFIER BPA-60 $816.00 $430.00

24-HTA125 BOGEN POWER AMPLIFIER HTA-124 $1,000.00 $490.00

24-A2524 BOGEN STATION CONNECTOR FOR 24AWG CABLE $35.00

24-A2522 BOGEN STATION CONNECTOR FOR 22AWG CABLE $35.00

24-ATB8 BOGEN CEILING BRIDGE TB8 $11.41 $6.50

24-RE84 BOGEN SPEAKER ENCLOSURE RE84 $22.69 $9.80

24-CA15C BOGEN CALL SWITCH CA15C $34.38 NO BID

24-CA10A BOGEN CALL SWITCH CA10A $34.38 $19.00

24-MCCA BOGEN MCCA RIBBON CABLE ASSEMBLY $92.00 NO BID

24-AS86 BOGEN P.A. SPEAKER S86T724PG8W $30.00 $19.99

24-AMAXIR BOGEN INPUT MODULE MONO AUX  MOD:MAX1R $101.75 $49.99

24-MIC1S BOGEN MICROPHONE INPUT MODULE SCREW TERMINALS MOD:MIC1S $101.75 $69.00

24-AP15T BOGEN SPEAKER/HORN MOD:SPT15A $121.69 $75.00

24-CSD1X2 BOGEN DROP-IN CEILING SPEAKER MOD:CSD1X2/U $150.00 $44.00

24-C100 CLASSIC SERIES AUDIO AMPLIFIER MOD: C100 $838.00 $369.00

24-RPK50 AUDIO AMPLIFIER RACK MOUNTING KIT $47.00 $26.90

24-MC2000 BOGEN COMPLETE  P.A. SYSTEM ASSEMBLED IN RACK FOR 96 STATIONS $15,177.00

24-SCTOOL PUNCH DOWN TOOL FOR STATION CONNECTOR (24AWG CABLE) $42.49

24-1CK20 1AMP TIME DELAY FUSE FOR P.A. SYSTEM GRAINGER #1CK20 NO BID

INSTALLATION COST FOR BOGEN P.A. EQUIPMENT / PER MAN HOUR $48.00 $80.00 / $75.00

NO BID

NovastarLaredo AlarmVENDORS M-1 Networks

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
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VI.) ALARMS GENERAL EQUIPMENT

PROPOSED
 ITEM CODE #

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

25-IBTGOLD ACT INTELLIGENT BATTERY TESTER MOD: GOLD-IBT $560.00 $65.00

25-A150 AIPHONE ACOUSTIC TUBE MOD:IAX-100 $200.00 $79.00

25-AI123 AIPHONE INTERCOM C-123 L/A $150.00 $75.00

25-A100S AIPHONE INTERCOM POWER SUPPLY MOD:PS-2420S $150.00 $595.00

25-A100V AIPHONE OPERATION UNIT MOD:OU-100
Sold as 1 Unit with MU-

100
$595.00

25-A100M AIPHONE WINDOW INTERCOM MAIN UNIT MOD:MU-100 $1,200.00 $274.00

25-AL1012 ALTRONIX POWER SUPPLY AL1012ULX FOR SEC. ALARM $480.00 $81.00

25-AL201 ALTRONIX POWER SUPPLY AL201UL FOR SEC. ALARM $136.00 $215.00

25-AL400 ALTRONIX POWER SUPPLY AL400ULX FOR ACCESS CONTROL $300.00 $44.00

25-ALDPS3 ALTRONIX POWER SUPPLY DPS3  Din Rail  FOR SEC. ALARM $62.00 $189.75

25-ANP3312 BATTERY YUASA 12V 33AMP-h $180.00 $63.00

25-ANP1212 BATTERY YUASA 12V 12AMP-h $60.00 $77.65

25-ANP1812 BATTERY YUASA 12V 18AMP-h $78.00 $28.00

25-ANP712 BATTERY YUASA 12V 7AMP-h $26.00 $60.00

25-A860 TRI-TECH DETECTOR BOSCH BLUE LINE MOD: ISM-BLD1-P $64.00 $60.00

25-A142C CABLE 14AWG 2CONDUCTOR FPLP CABLE 1000FT FOR FIRE ALARMS $320.00 $240.00

25-A162 CABLE 16AWG 2CONDUCTOR FPLP CABLE 1000FT FOR FIRE ALARMS $250.00

25-A182 CABLE 18AWG 2CONDUCTOR FPLP CABLE 1000FT FOR FIRE ALARMS $175.00

25-A184  CABLE 18AWG 4CONDUCTOR FPLP CABLE 1000FT FOR FIRE ALARMS $290.00

25-A88268 CABLE 18AWG 4CONDUCTOR STRANDED 1000FT FOR SEC. ALARMS $160.00

25-A211RI CABLE 22AWG 2 CONDUCTOR 1000FT STRANDED FOR SEC. ALARM $70.00

25-A22262 CABLE 22AWG 4 CONDUCTOR 1000FT STRANDED FOR SEC. ALARM $120.00

25-A24AWG CABLE 24AWG 2PAIRS 1000FT SOLID CAT3 FOR PHONE LINES $120.00

25-A1046 CABLE 24AWG 4PAIRS CAT5 1000FT  FOR P.A. SYSTEMS $130.00

25-BV500 DSC BV500 BRAVO 5 360-MOTION DETECTOR $55.00

25-A958 ADEMCO OH DOOR CONTACT MOD:958 $20.00

25-A1840N GE 1840N RARE EARTH MAGNET $6.00 $5.00

25-DHARMC GE DOOR HOLDER ARMATURE MOD:DHARMC $31.00 $21.00

25-ADHBPC GE DOOR HOLDER BACK PLATE MOD:DH-BP $8.00 $79.00

25-AH1504 GE DOOR HOLDER DHF-1224C $84.00 $49.50

25-DHERI GE DOOR HOLDER EXT. ROD MOD:DH-ER1 $7.00 $9.00

25-DHER3 GE DOOR HOLDER EXT. ROD MOD:DH-ER3 $10.00 $13.00

25-GE1921 GE MAGNET 1921C-N 3/4 Inch. $6.00 $6.95

25-GE1922 GE MAGNET 1922-B Thin 1" $6.00 $6.95

25-A1078 GE MAGNETIC DOOR CONTACT 1INCH MOD: 1078 $11.00 $10.75

25-GE1076 GE MAGNETIC DOOR CONTACT 3/4INCH MOD: 1076C-N $16.00 $13.00

25-A1045 GE MAGNETIC DOOR CONTACT MOD: 1045T SURFACE MOUNT $11.00 $9.00

25-A1075 GE 3/8INCH MAGNETIC CONTACT MOD:1075 $2.50 $2.50

25-A2302 GE CURTAIN CONTACT MAGNETIC MOD:2302 $52.00 $34.00

25-GE2315 GE OH DOOR CONTACT 2315AL $44.00 $27.50

25-AJ1653 GE SMOKE IN A CAN MOD: SM200 $120.00 for 12 Pack $10.00

25-FSP2R HORN-STROBE SYSTEM SENSOR MOD:P2R $65.00 $47.00

25-A5000 HES 8500 ELECTRIC DOOR STRIKE $425.00 NO BID

25-A9500 HES 9500 DOOR STRIKE $500.00 $369.00

Laredo Alarm M-1 Networks

NO BID

NovastarVENDORS

NO BID
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ALARMS GENERAL EQUIPMENT

PROPOSED
 ITEM CODE #

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

25-A5365 HID MINI PROX READER P/N 5365E4T00 $260.00

25-VT1 HIS TEST GAS DISPENSER  MOD: VT1 $250.00

25-VP16 HIS TEST POLE MOD: VP16 $800.00

25-VP4X HIS TEST POLE MOD: VP4X $250.00

25-EEB2 SECURITRON EXIT BUTTON MOD:EEB2 $120.00 $75.00

25-A4401 TAPE, TWO WAY FOR SECURITY CONTACTS $16.00 NO BID

25-STI9621 MOTION DETECTOR COVER STI 9621 $40.00 $25.00

25-MR101 MR-101/C RELAY $26.00 $24.00

25-MR201 MR-201/C RELAY $32.00 $25.00

25-EAX500 DOOR EXIT ALARM DETEX MOD:EAX500 $180.00

25-PS12PI PLUG-IN POWER SUPPLY 12VDC 1AMP $18.00

25-STI3100 PULL STATION COVER AND SPACER STI-1130 $120.00 $80.00

25-PCSTI PULL STATION COVER STI 1100 $120.00 $74.00

25-IDSS REVERE INSIDE SIREN  MOD:PI-IDSS $10.00 $7.00

25-AS18C REVERE OUTDOOR SIREN W/BOX MOD: RVL-18C/SRN $31.00 $23.50

25-ASRB1 RELAY SYSTEM SENSOR MOD:PR-1 $12.00 $14.95

25-SSPR2 RELAY SYSTEM SENSOR MOD:PR-2 $12.00 $14.95

25-A606024 TIMER 12/24 VDC ALTRONIX  MOD:6062 $31.00 $20.00

25-FSSR STROBE SYSTEM SENSOR MOD:SR $51.00 $32.00

25-ATSBC SECURITRON DOOR CORD 18INCH MOD:TSB-C $26.00 $19.00

25-STALM01 SIGCOM PULL STATION ALARM MODULE KIT MOD:ST-ALM01 $130.00 $24.00

25-STFRC01 SIGCOM PULL STATION FRONT COVER KIT MOD:ST-FRC01 $130.00 $45.00

25-T24175C TRANSFORMER ALTRONIX  T24175C $134.00 $89.00

25-A1240 TRANSFORMER AMSECO XT1240 $18.00 NO BID

25-A1640 TRANSFORMER AMSECO XT1640LED $18.00 $7.00

25-A2440 TRANSFORMER AMSECO XT2440 $18.00 $7.00

25-TLP606 TRIPP-LITE SURGE PROTECTOR  MOD:TLP606 $70.00 $172.00

25-WT201 VISONIC TRANSMITTER WT201 $48.00 $27.00

25-WT301 VISONIC TRANSMITTER WT301 $62.00 $37.00

25-BIT2FT 3/8 DRILL BIT 2FT LONG $20.00

25-BIT3FT 3/8 DRILL BIT 3FT LONG $22.00

25-PIR1376 PIR STABILIZER ACT MOD: 1376 $30.00

25-AP633 LONG RANGE MOTION DETECTOR GE MOD: AP633A $200.00 $134.00

25-BWC100 BAG OF 100 B-CONNECTORS UNFILLED $5.00 $6.50

25-SWAN1000 CROW DUALTECH DETECTOR MOD:SWAN1000 $40.00 $25.00

25-ACC770 SCOREDBOARD CONNECTOR WALL PLATE MOD: AC-C770

25-C7071 SCOREDBOARD CONNECTOR MOD:C7-071

25-201BATT BATTERY FOR VISONIC WT201 TRANSMITTER $14.00

25-ETP ELEVATOR EMERGENCY PHONE, TALK A PHONE MOD:ETP100E
$600.00 $389.99 EV / $349.00 EB

25-DTKRUV REGULAR PHONE LINE PROTECTOR MOD:1LVLPSCP-RUV $52.00 $29.95

25-DTKSGR 95VOLTS PHONE LINE PROTECTOR MOD:1LVLPSCP-SGR $50.00 NO BID

25-GB500 GLASSBREAKAGE DETECTOR MOD: DSC AC-500 $50.00 $30.69

25-51505 COMPRESSED AIR DUSTER 10 OZ. $10.00 $6.00

25-NL4MP AUDIO CONNECTOR MOD:NL4MP $4.00

25-NL4FC AUDIO CONNECTOR MOD:NL4FC $8.00

NO BID

NO BID

Laredo Alarm M-1 Networks

NO BID

VENDORS Novastar
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NO BID
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NO BID
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VII.) CAMERA SYSTEM EQUIPMENT LIST

PROPOSED
 ITEM CODE #

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

26-CPS1612 POWER SUPPLY 16OUTPUTS 12 VOLTS DC ---FUSED--- $175.00 $67.00 $135.00

26-CPS1624 POWER SUPPLY 16OUTPUTS 24 VOLTS AC---FUSED--- $175.00 $78.00 $149.00

26-AC111 CAMERA PTZ  PELCO MOD:SPECTRA III $2,900.00 NO BID $1,688.00

26-ARG6 CABLE COAXIAL RG-6 ROLL 1000FT $130.00 $95.00 $71.00

26-A48162 18-2 STRANDED CABLE  ROLL 1000FT $175.00 $120.00 $92.00

26-AC420 DOME, INDOOR, COLOR CAMERA, 12VDC 480LOR, VARIFOCAL $650.00 $95.00 $85.00

26-AC491 DOME CAMERA COLOR, IR,  OUTDOOR,  12VDC 480LOR, VARIFOCAL $660.00 $160.00 $109.00

26-PS12V POWER SUPPLY PLUG-IN TYPE 12VDC 1AMP. $16.00 $13.50 $10.00

26-ADVR16  16 CHANNEL VPON DVR NETWORKABLE W/2TB GB HARD DRIVE $2,560.00 $990.00

26-IDT DVR1624 INNOVATED DIGITAL TECHNOGIES 2TB OF STORAGE NO BID NO BID

26-APS24 IN LINE POWER SUPPLY 24VAC IN 12VDC OUT $16.00 $12.00 $16.00

26-AFRG6 F CONNECTOR FOR RG-6 COAXIAL CABLE $20.00 $1.05 $0.90

26-BNCWP BNC CONNECTOR WEATHERPROOF FOR RG-6 COAXIAL CABLE $20.00 $3.80 $1.60

26-BNCRG6 F CONNECTOR TO BNC ADAPTER $3.00 $3.80 $1.90

26-FRCA F CONNECTOR TO RCA ADAPTER $3.00 $3.50 $1.90

26-DVRACK 72INCH MOUNTING RACK FOR DVR $300.00 $195.00

26-ALCD19 COLOR FLAT 19INCH W/RGB INPUT MONITOR $450.00 $275.00

26-TV19RCA COLOR FLAT 19INCH MONITOR W/RCA VIDEO INPUT $450.00 $235.00

26-RGB4 4-WAY RGB VIDEO SPLITTER $140.00 $49.00 $119.00

26-RGB100 RGB VIDEO CABLE 100FT LONG $100.00 $67.00 $100.00

26-EHD500IR EVERFOCUS OUTDOOR DOME CAMERA  MOD:EHD-500IR $800.00 $269.00 $319.00

26-ED550 EVERFOCUS INDOOR DOME CAMERA  MOD:ED-550 $780.00 $248.00 $290.00

26-EHD525 EVERFOCUS OUTDOOR DOME CAMERA  MOD:EHD525/EX-3 $850.00 $260.00 $465.00

25-ANALOG
ANALOG CINTRON/ACE DOME OR SIMILAR CAMERA 650 TV LINES COLOR IR 
20 LED DAY NIGHT IP66 WEATHER PROOF NO BID $209.00 ACE NO BID

26-MD21500 GE INDOOR CAMERA MOD: MD2-1500 $460.00 $152.00 $170.00

26-TVDTIR GE OUTDOOR DOME, IR CAMERA MOD: TVD-TIR-HR $816.00 $259.00 $178.00

26-GECDRE GE OUTDOOR DOME, CAMERA MOD: GEC-DREU-VA3 $1,300.00 $359.00 $269.00

26-HD3CHB HONEYWELL DOME INDOOR CAMERA MOD: HD3CHB $810.00 $188.00

26-HD70 HONEYWELL DOME OUTDOOR CAMERA MOD: HD70 $690.00 $271.00

26-HD4U HONEYWELL DOME OUTDOOR CAMERA MOD: HD4U $1,100.00 $319.00

26-TV1224C ALTRONIX POWER SUPPLY MOD:ALTV1224C FOR CAMERAS $250.00 $178.00 $178.00

26-TV1224DC ALTRONIX POWER SUPPLY MOD:ALTV1224DC2 FOR CAMERAS $208.00 $134.00 $178.00

26-TV2416 ALTRONIX POWER SUPPLY MOD:ALTV2416ULX FOR CAMERAS $180.00 $118.00 $196.00

26-KCS1ARD AIPHONE VIDEO/INTERCOM KCS-1ARD $1,600.00 $893.00 $980.00

26-KC1X3 AIPHONE VIDEO/INTERCOM KC 1X3 $1,000.00 NO BID $775.00

26-KCDAR AIPHONE VIDEO/INTERCOM KC-DAR (outdoor camera ) $1,050.00 $485.00 $550.00

26-ADC485 PELCO DATA CONVERTER RS485 $200.00 NO BID $145.00

26-ACPTZ EVERFOCUS UNIVERSAL PTZ CONTROLLER MOD:EKB500 $780.00 $499.00 $355.00

26-KBD300A PELCO PTZ CONTROLLER MOD:KBD300A $1,000.00 $695.00 $348.00

26-BNCTOOL COMPRESSION TOOL FOR WP BNC CONNECTOR $80.00 NO BID $61.00

NO BID

NovastarLaredo Alarm

NO BID

VENDORS

NO BID

M-1 Networks



UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
PARTS, SUPPLIES & INSTALLATION FOR SECURITY ALARMS, FIRE ALARMS & PUBLIC ADDRESS SYSTEMS

RFP 2014-094

VIII.) AVIGILON COMPONENTS

PROPOSED
 ITEM CODE #

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

HD-NVR-EXP-15TB
TURNKEY INSTALLATION, PROGRAM & CONFIGURATION TO INCLUDE 
(LABOR, CONNECTIONS, STRAPS, CABLE, ETC) $8,390.00 $15,637.00

HD-NVR-EXP-30TB
TURNKEY INSTALLATION, PROGRAM & CONFIGURATION TO INCLUDE 
(LABOR, CONNECTIONS, STRAPS, CABLE, ETC) $15,652.00 $19,710.00

FSC2718FJ FISH EYE LENSE 2.7 MM $299.00 $430.00

FSC1314TH ULTRA WIDE LENSE 1.3 MM $426.00 $640.00

LC41214SC LENSE 4-12 MM $96.00 $157.00

LC92016KW LENSE 9-20 MM $329.00 $157.00

LC88016RB LENSE 8-80MM $378.00 $345.00

ES-HD STANDARD FORMAT ENCLOSURE $116.00 $169.00

ES-OPT-PED PEDESTAL AND CEILING MOUNT $85.00 $119.00

ES-OPT-WALL-S WALL MOUNT $52.00 $69.00

ES-OPT-WALL-SL WALL MOUNT RIGHT ANGLE $105.00 $69.00

SS-ES-HB SHADE COVER $40.00 $52.00

HD PANORAMIC 
DOME CAMERA 8MP 
WITH 2-4.4 MM LENS

TURNKEY INSTALLATION, PROGRAM & CONFIGURATION TO INCLUDE 
(LABOR, CONNECTIONS, STRAPS, CABLE, ETC)

$1,059.00 (Does not 
include cable)

$1,890.00

IP-66 TURRET MOUNTING BRACKET OD- BASE $16.00 $40.00

IP-66 PENDANT MOUNTING BRACKET OP-PEND $16.00 $40.00

GOOSENECK MOUNTING BRACKET PEND-GS-WALL $120.00 $140.00

HD PRO C  CAMERA 
11MP

TURNKEY INSTALLATION, PROGRAM & CONFIGURATION TO INCLUDE 
(LABOR, CONNECTIONS, STRAPS, CABLE, ETC)

$4,100.00 (Does not 
inlcude cable)

$7,740.00

HD PRO C CAMERA 
16MP

TURNKEY INSTALLATION, PROGRAM & CONFIGURATION TO INCLUDE 
(LABOR, CONNECTIONS, STRAPS, CABLE, ETC)

$5,920.00 (Does not 
include cable)

$8,690.00

LEF5014 CA LENSE 50 MM $510.00 $830.00

ALL WEATHER ENCLOSURE FOR PRO C CAMERA $115.00 $829.00

CONTROL 5400 WORKSTATION 2 MONITORS 4MN REMOTE $1,690.00 $2,365.00

CONTROL 5400 WORKSTATION 4 MONITORS 4MN REMOTE $2,400.00 $3,475.00

4PORT ANALOG 
ENCODER

TURNKEY INSTALLATION, PROGRAM & CONFIGURATION TO INCLUDE 
(LABOR, CONNECTIONS, STRAPS, CABLE, ETC) $240.00 $310.00

4PORT ANALOG 
ENCODER MT BRACKET $40.00 $52.00

SINGLE PORT POE INJECTOR FOR POWERING AVIGILON CAMERAS $43.00 $61.00

Price for IP Camera installation per drop $210.00

Price for Non -IP Camera installation per drop N/A

NO BID

10 TB-HD-NUR-EC & 
24C-HD-NVMS-ENT: 

$11,799.00
$12,669.00

$1,260.00

$1,495.00

Laredo AlarmVENDORS NovastarM-1 Networks

24 PORT 10TB NVR
TURNKEY INSTALLATION, PROGRAM & CONFIGURATION TO INCLUDE 
(LABOR, CONNECTIONS, STRAPS, CABLE, ETC)

TURNKEY INSTALLATION, PROGRAM & CONFIGURATION TO INCLUDE 
(LABOR, CONNECTIONS, STRAPS, CABLE, ETC) 

TURNKEY INSTALLATION, PROGRAM & CONFIGURATION TO INCLUDE 
(LABOR, CONNECTIONS, STRAPS, CABLE, ETC)

5MP DOME CAMERA 
WITH IR LEDs

5MP-HD-DN 
CAMERA

$995.00 w/Lens - $905.00 
w/o Lens

$995.00 w/Lens - $905.00 
w/o Lens (Does not 

include cable)

N/A



UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
PARTS, SUPPLIES & INSTALLATION FOR SECURITY ALARMS, FIRE ALARMS & PUBLIC ADDRESS SYSTEMS

RFP 2014-094

IX.) SIMPLEX EQUIPMENT

PROPOSED
 ITEM CODE #

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

27-A9101 ANNUNCIATOR FOR 4020 FIRE ALARM MOD:4603-9101

27-A9792 BASE W/ADDRESS FOR SMOKE DETECTOR MOD: 4098-9792

27-A9788 BASE W/O ADDRESS FOR QUICKCONNECT2  S. D.  MOD:4098-9788

27-A368 BOARD SALVE, FOR 4020 FIRE ALARM  MOD: 8565-368

27-A9145 BOARD, 24 LINK FOR P.A. SYSTEM MOD:5130-9145

27-A9140 BOARD, 24 STATIONS FOR P.A. SYSTEM MOD:5130-9140

27-A9120 BOARD, P.A CENTRAL PROCESSOR MOD:5130-9120

27-A9131 BOARD, P.A. POWER INTERFACE MOD:5130-9131

27-A9253 DISPLAY UNIT P.A. SYSTEM MOD:5130-9253

27-A9706 DUCT DETECTOR  MOD:4098-9706

27-A9756 4020 panel DUCT DETECTOR ADDRESSABLE W/ RELAY  MOD:4098-9756

27-A9755 4020 panel DUCT DETECTOR ADDRESSABLE W/O RELAY  MOD:4098-9755

27-A9612 HEAT DETECTOR QUICKCONNECT2 MOD:4098-9612

27-A569 NAC BOARD MOD: 565-569 FOR POWER EXTENDER

27-FS4009 POWER SUPPLY ADDRESSABLE FOR F.A.   MOD:4009-9201

27-PS4009 POWER SUPPLY CONVENTIONAL FOR F.A.  MOD:4009-9001

27-A341 POWER SUPPLY FOR 4020 FIRE PANEL MOD:636-341

27-A289 POWER SUPPLY FOR OLD 4020 FIRE PANEL MOD:636-289 

27-9001 PULL STATION ID-NET ADDRESSABLE MOD:2099-9001

27-A2099 PULL STATION M-NET ADDRESSABLE MOD:2099-9795

27-A9002 RELAY IAM Idnet MOD:4090-9002

27-A9227 SECONDARY CLOCK 115Vac  MOD:6310-9221

27-SD9710 SMOKE DETECTOR HEAD MOD:4098-9710

27-A9757 SMOKE DETECTOR HEAD W/ADDRESS  QUICKCONNECT2 MOD:4098-9757

27-A9410 SPEAKER 45 OHMS MOD:5120-9410

27-A9127 AUDIO-VISUAL ADDRESSABLE DEVICE MOD:4906-9127

27-A9121 VISUAL ADDRESSABLE DEVICE MOD: 4906-9101

27-A9781 BASE ADDRESSABLE MOD: 4098-9781

27-PULL9756 PULL STATION CONVENTIONAL MOD: 2099-9756

27-A9601 SMOKE DETECTOR HEAD MOD: 4098-9601

27-MON9101 MONITOR MODULE M-NET MOD:4090-9101

27-A9163 CONTROL MODULE M-NET MOD:2190-9163

27-A9155 MONITOR MODULE MOD:2190-9155

27-A488 4003 POWER LIMITED MOD:565-488

27-A211 8 POINT I/O BOARD FOR FIRE ALARM MOD:565-211
27-9714 SMOKE DETECTOR HEAD W/O ADDRESS MOD:4098-9714

X.) RAULAND ICS P.A. SYSTEM

PROPOSED
 ITEM CODE #

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

28-TCSLM TC6/ICS2 STATION LINE MODULE

28-ICS2TIM TCICS SER. 2 TELEPHONE INTERFACE MODULE

28-ICSCBS1 TCICS SLM 10FT CABLE

28-BLOCK 50 PAIRS PUNCH BLOCK
28-CLIPS BRIDGE CLIPS FOR PUNCH BLOCK

N/A N/A N/A

NO BID

One (1) vendor submitted a "No Bid".

FLAT RATE CHARGE FOR GENERAL MAINTENANCE / SERVICE CALLS

Laredo Alarm

No Bid

NO BID

Laredo Alarm M-1 NetworksVENDORS

Notes:

VENDORS

NO BID

Aviligilon changed part 
numbers. The part # for 
the server with the 24C 

channel are now two. Part 
#'s 10.0TB-HD-NVR-EC 

10.0TB storage HD-NVR-
EXP card installed and 
part # 24C-HD-NVMS-
ENT. Server and 24C - 

channel package 
$11,799.00 with server 

installed. Price per 
CAT6A cable drop ENT to 
end with CAT6A Leviton 

Modular Tack, device 
box.

NO BID

M-1 Networks Novastar

NO BID

Novastar


