
1 PICCOLO
$15-65 $160.00

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $75.00 $150.00 $195.00 7+DAYS $50.00 $165.00 $215.00 1-2 Weeks

2 FLUTE-CLOSED HOLE
$15-65 $160.00

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $75.00 $150.00 $195.00 7+DAYS $50.00 $155.00 $215.00 1-2 Weeks

3 FLUTE-OPEN HOLE
$15-75 $160.00

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $80.00 $175.00 $225.00 7+DAYS $50.00 $165.00 $225.00 1-2 Weeks

4 OBOE - (STUDENT MODEL) 
$25-85 $300-350

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $150.00 7+DAYS $75.00 $195.00 $325.00 1-2 Weeks

5 OBOE -(PROFESSIONAL MODEL)
$25-95 $350-400

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $150.00 7+DAYS $75.00 $225.00 $345.00 1-2 Weeks

6 Bb CLARINET
$15-75 $160.00

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $75.00 $150.00 $195.00 7+DAYS $50.00 $165.00 $225.00 1-2 Weeks

7 Eb ALTO SAXOPHONE
$25-85 $300-350

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $95.00 $325.00 $895.00 7+DAYS $85.00 $300.00 $420.00 1-2 Weeks

8 Eb ALTO CLARINET
$25-85 $250-275

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $95.00 $275.00 $395.00 7+DAYS $85.00 $300.00 $420.00 1-2 Weeks

9 BASS CLARINET
$25-95 $275-350

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $95.00 $295.00 $495.00 7+DAYS $85.00 $285.00 $375.00 1-2 Weeks

10 Eb CONTRA-BASS CLARINET
$30-115 $375-450

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $150.00 $525.00 $895.00 7+DAYS $95.00 $300.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

11 BASSOON
$35-95 $350-450

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $150.00 NO BID NO BID 7+DAYS $160.00 NO BID NO BID 1-2 Weeks

12
BASSOON (OVERHAUL, REFINISH, 
REPLATE KEYS)

13 TENOR SAX
$30-95 $350-425

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $125.00 $350.00 $995.00 7+DAYS $95.00 $385.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

14 BARITONE SAXOPHONE
$35-135 $375-450

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $195.00 $595.00 $1,995.00 7+DAYS $105.00 $475.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

15 CORNET-LACQUER
$15-55 $40-85

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $65.00 $125.00 $450.00 7+DAYS $55.00 $75.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

16 CORNET-SILVER
$15-55 $45-85

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $95.00 $150.00 $750.00 7+DAYS $55.00 $75.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

17 TRUMPET-LACQUER
$15-55 $40-85

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $65.00 $125.00 $450.00 7+DAYS $55.00 $75.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

18 TRUMPET-SILVER
$15-55 $45-85

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $95.00 $150.00 $750.00 7+DAYS $55.00 $75.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

19 FRENCH HORN (SINGLE)
$20-55 $40-85

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $95.00 $125.00 $1,250.00 7+DAYS $70.00 $95.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

20 FRENCH HORN (DOUBLE)
$25-65 $40-85

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $120.00 $175.00 $1,790.00 7+DAYS $75.00 $95.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

21 TENOR TROMBONE
$15-50 $40-85

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $75.00 $95.00 $450.00 7+DAYS $65.00 $75.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

22 TENOR TROMBONE WITH F. ATT
$15-55 $40-95

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $95.00 $125.00 $895.00 7+DAYS $75.00 $85.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

23 BASS TROMBONE 2-VALVES
$15-60 $40-105

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $125.00 $165.00 $950.00 7+DAYS $85.00 $90.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

24 EUPHONIUM (3 valve lacquer)
$15-55 $40-85

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $95.00 $125.00 $1,300.00 7+DAYS $55.00 $95.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

25 EUPHONIUM (3 valve silver)
$15-60 $40-90

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $120.00 $150.00 $1,850.00 7+DAYS $55.00 $95.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

26 EUPHONIUM (4 value lacquer)
$15-60 $40-90

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $125.00 $150.00 $1,800.00 7+DAYS $65.00 $110.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

27 EUPHONIUM (4 value silver)
$15-65 $40-95

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $150.00 $175.00 $2,400.00 7+DAYS $65.00 $110.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

28  TUBA  (lacquer) 4 VALVE PISTON
$30-85 $50-105

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $150.00 $250.00 $4,950.00 7+DAYS $75.00 $115.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

29 TUBA (lacquer) 4 VALVE ROTARY
$35-95 $50-135

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $200.00 $250.00 $5,500.00 7+DAYS $75.00 $115.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

30 TUBA (silver) 4 VALVE PISTON
$30-90 $50-110

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $250.00 $350.00 NO BID 7+DAYS $75.00 $115.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

31 TUBA (silver) 4 VALVE ROTARY
$35-105 $50-145

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $295.00 $395.00 NO BID 7+DAYS $75.00 $115.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

32 MARCHING BARITONE LACQUER
$15-50 $40-85

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $95.00 $125.00 $1,300.00 7+DAYS $60.00 $75.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

33 MARCHAING  BARITONE SILVER
$15-60 $40-90

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $125.00 $150.00 $1,850.00 7+DAYS $60.00 $75.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

34 MARCHING MELLAPHONE SILVER
$15-60 $40-90

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $95.00 $125.00 $1,850.00 7+DAYS $75.00 $95.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

35  MARCHING MELLAPHONE LACQUER
$15-50 $40-85

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $95.00 $125.00 $1,300.00 7+DAYS $75.00 $95.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

36 SOUSAPHONE SILVER
$30-95 $50-145

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $195.00 $250.00 NO BID 7+DAYS $85.00 $105.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

37 SOUSAPHONE LACQUER
$30-90 $50-135

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $150.00 $195.00 $4,250.00 7+DAYS $85.00 $105.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

38 SOUSAPHONE WHITE FIBERGLASS
$30-65 $50-95

Price 
Quoted on 
Inspection.

1 Week $195.00 $250.00 $2,400.00 7+DAYS $80.00 $95.00 NO BID 1-2 Weeks

*One Vendor Submitted a "No Bid"

Delivery 
Time

NOTES:

Delivery Time depends on the time of year 
when the work is to be done. We do not do 

"Repair 3" in certain months, due to the time to 
complete them.

NO BID

The Band Shop

Repair 1 Repair 2 Repair 3 Delivery 
Time

NO BID NO BID

Repair 1 Repair 2ITEM DESCRIPTION Repair 1 Repair 2 Repair 3 Delivery 
Time

Repair 3

VENDORS Hillje Music Centers TEE'S Music House

UNITED INDPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT 
BAND INSTRUMENT REPAIRS 

RFP 2014-089

NO BID

NO BID


