
UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT

9R22.5 $189.09 $18,909.00 $230.00 $23,000.00 $287.50 $28,750.00 $225.43 $22,543.00 $301.18 $30,118.00 No Bid

Brand 

10R22.5 $219.88 $21,988.00 $251.00 $25,100.00 $256.50 $25,650.00 $246.50 $24,650.00 $264.50 $26,450.00 $353.48 $35,348.00

Brand

11R22.5 $231.98 $23,198.00 $260.00 $26,000.00 $285.82 $28,582.00 $252.45 $25,245.00 $293.82 $29,382.00 $376.04 $37,604.00

Brand

225/70R19.5 $132.25 $13,225.00 $199.00 $19,900.00 $205.06 $20,506.00 $192.57 $19,257.00 $213.06 $21,306.00 $223.24 $22,324.00

Brand

245/75R22.5 $287.73 $28,773.00 $329.00 $32,900.00 $289.00 $28,900.00 $325.97 $32,597.00 $303.56 $30,356.00 $358.63 $35,863.00

Brand

255/70R22.5 $182.96 $18,296.00 $224.00 $22,400.00 $245.93 $24,593.00 $215.91 $21,591.00 $254.93 $25,493.00 $380.22 $38,022.00

Brand

225/50R/17 $75.20 $3,760.00 $95.08 $4,754.00 $79.16 $3,958.00 $97.08 $4,854.00 $105.25 $5,262.50 $107.25 $5,362.50

Brand

225/60R/16 $66.30 $3,315.00 $86.76 $4,338.00 $88.31 $4,415.50 $90.31 $4,515.50 $82.08 $4,104.00 $101.33 $5,066.50

Brand

LT225/75R/16 
10PLY $88.00 $4,400.00 $108.53 $5,426.50 $107.53 $5,376.50 $108.53 $5,426.50 $113.11 $5,655.50 $125.85 $6,292.50

Brand

235/55R/17 $82.42 $4,121.00 $102.38 $5,119.00 $101.38 $5,069.00 $103.38 $5,169.00 $123.82 $6,191.00 $112.27 $5,613.50

Brand

LT235/85R/16 
10PLY $104.04 $5,202.00 $111.80 $5,590.00 $110.80 $5,540.00 $111.80 $5,590.00 $134.93 $6,746.50 $131.24 $6,562.00

Brand

LT245/75R/16 
10PLY $102.00 $5,100.00 $107.11 $5,355.50 $96.11 $4,805.50 $103.82 $5,191.00 $131.78 $6,589.00 $133.38 $6,669.00

Brand

LT245/75R/17 10 
PLY $132.60 $6,630.00 $120.66 $6,033.00 $117.12 $5,856.00 $118.12 $5,906.00 $147.69 $7,384.50 $159.35 $7,967.50

Brand
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Police Auto 50%; Auto Radial & Light Truck Radial 
48%; Unisteel RLT D/139 42%; Med Commerical 

Radial 42%

Dunlop/ USA SP348

T & W Tire

0%

Toyo China

Hankook Korea
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Firestone USA

Firestone USA
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0%

Firestone USA
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50

Firestone USA

Firestone USA

Firestone USA
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100
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VENDORS
DESCRIPTION

100

100
Toyo Japan

% DISCOUNTEST.      
QTY

Samson China
100

Samson China

50

50

Lanvigator China

Samson China

Duro Taiwan

Toyo China

Hankook Korea

Hankook Korea

Hankook Korea

Toyo China

Firestone USA

Firestone USA

Firestone USA

Firestone USA

Auto/LT 20% - Med Truck 41% - OTR 34%

Firestone USA

Hankook Korea

Firestone USA

Firestone USA

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

Firestone USA

Firestone USA

Firestone USA

Hankook KoreaFirestone USA

Toyo China

Hankook Korea

Toyo China

Mastercraft USA

Hankook Korea

Toyo China

Hankook Korea

Toyo China

Hankook Korea



UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT UNIT EXT

20%

Hesselbein Tire Southwest Wingfoot Commercial Tire Center (Goodyear)

Police Auto 50%; Auto Radial & Light Truck Radial 
48%; Unisteel RLT D/139 42%; Med Commerical 

Radial 42%

T & W Tire

0%

GCR Tire Centers

0%

A To Z Tire & Battery, Inc.

0%

VENDORS
DESCRIPTION

% DISCOUNTEST.      
QTY

Auto/LT 20% - Med Truck 41% - OTR 34%

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

P265/70R/17 $97.00 $4,850.00 $109.82 $5,491.00 $109.82 $5,491.00 $110.82 $5,541.00 $126.68 $6,334.00 $124.36 $6,218.00

Brand

LT265/70R/17 
10PLY $116.00 $5,800.00 $131.18 $6,559.00 $130.18 $6,509.00 $134.39 $6,719.50 $145.81 $7,290.50 $155.35 $7,767.50

Brand

P275-65R/18 $140.45 $7,022.50 $110.56 $5,528.00 $115.56 $5,778.00 $118.53 $5,926.50 $157.97 $7,898.50 $163.05 $8,152.50

Brand

LT275/65R/18 10 
PLY $204.00 $10,200.00 $141.69 $7,084.50 $141.69 $7,084.50 $142.69 $7,134.50 $214.26 $10,713.00 $178.91 $8,945.50

Brand

7.00-15 $67.92 $1,698.00 $74.00 $1,850.00 $65.27 $1,631.75 $75.00 $1,875.00 $126.00 $3,150.00

Brand

7.50-16 $82.39 $2,059.75 $87.00 $2,175.00 $75.00 $1,875.00 $88.00 $2,200.00 $192.73 $4,818.25

Brand

18-8.50-8 $23.74 $593.50 $38.00 $950.00 $39.00 $975.00 $37.00 $925.00 $44.00 $1,100.00

Brand

ST205/75R/15 $62.72 $1,568.00 $60.00 $1,500.00 $59.00 $1,475.00 $66.00 $1,650.00 $121.00 $3,025.00 $82.84 $2,071.00

Brand

Amount ($) Size Amount ($) Size Amount ($) Size Amount ($) Size Amount ($) Size Amount ($) Size

$10.00 9R22.5; 225/70R19.5 $30.00 11R22.5 $8.00 9R22.5 & 10R22.5 
Recapable $3.50 Auto/LT - Debit to account $5.00 9R22.5 and up/only if it's 

caging credit $35.00 11R225, 255/70R22.5, 
245/75R225

$20.00  10R22.5; 255/70R22.5

$55.00  11R22.5

$2.75 P + LT Tires & Scrap Tires $65.00 Name Brand Virgin Casing - 
Credit to account $0.00 7.00-15 to 265/70R17

$35.00 Off Brand Casing - Credit to 
account

$25.00 10R225

Goodyear CT&SC does 
not retread these type of 

casings. Goodyeear 
CT&SC offers to remove 
these tires on the basis of 

one-tire sold under 
awarded contract, one-tire 

picked up for disposal.

No Bid

Amount to be paid to UISD per discarded tire picked up by vendor:

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

HEAVY DUTY TRUCK & 
BUSES

Weekly

Goodyear/ USA/ WRL ARMR TRAC

Goodyear USA / Marathon C

Goodyear/ USA/ WRL ARMR TRAC

Goodyear/ USA/ WRL SRA

Goodyear/ USA/ Assurance FMFirestone USA

Firestone USA

Firestone USA

Firestone USA

Supermax China

NuTech China

There will be no charge on pricing up light truck and 
passenger tires that are for scrap.

Supermax

Carlisle USA

Firestone USA

Triangle

Firestone USA

Lanvigator China
50

Lanvigator China
50

Gladiator China

25

25

25
Duro Taiwan

Hartland China

Toyo Japan

Saffiro China

Scrap Tires - Picked up will be billed for disposal at 
$8.00 each.

Hartland China

25

FREQUENCY OF PICK UP

$7.50 Disposal Charge on Heavy-Duty Trucks & 
Bus Tires. $3.75 Disposal Charge on Light-Duty 

Trucks & Cars.
NOTES

50

Firestone USA

Firestone USA

Weekly

LIGHT DUTY TRUCKS & 
BUSES

Every Two Weeks / ThursdaysOnce a Week

Bridgestone USA

50

No Bid

NuTech China

Firestone USA

Firestone USA

Bridgestone USA

Firestone USA

Supermax Cina

Deestone China

Omni China

$45.00 11R22.5 Recapable

When needed please contact the company.

Hankook Korea

Hankook Korea

Hankook Korea

Hankook Korea

Power King USA

Hankook Korea

Power King USA

Carlisle USA

Every week if needed

$10.00 11R22.5 and up/only if it's 
caging credit$5.00 Med/Heavy - Debit to 

account

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Deestone China

Deestone China


