Section |. Equipment & Supplies

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
WELDING EQUIPMENT, SUPPLIES & SERVICE

RFP 2014-072

VENDORS Praxair Distribution, Inc. Tim's
CITY Laredo, TX Laredo, TX
% Off Catalog Price 35% 10%
% Off Shelf Price 35% 10%
% Off List Price 35% 10%
UNIT OF ) .
DESCRIPTION EST. QTY | EST. REFILLS Rental Cost Refill Cost Rental Cost Refill Cost
MEASURE
every 4
Pure Argon (336 c/f) CYL 2 months $67.20 $138.00 $86.02 $96.80
Argon / Carbon Dioxide 75/25 every 4
(356 cif) CYL 4 months $67.20 $220.00 $165.10 $217.60
every 4
Oxygen (251 cff) CYL 6 $201.30 $72.00 $192.00 $96.42
months
Acetylene (145 c/f) cyL 8 er‘]’;rr{tﬁf $403.20 $320.00 $384.00 $352.00
Nitrogen (230 c/f) CYL 2 monthly $16.80 $40.00 $16.00 $42.14
Acetylene (304 c/f) CYL 1 monthly $8.40 $115.00 $8.00 $106.40
Oxygen (21 c/f) CYL 1 monthly NO BID $9.00 NO BID $9.74
Acetylene (10 c/f) CYL 1 monthly NO BID $13.00 NO BID $15.02
DESCRIPTION UNIT EST.QTY. |UNIT PRICE TOTAL PROPOSED BRAND | UNIT PRICE TOTAL PROPOSED BRAND
Welding Rod’s #6011-1/8” (50 LB box) Box 6 $115.50 $693.00 Lincoln $84.50 $507.00 uTpP
Victor Cutting Tip . . .
(0-1:101, 11101, 2.1-101, & 3-1-101) Each 4 $17.29 $69.15 Victor $16.28 $65.12 Victor Professional
Clear Face Shield with Headgear Each 12 $35.00 $420.00 Fibre Metal $25.77 $309.24 Jackson Safety
Standard Size Tip Cleaner Each 2 $5.00 $10.00 Pro Star $3.50 $7.00 Wypo
OXY/ACE Hose (%" x 25) Each 3 $30.00 $90.00 Pro Star $31.86 $95.58 Anchor
OXY/ACE Hose (%” x 50°) Each 3 $45.00 $135.00 Pro Star $33.98 $101.94 Anchor
Shoe Handle Carbon Wire Brush Each 2 $2.00 $4.00 Pro Star $2.76 $5.52 Anderon Brush
Cutting Goggles (shade #5) Each 6 $10.00 $60.00 Pro Star $10.77 $64.62 Anchor
Section Il. Repairs
VENDORS Praxair Distribution, Inc. Tim's
DESCRIPTION Labor Cost Per Hour Labor Cost Per Hour
Miller Dialac 250 AC/DC Welding Machine $90.00
Miller Bobcat 250 AC/DC Welding Maching $90.00 NO BID
Miller Bobcat 225 AC/DC Welding Maching $90.00
Section Ill. Service
Estimated delivery time after reciept of PO 1 business day 1-3 days
Delivery charge, if applicable $15.40 $15.00
Does your company provide welding safety classes? No No
Does your company provide presentations for new equipment? Yes Yes

One (1) vendor submitted a "No Bid".




