UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
BUS VEHICLE REPAIRS AND SERVICES
RFP 047-2015

VENDORS A & B Wheel Alignment Andy's Auto & Bus Air, Inc GCR Tires & Service Rotex Truck Center TCl Tire Center
SEC. I: HOURLY LABOR AND REPLACEMENT[ |\ oo | %DisC. | INSTALLATION [ WARRANTY LIST PRICE % DISC.__| INSTALLATION | WARRANTY [ oo o | %DISC. [ INSTALLATION | WARRANTY LIST PRICE % DISC.__ [ INSTALLATION | WARRANTY |\ oo | %DISC. | INSTALLATION | WARRANTY
PARTS FOR MECHANICAL TRADES | oFfusT | RATE/HOUR [(MOs./MiLES) OFF LIST | RATE/HOUR | (MOS./MILES) | oFFusT | RATE/HOUR [ (MOS./MILES) OFF LIST | RATE/HOUR | (MOS./MILES) | OFFLST | RATE/HOUR | (MOS./MILES)
A/C SERVICE AND INSTALLATION N/A 30% $75.00 12 Months N/A $10.00 $75.00 N/A
BODY REPAIRS/COLLISION N/A
A.) BUSES N/A B.) 10% B.)$75.00 | B.)12 Months
B.) CARS & TRUCKS N/A
TRANSMISSION REPAIRS AND SERVICE ) N/A 10% $75.00 12 Months
No bid No bid No Bid No Bid
MUFFLER REPAIRS AND SERVICE No Bid
GASOLINE ENGINE REPAIR AND SERVICE
DIESEL ENGINE REPAIRS N/A 10% | $7500 | 12 Months
ELECTRIC SERVICE AND REPAIRS N/A 10% | $7500 | 3Months
RADIATOR REPAIR AND INSTALLATION N/A_ | 30% | $7500 | 12 Months No Bid
DIAGNOSTIC REPAIRS AND SERVICE NA | 30% | $75.00 | 12 Months N/A 10% | $7500 | N/A
SEC. II: HOURLY LABOR AND 9 9 9 9 9
PRICE PER % DISC. FROM | LABOR RATE FOR PRICE PER % DISC. FROM | LABOR RATE FOR PRICE PER % DISC. FROM | LABOR RATE FOR PRICE PER % DISC. FROM [LABOR RATE FOR PRICE PER % DISC. FROM | LABOR RATE FOR
REPLACEMENT PARTS FOR WHEEL AXLE LIST PRICE for ADDITIONAL WARRANTY AXLE LIST PRICE for ADDITIONAL WARRANTY AXLE LIST PRICE for ADDITIONAL WARRANTY AXLE LIST PRICE for | ADDITIONAL WARRANTY AXLE LIST PRICE for ADDITIONAL WARRANTY
ALIGNMENTS AND BALANCING parts WORK parts WORK parts 'WORK parts WORK parts WORK
WHEEL ALIGNMENT FOR PICKUP TRUCKS & N/A $38.95 1/2
CARGO VANS ton No Bid No Bid
WHEEL ALIGNMENT FOR DISTRICT CARS N/A $29.95
WHEEL ALIGNMENT FOR SCHOOL BUSES N/A $165.00 |$40.00 per hour| 30 days $115.00 N/A N/A 30 days $89.99 N/A $85.00/hour 30 days
WHEEL ALIGNMENT FOR HEAVY DUTY $85.00 not $100.00
VEHICLES N/A including $90.00 N/A N/A 30 days front/$200.00 N/A $85.00/hour 30 days
exsentrics 3axle
No bid No bid
BALANCING FOR PICKUP TRUCKS & CARGO | $6.00/tire 0% $15.00 N/A N/A $21.00 per tire N/A N/A 30 days
BALANCING FOR DISTRICT CARS $5.00/tire 0% $15.00 N/A N/A $21.00 per tire N/A N/A 30 days
BALANCING FOR SCHOOL BUSES $16.00/tire 0% $40.00 per hour| 30 days $30.00 N/A N/A $36.00 per tire N/A N/A 30 days
BALANCING FOR HEAVY DUTY VEHICLES | $16.00/tire 0% $30.00 N/A N/A $36.00 per tire N/A N/A 30 days
ANY OTHER ADDITIONAL WORK REQUIRED
TO PERFORM THE ALIGNMENT OR N/A No Bid No Bid
BALANCING
SEC. ll: PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT ON PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT
LABOR & PARTS FOR ALL OTHER ITEMS
| |DISCOUNT FROM LIST PRICE ON _ 30% _ 10% No Bid
REPLACEMENT PARTS No Bid No Bid
2 |LABOR RATE PER HOUR $75.00 $75.00 $85.00 an hour
SEC. IV: SAFETY INSPECTION STICKERS cosT cosT cosT cosT cosT
1 |[SAFETYINSPECTION STICKER FOR
DISTRICT BUSES No bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 [SAFETY INSPECTION STICKER FOR
DISTRICT VEHICLES
SEC. V: QUESTIONS & STATEMENTS
1 giG(:JPL;&\TAI/g’?KING HOURS & DAYS Mon-Sat. 9:30am-7:30pm. Closed on Holidays. 7am-6pm Mon-Fri & 8am-2pm Sat 8am-5pm Mon. thru Fri & 8am-12pm Sat. 7am-8pm M-F; 8am-2pm Sat. 8-5 pm M-F
o |SERVICE VEHICLES OUTSIDE Ves Ves Ves Ves Ves
NORMAL HOURS AT SAME PRICE
5g | SERVICE VEHICLES AT ANY UISD No ves Ves ves Ves
PROPERTY
3 |VENDOR AGREES TO KEEP ALL PARTS Ves Ves Ves Ves Ves
IN STOCK
VENDOR AGREES TO ADDRESS
4 |WARRENTY WORK W/IN 48 HRS Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
EROM TIMF OF WORK




