
VENDORS Alert Services, 
Inc.

Aluminum
Athletic

Equipment Co.

America Team 
Sports Athletica, Inc. BBI Tennis 

Group

Barcelona
Sporting
Goods

Bill Fritz Sports 
Corp

Bill Guthrie Sports 
Inc. BSN Cannon

Sports, Inc. C-Pro Usa Clarke
Distributing

% OFF SHELF PRICE n/a n/a 10-40% 0% 20% n/a n/a 5%-40% n/a 25% 0% 0%
% OFF LIST PRICE 20% n/a 10-40% 0% 20% n/a n/a 5%-40% n/a 25% 10% 0%

% OFF CATALOG PRICE 20% 14% 10-40% 15% 20% n/a 10% 5%-40% 10% 25% 0% 0%

VENDORS Everything
Medical Gilman Gear GTM

Sportswear
Henry Schein 

Medical Leslie G Medco Supply MFAC, LLC M-F Athletic Mira's Sports
Neff

Motivation
Inc.

Nasco Palos Sports 

% OFF SHELF PRICE 0% 5% 0% 0% n/a 0% 0% n/a 10% n/a 10% n/a
% OFF LIST PRICE 0% 5% 0% 0% 75% 0% 0% n/a 10% n/a 10% n/a

% OFF CATALOG PRICE 10% 5% 0% 15% n/a 0%-18% 10% 7% 10% 10% 10% 10%

VENDORS Riddell / All 
American S&S Worldwide School Health School

Specialty
Sport Imports, 

Inc.

South Texas 
Medical
Equip. & 
Supplies

T-Shirt Gallery 
& Sports The Graphix Store The Laredo 

Country Club

The Sports 
Center of 
Laredo

US Games Wolverine
Sports

% OFF SHELF PRICE n/a 0% 0% n/a 0% 10% 1-25% 5% 15% 15%-50% n/a n/a
% OFF LIST PRICE n/a 18% 0% 25% 0% 10% 1-25% 5% 15% 15%-50% n/a n/a

% OFF CATALOG PRICE 1-40% 0% 11% 15% 0% 10% 1-25% 5% 15% 15%-50% 15% 0%

ATHLETIC SUPPLIES & EQUIPMENTS
UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRCIT

Prices are 
wholesale.

Free shipping 
depending on 
the product.

NOTES

Exclusions: PV/HJ 
Crossbars, Vaulting 

Poles, Portable 
Press Box, 

Donkey's, Video 
Towers.

Discount doesn't 
apply to balls, 

nets or teaching 
aids.

RFP 2014-070

Shipping will be 
prepaid & added to 

invoice. Need to 
call for pricing

15% off US 
Games Spring 
2014 Catalog. 
On Playground 
Equipment only.

Discounts vary 
need to 

contact for 
pricing.

Bid #: 
100376385.
Materials & 

Supplies: 18%, 
Equipment & 

Furniture: 15%, 
Tape: 12%, 

Athletic Trainers 
Bags 12%. 
Orders over 

$90.00, all items 
are quoted 

F.O.B.
Destination via 
UPS Ground or 
motor freights.

NOTES

NOTES Webiste discount.

Please reference 
bid #2014-070 on 

all correspondence 
for special pricing.

Free freight 
orders over 

$100.00
excluding all 'X' 
and 'T' items. 

Please
reference Code 
#: 62215 when 

ordering.

Catalog pricing.

Three (3) vendors submitted a "No Bid"

Exclusions to discounts 
see Proposal

Free shipping on 
parcel shipped 
items for orders 

$49.00. Add $9.95 
if the subtotal is 

under 49.00. Truck 
and freight items 
will be charged a 

minimum of 
$79.00 or 15% of 

the item price, 
whichever is 

greater.



 VOLLEYBALL Est.
Qty

America
Team Sports

Athletica,
Inc.

Barcelona
Sporting
Goods

Bill Fritz 
Sports

Bill Guthrie 
Sports Inc. BSN Cannon

Sports, Inc. C-Pro Usa GTM
Sportswear

Mira's
Sports

Neff Motivation 
Inc.

Riddell / All 
American

S & S 
Worldwide

School
Specialty

Smash
Tennis

The Graphix 
Store

T-Shirt
Gallery and 

Sports

The Sports 
Center of 
Laredo

Wolverine Sports

Shoes: Nike Air Max - Black & 
White 75

No Bid No Bid $60.00 No Bid $115.50 No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No Bid
$85.00 / Asics 

Gel-Vally Cross 
3 Bison/Q001

No bid

Shoes: Nike Air Efficient Mid-
Black & White 75 No Bid No Bid $50.00 No Bid $115.50 No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No Bid No bid No bid

Kneepads: Nike Skinny Volleyball
- White 120 No Bid No Bid $17.50 No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No Bid No bid No bid

Kneepads: Asics Gel - White 120 $12.50 No Bid $4.98 No Bid $12.00 No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.98 No bid No Bid No bid No bid $12.75 No bid $14.00 / 
#ZD900 $19.50 / Z00506 No bid

Practice Balls: White Tachikara 
SV-18L 60 $29.65 No Bid $32.50 $31.05 $32.56 $31.66 $27.01 / 

AS6100 No Bid No Bid $39.95 No bid No Bid $32.79 / 
W5842002 No bid No bid No bid $36.85 $37.00 No bid

Game Balls: White Tachikara SV-
5WH 30 $34.95 No Bid $32.50 $35.96 $38.87 $38.49 $31.50 / 

AS6127 No Bid No Bid $47.95 No bid No Bid $51.65 / 
W11134

$34.79 / SSI 
#003781 No bid No bid $43.99 $45.00 No bid

Uniform Shorts: Mizuno 6" Soft 
Nylon Short Black 30

$16.65 No Bid $18.95 No Bid $18.90 No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No Bid No bid No bid $19.00 No bid

$18.50 / 
Mizuno Low 
Rider Tights 

440015

$17.50 No bid

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

$126.95 BC-
HHAM

No Bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

$ 42.95+shipping 
/$43.34 no 

shipping BA2831

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$38.95

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$89.96 / 
AS13031

No Bid

No Bid

$115.95

$15.00

$16.65

No Bid

No Bid

$112.08

No Bid

No Bid

$7.99

$8.99

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$84.99

No Bid $28.95

$4.98

$7.99

$106.00

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

$10.47 / SHP7-7" 
Inseam-Promesh
Shorts w/ Tricot 

Lining

$5.35 / Riddell 
(Jerzees) #J2110 

50/50 T-Shirt 
W/1CCLOG & #'s 

(Add $2.00 for 2XL & 
3XL)

$6.55 / Riddell (A-4) 
#NB5301 / Mesh, Lined 
Short 6" Inseam  (Add 
$1.00 for 2XL & $1.50 

for 3XL)

No Bid

No bid$5.59$5.95

$6.65

$6.65

$13.15

No bid$7.24

No bid$7.24

No bid

Practice Shirts: 50/50 T-Shirt w/ 
Logo and # Champion or Hanes 
Beefy

Practice Shorts: Black 6" Inseam 
Micromesh w/ Logo & Number

Practice Shorts: Black 6" Inseam 
Nylon Tricot Mesh w/ Logo & 
Number

Practice Shorts: Black 6" Inseam 
Micromesh Double Lined w/ 
Drawstring w/ Logo & Number

Ball Cart: Tachikara Ball Chart

Travel Bags: Basic Black 
Cordura or Nylon Bag w/ Logo & 
Number - 24" X 12" X 11"

No bid

Uniform Jersey: Mizuno 
Performance Mesh Short Sleeve 
Jersey Black

240

240

3 $110.00

No bid$7.24

60

No Bid

No Bid No bid

$6.65

60

No bid

No Bid No Bid

$10.47 No bid

No Bid

$10.47 No bid$12.60

$102.49 / 
W8027

$22.62 No bid

No bid

$94.98

$21.50

No bid No Bid

$5.60 / 
Gildan 5000 

T-Shirt
$6.00

No bid No bid $15.00 / 
MM6477

$25.75 / lc 
logo and 6" 
#'s front & 

back Mizuno 
440.88 Cap 

Sleeve

$119.00

$23.69 / ST05 
12X12X24 lc 
logo  and #

No bid $15.00 / 
MM6477

No bid No bid $15.00 MM6477

No bid

No bid $22.50 / 
#440388

240

No bid

$7.30 / Gildan 
50/50 6" #

$8.30 / S-XXL 
Badger 7" 
7237 Mini 

Mesh w/ liner 
lc logo & #

$116.00

No bid No bid $26.00 / 
Tachikara (TV6)

$18.25

No bid

No bid

$20.25 / BG995-
Small Color 

Block Duffel 21" 
W X 10.5" H X 

10" D

No bid

$10.80

$10.80

$10.80

No bidNo bid

No Bid

$9.50

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$6.07/ TS500 
Gilpan 100% 

cotton
No Bid

$10.50 / 
Budser 5" 

Inseam 7216

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRCIT
ATHELTIC SUPPLIES & EQUIPMENTS

RFP 2014-070
VOLLEYBALL

No Bid

No Bid

240

$5.15

$8.30 / S-XXL 
Badger 7" 
7207 Mini 

Mesh w/ liner 
lc logo & #

No Bid



Est.
Qty.

America Team 
Sports

Barcelona
Sporting Goods

Bill Guthrie 
Sports Inc.

Cannon Sports, 
Inc. C-Pro Usa Mira's Sports T-Shirt Gallery & 

Sports

Team
Express

Distributing

The Sports 
Center of 
Laredo

36 $87.50 / 5500 $199.00 $94.00 No Bid No Bid $79.95 / S400 33 
in 30 oz No bid No bid No bid

36 $87.50 / 5500 $290.00 $63.00 No Bid No Bid $119.98 / S500 
33 in 30 oz No bid $79.99 No bid

36 $3.50 / Gildan 
5000 $5.98 $4.00 No Bid $5.40 No Bid

$6.45 S-XL 
Gildan 50/50 lc 

logo
No bid $5.00 / 

T525C

36
$42.50 / BDFN14-

RR $46.95 $45.00 No Bid No Bid $55.95 / BBFN14-
RR No bid $37.99 No bid

36

$230.00 / Attack-
5 $199.99 $84.80 No Bid No Bid $199.99 / Assault 

33 in 30 oz No bid No bid No bid

36 No Bid $115.00 $128.60 No Bid No Bid $149.95 / 
WTAT7377 No bid $94.99 $125.00 / 

WTAT7377

No Bid

$29.77 / 
AS03547$36.65

BASEBALL

Bat Easton B72 Redline Bat 33-28 0Z2

Bat Easton BRX 100 CX Reflex C-Core 33-28 OZ.3

Louisville Fungo 35" TPXFW

Pant Prop. Grey Professional Weight Visa Polyester Warp 
Knit Fabric  Double Knees, Two Rear set in Pockets, 2" 
Non-Roll Elastic Waistband Pro Tunnel Belt Loops , Two 
Needle Cover Stitched Seams Brass Zipper Fly Front T

 T-1000 Shirts Champion

Pro Pant White Speedline #6881 Pro Tunnel Beltloops

Bat Bag HBB-Hanging  - Holds 12 Bats -  Black 45" X 35 
1/2"

Bat BB-9 Louisville Slugger Air Attack 33-28 OZ

Batting Tees Tuffy 5 ATEC 5 Position 

36 No Bid

No Bid
Cap New Era Baseball  Woolserge Fitted and also 
adjustable White Crown Orange Bill Grey Underneath Two 
Color Full Block

$13.98

$20.00

$54.00

$36.25

$15.99

No bid $18.99

No bid
$17.98 / Game 

Cap GP340 
w/mono

$45.95 / Easton 
A163142

35"X9"X11"

No Bid

No Bid36

36 No Bid

$16.75 / Champs 
BP6UL

$16.75 $36.25

$39.9936

$39.99

No bid No bid $30.00 / All 
Star

No bid $10.99

$21.95 / 
Rwalings
BP31MR

$42.95 / 
Rawlings
PRO150

No Bid

No Bid

$18.00 / 
Ricardson

Cap

$49.00 / 
BB1

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRCIT
ATHLETIC SUPPLIES & EQUIPMENTS
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$42.00 / 
CPRO

$54.00



SOCCER

Est.
Qty.

Alert
Services,

Inc.

Aluminum
Athletic

Equipment
Co.

America
Team Sports

Barcelona
Sporting
Goods

Bill Fritz 
Sports Corp

Bill Guthrie 
Sports Inc. BSN Cannon

Sports, Inc.
Mira's
Sports

S & S 
Worldwide

School
Specialty

T-Shirt
Gallery & 

Sports

The Sports 
Center of 
Laredo

$52.00

$19.99

$198.00 No Bid No bid

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

$4.51 / 
AS50010

No Bid

$54.95 / 
AS49182

$1.65 / 
AS2110

$39.99

$8.00

$4.00

$4.00

$249.00

$31.00

Net Pegs for Back of 
Soccer Net
REF: Kwik-Goal NP-2

Soccer Ball Hampden 32 
Panel Size 5 Practice
REF: UMBRO 1445

Soccer Ball Game Club 
Sheen    Size 5 REF: 
UMBRO 4565

Madrid Shinguards
REF: UMBRO 0972

Solid Soccer Sock
REF: Twin City Osk

Sanitary Socks for 
underneath Shinguards
REF: Twin City Msst

150

12

150

324

324

3

3

72

6

6

6

Corner Flags
REF: Campion SF30 or 
Equal

Corner Flag Carrying 
Bag
REF: Kwik-Goal CF-1

12" Orange Drill Cones
REF: Champion TC-12

Soccer Net       White 
3MM
REF: Kwik Goal 0050A

Goalie Jersey Jupiter  - 
Sizes S-XL
REF: High Five 411-01

$12.95 / 
Select
Classic

No bid $30.00 No bid$39.99 $8.65 / 
ES49081 No bid

$8.48 / SSI 
#1282629

MIKASA SS50

No bid
$22.50 / 

Select Thor 
NFHS

No bid $18.00 No bid No bid
$20.40 / SSI 
#1337383

MIKASA PO

No bid

$10.65 / 
Adiddas

F87261 F50 
Pro Lite

No bid $30.00 No bidNo bid

No bid

No bid No bid

No bid $3.55 No bid $4.31 No bid No bid No bid

No bid

No Bid No bid No Bid No bidNo Bid$22.00

No bid

No bid$5.98 / BSN 
#1366514 No Bid

No bidNo bid

$85.00 No Bid $49.91 $63.25 $81.00 / 
SCF30

$26.06 / 
Tandem
W3977

$44.98 / 
Alumaqual

MSSOCFLOY

No bid No bid

No bid No bid

No bid

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

No bid

No bid No Bid $18.01 No Bid No bid

$2.65 No Bid $2.25 $2.25 $2.50 ea.

$14.20 / 
High5 Spetor 

GK

$70.15 / 
#1238624 w/ 

carry bag

$4.68 / SSI 
#716167 POLY 
ENTERPSISES

EDU-12PM

No bid

$4.91 / S & S 
W6067002

No Bid

$6.95

No Bid No bid

No bid

$26.00 / 
Champro
SB1205

No bid

$17.50 / 
Diadora

Stadio R Ball

$20.00 / 
Champro

A8C

$4.50 / Twin 
City OSK

$45.96 set / SSI 
#016860

$5.00 / All 
Star N3

$3.50 / Twin 
City MSST

$3.00 / All 
Star 33BNo bid

$71.25

$22.00 / 
24280 High 

Five

$44.50 / 
Kwik Goal 

SB701

No bid

No bid
$112.50 / 
Champion

203

$2.00 / 
Champion

SNT

$2.59 / TC12

No bid

No Bid

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
ATHLETIC SUPPLIES & EQUIPMENT
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$3.94 / BSN 
12" Orange 

PVC
#1040814

$28.00 / 
Champro
SB1505

$27.25 / 
Diadora

Coppa Ball

No bid

$68.79 / 
SCF30

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$3.50

$92.00 / AAE-
TM-4 No Bid $121.50

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$4.15

$5.95

No bid

$2.85 No bid $3.40No bid



CROSS COUNTRY
Est.
Qty.

Aluminum
Athletic

Equipment
Co.

America
Team Sports

Barcelona
Sporting
Goods

Bill Fritz 
Sports Corp

Bill Guthrie 
Sports Inc.

Cannon
Sports, Inc. C-Pro USA GTM

Sportswear MFAC, LLC M-F Athletic Mira's
Sports

T-Shirt Gallery & 
Sports

The Sports 
Center of 
Laredo

No Bid

$127.50 ea. / 
MFAH #3130

$9.98 / 
GameGear

$10.98 / 
GameGear

$12.50 / 
GameGear

TR950

$297.50

No Bid

$155.05 / 
AS5820

No bid

$11.05 $16.00

No Bid

$10.25 / 
LUN16

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Track Short (sizes 5-24)
REF: Cobblestone TR 403 360

3

$9.75

$12.00

$14.00180

No bid $8.25

$10.65

Cross Country Measuring 
Wheel                           REF: 
Blazer 1790

Track Singlet w/one Color 
Logo / Team Name of Full 
Front
REF C bbl E TR903

$215.00

Women's Track Singlet 
w/one Color Logo / Team 
Name of Full Front
REF: Cobblestone TR932

180 No bid

$125.00 / 
AAE-TM-4

No bid

$8.25 / S-XL TR403

No bid $10.50 / S-XL (lc 
logo) TR903$10.65

$10.00 / 
SH03

$10.25 / 
UN16

No Bid

No bid $9.35 No Bid

$24.00

$245.00 / Blazer 
#1790$188.00No Bid $202.50 $200.00

$10.50 / S-XL (lc 
logo) TR903WNo bidNo bid

$245.00

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
ATHLETIC SUPPLIES & EQUIPMENT

RFP 2014-070
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$16.00

$16.00 $22.50

$17.50$9.90 $8.92



SOFTBALL Est.
Qty.

America
Team Sports

Barcelona
Sporting
Goods

Bill Guthrie 
Sports Inc. BSN Cannon

Sports, Inc. Mira's Sports S & S 
Worldwide

The Sports 
Center of 
Laredo

No Bid

$47.85 / 
ES030593

$59.95 / 
CFA2

No Bid

$69.99

$64.00

$45.00

No Bid

No Bid

$19.15 / 
ES03503

$36.60 / 
ES030273

No Bid

$65.28

$63.65

School Specialty

No bid

$0.91 / SSI #089149 
WIFFLE BALL 659S

No bid

$11.67 / SSI # 14505384 
WILSON WTA5407BL

$63.23 / 
AS030409

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No bid

No bid

$49.00 / All 
Star BB1

$52.50 / ALL 
Star

CMW1010BT

No bid

No bid

No bid

$13.50

No bid

No bid

$40.00 / All 
Star BH 
3000FG

$140.00 / 
MVP2500 All 

Star

$40.00 / All 
Star MVP 2500

$55.00 / All 
Star HB1

$105.00 / 
CPLU145PRO

$85.00 / 
LGW14SPRO

No Bid

6

$80.00 dz 
Softballs SB12LNPFP 
Yellow Fastpitch
REF: Dudley 4Y-321

White Wiffle Softball
REF: Champro CSB-51

Dimple Pitching Machine 
Balls     Yellow
REF: Champro CSB-59

$65.95 $62.89 $6.55 / 
W12044

$69.00 / 43-
147

$44.50

$64.98 dz / 
Dudley 4Y-

321
#BBDUDYEL

$.86 BSN 12' 
3192XXXX

$59.00

$11.50

$28.00

No Bid

6

24

6

3

3

$52.50

$33.50

$16.50

$22.50

No Bid $16.26

Hanging Helmet Bags w/ 
School Logo to match Logo 
on the side of the Players 
Bag REF: Amerisport FG333

Hanging Helmet Bags w/ 
School Logo to match Logo 
on the side of the Players 
Bag   REF: Amerisport 
FG332

Batters Helmet (sizes S-XL)
REF: Rawlings PL95R

Catchers Helmets (sizes S-
XL)
REF: Rawlings CH0250

Catchers Mask
REF: Rawlings LWMXJ

Chest Protector
REF: Rawlings WCP

Leg Gaurds
REF: 15DCW

Catchers Mitt
REF: Rawlings RMP12SC

$45.00

No Bid

No Bid

$20.00

$29.74

$9.19

6

6

6

6

$10.00

$33.95 / 
AGP2

No bid

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

$18.98 dz / 
McGreger

#BBDSBALL

No Bid

No Bid

$46.98 / Jugs 
B2015

$21.95 / 
CFBH

No bid

$50.00

$50.00

$42.50

$65.00

$20.00

No bidNo Bid

No bidNo Bid

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
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RFP 2014-070
SOFTBALL

No bid

No bid

$35.00

No Bid

$33.87

No Bid

$19.98

18

$97.92 $64.95 / 
CFPCM

$63.65

No bid

$22.87 / 
ES03983

$55.98 / 
SDCW

No bid

No Bid



TENNIS Est. Qty
America

Team
Sports

BBI Tennis 
Group

Barcelona
Sporting
Goods

Bill Fritz 
Sports Corp

Bill Guthrie 
Sports Inc. BSN Cannon

Sports, Inc. C-Pro USA Clarke
Distributing Mira's Sports Neff

Motivation
Riddell / All 
American School Specialty

The
Graphix

Store

T-Shirt
Gallery and 

Sports

The Sports 
Center of 
Laredo

Wolverine
Sports

Racquet 19” to 27” Gamma First set 
Jr., lightweight, midplus head, 2 
handed grip

20 No bid $12.79 No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$19.99 Wilson US 
Open 23" WJR52-

23
No Bid No Bid No bid

$7.17 / SSI 
#009226

SPORTIME 009226
No bid No bid

$63.00 / 
Wilson

MCJR9B
No bid

Quick kids 36 Foam ball Low 
bounce, 36’ court 

10/dz No bid $31.99 No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.00 ea./TE176-
60 No Bid No Bid No bid

$29.82 / SSI 
#1321052

ONCOURT
OFFCOURT

BQF12

No bid No bid

$41.00 / 
BQR6 Low 
Court-Off

Court

No bid

Quick kids 36 Foam ball Low 
bounce, 36’ court

5/60pk No bid $119.99 No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.50 ea./TE176-
12 No Bid No Bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No Bid No bid

Quick kids 36 Tennis Ball Low 
bounce, 36’ court

10/dz No bid $23.99 No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid

$29.82 / SSI 
#1321052

ONCOURT
OFFCOURT

No bid No bid $41.00 No bid

Revolution Foam Ball Medium 
bounce, 36’ court

10/dx No bid $31.99 No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00/dz No Bid No Bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

$34.00 / 
Fromuth
Gamma
IGFBI

No bid

Revolution Foam Ball Medium 
bounce, 36’ court

5/60pk No bid $119.99 No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $120.00 / 60 No Bid No Bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No Bid No bid

Quick kids 60 Tennis Ball Medium 
bounce, low compression, 60’ court 10/dz No bid $23.99 No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.50/dz No Bid No Bid No bid

$68.89 PK of 72 / 
SSI #1466306 

ONCOURT
PFFCOURT
BQ60CAN24

No bid No bid

$17.50 / 
Fromuth
Gammas

IGSFI

No bid

Quick kids 60 Tennis Ball Medium 
bounce, low compression, 60’ court 5/60pk No bid $71.99 No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $52.00 / 60 No Bid No Bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No Bid No bid

First Set 18’ Junior Net Lightweight 
steel frame, durable nylon net, carry 
bag

5 No bid $103.99 No Bid No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $129.00 ea. TE247 No Bid No Bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
$125.00 / 
Fromuth
FEPTSI

No bid

No bid

No Bid

$3.59 / 
TSG500-
Gildan T-

Shirt 100% 
Coton

No Bid

No Bid

No bid

$4.25+shipping/
$4.16 no 
shpping
BA457P

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

$12.24 / 
AS5507

$7.19 / 
ES5563

No Bid

No Bid

$982.49 / 
AS55045

$189.27 / 
AS55023

$15.28 / 
AS5566 $38.95

$96.50 / case

$50.00 / 
MCBTF

$6.00 / 
Wilson Tida 

Force

$32.50 / 
Gamma

$4725.00 / 
Fromuth
OLOP2

$237.50 / 
Fromuth
OLOBER

$40.00 / 
Fromuth
Gamma
GHWH

No bid

No bid

No BidNo Bid

$5.20 / S-XL 
Gildan

50/50 lc 
logo.

No bid

No bid

No Bid No Bid $15.00 ea./Wilson 
Eenergy WPSI

No bid

No bid

No bid No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

$4.98 $9.90

No Bid $59.00 ea./TE172

$27.50 / 
Wilson

WR2323700

Pneumatic Remote Control for 
Lobster Tennis Machine - REF: 
Athletic Cnct. MTAIRREM

Ball Hooper
REF: Athletic Cnct. MTINSTRU

Tennis Balls   Heavy Duty 
Tournament   REF: Wilson T1001 
(72 balls per case)

Titanium Stretch Racket
REF: Wilson T3006

White T-Shirt w/one Color Screen on 
Front              REF: Russell 29MW 

Court Marker Lines Non skid, pvc 
marker lines for outlining 36’ or 60’ 
court

Lobster Tennis Ball Machine w/ 
Random Oscilator - REF: Athletic 
Cnct. MTLOBOSC

2/12pk

$77.50 / 
case

$5.00 / 29M

No bid

No bid $31.99

$100.25

$799.00 No bidNo Bid

No Bid $4.00

$3.08 set of 3 / SSI 
#006449No Bid

No Bid

$58.99 No bid

$20.00 No bid

No Bid

No bid

No bid No Bid

No bid

No bid

$3.06 ea. / 
Gildan

No bid

$3.23 / Riddell 
Gildan #GD110 
50/50 White T-

Shirt w/1CC Logo 
(#'s extra)

No Bid
$10.00ea./67014M
Unisex White w/ 
one color print

$135.99 No bid

No Bid

No bid

No Bid
$209.98/
Lobster

#1154788

No Bid

$879.98 / 
Lobster Elite 

Freedom
#1282474

$65.00 ea. / TE38-
2W

No bid

No bid

$5.98 / Jerzee

No Bid

$31.99 $39.00 No Bid $28.98 / BSN 
#MTINSTRU No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

15

120

No bid$96.00 / 
case

$3.19 can of 3 
/ Wilson 
T1001

#MTWILCAN

$57.60 / case

No bid

No Bid

No Bid$25.50

3

9

3

No bidNo Bid

$1395.00 ea./TE38-
E2 No Bid

$23.00 ea./TE19

No Bid

No Bid
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No bid

$32.64 / SSI 
#008069

ONCOURT
OFFCOURT

CEMP72

120

No Bid No bid No bid



TRACK Est.
Qty.

America
Team
Sports

Barcelona
Sporting
Goods

Cannon Sports, 
Inc. C-Pro USA MFAC, LLC Mira's Sports Neff Motivation 

Inc. School Specialty T-Shirt Gallery 
& Sports

The Sports 
Center of 
Laredo

$18.95 AAE-
PF100 $12.82 MSTAP330-330'

Alumagoal
$33.00 ea. / 

#4275 $17.00 4272A $56.95/Frazier
UR300/90M

$15.20 / Champion 
R330 SSI #009890

$38.95 - 300 
MSTAP300

$15.25 AAE-
PF60 $9.82 MSTAP200-200'

Fiberglass
$22.00 ea. / 

#4273 $23.50 4273A $39.95/Frazier
UR200/60M

$10.27 / Champion 
R200 SSI #008399

$25.99 - 200 
MSTAP200

$13.75 AAE-
PF50 $7.16 MSTAP165-165' $18.00 ea. / 

#4277 $34.50 4275A $28.95/Frazier
UR165/50M

$23.50 - 165 
MSTAP165

Training Shoes - Nike Air
Womens 120

$47.25 / 
Adidas
D74006
Special
Trainer

$65.00 No Bid $45.00 No Bid No Bid No bid No bid No Bid No Bid

Discus Womens - 1 Kilo Gill 
Super Spin 6 No bid $69.00 $70.23 / AS5830 No Bid $90.00 ea. / MF 

Alt. #9489
$44.95 / Frazier 

#477 No bid
$5.37 / Champion 

1.0 KR SSI 
#008336

$275.00 / Gill 
#305 Shooting 

Star

$327.50 / Gill 
Gold Discus 

72023

Shot Put - Brass, Womens - 4 
Kilo 3 No bid $130.00 $31.23 / ESSP4 No Bid $98.00 ea. / 

#4351 $25.95 / Cast Iron No bid No bid $130.00 / Gill 
3594

$132.00 / Gill 
3594

Sprirt Poles, 15"1"175 6 No bid $520.00 No Bid No Bid $515.00 ea. / 
SP460/80 No Bid No bid No bid No bid $550.00 / Gill 

C150175

Training Shoes - Nike Air 
Contrail 36

$47.25 / 
Adidas
D74006
Special
Trainer

$65.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid No bid

$48.00 / Ascics 
Gel Contendz 
Women's & 

Men's

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$385.00 ea.

No Bid

No Bid

No BidNo Bid

$3081.56 / 
ES58068

$65.00 / 
KEJ838 - 
KEB820

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
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$485.00 / SP460/80

$65.00

$25.00

No Bid

$20.01 / 
ES58010

BSN

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$550.00 / Gill 
727

$2144.00 / Gill 
7130

$63.00No Bid

No Bid No Bid

$19.62 / Neff-BG995-
Small Color Block 
Duffel, Black/Grey 

21"WX10.5"HX10"D

No bid

$120.00 / Gill 
983

No Bid

$1166.09 pr / 
Porta Pit 

APVELITE

No bid

No bid No bid

No bid

Lap Counter 2, 10" Digits 
Wheel Mounted Base Bell

Aluminum Pole Vault 
Standards 8'6" - 19" 4' Offset 
Unit Pegs 6"

Fiberglass Measuring Tapes, 3 
Tape, 330'-200'-165'

18

Windsuits, Jacket 100% Nylon, 
Water Repellent Crinkle 
Finishing, Gray/White/Black w/ 
Logo on Left Chest - Pants 
Black w/ Logo on Left Leg 
Chest - REF: Pro Celebrity 

Travel Bags - Addidas 
Santiago Team Bag M
25' X 10' X 11' Denier Nylon 
Bag, Black/White

36

120

36

3

No bid

296.98 / Blazer 
#AFLCBXXX$495.00

$131.00

$50.00

$32.00

No bid

No bid

No Bid

$66.54

$70.00

M-F Athletic

$369.00 / 4310A

$1295.00 / BLAZER 
1190

No Bid

No Bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid No bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$92.00 / 9489A

$75.50 / S-XL 
ProCelebrity

KEJ 838 
KEB820 w/stock 
ends ledt chest 
& leg chipant

$83.00 / #4351A$143.36

Aluminum
Athletic

Equipment Co.
$595.00 / AAE-BC-

B

$4.50 / AAE-80001 
(X-Bar Pins only)

No bid

No bid

$85.00

$19.00 / 
Defender

Duffel-
5126695

Bill Guthrie 
Sports Inc.

No Bid

No Bid

$37.08

$66.54

$172.33

$58.50 / 
Sport Tek 
JST61 - 
PST61

$145.00 / AAE-
GWD

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$88.65

No bid

No bid

No bid



Section VIII: FOOTBALL Est.
Qty.

Alert
Services Inc.

America
Team Sports

Barcelona
Sporting
Goods

Bill Guthrie 
Sports Inc. BSN Cannon

Sports, Inc. C-Pro USA Mira's Sports
Neff

Motivation
Inc.

Riddell / All 
American

T-Shirt Gallery and 
Sports

The Graphix 
Store

The Sports 
Center of 
Laredo

No Bid

$12.95 / 
F45014

$7.50 / 
C25109

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$5.50 / Jerzie 
50/50 29M

No Bid

$63.12
AS20109

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$178.00

$9.95

$25.00

$4.98

$6.98

$19.99

Notes

Practice Pants - Rawlings F4555

Football Girdle
REF: Rawlings BS5P09

Shoulder Pads - Schutt Tornado 
Model 8205 Single Hook-Up w/ 
Attached Backplate

Practice Football Shoes - Hi-Top 
Reebok Pit Bull Nylon

Practice Shorts - 1000 Denier w/ One 
Color Logo - REF: NECI 08070

Footballs w/ Logo - REF: Wilson 
F1005

Football Helmets - AHI Pro Air w/ 
Face Mask

1/2" Cleats for Nike Shoes

Receiver Gloves - Rawlings PRG

T-Shirts - Russell 64030 w/ One Color 
Logo

Lightweight Hip Pad Sets
REF: Model V3PP #130611 XX

Helmets - Pro Air II - Model 7788

72

90

6000

12 dz

30

300

75

54

24 dz

180

36dz $72.50 / A4-
N52Y3 $9.80

No Bid

No Bid

$7.99

$63.00

$107.88 / 
NEFF SHP7 
OR SHP9 

PRO

No bid

$62.40 / Riddel (A-4) 
#N5296 100% Ply, 
Lined w/1cc Logo 

(Add $1.00 for 2 XL 
& 3 XL)

No bid No bid

No Bid

$140.00 / Riddell 
#48310 Kombine w/ 
Built In Backplate

No bid$75.00

No bid

9 dz

No bid

No bid

No bid

$14.55 / 
ASSAT6LV

$69.95 / 
Jersey-29M

No bid

$237.00 / 
FGP5

$117.00 / 
F45014
(white)

$26.50 / 
Adidas-
G98753

Filthyquick
MD

No Bid

$66.48

$239.28

No Bid

No Bid

No BidNo bid

No Bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

$43.68 TSG 
500 Gildan 
Grey shirts

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

$85.00 / Riddell 
RevoEdge #41171 

All sizes w/ soft cup, 
No paint (MS 

Helmet)

No bid

No bid

$48.60 dz. / Riddell 
TSF 50/50 T-Shirt 
w/1cc Logo (#'s 

extra)
$9.68 / Riddell Vent 
Air 9" Hip Pad Set. 
Colors avall #48164

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

$70.00

$41.27 / Gildan

No Bid

$11.50 / 
Champro
RHULAZ

$15.00 / 
Cobblestone

MM6477

No Bid

No bid

$408.00 dz / 
Champro
FPGU8

No bid

No bid

$75.00 per 
100

$9.03 set / 
Schutt V3PP 
#13061102

$288.00 dz / Riddell 
#G10PTC w/hip, tail 

& thigh pads

$72.00

No bid

$11.98 / 
Frazier
TG2000

$19.98 / 
Frazier G-DK5-

DLT

No bid

No bid

$220.50 / Riddell 
RevoSpeed #41190 
uncl. Paint & hard 

cup (Add $15.00 for 
XL)

No bid

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No bidNo bid
$27.50 / 
Champro

FP10

No Bid

No bid

No bid

$92.98 / Gear 
Proker Z-Cool 

#1375237

No bid

No bid

No bid
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No Bid

$55.00 / 
Nike Shark

No bid

$6.50 / S-XXL 
AYN5296 9" mesh 

short lc logo.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$10.80

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$25.20

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$15.40 / 
McDavid 5 pkt 

girdle

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$6.15 / S-XL Gildan 
50/50 lc logo

No Bid

No Bid



GOLF Est.
Qty.

America Team 
Sports

Barcelona
Sporting Goods

Bill Guthrie 
Sports Inc.

Cannon
Sports, Inc. C-Pro USA Mira's Sports T-Shirt Gallery & Sports The Laredo 

Country Club
The Sports 

Center of Laredo

No Bid

$14.95

No Bid

$45.00

No Bid

No Bid

$85.00

$85.00

$85.00

$55.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$45.00

$38.00

$28.95

$15.00

$15.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$9.00

$39.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Golf Bags - REF: Ping Hoofer Vantage

Golf Balls - Bridgestone E-5

Golf Balls - REF: Spalding XL 2000 Extra 
Distance

Golf Balls - REF: Srixon Trispeed

Golf Balls - REF: Srixon Soft Feel

Golf Balls TA LNG - REF: Nike

Golf Balls - REF: Taylor Made TP - Blk  -
Model 30150501
Gloves - White/Silver Black -
REF: Nike Dura Feel

Gloves - REF: Nike

Gloves - REF: Footjoy Stasof

Tees - 200 per bag

Rain Jacket - REF: Adidas Clim Proof 
Provisional #468612

Rain Pants - REF: Adidas Clim Proof 
Provisional # 468606

Golf Shirts w/ logo - Climate Jersey w/ 
Hydrophilic Finish - REF: Adidas 862490

Golf Shirts w/ logo - Climate Jersey w/ 
Hydrophilic Finish - REF: Adidas 423135

Mens / Womens Polo Shirt - REF: Nike Dri Fit

Mens / Womens Tech Mock
REF: Nike Dri Fit

Womens Short Sleeve Shirt
REF: Under Armour

Golf Shirts - REF: Lamode (to include logo)

Caps w/ Logo - Fit Swoosh Flex Fit
REF: Nike 595746
Verdana Blucher Saddle II - Women Shoe
REF: Nike

Golf Club Set / Boys - REF: Tech Edge S360

Medicus Swing Trainer - 5 Iron Left Hand

Medicus Swing Trainer - Driver Right Hand

Medicus Swing Trainer - Driver Left Hand

10

50dz

60 dz

15 dz

15 dz

Shag Bags - REF: Hornning

Golf Shirts w/ Logo Page
REF: Callaway CS15557

Golf Shirts w/ Logo - REF: Callaway CW16409

Golf Shirts w/ Logo - REF: Callaway CW16391

Rain Suits - REF: Slazenger

6 dz

12 dz

15 dz

10

12

2

10

2

1

1

10dz

12 dz

10

10

3 dz

8

10

No bid

No bid

No bid

18

5

12

12

10

10

8

$157.35 No bid No bid

10

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No Bid

$30.00 No bid No bid

$22.00 No bid No bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No bid No bid

No Bid No bid No bid

No Bid

No Bid

$24.75 No bid No bid

No bid

No bid No Bid No bid No bid

No Bid

No BidNo Bid No bid

No bid

No bid No Bid No bid No bid

No bid

No Bid

No BidNo Bid No bid

No bid

No bid No Bid No bid No bid

No bid

No Bid

No BidNo Bid No bid

No bid

No bid $26.25 No bid No bid

No bid

$36.00 / Adidas 
Polo-1893

$36.00 / #1892No Bid No bid

No bid

No bid No Bid No bid No bid

No bid

$45.00 / 
#523065

No BidNo Bid No bid

No bid

No bid No Bid No bid No bid

No bid

$22.99 / 
#1233719

No BidNo Bid No bid

No bid

No bid No Bid No bid No bid

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No bid

No bid

$35.00 / 6942 $65.25 No bid $60.00 / S-XL BAW Rain 
Stop Jacket #JS009J

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No bid

$30.00 / BAW Rain Stop
Pant JS009FP

No bid No Bid $22.76 / 
AS2299

No bid

$27.50 / 9542

No Bid

No Bid

No bid

No bid

No bid No Bid $25.53 / 
AS2220

No bid

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No bid

No bid

No bid No Bid $29.23 / 
AS2242

No bid

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid $29.28 / 
AS2236

No bid

No bid No Bid No bid No bid

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No bid

$155.00 No bid

$185.00 No bid

$24.00 No bid

$24.00

No Bid

No bid

$23.99 No bid

$23.99 No bid

$22.99 No bid

$43.99 No bid

$12.99 No bid

No bid

$15.99 No bid

$15.99

$3.35 No bid

$46.99 $45.00 / Pro 
Celebrity

$46.99 $45.00 / Pro 
Celebrity

$55.99 $28.00 / Pro 
Celebrity

$55.99 No bid

$46.99 $20.00 / Blue Gen. 
BG62165

$46.99 $25.00 / Blue Gen. 
BG7225

$55.99 $25.00 / Blue Gen. 
BG7225

$55.99 $25.00 / Blue Gen. 
BG7225

$55.99 $25.00 / Blue Gen. 
BG7225

$55.99 $25.00 / Blue Gen. 
BG7225

$72.50 ea. / 
Holloway 229062 - 

229056

No bid

$65.99

$275.00 No bid

$65.99 $34.00 / Holloway 
229076

$60.99 $27.50 / Holloway 
229096

$15.99

No bid

$14.99 $228.00 dz / 
Ricardson Cad 

$120.00 No bid

$180.99 No bid

$110.00 No bid

Golf Shirts w/ Logo Page
REF: Callaway C29499 12 dz No bid No Bid No bid No bid

$180.99

No Bid
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$104.90 No bid No bid15Golf Balls - REF: Ping Hoofer w/ Stand No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$38.00

$38.00

$34.20

$34.20

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$13.50

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



SWIMMING Est.
Qty.

America Team 
Sports

Bill Fritz 
Sports Corp

Cannon
Sports, Inc.

The Sports 
Center of 
Laredo

Printed Latex Caps 12 No bid No bid $1.63 / 
AS5312 $20.00

$14.00

$38.00

$ 16.50 ea.

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

$3.97 / 
ES5310

No bid

No bid

No bid

No bid

$33.30

No bid

No bid

4 dz

4 dz

No bid

No bid

Team Sprint Goggles - REF: TYR LGT

20

12

No bidSwim Fins - Sizes 8-11 to 5-7 & 7-9 to 15-
17             REF: Zoomers ZRED BTF
Lane Gainer Surgical Tubing 3/8" - REF: 
ST316
Adult Snorkel Training Equipment
REF: Finis Swim Snokel #105009

No bid

No bid

No bidSolid Silicone Caps - REF: Speedo 
751104

per foot

12

No bid

No bid
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No bid

12

$66.00 No bid

Swimming Trunk - Poly Mesh Striped 
Square Leg - Speedo 705970
Hydrospex Goggles - REF: Speedo 
750281



EXERCISE EQUIPMENT Barcelona Sporting 
Goods

Bill Fritz 
Sports Corp BSN Cannon Sports, 

Inc.
Flaghouse

Inc. MFAC, LLC S&S Worldwide School
Specialty

The Sports 
Center of 
Laredo

$11.95 ea. MF Alt. 
#6548

No Bid

$35.95 ea. / MF Alt 
#8232 (Only used 
for body weight 

exercises, No weight 
or dumbbells.)

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$180.39 / W9075

No Bid$27.00

$220.00

No bid

No bid

No bid$320.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Tote Master Ball Cart - 3'L X 2'W X 3'H
REF: Sportime 405270941

Stretching/Strengthening 65CM Ball
REF: Exerball 107881415

Exercise Mat - 20W X 48L 1/2'H
REF: American Gateway Marketing Group

Low Push Up Bar - 24"L X 14"W (61CM X 
35.6CM) - REF: Park & Sun USA

Exercise Tubing - Heavy/Moderate
REF: Exertube

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$9.74 / ES16288

$10.88 / BSN
7137XXXX

4'L x 2'W x 3/8" W

$7.34 / BSN 
1249828 Cando 

tube with handles 
heavy

$9.86
$6.19 / GAIAM 

XR-H SSI 
#015302

$13.98 / Reactor 
#1335934 No bid

$13.51 / Sportime 
1005623 SSI 

#1005623

$121.22 / BSN 
STBALLOC $148.50

$9.86 $25.11 / SSI 
#009734 No bid

$22.95
$12.06 / Aeromat 

74502 SSI 
#006221

$17.95 ea. / MF 
Alt. #1062

No Bid

No bid

No bid
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$140.00 / TOTE 
MASTER TE-2 1 

SSI #013022

$275.00 / 
Champion

LTX

$22.00 / Atn. 
Connection

7137

No bid



SWIMMING POOL CHEMICALS
Muriatic Acid Case
50 LB Sodium Bicarbonate
50 LB Soda Ash
100 LB Drum Pusar Briquettes 
Kop Kit for Acid Pump
Kop Kit Replacement Tubing
Replacement Screen / Pulsar Line
Muriatic Acid 15 Gal. Drum 

Cleaning Fee
Drum Deposit

No Bid
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ATHLETIC SUPPLIES & EQUIPMENT
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TRAINER SUPPLIES Est.
Qty

Alert Services, 
Inc. BSN Cannon Sports, 

Inc.
Everything

Medical
Henry Schein 

Medical Mira Sport's Medco Supply MFAC, LLC School
Health

School
Specialty

South Texas 
Medical Equip. & 

Supplies

The Sports 
Center of Laredo

Powerflex - 2' X 6 YDS Black 10 $25.50 No bid No Bid $25.85 / 24/cs $25.89 / case No Bid $26.33 / 37905 No Bid $35.56 cs / 
#28170 No bid No Bid No bid

Heel & Lace Pads - 3"3" X 1/16 - 2000 / Box
REF: Mueller 10 $18.55 No bid No Bid $16.25 / 2000/bx $18.95 / case $33.95 / 

#080202 $20.30 / 6355S No Bid $26.08 cs / 
#28124 No bid No Bid $202.00 bx  

Q.D.A. - 8 OZ Aerosol - REF: Cramer 5 $6.35 No bid No Bid $7.95 / 8oz can $6.05 / bottle $19.50 ea. / 
#171531 $6.54 / 12170 No Bid $11.61 ea. / 

#50098 No bid No Bid $17.00 ea. / 
#171531

Tuf Skin - 8 OZ Aerosol - REF: Cramer 5 $7.44 8 oz / 
$7.86 10 oz No bid No Bid $6.80 / 8 oz can $7.89 / bottle $16.95 ea. / 

#203531 $8.11 / 28054M No Bid $10.41 ea. / 
#50097 No bid No Bid $14.00 ea. / 

#203531
Tuf Skin - 8 OZ Aerosol - Case of 12 -
REF: Cramer 5 $89.28 No bid No Bid $81.00 / 12/case $94.68 / case No Bid $97.32 / 

12430C No Bid $129.92 cs / 
#50097(12) No bid No Bid $168.00 bx / 

#203531

Tuf Skin - 10 OZ Aerosol - Case of 12 -
REF: Cramer 5 $94.32

$9.13 / Cramr 
Tuffskin 10oz 

#1078626
No Bid $90.00 / 12/case $90.00 / case No Bid $96.96 / 

12390C No Bid $148.44 ca / 
#50020(12) No bid No Bid $218.50 bx / 

#204033

Tape Remover - Pint - REF: Cramer 5 $9.47
$10.98 / Cramer 

Pint bottle 
#1078589

No Bid $8.75 / 16 oz ft $9.19 / bottle $21.95 ea. / 
#204033

$10.32 / 
28059M No Bid $13.13 ea. / 

#34100 No bid No Bid $17.00 ea. / 
#040481

Universal Adhesive Removal Wipes
Package of 50 2 $3.00 No bid No Bid $3.30 / 100/bx $3.72 / box No Bid $3.97 / 317594 No Bid $9.83 bx / 

#49036 No bid No Bid No bid

Elastic Bandage - 6" X 10 YDS - 10 / Box         REF: 
Econo Wrap 15 $29.50 No bid No Bid $12.50 / 10/bx $40.42 / box No Bid $18.95 / 

36300C No Bid $31.20 bx / 
#31147(10) No bid No Bid $45.00

Sterile Gauze Pads - 2" X 2" - 100 / Box 5 $3.90 No bid No Bid $2.10 / 100/bx $2.48 / box No Bid $3.15 / 35250 No Bid $5.15 bx / 
#27542 No bid $6.75 $12.50

Sterile Gauze Pads - 3" X 3" - 100 / Box 5 $5.37 No bid No Bid $3.19 / 100/bx $3.51 / box No Bid $3.95 / 35260 No Bid $5.61 bx / 
#27543 No bid $14.85 ea. $17.00

Sterile Gauza Pads - 4" X 4" - 100 / Box 5 $7.80 No bid No Bid $4.69 / 100/bx $5.60 / box No Bid $6.31 / 35270 No Bid $8.88 bx / 
#27544 No bid $14.00 ea $27.00

2nd Skin - 1" Squares 5 $17.70 / Alert 
Aqua Patch No bid No Bid $15.20 / 200/Jar $16.14 / Jar No Bid $18.77 / 35650 No Bid $26.17 jar / 

#27060 No bid No Bid No bid

2nd Skin - 3" Squares 5 $25.00 / Alert 
Aqua Patch No bid No Bid $22.95 / 48/Jar $23.99 / Jar No Bid $27.90 / 35690 No Bid $36.05 jar / 

#27061 No bid No Bid No bid

Cosmopores Dressing - 4" X 8" - REF: Hartman 5 $21.66 No bid No Bid $18.70 / 25/bx $20.64 / box No Bid $22.73 / 81911 No Bid $26.66 bx / 
#27251

No bid No Bid No bid

4 Wing Dressing - 3" X 3" - 50 / Box
REF: Coverlet 5 $8.85 No bid No Bid $3.50 / 50/bx $7.45 / box No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.06 bx / 

#32265 No bid No Bid No bid

$4.28 ea.

$12.38 ea.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$12.15 ea.

$13.05 ea.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$3.38 ea. 

5

5

No Bid

No Bid

10

10

10

15

15

15

No Bid

32

10

10

10

10

10

No Bid

No Bid

$10.60

$34.50

$33.50

No Bid

No Bid

$8.40 bx / 
ES5970

$10.00 bx / 
ES5971

No Bid

$59.95 / 32 ct 
Mueller 130605 

No Bid

No Bid

$4.50 ea. / 
#430626

$84.95 / 24 ct / 
Mueller 130602P

$84.99 / 16 ct 
Mueller 130603P 

No Bid

$66.95 / 48 ct 
#130707

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$55.00 $62.38 / 
AS59104 $49.49 / 32/cs

$32.70 / 
ES59002

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Coach Athletic Tape - 1 1/2" X 15 YDS 32 BOX
REF: J&J

Pro Trainer Elastic Tape - 2" X 7.5 YDS
REF: Medco
AC Tape - 2" X 5 YDS 24/BX
REF: Hartmann
Tear-Light Tape - 2" X 7 1/2 YDS - 24 / Box
REF: Mueller

Heel & Lace Pads - 3"3" X 1/16 - 2000 / Box
REF: Cramer

$80.00 per box / 
#5212

$32.70 / 
ES59002

Elastic Bandage - 3" X 4 1/2 YDS - 10 / Box
REF: Econo Wrap

Elastic Bandage - 4" X 4 1/2 YDS - 10 / Box
REF: Econo Wrap

Fingertip Dressing - 2 1/2" X 1 1/2" - 100 / Box
REF: Coverlet

#13.10 bx / 
ES5972

No Bid

Elastic Bandage - 6" X 4 1/2 YDS - 10 / Box         REF: 
Econo Wrap

Knuckle Dress - 1 1/2" X 3" - 100 / Box
REF: Coverlet

$40.00

$46.25

$40.00

No BidElastic Tape - 2" X 5 YDS - 24 / Box
REF: J & J
Elastic Tape - 3" X 5 YDS - 16 / Box
REF: J & J
Pro Trainer Foam Underwrap - 2 3/4" X 30 YDS
REF: Medco

M-Wrap - 2 3/4" X 30 YDS Black
REF: Mueller

No bid$6.72

$9.56

$6.61

$6.00

$7.20

No bid

No bid

No Bid $3.83 bx / 
#32248

No bid No bid

No bid No Bid $5.50 bx / 
#32230 No bid No bid

No Bid

$14.23 / 
36370C

$7.80 bx / 
#31095 No bid $54.50

No bid $9.39 / 36360C $5.33 bx / 
#31094 No bid $43.50 bx $4.10 / 10/bx

$7.56 / 36350C $4.42 bx / 
#31093 No bid

$37.50 bx / 
Cramer 3X5 (12 

per box)

$22.49 Cramer 
3"x3" #1078312

$17.28 / 
28052M

$24.96 bx / 
#28123 No bid $40.50 bx / 

Cramer 082514No Bid

$40.98 case / 
Mueller M-Wrap 
#1362650-black
& #1362651-blue

$33.15 / 92095 $40.98 cs / 
#28065 No bid $93.50 bx / Muller 

214615

$60.52 / 84500 $69.42 cs / 
#28108 No bid $92.00 bx / 

Cramer 284300

No bid $29.52 / 92120 $37.29 cs / 
#28047 No bid $93.50 bx / Muller 

214592

$92.00 bx / 
Cramer 284200No bid $60.52 / 84480 $69.42 cs / 

#28107 No bid

No bid

No bid $43.38 / 85962 $59.45 cs / 
#28128 No bid No bid

No bid $34.15 / 85295 $57.36 cs / 
#28428 No bid $52.50 / Cramer 

285102
$68.22 cs / 

#28249 No bid $91.00 / Cramer 
284200No bid $42.45 / 84410

$63.00 / Cramer 
280750No bid $51.26 / 

32044M
$59.14 cs / 

#28026

$46.40 / cs 
Cramer

029287 32 per 
cs

$16.25 / 2000/bx

$3.30 / 10/bx

$6.30 / 10/bx

$2.85 / 100/bx

$34.50 / 24/cs

$40.95 / 24/cs

$43.70 / 24/cs

$55.39 / 24/cs

$55.39 / 16/cs

$31.49 / 48/cs

$5.16 / box

$5.27 / box

$49.65 / case

$2.85 / 100/bx

$42.81 / case

$44.23 / box

$45.26 / case

$57.88 / case

$57.88 / case

$32.51 / case
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$4.28 / box

$6.01 / box

$33.57 / case

$16.54 / box

$3.18 / box

$31.49 / 48/cs


