United Independent School District
Paint & Paint Supplies
RFP 2014-068

VENDORS Briggs Equipment Home Depot USA The Sherwin Williams Co.
PERCENTAGE DISCOUNTS
% off Shelf Price 3% (Annual rebates under US Communities) 40%
% off List Price No Bid 0% TXMAS No. 5-51V010
% off Catalog Price 0% 40%
EXTERIOR OIL BASE ENAMEL HOUSE
PAINT BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
\White - 1 gallon Glidden 2516-0100-01 $27.44 B54w101 16.67
White - 5 gallons B54w101 83.05
Pastel Colors - 1 gallon Glidden 2516-0100-01 $27.44 B54w102 16.61
Pastel Colors - 5 gallons No Bid B54w102 83.05
Medium Colors - 1 gallon Glidden 2516-0100-01 $27.44 B54w102 16.61
Medium Colors - 5 gallons B54w102 83.03
Deep Colors - 1 gallon Glidden 2516-0100-01 $27.44 B54w103 16.61
Deep Colors - 5 gallons B54w103 83.05
INTERIOR OIL BASE ENAMEL HOUSE
PAINT BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
\White - 1 gallon Glidden 1516-0100N-01 $29.40 B34w451 PM400 alkyd $18.41
\White - 5 gallons Glidden 1516-0100N-05 $146.85 B34w451 PM400 alkyd $92.05
Pastel Colors - 1 gallon Glidden 1516-0100N-01 $29.40 B34w451 PM400 alkyd $18.41
Pastel Colors - 5 gallons No Bid Glidden 1516-0100N-05 $146.85 B34w451 PM400 alkyd $92.05
Medium Colors - 1 gallon Glidden 1516-0100N-01 $29.40 B34w452 PM400 alkyd $18.41
Medium Colors - 5 gallons Glidden 1516-0100N-05 $146.85 B34w452 PM400 alkyd $92.05
Deep Colors - 1 gallon Glidden 1516-0100N-01 $29.40 B34w453 PM400 alkyd $18.41
Deep Colors - 5 gallons Glidden 1516-0100N-05 $146.85 B34w453 PM400 alkyd $92.05
INTERIOR PURE WHITE LATEX CEILING
PAINT BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
Flat Latex Paint - 1 gallon No bid Glidden GLN6400 01 $20.78 64035447 $12.00
Flat Latex Paint - 5 gallons Glidden GLN6400 05 $93.50 640354445 $48.10
INTERIOR LATEX S/G PAINT BRAND & ITEM NUMBER | UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
\White - 1 gallon Glidden GLN6400 01 20.78 6503062957 PM400 0 VOV LSG 16.00
White - 5 gallons Glidden GLN6400 05 93.50 650362965 PM400 0 VOV LSG 81.80
Pastel Colors - 1 gallon Glidden GLN6400 01 20.78 B31w4452 PM400 0 VOV LSG 16.00
Pastel Colors - 5 gallons No Bid Glidden GLN6400 05 93.50 B31w4452 PM400 0 VOV LSG 81.80
Medium Colors - 1 gallon Glidden GLN6400 01 20.78 B31w4453 PM400 0 VOV LSG 16.00
Medium Colors - 5 gallons Glidden GLN6400 05 93.50 B31w4453 PM400 0 VOV LSG 81.80
Deep Colors - 1 gallon Glidden GLN6400 01 20.78 B31wr26 PM200 0 VOV LSG 22.89
Deep Colors - 5 gallons Glidden GLN6400 05 93.50 B31wr26 PM200 0 VOV LSG $114.45
EXTERIOR ACRYLIC LATEX FLAT PAINT BRAND & ITEM NUMBER | UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
\White - 1 gallon Glidden 6111 01 19.18 ABw151 A-100 FLAT 18.00
\White - 5 gallons Glidden 6111 05 85.60 ABw151 A-100 FLAT 89.25
Pastel Colors - 1 gallon Glidden 6111 01 19.18 ABwW152 A-100 FLAT 18.00
Pastel Colors - 5 gallons No Bid Glidden 6111 05 85.60 ABwW152 A-100 FLAT 89.25
Medium Colors - 1 gallon Glidden 6111 01 19.18 ABwW152 A-100 FLAT 18.00
Medium Colors - 5 gallons Glidden 6111 05 85.60 ABwW152 A-100 FLAT 89.25
Deep Colors - 1 gallon Glidden 6111 01 19.18 ABw152 A-100 FLAT 18.00
Deep Colors - 5 gallons Glidden 6111 05 85.60 ABW152 A-100 FLAT 89.25
LEAD FREE OIL BASE ENAMEL for
METAL BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
\White - 1 gallon Glidden DevGuard 4308-0100 01 $27.54 B54w101 Ind. Enamel $16.61
\White - 5 gallons Glidden DevGuard 4308-0100 05 $130.83 B54w101 Ind. Enamel $83.05
Pastel Colors - 1 gallon Glidden DevGuard 4308-0100 01 $27.54 B54w102 Ind. Enamel $16.61
Pastel Colors - 5 gallons Glidden DevGuard 4308-0100 05 $130.83 B54w102 Ind. Enamel $83.05
Medium Colors - 1 gallon No Bid Glidden DevGuard 4308-0100 01 $27.54 B54w103 Ind. Enamel $16.61
Medium Colors - 5 gallons Glidden DevGuard 4308-0100 05 $130.83 B54w103 Ind. Enamel $83.05
Deep Colors - 1 gallon Glidden DevGuard 4308-0100 01 $27.54 B54w104 Ind. Enamel $16.61
Deep Colors - 5 gallons Glidden DevGuard 4308-0100 05 $130.83 B54w104 Ind. Enamel $83.05
Industrial Enamel Safety Yellow-1 gallon No Bid B54Y3007 Ind. En Safety Yellon $19.84
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VENDORS Briggs Equipment Home Depot USA The Sherwin Williams Co.
LEAD FREE OIL ggf(E):QOsr METAL SAFETY BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
Safety Red - 1 gallon Rustoleum 49554 $26.87 B54R0038 Ind. Ename 19.84
Safety Red - 5 gallons No Bid B54R0038 Ind. Ename 94.20
Safety Yellow - 1 gallon Glidden DevGuard 4308-0400 01 $28.01 B54R3007 Ind. Ename 19.84
Safety Yellow - 5 gallons Glidden DevGuard 4308-0400 05 $133.23 B54R3007 Ind. Ename 94.20
Safety Orange - 1 gallon Glidden DevGuard 4308-9200 01 $33.49 B54R3008 Ind. Enamel 19.84
Safety Orange -5 gallons No Bid B54R3008 Ind. Enamel 94.20
Safety Blue - 1 gallon No Bid Rustoleum 751601 $26.87 B54 Series Ind. Enamel 19.84
Safety Blue - 5 gallons No Bid B54 Series Ind. Enamel 94.20
Paint Thinner - 1 gallon Kleenstrip 198373 $10.97 154-8759 $7.05
Paint Thinner - 5 gallons No Bid 154-2331 Pt. thinner (metal) 26.85
Lacquer Thinner - 1 gallon Kleenstrip 522522 $17.56 160-0204 16.12
Lacquer Thinner - 5 gallons No Bid 406-0604 65.08
Paint Remover - 1 gallon Kleenstrip 576735 $24.48 1527712 SavoGram Superstrip 19.40
Paint Remover - 5 gallons No Bid 527712 SavoGram Superstrip, specail ord| 97.00
INTERIOR, EXTERIOR & METAL PRIMERS BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
Exterior Primer Water Base - 1 gallon Glidden GL-3210-1200-01 (Gripper) $17.58 600-6258 ProBlock 18.45
Exterior Primer Water Base - 5 gallons Glidden GL-3210-1200-05 (Gripper) $79.20 600-6266 Problock 90.25
Exterior Primer Oil Base - 1 gallon No Bid 650133366 Fast Drying Primer 17.86
Exterior Primer Oil Base - 5 gallons No Bid 650133374 Fast Drying Primer 85.45
Interior Water Base - 1 gallon No Bid Glidden 1050-1200 01 $7.98 B28W8601 Int. Wall Primer 10.19
or Water Base - 5gallons Glidden 1050-1200 05 $31.98 B28W8601 Int. Wall Primer 50.95
or Oil Base - 1 gallon No Bid 650133366 Fast Drying Primer 17.86
or Oil Base - 5 gallons No Bid 650133374 Fast Drying Primer 85.45
Premium Metal Primer - 1 gallon Glidden DevGuard 4141-1000 01 $21.52 6304539 Kem Bond 26.01
[Premium Metal Primer - 5 gallons Glidden DevGuard 4141-1000 05 $105.76 640167151 Kem Bond $126.45
LEAD FREE TRAFFIC AND ZONE
MARKING FLAT LATEX PAINT BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
White - 1 gallon Rustoleum 449091 26.87 80003238 Setfast Flat White 14.52
White - 5 gallons Traffic Paint 22693-05 63.34 80003238 Setfast Flat White 72.60
Yellow - 1 gallon Rustoleum 751630 21.97 80003246 Setfast Yellow 15.41
Yellow - 5 gallons Traffic Paint 2088-05 72.23 80003246 Setfast Yellow 77.05
Red- 1 gallon Rustoleum 495544 26.87 640114666 Setfast Red 23.00
Red - 5 gallons No Bid 640114666 Setfast Red $114.75
Blue - 1 gallon Rustoleum 751630 $21.97 640114641 Setfast Blue $14.52
Blue - 5 gallons No Bid Traffic Paint 2090-05 $88.43 640114641 Setfast Blue $72.60
:{Ex?’ﬁ&?jg"&igﬁspa'm (Conventional No Bid 800003246 ProMar Solvent $69.45
SetFast Zone Marking Paint (Premium Alkyd) No Bid 650327224 Propark Red $127.95
Red-5 gallons
:{fx‘;‘}éﬂ‘g g"’;ﬁ"’;g Paint (Conventional No Bid 800003246 ProMar Solvent $60.45
:I'lf;‘g‘;"ljZgi’:’i"ﬁ’;ﬁ;\:\ig‘;ﬁzg‘f"“"”a' No Bid 800055923 Solvent Based Yellow $73.75
NON-SKID ACRYLIC COATING BRAND & ITEM NUMBER | UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
French Gray - 1 gallon No Bid Glidden DF8016 01 _ $19.98 650202864 Porch and Floor $28.00
French Gray - 5 gallons No Bid 650202872 Porch and Floor $137.50
CLEAR WOOD FINISHES BRAND & ITEM NUMBER | UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
Exterior Varnish all Sheens - 1 gallon 1545102 Minwax Int/Ext $33.60
Exterior Varnish all Sheens - 5 gallons 1545100 Minwax Int/Ext $195.00
Interior Varnish all Sheens - 1 gallon AB6v391 Int. Varnish $23.51
|Int erior Varnish all Sheens - 5 gallons AB6v391 SW WD Classics $115.00
Polyurethane Industrial - 1 gallon 1021252 WD Classics poly. $24.94
Polyurethane Industrial - 5 gallons No Bid A66F90 Wd ClI. Poly $120.00
Lacquer Finish - 1 gallon T75C15 $23.00
Lacquer Finish - 5 gallons No Bid T75C15 $115.00
Sealer Oil Base - 1 gallon 640315909 fst dry sealer 19.06
Sealer Oil Base - 5 gallons B26V43 90.00
Sealer Lacquer - 1 gallon B44VT0061 Gem lacq. 22.00
Sealer Lacquer - 5 gallons B44VT0061 Gem lacq. $105.00
Miniwax Stains - 1 gallon Minwax 916951 19.98 1543313 Minwax St. 14.23
Miniwax Stains - 5 gallons Minwax 70.00
|Oil Stains - 1 gallon No Bid A49w207 Wd Classics 20.06
Oil Stains - 5 gallons A49w207 Wd Classics 97.50
HEAT RESISTANT PAINT ENAMEL BRAND & ITEM NUMBER | UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
Hi Heat Paint Alum - 1 gallon 6311336 hh alum $24.00
Hi Heat Paint Alum - 5 gallons No bid No Bid 6311300 $115.00
Hi Heat Paint Colors - 1 gallon 1883823 sw hiheat flame control $99.00
Hi Heat Paint Colors - 5 gallons 1883800 sw hiheat flame control $149.00
FAST-DRYING SOLVENT | BRAND & ITEM NUMBER | UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE | BRAND & ITEM NUMBER | UNIT PRICEl
VM&P Naphtha R1K3 Reducer-1 gallon | No Bid No Bid | 853-8720 Vmp Naphtha | $19.00 |
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VENDORS

Briggs Equipment

Home Depot USA

The Sherwin Williams Co.

PAINT BRUSHES FOR LATEX PAINT BRAND & ITEM NUMBER | UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
2" Nylon - all purpose All Paints 453048 $7.97 1809995 Proval Trim $4.23
3" Nylon - all purpose No Bid All Paints 463175 $9.97 1809961 Proval Trim $6.43
4" Nylon - all purpose All Paints 716871 $10.97 1890035 Proval Trim $10.49
PAINT BRUSHES FOR ENAMEL FINISHES BRAND & ITEM NUMBER | UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
2" Nature Bristle All Paints 453048 $7.97 1803303 Commodore $5.05
3" Nature Bristle No Bid All Paints 463175 $9.97 1803311 Commodore $7.09
4" Nature Bristle All Paints 716871 $10.97 1803329 Commodore $11.01
ROLLER COVERS - GENERAL PURPOSE -
9" BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
1/4" Nap Poly Roller Cover All Paints 852363 $3.47 650266034 Cont. series $3.06
3/8" Nap Poly Roller Cover All Paints 537483 $3.67 1728518 Cont. series $2.64
1/2" Nap Poly Roller Cover All Paints 852563 $3.87 1728500 Cont. Series $2.55
1" Nap Poly Roller Cover No Bid No Bid 1734409 Cont. Series $3.83
1 1/2" Nap Poly Roller Cover 1735346 Cont. Series $5.64
378" Nap %omractor Series Soft Woven 4 .
Trim All Paints 438301 $4.97 1810308 Soft Woven Colossus $4.31
ROLLER COVERS for OIL BASE
& INDUSTRIAL PAINTS - 9" BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
1/4" Nap Poly Roller Cover All Paints 852363 3.47 1551332 Sherfab 4.52
1/2" Nap Poly Roller Cover All Paints 852563 3.87 1551456 Cont. series 8.42
3/4" Nap Poly Roller Cover No Bid All Paints 497665 4.97 1551464 Cont. Series 8.87
1" Nap Poly Roller Cover No Bid 1806488 Cont. Series 9.51
1 1/2" Nap Poly Roller Cover 1551480 Cont. Series 9.95
LATEX PAINT ROLLER COVERS - 9" BRAND & ITEM NUMBER | UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
1/4" Polyblend Cover All Paints 852363 3.47 173933 Poly Woven Cont. ser. 4.33
1/2" Polyblend Cover All Paints 852563 3.87 1734300 Cont. Series 2.55
3/4" Polyblend Cover No Bid All Paints 497665 4.97 1734318 Cont. Series 3.05
1" Polyblend Cover No Bid 1734409 Cont. Series 3.83
1 1/2" Polyblend Cover 1734406 Cont. Series 5.64
MINI'ROLLERS & KITS BRAND & ITEM NUMBER | UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
4" Foam All Paints 229424 $6.97 650260185 Foam 4" 4.41
6" Foam 650260193 Foam 6" 4.89
4" Woven No Bid No Bid 650166150 4" woven blue 4.25
6" Woven 650166275 6" woven blue 4.89
Foam with Handle No Bid
ROLLER HANDLES & TRAYS BRAND & ITEM NUMBER | UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
9" Paint Tray 1709385 Premium 9" Tray 2.55
9" Handle - Good Quality 1801497 Heavy Duty 5 wire 1.79
9" Handle - Better Quality . . 1801489 Heavy Duty 3.31
9" Handle - Best Quality No Bid No Bid 1715135 Professional 5.43
4" Extension Wood Pole 1731892 4' Pole 1.79
6" Extension Wood Pole 1703263 6' Pole 2.91
ABRASIVES BRAND & ITEM NUMBER | UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
Steel Wool 0-0000 Steel Wool 835128 3.98 9513441 Steel Wool $3.81
Fine Sandpaper Norton 572643 3.97 1539907 3M 0.43 ea
Coarse Sandpaper Norton 326883 3.97 1539915 3M 0.43 ea
et or Dry Metal S/Paper No Bid Norton 572643 3.97 1552110 GTK copr. 60 1.94 / ft
Floor Sandpaper - 60 grit by ft Norton 362883 3.97 No Bid
Floor Sandpaper - 80 grit by ft Norton 362883 3.97 1552108 GTK 80 [ $1.94/1t
Floor Sandpaper - 100 grit by ft Norton 572572 3.97 1552090 GKT 100 | $1.94/1t
| SPACKLE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER | UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
Interior - 1 quart Phenopatch 512428 $5.48 1516442 Sw Spackle $3.83
Interior - 1 gallon No Bid Phenopatch 513187 $14.48 1516000 Shrink Free SW $15.05
Exterior - 1 quart DAP 250921 $6.98 1542000 MnWax $9.73
Exterior - 1 gallon DAP 283738 $18.48 No Bid
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VENDORS Briggs Equipment Home Depot USA The Sherwin Williams Co.
MASKING TAPE (ROLL) BRAND & ITEM NUMBER | | UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
1/4" No Bid 4048914 Shurtape $0.35
1/2" 11534916 Shurtape $1.19
1" No Bid Scotchblue 958999 $3.93 1534924 Shurtape $1.35
11/2" Scotchblue 303121 $5.93 1534924 Shurtape $2.05
2" Scotchblue 315026 $6.58 1722297 Shurtape $2.55
DROP CLOTHS BRAND & ITEM NUMBER | UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE
0.05 Plastic Drop - 9" X 12" Husky 143652 (3 pak) $4.97 1452240 Polyamerica $0.77
1 Mil. Plastic Drop - 9" X 12" No Bid Husky 460257 (1 pak) $2.98 1452432 Polyamerica $1.49
Canvas - 9" X 12" Everbilt 279760 (10 pak) $26.98 9743717 Contractor Canvas $21.67
Canvas - 12" X 15" Everbilt 633741 $31.98 1136811 Cont. Canvas $31.19
MISCELLANEOUS | BRAND & ITEM NUMBER | UNIT PRICE | BRAND & ITEM NUMBER UNIT PRICE BRAND & ITEM NUMBER [ UNIT PRICE |
[Caulk - Tube | No Bid | Alex 753709 $3.98 1518323 c850 | s140 |

*One (1) vendor submitted a "No Bid" Proposal.
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