UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
HEAVY EQUIPMENT RENTAL SERVICES
RFP 2014-066

VENDOR Briggs Equipment Holt Texas, LTD
SECTION I: PERCENTAGE DISCOUNTS
% off CATALOG PRICE
% off LIST PRICE 0% 0%
% off SHELF PRICE
SECTION II: GENERAL EQUIPMENT COST PER WEEK | COST PER MONTH COST PER WEEK | COST PER MONTH
Automatic Level #AX-1 for Elevation w/ Legs No Bid .
Concrete Finisher 48" $237.00 | $495.00 No Bid
Dozer STD Track 70 HP No Bid $1,237.29 [ $3,036.24
Air Pavement Breaker 30# w/ Moil Point 1" X 4 1/4" $192.00 | $440.00
Concrete Finisher 36" No Bid
Saw Concrete 13 HP $237.00 $495.00 No Bid
Push Around Manlift (GENIE) 23" to 25" $225.00 $675.00
Push Around Manlift (GENIE) 30" to 33" $300.00 $725.00
#MP 60 FH (BOOM) 60" Lift $1,195.00 $3,295.00
Motorgrader #730 A No Bid $3,391.86 [ $8,788.71
Ditchwitch Trencher #4500 $1,115.00 | $3,295.00
# L 35 Backhoe Tractor No Bid
Dump Truck 6 1/2 yd .
No Bid
Motorgrader #710 A $2,745.45 [ $6,654.03
#460 Trencher UIT 4" BOOM No Bid
Front End Loader Mod #821 13 CAB-H & A 3.5-Y $1,695.00 | $4,895.00 $2,404.43 | $5,887.08
20" to 30"Height Manlift (GENIE) 19'-$333.00/ 26'-435.00/32' - 477.00
416-F Backhoe Tractor $895.00 | $2,498.00
Dump Truck 6 cub!c yards No Bid
Dump Truck 8 cubic yards No Bid
Dump Truck 10 cubic yards
Dump Truck 12 cubic yards




