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1 40-11214 LUMBER  1 x 12 x 14 EA No Bid $19.98 No Bid

2 40-11216C LUMBER, 1 x 12 x 16 CEDAR EA No Bid $22.98 No Bid

3 40-1216C LUMBER, 1 x 2 x 16 CEDAR EA No Bid $6.99 No Bid

4 40-128 LUMBER, 1 x 2 x 8 EA No Bid $3.48 No Bid

5 40-1410 LUMBER, 1 x 4 x 10  CEDAR EA No Bid $6.29 No Bid

6 40-1610 LUMBER,  1 x 6 x 10 CEDAR EA No Bid $10.29 No Bid

7 40-1810 LUMBER, 1 x 8 x10 EA No Bid $13.99 No Bid

8 40-1816C LUMBER, 1 x 8 x 16 CEDAR EA No Bid $19.99 No Bid

9 40-2068W DOOR, SOLID WOOD 2.0 x 6.8 EA No Bid $105.00 No Bid

10 40-21212 LUMBER, 2 x 12 x 12 EA No Bid $21.99 No Bid

11 40-21216 LUMBER, 2 x 12 x 16 EA No Bid $30.99 No Bid

12 40-2480W DOOR, WOOD 24 x 80 EA No Bid $26.99 No Bid

13 40-2610 LUMBER, 2 x 6 x 10 EA No Bid $8.99 No Bid

14 40-2616 LUMBER, 2 x 6 x 16 EA No Bid $12.99 No Bid

15 40-2616T LUMBER, TREATED 2 x 6 x 16 EA No Bid $14.49 No Bid

16 40-2810 LUMBER 2x8x10 EA No Bid $9.19 No Bid

17 40-2816 LUMBER 2x8x16 EA No Bid $15.49 No Bid

18 40-2816T LUMBER, TREATED 2 x 8 x 16 EA No Bid $16.49 No Bid

19 40-2818 LUMBER, 2x8x18 EA No Bid $15.49 No Bid

20 40-3068M DOOR, METAL 30 x 68 EA No Bid $159.99 No Bid

21 40-3068W DOOR, WOOD 30 x 68 EA No Bid $83.00 No Bid

22 40-3680W DOOR, WOOD 36 x 68 EA No Bid $73.00 No Bid

23 40-4196 SEALER, ASPHALT-CONCRETE LIQUA- EA No Bid No Bid No Bid

24 40-4410T LUMBER 4 x 4 x 10' TREATED EA No Bid $16.99 No Bid

25 40-448T LUMBER, TREATED 4 x 4 x 8' EA No Bid $10.79 No Bid

26 40-BW01 TIE WIRE [ROLLS] RLL $4.50 Sastie Wir $4.99 $4.99

27 40-CRM80 READY MIX 80 LBS. BAG $3.95
Ala 71295

Quikrete
$4.59 $4.29

28 40-CT2983 TILE, CEILING  2 x 4 FIBERGLASS BX No Bid $51.00 No Bid

29 40-CT584 TILE, CEILING  2 x 2 BX No Bid - special order No Bid

30 40-DS36 DOOR SWEEP, ALUMINUM  36" EA No Bid $11.99 No Bid

31 40-DS602 SCREW, DRYWALL 6 x 2 LB No Bid $5.99 No Bid

32 40-DS61 SCREW, DRYWALL   6 x 1 LB No Bid $5.99 No Bid

33 40-NC08 NAIL, #8 COMMON LB No Bid $4.99 No Bid

34 40-QS25 FLOOR LEVELER,  PATCHING COMPOUND 25# BAG No Bid $18.99 No Bid

35 40-RF02 ROOF FLASHING 1"-2" EA No Bid $9.49 No Bid

36 40-RF30 FELT, ROOFING #30 EA No Bid $18.99 No Bid

37 40-RF34 ROOF FLASHING 3-4" EA No Bid $8.49 No Bid

38 40-SCT40 TEXTONE,  CEILING SPRAY EA No Bid $9.99 No Bid

39 40-SF350 SNAKE FENCE 36" X 50' RLL No Bid $61.00 No Bid

40 40-SH03 SHINGLES, ROOF PKG No Bid $30.95 20yrs+25 yrs No Bid

41 40-TMG22 THINSET, MORTAR BAG $8.50
LAT317

Grey Laticrete
$9.99 No Bid

42 40-VT615 TILE VINYL SPEARMINT BX No Bid No Bid No Bid

43 40-VT785 TILE, VINYL CIRRAS BX No Bid No Bid No Bid

44 40-VT862 TILE, VINYL WHITE CLOUD BX No Bid $70.00 No Bid

45 40-VT873 TILE, VINYL SAND DUNE BX No Bid $70.00 No Bid

46 40-VT874 TILE, VINYL DESERT HAZE BX No Bid $70.00 No Bid

47 40-VT957 TILE, VINYL FIELDSTONE BX No Bid $70.00 No Bid

48 40-VTD042 CERAMIC TILE D042 BX No Bid No Bid No Bid

49 40-VTD156 CERAMIC TILE D-156 BX No Bid No Bid No Bid

50 40-VTD178 CERAMIC TILE D178 BX $43.75 4x4 Standard Color No Bid No Bid

51 40-VTD343 CERAMIC TILE D343 BX $43.75 4x4 Standard Color No Bid No Bid

52 40-VTD452 CERAMIC TILE D452 BX $43.75 4x4 Standard Color No Bid No Bid

53 40-VTILE TILE VINYL BX No Bid $40.95 Stock Color No Bid

54 40-VTMRT1 MARAZZI PORCELAIN TILE MRT-1 BX $58.12 Marazzi per Box No Bid No Bid

55 40-VTMRT3 MARAZZI PORCELAIN TILE MRT3 BX $58.12 Marazzi per Box No Bid No Bid

56 40-W3X3 WINDOWS FOR PORTABLES EA No Bid No Bid No Bid

57 40-WB9648 WHITE BOARD No Bid $16.99 No Bid

58 40-WER14X10 ROUND ROD, ¼" x  10 EA No Bid No Bid $3.60

59 40-WM4X50 WIRE MESH RLL $120.00
SAS 6610 

Mesh Roll
$199.99 No Bid

60 40-WP48 PANELING EA No Bid $21.00 Stock Color No Bid

61 40-WS14 WEATHERSTRIP EA No Bid $9.99 No Bid

62 60-11249 TWINE, NYLON RLL No Bid $9.99 No Bid

63 60-42100 WEATHERSTRIP 3' X 6' No Bid $16.99 No Bid

64 60-CH14 CHAIN 1/4" FEET No Bid $3.29 No Bid

65 60-CR3208 CHAULK LINE REFILL EA $4.50
SOU 16-812

Trollex USA
$5.99 No Bid

66 60-F1212 FOAM SEALANT SPRAY CAN EA No Bid $5.99 No Bid
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67 60-GS12 SPRAY GREASE TUBE No Bid $6.99 No Bid

68 60-HCB12 BLADE, CONCRETE 12" EA No Bid No Bid No Bid

69 60-HS78 HOLE SAW 7/8" EA No Bid $15.99 No Bid

70 60-HSB24 BLADE HACKSAW EA No Bid $5.99 No Bid

71 60-MCW12 BLADE CARBIDE 12" EA No Bid $12.99 No Bid

72 60-NYS04 STRAP NYLON 4" EA No Bid $6.99 No Bid

73 60-NYS06 STRAP NYLON 6" EA No Bid $8.99 No Bid

74 60-NYS12 STRAP NYLON 12" EA No Bid $10.99 No Bid

75 60-NYS14 STRAP NYLON 14" EA No Bid $12.99 No Bid

76 60-NYS21 STRAP  NYLON 21" EA No Bid $19.99 No Bid

77 60-NYS28 STRAP NYLON 28" EA No Bid $24.99 No Bid

78 60-NYS36 STRAP NYLON 36" EA No Bid $28.99 No Bid

79 60-NYS45 STRAP NYLON 45" EA No Bid $9.99 No Bid

80 60-SB714 BLADE SAW 7 1/4" EA No Bid $8.99 No Bid

81 61-CB993 ADHESIVE COVE BASE (1-GAL) EA No Bid $21.79 No Bid

82 61-CBA2100 ADHESIVE COVE BASE (4-GAL) EA No Bid No Bid No Bid

83 61-CFLA01 CONCRETE ADDITIVE GAL. EA No Bid $21.99 No Bid

84 61-COCE01 CONTACT CEMENT (GAL.) EA No Bid $28.99 No Bid

85 61-COCE32 CONTACT CEMENT (QT.) EA No Bid $14.99 No Bid

86 61-JC02 JOINT COMPOUND SHEETROCK BX No Bid $8.99 No Bid

87 61-SD05 CEMENT, ROOF SILVER DOLLAR EA No Bid No Bid No Bid

88 62-21691 SANDING  BELT  3" X 21" EA No Bid $6.99 No Bid

89 62-51503 TAPE MASKING 3" RLL No Bid $5.99 No Bid

90 62-9001NA SANDPAPER FINE 150 SHEET No Bid $2.79 No Bid

91 62-9002NA SANDPAPER MEDIUM 100 SHEET No Bid $4.99 No Bid

92 62-9038NA SANDPAPER COARSE 60 FOR WO SHEET No Bid $4.99 No Bid

93 63-H5M520 ANCHOR PLASTIC #14-16 X 1 PKG No Bid $6.29 No Bid

94 63-PAK14 ANCHOR KIT PLASTIC PKG No Bid $13.99 No Bid

95 63-SH3830 ANCHOR WEDGE 3/8 X 3 EA No Bid $2.29 $0.58

96 63-W3805 ANCHOR WEDGE  3/8 X 5 EA No Bid $3.99 $1.59

97 63-WA12334 ANCHOR WEDGE 1/2 X 3 3/4 EA No Bid $3.99 $0.89

98 63-WA12412 ANCHOR WEDGE 1/2 X 4 1/2 EA No Bid $4.05 $0.89

99 63-WA12512 ANCHOR WEDGE  1/2 X  5 1/2 EA No Bid $4.29 $1.09

100 63-WA38334 ANCHOR WEDGE 3/8 X 3 3/4 EA No Bid $2.99 $0.58

101 63-WA58414 ANCHOR WEDGE 5/8 X 4 1/4 EA No Bid $3.99 $2.49

102 64-CTDNE TAPE CAUTION DO NOT ENTER RLL No Bid $11.99 $4.49 pair

103 CHICKEN WIRE 2"x50" EACH No Bid $21.99 No Bid

104 HINGES,  4 ½" x 4½" EACH No Bid $6.99 $18.12

105
ARDEX SDF FINE FINISH PATCHING 

COMPOUND 10# BAGS
EACH No Bid $16.99 No Bid

106 MAPEI #711 ADHESIVE 4 GAL EACH No Bid No Bid No Bid
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