Section |. Same Day Trips

Charter Bus Services
RFP 031-2015

United Independent School District

Vendors Bill's Sparkling Charter Cougar Bus Lines Daisy Charter & Shuttles Imperial Bus Co. Kerville Bus/Coach USA
DOT #/MC# 537119 / 268020 1127893/459987 397239/226521 1261610/492765 136534/27530
Bus Fleet Reg“';’" BUS|  Handicap Bus 0 Bﬁgeus% Handicap Buses 2 Bizgeuslazre Handicap Buses 3 ;SS:I::} Handicap Buses 0 Bizi‘;'zre Handicap Buses 35
Headquarters Corpus Christi, Tx Laredo, Tx San Antonio, Tx San Antonio, Tx San Antonio, Tx
DESTINATION Regular Bus Hagifap gz'a; Regular Bus Hagtii;:ap Seat CAP. Regular Bus | Handicap Bus CS::? Regular Bus Hag(l:ljiscap CS::?} Regular Bus Hagdui;:ap CS::?
SAN ANTONIO $1,900.00 No Bid 57 | $1,350.00 | $1,800.00 50-56 $1,844.00 | $1,844.00 56 $1,850.00 N/A 49-57 | $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 | 55
CORPUS CHRISTI $1,900.00 No Bid 57 | $1,350.00 | $1,800.00 50-56 $1,844.00 | $1,844.00 56 $1,850.00 N/A 49-57 | $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 | 55
BROWNSVILLE $2,400.00 No Bid 57 $1,550.00 | $2,000.00 50-56 $2,047.00 | $2,047.00 56 $2,200.00 N/A 49-57 | $2,760.00 | $2,760.00 55
MCALLEN $1,900.00 No Bid 57 $1,350.00 | $1,800.00 50-56 $1,844.00 | $1,844.00 56 $1,850.00 N/A 49-57 | $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 55
KINGSVILLE $1,750.00 No Bid 57 $1,350.00 | $1,800.00 50-56 $1,844.00 | $1,844.00 56 $1,850.00 N/A 49-57 | $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 55
EAGLE PASS $1,750.00 No Bid 57 $1,350.00 | $1,800.00 50-56 $1,844.00 | $1,844.00 56 $1,850.00 N/A 49-57 | $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 55
AUSTIN $2,600.00 No Bid 57 $1,550.00 | $2,000.00 50-56 $2,264.00 | $2,264.00 56 $2,275.00 N/A 49-57 | $2,865.00 | $2,865.00 55
NEW BRAUNFELS $2,200.00 No Bid 57 $1,450.00 | $1,900.00 50-56 $1,893.00 | $1,893.00 56 $1,975.00 N/A 49-57 | $2,370.00 | $2,370.00 55
HOUSTON $3,600.00 No Bid 57 $2,560.00 | $3,100.00 50-56 $2,761.00 | $2,761.00 56 $2,950.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,360.00 | $3,360.00 55
$3,750*See
DALLAS No Bid No Bid 57 $2,660.00 | $3,200.00 50-56 $3,587.00 | $3,587.00 56 notes N/A 49-57 | $4,390.00 | $4,390.00 55
DEL RIO $2,200.00 No Bid 57 $1,450.00 | $1,900.00 50-56 $1,844.00 | $1,844.00 56 $1,950.00 N/A 49-57 | $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 55
UVALDE $1,750.00 No Bid 57 $1,350.00 | $1,800.00 50-56 $1,844.00 | $1,844.00 56 $1,850.00 N/A 49-57 | $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 55
$5,400*See

EL PASO No Bid No Bid 57 $3,560.00 | $4,000.00 50-56 $4,812.00 | $4,812.00 56 notes N/A 49-57 | $5,580.00 | $5,580.00 55
ALICE $1,600.00 No Bid 57 $1,350.00 | $1,800.00 50-56 $1,844.00 | $1,844.00 56 $1,850.00 N/A 49-57 | $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 55
HARINGEN $2,200.00 No Bid 57 $1,450.00 | $1,900.00 50-56 $1,844.00 | $1,844.00 56 $1,950.00 N/A 49-57 | $2,400.00 | $2,400.00 55
LA JOYA $1,750.00 No Bid 57 $1,350.00 | $1,800.00 50-56 $1,844.00 | $1,844.00 56 $1,850.00 N/A 49-57 | $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 55
SINTON $1,900.00 No Bid 57 $1,350.00 | $1,800.00 50-56 $1,844.00 | $1,844.00 56 $1,850.00 N/A 49-57 | $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 55
GREGORY PORTLAND $1,950.00 No Bid 57 $1,350.00 | $1,800.00 50-56 $1,844.00 | $1,844.00 56 $1,850.00 N/A 49-57 | $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 55
ROMA $1,600.00 No Bid 57 $1,350.00 | $1,800.00 50-56 $1,844.00 | $1,844.00 56 $1,850.00 N/A 49-57 | $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 55
EDCOUCH ELSA $2,025.00 No Bid 57 | $1,350.00 | $1,800.00 50-56 $1,844.00 | $1,844.00 56 $1,900.00 N/A 49-57 | $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 | 55
San Angelo No Bid No Bid 57 $2,600.00 | $3,100.00 50-56 $2,880.00 | $2,880.00 56 $3,100.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,460.00 | $3,460.00 55
Victoria $2,200.00 No Bid 57 | $1,450.00 | $1,900.00 50-56 $1,865.00 | $1,865.00 56 $1,950.00 N/A 49-57 | $2,350.00 | $2,350.00 | 55




Section |. Same Day Trips

United Independent School District

Charter Bus Services
RFP 031-2015

Vendors OK Tours Regent Coach River City Coaches Star Shuttle, Inc. Tornado Tours, Inc. Zima Real
DOT #/MC# 570178/277375 823332/365568 261170/184221 660715/309567 991034/418249 1764020/644733
Regular : Regular . Regular . Regular . Regular . Regular .
Bus Fleet Buses 18 Handicap Buses 1 Busseg 20- | Handicap Buses 2 Buses 19 Handicap Buses 1 Buses 41 Handicap Buses 4 Buses 3 Handicap Buses 0 Buses 16 Handicap Buses 4
Headquarters San Antonio, Tx San Antonio, Tx San Antonio, Tx San Antonio, Tx San Antonio, Tx Houston, Tx

DESTINATION Regular Bus Hag(ljjiscap (f:?:t, Regular Bus |Handicap Bus g:'a:t. Regular Bus Hagtii;:ap CS:IZ;t. Regular Bus Ha;duiscap CS:": R%guuslar Hagtlijiscap Cszlit. R%guuslar Hag(lijiscap (leit.
SAN ANTONIO $2,250.00 | $2,750.00 | 56 | $2,337.50 | $2,337.50 56 $1,785.00 | $2,085.00 55 $3,020.50 | $3,020.50 56 $1,500.00] $1,850.00{ 52-56 | $1,650.00|$1,850.00| 52-56
CORPUS CHRISTI $2,250.00 | $2,750.00 | 56 | $2,487.50 | $2,487.50 56 $1,785.00 | $2,085.00 55 $3,213.00 | $3,213.00 56 $1,500.00] $1,850.00{ 52-56 | $1,650.00|$1,850.00| 52-56
BROWNSVILLE $2,700.00 | $3,200.00 56 $2,955.00 | $2,955.00 56 $2,095.00 | $2,395.00 55 $3,598.00 | $3,598.00 56 $1,850.00 $2,200.00{ 52-56 | $2,000.00| $2,200.00| 52-56
MCALLEN $2,700.00 | $3,200.00 56 $2,581.00 | $2,581.00 56 $1,785.00 | $2,085.00 55 $3,309.25 | $3,309.25 56 $1,500.00] $1,850.00{ 52-56 | $1,650.00| $1,850.00| 52-56
KINGSVILLE $2,250.00 | $2,750.00 56 $2,207.00 | $2,207.00 56 $1,785.00 | $2,085.00 55 $2,924.25 | $2,924.25 56 $1,500.00] $1,850.00{ 52-56 | $1,650.00| $1,850.00| 52-56
EAGLE PASS $2,250.00 | $2,750.00 56 $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 56 $1,550.00 | $1,850.00 Min?rium $3,116.75 | $3,116.75 56 $1,500.00] $1,850.00{ 52-56 | $1,650.00| $1,850.00| 52-56
AUSTIN $2,795.00 | $3,295.00 56 $3,142.00 | $3,142.00 56 $2,295.00 | $2,595.00 55 $3,598.00 | $3,598.00 56 $1,850.00 $2,200.00{ 52-56 | $2,000.00| $2,200.00| 52-56
NEW BRAUNFELS $2,495.00 | $2,995.00 56 $2,768.00 | $2,768.00 56 $2,220.00 | $2,520.00 | 56 Max | $3,213.00 | $3,213.00 56 $1,500.00] $1,850.00{ 52-56 | $1,650.00|$1,850.00| 52-56
HOUSTON $3,450.00 | $3,950.00 56 $3,703.00 | $3,703.00 56 $3,140.00 | $3,440.00 55 $4,810.00 | $4,810.00 56 $2,500.00 $2,850.00| 52-56 | $2,650.00| $2,850.00| 52-56
DALLAS $4,475.00 | $4,975.00 56 $4,638.00 | $4,638.00 56 $3,650.00 | $3,950.00 55 $5,388.00 | $5,388.00 56 $3,000.00 | $3,350.00| 52-56 | $3,150.00 | $3,350.00| 52-56
DEL RIO $2,495.00 | $2,995.00 56 $2,675.00 | $2,675.00 56 $1,935.00 | $2,235.00 55 $3,116.75 | $3,116.75 56 $1,850.00 $2,200.00{ 52-56 | $2,000.00| $2,200.00| 52-56
UVALDE $2,100.00 | $2,600.00 56 $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 56 $1,785.00 | $2,085.00 55 $2,828.00 | $2,828.00 56 $1,500.00] $1,850.00{ 52-56 | $1,650.00|$1,850.00| 52-56
EL PASO $5,895.00 [ $6,395.00 56 $6,000.00 | $6,000.00 56 $5,750.00 | $6,050.00 55 $7,178.00 | $7,178.00 56 $3,600.00 | $3,950.00| 52-56 | $3,750.00 | $3,950.00| 52-56
ALICE $1,825.00 | $2,325.00 56 $2,114.00 | $2,114.00 56 $1,785.00 | $2,085.00 55 $2,828.00 | $2,828.00 56 $1,500.00] $1,850.00{ 52-56 | $1,650.00|$1,850.00| 52-56
HARINGEN $2,700.00 | $3,200.00 56 $2,768.00 | $2,768.00 56 $1,899.00 | $2,199.00 55 $3,405.50 | $3,405.50 56 $1,850.00 $2,200.00{ 52-56 | $2,000.00| $2,200.00| 52-56
LA JOYA $2,700.00 | $3,200.00 56 $2,300.00 | $2,300.00 56 $1,785.00 | $2,085.00 55 $3,020.50 | $3,020.50 56 $1,500.00| $1,850.00 52-56 | $1,650.00( $1,850.00| 52-56
SINTON $2,250.00 | $2,750.00 56 $2,488.00 | $2,488.00 56 $1,785.00 | $2,085.00 55 $3,116.75 | $3,116.75 56 $1,500.00| $1,850.00 52-56 | $1,650.00( $1,850.00| 52-56
GREGORY PORTLAND $2,250.00 | $2,750.00 56 $2,581.00 | $2,581.00 56 $1,785.00 | $2,085.00 55 $3,213.00 | $3,213.00 56 $1,500.00| $1,850.00 52-56 | $1,650.00( $1,850.00| 52-56
ROMA $2,700.00 | $3,200.00 56 $2,020.00 | $2,020.00 56 $1,785.00 | $2,085.00 55 $2,731.75 | $2,731.25 56 $1,500.00| $1,850.00 52-56 | $1,650.00( $1,850.00| 52-56
EDCOUCH ELSA $2,500.00 | $3,000.00 | 56 | $2,581.00 | $2,581.00 56 $1,785.00 | $2,085.00 55 $3,309.25 | $3,309.25 56 $1,500.00] $1,850.00] 52-56 | $1,650.00]| $1,850.00| 52-56
San Angelo $3,800.00 | $4,300.00 56 $3,797.00 | $3,797.00 56 $3,250.00 | $3,550.00 55 $4,521.75 | $4,521.75 56 $2,500.00| $2,850.00 52-56 | $2,650.00 $2,850.00| 52-56
Victoria $2,250.00 | $2,750.00 | 56 | $2,768.00 | $2,768.00 56 $1,970.00 | $2,270.00 55 $3,405.50 | $3,405.50 56 $2,100.00] $2,450.00] 52-56 | $2,250.00] $2,450.00]| 52-56




Section Il. Overnight Trips

United Independent School District

Charter Bus Services

RFP 031-2015

Vendors Bill's Sparkling Charter Cougar Bus Lines Daisy Charter & Shuttles Imperial Bus Co. Kerville Bus/Coach USA
DOT #/MC# 537119/268020 1127893/459987 397239/226521 1261610/492765 136534/27530
Regular Bus| . gicap Bus 0 Regular Handicap Buses 2 Regular Handicap Buses 3 Regular Handicap Buses 0 Regular | . dicap Buses 35
BUS FLEET 8 Buses 20 Buses 26 Buses 6 Buses 56
Headquarters Corpus Christi, Tx Laredo, Tx San Antonio, Tx San Antonio, Tx San Antonio, Tx
Handicap Seat Handicap Seat Handicap Seat Handicap Seat
DESTINATION Regular Bus Bus cap. | Regular Bus Bus Seat CAP. Regular Bus Handicap Bus | CAP. Regular Bus Bus cap. |Regular Bus Bus CAP.
SAN ANTONIO $3,600.00 No Bid 57 $2,000.00 | $2,450.00 50-56 $3,104.00 | $3,104.00 56 $3,000.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,640.00 | $3,640.00 55
CORPUS CHRISTI $3,600.00 No Bid 57 $2,000.00 | $2,450.00 50-56 $3,104.00 | $3,104.00 56 $3,000.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,640.00 | $3,640.00 55
BROWNSVILLE $3,600.00 No Bid 57 $2,200.00 | $2,650.00 50-56 $3,104.00 | $3,104.00 56 $3,300.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,840.00 | $3,840.00 55
MCALLEN $3,600.00 No Bid 57 $2,000.00 | $2,450.00 5056 $3,104.00 | $3,104.00 56 $3,000.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,640.00 | $3,640.00 55
KINGSVILLE $3,600.00 No Bid 57 $2,000.00 | $2,450.00 5056 $3,104.00 | $3,104.00 56 $3,000.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,640.00 | $3,640.00 55
EAGLE PASS $3,600.00 No Bid 57 $2,000.00 | $2,450.00 5056 $3,104.00 | $3,104.00 56 $3,000.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,640.00 | $3,640.00 55
AUSTIN $3,800.00 No Bid 57 $2,200.00 | $2,650.00 50-56 $3,104.00 | $3,104.00 56 $3,300.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,640.00 | $3,640.00 55
NEW BRAUNFELS $3,600.00 No Bid 57 $2,100.00 | $2,550.00 50-56 $3,104.00 | $3,104.00 56 $3,150.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,640.00 | $3,640.00 55
HOUSTON $4,000.00 No Bid 57 | $3,210.00 | $3,750.00 5056 $3,104.00 | $3,104.00 56 $3,500.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,840.00 | $3,840.00 | 55
DALLAS $4,300.00 No Bid 57 | $3,310.00 | $3,850.00 5056 $3,587.00 | $3,587.00 56 $3,750.00 N/A 49-57 | $4,690.00 | $4,690.00 | 55
DEL RIO $3,600.00 No Bid 57 | $2,100.00 | $2,550.00 5056 $3,104.00 | $3,104.00 56 $3,150.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,640.00 | $3,640.00 | 55
UVALDE $3,600.00 No Bid 57 | $2,000.00 | $2,450.00 5056 $3,104.00 | $3,104.00 56 $3,000.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,640.00 | $3,640.00 | 55
EL PASO $6,000.00 No Bid 57 | $4,210.00 | $4,650.00 5056 $4,812.00 | $4,812.00 56 $5,400.00 N/A 49-57 | $5,780.00 | $5,780.00 | 55
ALICE $3,600.00 No Bid 57 | $2,000.00 | $2,450.00 5056 $3,104.00 | $3,104.00 56 $3,000.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,640.00 | $3,640.00 | 55
HARLINGEN $3,600.00 No Bid 57 | $2,100.00 | $2,550.00 5056 $3,104.00 | $3,104.00 56 $3,150.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,640.00 | $3,640.00 | 55
LA JOYA $3,600.00 No Bid 57 | $2,000.00 | $2,450.00 5056 $3,104.00 | $3,104.00 56 $3,000.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,640.00 | $3,640.00 | 55
SINTON $3,600.00 No Bid 57 | $2,000.00 | $2,450.00 5056 $3,104.00 | $3,104.00 56 $3,000.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,640.00 | $3,640.00 | 55
GREGORY PORTLAND $3,600.00 No Bid 57 | $2,000.00 | $2,450.00 5056 $3,104.00 | $3,104.00 56 $3,000.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,640.00 | $3,640.00 | 55
ROMA $3,600.00 No Bid 57 | $2,000.00 | $2,450.00 5056 $3,104.00 | $3,104.00 56 $3,000.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,640.00 | $3,640.00 | 55
EDCOUCH ELSA $3,600.00 No Bid 57 $2,000.00 | $2,450.00 50-56 $3,104.00 | $3,104.00 56 $3,100.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,640.00 | $3,640.00 55
San Angelo $4,000.00 No Bid 57 | $3,250.00 | $3,750.00 50-5 $3,104.00 | $3,104.00 56 $3,450.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,840.00 | $3,840.00 | 55
50-56
Victoria $3,600.00 No Bid 57 $2,100.00 | $2,550.00 $3,104.00 | $3,104.00 56 $3,150.00 N/A 49-57 | $3,640.00 | $3,640.00 55




Section Il. Overnight Trips

United Independent School District

Charter Bus Services
RFP 031-2015

Vendors OK Tours Regent Coach River City Coaches Star Shuttle, Inc. Tornado Tours, Inc. Zima Real
DOT #/MC# 570178/277375 823332/365568 261170/184221 660715/309567 991034/418249 1764020/
R | Regular | |
egular Handicap Buses 1| Buses 20- | Handicap Buses 2 Regular Handicap Buses 1 Regular Handicap Buses 4 Regular Handicap Buses 0 Regular Handicap Buses 4
Buses 18 Buses 19 Buses 41 Buses 3 Buses 16
BUS FLEET 56
Headquarters San Antonio, Tx San Antonio, Tx San Antonio, Tx San Antonio, Tx Houston, Tx

Handicap Seat K Seat Handicap Seat Handicap Seat Regular | Handicap Seat Regular | Handicap Seat
DESTINATION Regular Bus Bus cap. | Regular Bus [Handicap Bus| cap. |Regular Bus Bus cap. |Regular Bus Bus CAP. Bus Bus CAP. Bus Bus CAP.
SAN ANTONIO $3,100.00 | $3,600.00 56 | $2,663.70 | $2,663.70 56 $2,400.00 | $2,700.00 55 $3,220.50 | $3,220.50 56 $2,500.00| $2,850.00 52-56 | $2,650.00 $2,850.00| 52-56
CORPUS CHRISTI $3,100.00 | $3,600.00 56 | $2,663.70 | $2,663.70 56 $2,400.00 | $2,700.00 55 $3,500.00 | $3,500.00 56 $2,500.00| $2,850.00 52-56 | $2,650.00 $2,850.00| 52-56
BROWNSVILLE $3,575.00 | $4,075.00 56 | $2,955.00 | $2,955.00 56 $2,675.00 | $2,975.00 55 $3,800.00 | $3,800.00 56 $2,850.00| $2,850.00 52-56 | $3,000.00( $3,000.00| 52-56
MCALLEN $3,575.00 | $4,075.00 56 | $2,581.00 | $2,581.00 56 $2,400.00 | $2,700.00 55 $3,509.25 | $3,509.25 56 $2,500.00| $2,850.00 52-56 | $2,650.00 $2,850.00| 52-56
KINGSVILLE $2,895.00 | $3,395.00 56 | $2,663.70 | $2,663.70 56 $2,400.00 | $2,700.00 55 $3,124.25 | $3,124.25 56 $2,500.00| $2,850.00 52-56 | $2,650.00 [ $2,850.00| 52-56
EAGLE PASS $3,100.00 | $3,600.00 56 | $2,663.70 | $2,663.70 56 $2,400.00 | $2,700.00 55 $3,316.75 | $3,316.75 56 $2,500.00| $2,850.00 52-56 | $2,650.00 $2,850.00| 52-56
AUSTIN $3,650.00 | $4,150.00 56 | $3,142.00 | $3,142.00 56 $2,875.00 | $3,175.00 | 55 Min | $3,798.00 | $3,798.00 56 $2,850.00] $3,200.00| 52-56 | $3,000.00| $3,200.00| 52-56
NEW BRAUNFELS $3,350.00 | $3,850.00 56 | $2,768.00 | $2,768.00 56 $2,765.00 | $3,065.00 55 $3,413.00 | $3,413.00 56 $2,500.00| $2,850.00 52-56 | $2,650.00 $2,850.00| 52-56
HOUSTON $4,350.00 | $4,850.00 56 | $3,703.00 | $3,703.00 56 $3,285.00 | $3,585.00 | 56 Max | $5,010.50 | $5,010.50 56 $3,100.00] $3,850.00| 52-56 | $3,250.00| $3,850.00| 52-56
DALLAS $5,350.00 | $5,850.00 56 | $4,638.00 | $4,638.00 56 $4,295.00 | $4,595.00 55 $5,588.00 | $5,588.00 56 $3,500.00 $4,350.00] 52-56 | $3,650.00| $4,350.00| 52-56
DEL RIO $3,350.00 | $3,850.00 56 | $2,675.00 | $2,675.00 56 $2,400.00 | $2,700.00 55 $3,316.76 | $3,316.75 56 $2,850.00] $3,200.00| 52-56 | $3,000.00| $3,200.00| 52-56
UVALDE $2,950.00 | $3,450.00 56 | $2,663.70 | $2,663.70 56 $2,400.00 | $2,700.00 55 $3,028.00 | $3,028.00 56 $2,500.00 $2,850.00| 52-56 | $2,650.00| $2,850.00| 52-56
EL PASO $6,750.00 | $7,250.00 56 | $6,000.00 | $6,000.00 56 $5,750.00 | $6,050.00 55 $7,378.00 | $7,378.00 56 $4,850.00| $4,950.00] 52-56 | $5,000.00| $5,000.00| 52-56
ALICE $2,650.00 | $3,150.00 56 | $2,663.70 | $2,663.70 56 $2,400.00 | $2,700.00 55 $3,028.00 | $3,028.00 56 $2,500.00 $2,850.00| 52-56 | $2,650.00| $2,850.00| 52-56
HARLINGEN $3,575.00 | $4,075.00 56 | $2,768.00 | $2,768.00 56 $2,475.00 | $2,475.00 55 $3,605.50 | $3,605.50 56 $2,850.00] $3,200.00| 52-56 | $3,000.00| $3,200.00| 52-56
LA JOYA $3,575.00 | $4,075.00 56 | $2,663.70 | $2,663.70 56 $2,400.00 | $2,700.00 55 $3,220.50 | $3,220.50 56 $2,500.00] $2,850.00| 52-56 | $2,650.00| $2,850.00| 52-56
SINTON $3,100.00 | $3,600.00 56 | $2,663.70 | $2,663.70 56 $2,400.00 | $2,700.00 55 $3,316.75 | $3,316.75 56 $2,500.00 $2,850.00| 52-56 | $2,650.00| $2,850.00| 52-56
GREGORY PORTLAND $3,100.00 | $3,600.00 56 | $2,663.70 | $2,663.70 56 $2,400.00 | $2,700.00 55 $3,413.00 | $3,413.00 56 $2,500.00] $2,850.00| 52-56 | $2,650.00| $2,850.00| 52-56
ROMA $3,100.00 | $3,600.00 56 | $2,663.70 | $2,663.70 56 $2,400.00 | $2,700.00 55 $2,931.75 | $2,931.75 56 $2,500.00 $2,850.00| 52-56 | $2,650.00| $2,850.00| 52-56
EDCOUCH ELSA $3,275.00 | $3,775.00 56 | $2,663.70 | $2,663.70 56 $2,400.00 | $2,700.00 55 $4,721.75 | $4,721.75 56 $2,500.00| $2,850.00| 52-56 | $2,650.00 $2,850.00| 52-56
San Angelo $4,675.00 | $5,175.00 56 | $3,797.00 | $3,797.00 56 $3,600.00 | $3,900.00 55 $4,721.75 | $4,721.75 56 $3,100.00] $3,850.00] 52-56 | $3,250.00] $3,850.00| 52-56
Victoria $3,100.00 | $3,600.00 56 | $2,768.00 | $2,768.00 56 $2,400.00 | $2,700.00 55 $3,605.50 | $3,605.50 56 $2,500.00| $3,450.00 52-56 | $2,650.00 $2,850.00| 52-56




United Independent School District
Charter Bus Service
RFP 031-2015

Bill'sSparkling Cougar Bus Lines Daisy Charter & Shuttles Imperial Bus Co. Kerville Bus/Coach USA
Section lll. Reserved Dates For UISD - Band/Football
Lyndon B. Johnson High School SEATING UNIT Extension Price SEATING UNIT Extension Price SEATING UNIT Extension Price SEATING | UNIT | Extension Price | SEATING UNIT Extension Price
DATES DESTINATION aory. | capacity PRICE PRICE CAPACITY PRICE PRICE CAPACITY PRICE PRICE capaciTy | PRICE | PRICE CAPACITY PRICE PRICE
Saturday, September 5, 2015 San Antonio, Texas(Band & Cheer/Dance 5 57 $1,900.00 $9,500.00 50-56 $1,350.00 $6,750.00 56 $1,844.00 $9,220.00 Not Available 55 $2,300.00 | $11,500.00
Saturday, September 5, 2015 | San Antonio, Texas (Football 2 57 $1,900.00 | $3,800.00 50-56 | $1,250.00 $2,500.00 56 $1,844.00 $3,688.00 49-57 | $1,850.00 $3,700.00 55 $2,300.00 $4,600.00
San Antonio, Texas(Marching) or See below for other $2.300.00 | $11,500.00
Saturday, October 10,2015 city-but same day 5 57 1,900.00 | $9,500.00 | 50-56 | $1,350.00 | $6.750.00 56 1,844.00 |  $9,220.00 Not Available 55 . e
McAllen, Texas(Marching)see notes above 5 57 1,900.00 | $9,500.00 50-56 | $1,350.00 $6.,750.00 56 1,844.00 $9,220.00 Not Available 55 2,300.00 | $11,500.00
Friday, October 23, 2015 Del Rio, Texas (Band & Cheer/Dance) 5 57 2,200.00 [ $11,000.00 50-56 | $1,450.00 $7,250.00 56 1,844.00 $9,220.00 Not Available 55 2,300.00 | $11,500.00
Friday, October 23, 2015 Del Rio , Texas (Football) 2 57 2,200.00 | $4,400.00 50-56 | $1,350.00 | $2,700.00 56 1,844.00 $3,688.00 4957 | $1,950.00 | $3,900.00 55 2,300.00 | $4,600.00
*Play Off Game Tentative(Valley Band & $2,300.00 | $11,500.00
Friday, November 13, 2015 Cheer/Dance) 5 57 $2,400.00 | $12,000.00 50-56 | $1,450.00 $7,250.00 56 $1,844.00 $9,220.00 Not Available 55
$2,300.00 | $11,500.00
*Play Off Game Tentative(CC-Band & Cheer/Dance) 5 57 $1.900.00 $9.500.00 50-56 $1,350.00 $6.750.00 56 $1,844.00 $9,220.00 Not Available 55
Friday, November 13, 2015 Play Off Game Tentative(Valley Football) 2 57 $2,400.00 | $4.800.00 50-56 | $1,350.00 $2,700.00 56 $1,844.00 $3,688.00 Check Availabilit 55 $2,300.00 $4,600.00
: : Play Off Game Tentative(CC Footabll 2 57 $1,900.00 $3,800.00 50-56 $1,250.00 $2,500.00 56 $1,844.00 $3,688.00 Check Availabilit 55 $2,300.00 $4,600.00
*Play Off Game Tentative(Valley Band & $2.300.00 | $11,500.00
Friday, November 20,2015 Cheer/Dance) 5 57 $2,400.00 | $12,000.00 50-56 | $1,450.00 $7,250.00 56 $1,844.00 $9,220.00 Not Available 55 R T
*Play Off Game Tentative( CC-Band & Cheer/Dance) 5 57 $1.900.00 $9.500.00 50-56 $1,350.00 $6.750.00 56 $1,844.00 $9,220.00 Not Available 55 $2,300.00 | $11,500.00
Friday, November 20,2015 Play Off Game Tentative(Valley Football) 2 57 $2,400.00 | $4,800.00 50-56 | $1,350.00 $2,700.00 56 $1,844.00 $3,688.00 Check Availabilit 55 $2,300.00 $4,600.00
! . Play Off Game Tentative(CC-Football) 2 57 $1,900.00 | $3,800.00 50-56_| $1,250.00 $2,500.00 56 $1,844.00 $3,688.00 Check Availability 55 $2,300.00 $4,600.00
*=Attending Football Games
United South High School
|oates DESTINATION QrY,
|Fr\clay. September 18,2015 Corpus Christi, Texas (Band & Cheer/Dance) 7 57 $1,900.00 | $13,300.00 | 50-56 | $1,350.00 $9.,450.00 56 $1,844.00 $12,908.00 Not Available 55 $2,300.00 | $16,100.00
Friday, September 18,2015 Corpus Christi, Texas Ray (Football, 2 57 $1,900.00 $3,800.00 50-56 $1,250.00 $2,500.00 56 $1,844.00 $3,688.00 49-57 [ $1,850.00 $3,700.00 55 $2,300.00 $4,600.00
Friday, September 26,2015 McAllen, Tx Pre-UIL Marching Contest 5 57 $1,900.00 | $9,500.00 50-56 | $1,350.00 $6,750.00 56 $1,844.00 $9,220.00 Not Available 55 $2,300.00 | $11,500.00
San Antonio, Texas(Marching) or See below for other $2.300.00 | $16,100.00
Saturday, October 10,2015 city-but same day 7 57 $1,900.00 | $13,300.00 | 50-56 | $1,350.00 | $9,450.00 56 $1,844.00 |  $12,908.00 Not Available 55 e e
McAllen, Texas(Marching)see notes above 7 57 $1,900.00 | $13,300.00 50-56 | $1,350.00 $9,450.00 56 $1,844.00 $12,908.00 Not Available 55 $2,300.00 | $16,100.00
Friday, October 30, 2015 Del Rio, Texas (Band & Cheer/Dance) 7 57 $2,200.00 | $15,400.00 50-56 $1.450.00 $10,150.00 56 $1,844.00 $12,908.00 Not Available 55 $2,300.00 | $16,100.00
Friday & Saturday, Oct. 30- . .
31,2015 LETee A M e 7 57 | $1,900.00 | $13,300.00 | 50-56 | $2,000.00 | $14,00000 | 56 | $3,104.00 | $21,728.00 Not Available 55 | $2:30000] $16,100.00
Friday, October 30,2015 Del Rio, Texas (Football 2 57 $2,200.00 $4,400.00 50-56 $1,350.00 $2,700.00 56 $1,844.00 $3,688.00 49-57 [ $1,950m $3,900.00 55 $2,300.00 $4,600.00
*Play Off Game Tentative(McAllen, Tx-Band & $2.300.00 | $16,100.00
Friday, November 13,2015 Cheer/Dance) 7 57 $1,900.00 | $13,300.00 | 50-56 | $1,350.00 $9,450.00 56 $1,844.00 $12,908.00 Not Available 55 T R
Friday , November 13, 2015 Play Off Game Tentative (McAllen, Tx-Football) 2 57 $1,900.00{ $3,800.00 50-56 $1,250.00| $2,500.00 56 $1,844.00]  $3,688.00 Check Availabilit 55 $2,300.00| $4,600.00
+Piay Off Game Temailve(MeAllen, Tx-sand & 7 $1,900.00 $1,350.00 $1,844.00 $2,300.00| $16,100.00
Friday, November 20, 2015 Cheer/Dance) 57 ! ) $13,300.00 50-56 ! ) $9,450.00 56 ! ) $12,908.00 Not Available 55 ; ) ' )
Friday, November 20, 2015 Play Off Game Tentative (McAllen, Tx-Football) 2 57 $1,900.00 $3,800.00 50-56 $1,250.00 $2,500.00 56 $1,844.00 $3,688.00 Check Availability 55 $2,300.00 $4,600.00
*=Attending Football Games
[UNITED HIGH SCHOOL
DATES DESTINATION QTY.
Friday, September 4,2015 Mission, Texas(Band & Cheer/Dance) 9 57 $1,900.00 | $17,100.00 50-56 | $1,350.00 [ $12,150.00 56 $1,844.00 $16,596.00 Not Available 55 00.00 | $20,700.00
Fridaﬁ. Segtemher 4,2015 Sharyland, Texas(Football) 2 57 $1,900.00 $3,800.00 50-56 $1,250.00 $2,500.00 56 $1,844.00 $3,688.00 49-57 | $1,850.00 $3,700.00 55 00.00 $4,600.00
Friday, September 18,2015 McAllen, Texas(Band & Cheer/Dance) 9 57 $1,900.00 | $17,100.00 50-56 | $1,350.00 [ $12,150.00 56 $1,844.00 $16,596.00 Not Available 55 00.00 | $20,700.00
Friday, September 18,2015 McAllen, Texas Rowe(Football 2 57 $1,900.00 | $3,800.00 50-56 | $1,250.00 $2,500.00 56 $1,844.00 $3,688.00 4957 | $1.350m $3,700.00 55 00.00 $4,600.00
Friday, October 9,2015 Del Rio, Texas(Band & Cheer/Dance) 9 57 $2,200.00 | $19,800.00 50-56 | $1,450.00 [ $13,050.00 56 $1,844.00 $16,596.00 Not Available 55 00.00 | $20,700.00
Friday, October 9,2015 Del Rio, Texas (Football 2 57 $2,200.00| $4,400.00 50-56 $1,450.00( $2,900.00 56 $1,844.00 $3,688.00 [49-57 | $1,950.00 $3,900.00 55 $2,300.00( $4,600.00
San Antonio, Texas(Marching) or See below for other
y 9 $1,900.00 $1,350.00 $2,300.00| $20,700.00
Saturday, October 10,2015 city-but same day 57 $17,100.00 | 50-56 $12,150.00 56 $1,844.00|  $16,596.00 Not Available 55
McAllen, Texas(Marching)see notes above ° 57 $1,800.00 $17,100.00 50-56 $1,350.00 $12,150.00 56 $1,844.00 $16,596.00 Not Available 55 $2,300.00 | $20,700.00
Friday, October 23,2015 Eagle Pass, Texas (Band & Cheer/Dance) 9 57 $1,750.00| $15,750.00 50-56 $1,350.00f $12,150.00 56 $1,844.00 $16,596.00 Not Available 55 $2,300.00f $20,700.00
Friday, October 23,2015 Eagle Pass, Texas (Football) 2 57 $1,750.00 $3,500.00 50-56 $1,250.00( $2,500.00 56 $1,844.00 $3,688.00 Not Available 55 $2,300.00| $4,600.00
Friday & Saturday, Oct. 30-
1,900.00 2,000.00 104.00 40. 2,760.
31,2015 Bands of America Marching Contest ° 57 $1.900.0 $17,100.00 | 50-56 $2.00000] 16 600.00 56 83,1040 $27,936.00 Not Available 55 $3,640.00] $327760.00
*Play Off Game Tentative(McAllen, Tx-Band & 9 $1,900.00 $1,350.00 $1,844.00 $2,300.00| $20,700.00
Friday, November, 13,2015 Cheer/Dance) 57 $17,100.00 50-56 $12,150.00 56 $16,596.00 Not Available 55
Friday, November 13, 2015 Play Off Game Tentative(McAllen, Tx-Football) 2 57 $1,900.00 $3,800.00 50-56 $1,250.00 $2,500.00 56 $1,844.00 $3,688.00 Check Availabilit 55 $2,300.00 $4,600.00
*Play Off Game Tentative(McAllen, Tx-Band & $2,300.00 | $20,700.00
Friday, November 20, 2015 Cheer/Dance) 9 57 $1,900.00 | $17,100.00 50-56 | $1,350.00 | $12,150.00 56 $1,844.00 $16,596.00 Not Available 55
Fridax. November 20,2015 Plaz Off Game TentativegMcAIIen, Tx-Football) 2 57 $1,900.00 $3,800.00 50-56 $1,250.00 $2,500.00 56 $1,844.00 $3,688.00 Check Availability 55 $2,300.00 $4,600.00
Alexander High School
DATES [oEsTivaTioN QrY,
Friday, September 25,2015 San Angelo, Texas (Band & Cheer/Dance) 7 No Bid No Bid No Bid 50-56 | $2,600.00 | $18,200.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid Not Available 55 $3,640.00 | $25,480.00
Friday, September 25,2015 San Angelo, Texas (Football 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid 50-56 | $2,500.00 $5,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid Check Availabilit 55 $3,460.00 | $6,920.00
S San Antonio, Texas(Marching) or See below for other $2,300.00 | $16,100.00
aturday, October 10,2015 city-but same day 7 57 $1,900.00 | $13,300.00 50-56 $1,350.00 $9,450.00 56 $1,844.00 $12,908.00 Not Available 55
McAllen, Texas(Marching)see notes above 7 57 $1,900.00 | $13,300.00 50-56 | $1,350.00 $9,450.00 56 $1,844.00 $12,908.00 Not Available 56 $2,300.00 | $16,100.00
Friday & Saturday, Oct. 30-
31,2015 Bands of America Marching Contest 7 57 $1,900.00 | $13,300.00 50-56 | $2,000.00 | $14,000.00 56 $3,104.00 $21,728.00 Not Available 55 $3,640.00 | $25,480.00
Friday, November 13,2015 “Play Off Game Tentative(McAllen, Tx-Band & $2,300.00 | $16,100.00
Cheer/Dance) 7 57 $1,900.00 | $13,300.00 50-56 $1,350.00 $9,450.00 56 $1,844.00 $12,908.00 Not Available 55
Friday, November 13,2015 Play Off Game Tentative(McAllen, Tx-Football) 2 57 $1,900.00 $3,800.00 50-56 $1,250.00 $2,500.00 56 $1,844.00 $3,688.00 Check Availabilit 55 $2,300.00 $4,600.00
Friday, November 20,2015 “Play Off Game Tentative(McAllen, Tx-Band & $2,300.00 | $16,100.00
Cheer/Dance) 7 57 $1,900.00 | $13,300.00 50-56 $1,350.00 $9,450.00 56 $1,844.00 $12,908.00 Not Available 55
Friday, November 20,2015 Play Off Game Tentative(McAllen, Tx-Football) 2 57 $1,900.00 |  $3,800.00 50-56 | $1,250.00 $2,500.00 56 $1,844.00 $3,688.00 Check Availability 55 $2,300.00 $4,600.00
Notes:




United Independent School District
Charter Bus Service
RFP 031-2015

OK Tours Regent Coach Line River City Coaches Star Shuttle, Inc. Tornado Tours, Inc. Zima Real Bus, Inc.
Section lll. Reserved Dates For UISD - Band/Football
Lyndon B. Johnson High School SEATING unIT Extension Price_|  SEATING UNIT Extension Price SEATING unIT Extension Price | ~ SEATING uNIT Extension Price |  SEATING uNIT Extension Price | SEATING|  UNIT | Extension Price
DATES DESTINATION arv. | capacity PRICE PRICE CAPACITY. PRICE PRICE CAPACITY. PRICE PRICE CAPACITY PRICE PRICE capaciTy | pRIcE PRICE___fcapacim| _ pricE PRICE
Saturday, September 5, 2015 San Antonio, Texas(Band & Cheer/Dance) 5 56 $2,250.00 | $11,250.00 56 $2,337.50 | $22,206,250.00 55/56 $2,775.00 $13,875.00 56 $3,443.00 | $17,215.00 52-56 | $1,500.00] $7,500.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $8,250.00
Saturday, September 5, 2015 | San Antonio, Texas (Football 2 56 $2,250.00 $4,500.00 56 $2,337.50 | $8,882,500.00 55/56 $1,785.00 $3,570.00 56 $3,443.00 $6,886.00 52-56 | $1,500.00| $3,000.00 | 52-56
San Antonio, Texas(Marching) or See below for other
Saturday, October 10,2015 city-but same day 5 56 $2,250.00 | $11,250.00 56 $2,337.50 | $22,206,250.00 55/56 2,775.00 $13,875.00 56 $3,443.00 | $17,215.00 52-56 1,500.00 7,500.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00{ $8,250.00
McAllen, Texas(Marching)see notes above 5 56 $2,700.00| $13,500.00 NA 55/56 2,775.00 $13,875.00 56 $3,780.50 | $18,902.50 52-56 1,500.00| $7,500.00 | 52-56 | ¢ $8,250.00
Friday, October 23, 2015 Del Rio, Texas (Band & Cheer/Dance) 5 56 $2,495.00 | $12,475.00 56 $2,675.00 | $29,425,000.00 55/56 2,925.00 $14,625.00 56 $3,555.50 | $17,777.50 52-56 1,850.00 9,250.00 | 52-56 | $2,000.00 $10,000.00
Friday, October 23, 2015 Del Rio , Texas (Football) 2 56 $2,495.00 $4,990.00 56 $2,675.00 | $11,770,000.00 55/56 1,935.00 $3,870.00 56 $3,555.50 $7,111.00 52-56 1,850.00 3,700.00 | 52-56 | $2,000.00{ $4,000.00
*Play Off Game Tentative(Valley Band &
Friday, November 13, 2015 Cheer/Dance) 5 56 $2,495.00 | $12,475.00 56 $2,675.00 | $32,100,000.00 55/56 $2,915.00 $14,575.00 56 $3,655.50 | $17,777.50 52-56 | $1,850.00| $9,250.00 | 52-56 | $2,000.00| $10,000.00
*Play Off Game Tentative(CC-Band & Cheer/Dance) 5 56 $2,250.00 | $11,250.00 56 $2,487.50 | $23,631,250.00 55/56 $2,775.00 $13,875.00 56 $3,668.00 | $18,340.00 52-56 | $1,500.00] $7,500.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $8,250.00
Friday, November 13, 2015 Play Off Game Tentat!ve Valley Football) 2 56 $2,495.00 $4,990.00 56 $2,675.00 | $12,840,000.00 55/56 $1,925.00 $3,850.00 56 $3,555.50 $7,111.00 52-56 | $1,850.00| $3,700.00 | 52-56 | $2,000.00| $4,000.00
Play Off Game Tentative(CC Footabll 2 56 $2,250.00 $4,500.00 56 $2,487.50 $9,452,500.00 55/56 $1,785.00 $3,570.00 56 $3,668.00 $7,336.00 52-56 | $1,500.00] $3,000.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $3,300.00
*Play Off Game Tentative(Valley Band &
Friday, November 20,2015 Cheer/Dance) 5 56 $2,700.00 | $13,500.00 56 $2,675.00 | $32,100,000.00 55/56 $2,915.00 $14,575.00 56 $3,655.50 | $17,777.50 52-56 | $1,850.00| $9,250.00 | 52-56 | $2,000.00| $10,000.00
*Play Off Game Tentative( CC-Band & Cheer/Dance) 5 56 $2,250.00 | $11,250.00 56 $2,487.50 | $23,631,250.00 55/56 $2,775.00 $13,875.00 56 $3,668.00 | $18,340.00 52-56 | $1,500.00] $7,500.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $8,250.00
Friday, November 20,2015 Play Off Game Tentative(Valley Football) 2 56 $2,495.00 $4,990.00 56 $2,675.00 | $12,840,000.00 55/56 $1,925.00 $3,850.00 56 $3,555.50 $7,111.00 52-56 | $1,850.00| $3,700.00 | 52-56 | $2,000.00| $4,000.00
! . Play Off Game Tentative(CC-Football) 2 56 $2,250.00 $4,500.00 56 $2,487.50 | $9,452,500.00 55/56 $1,785.00 $3,570.00 56 $3,668.00 $7,336.00 52-56_ | $1,500.00( $3,000.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $3,300.00
*=Attending Football Games
United South High School
|oates DESTINATION QrY,
|Fr\clay. September 18,2015 Corpus Christi, Texas (Band & Cheer/Dance) 7 56 $2,250.00| $15,750.00 NA 55/56 $2,775.00 $19,425.00 56 $3,668.00 | $25,676.00 52-56 | $1,500.00| $10,500.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $11,550.00
Friday, September 18,2015 Corpus Christi, Texas Ray (Football; 2 56 $2,250.00| $4,500.00 NA 55/56 $1,785.00 $3,570.00 56 $3,668.00 $7,336.00 52-56 | $1,500.00] $3,000.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $3,300.00
Friday, September 26,2015 McAllen, Tx Pre-UIL Marching Contest 5 56 $2,700.00| $13,500.00 NA 55/56 $2,775.00 $13,875.00 56 $3,780.50 | $18,902.50 52-56 | $1,500.00] $7,500.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $8,250.00
San Antonio, Texas(Marching) or See below for other
Saturday, October 10,2015 city-but same day 7 56 $2,250.00| $15,750.00 NA 55/56 $2,775.00 | $19,425.00 56 $3,443.50 | $24,104.50 | 52-56 | $1,500.00| $10,500.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $11,550.00
McAllen, Texas(Marching)see notes above 7 56 $2,700.00| $18,900.00 NA 55/56 $2,775.00 $19,425.00 56 $3,780.50 | $26,463.50 52-56 | $1,500.00| $10,500.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $11,550.00
Friday, October 30, 2015 Del Rio, Texas (Band & Cheer/Dance) 7 56 $2,495.00 | $17,465.00 56 $2,675.00 | $41,195,000.00 55/56 $2,925.00 $20,475.00 56 $3,555.50 | $24,888.50 52-56 | $1,850.00| $12,950.00 | 52-56 | $2,000.00| $14,000.00
Friday & Saturday, Oct. 30- . .
31,2015 Band of America Marching Contest 7 s | %2000 | si1575000 | 56 | P265370 | sa545721000| ssis6 | s277500 | $1042500 | 56 | $3443.00 | spazoro0 | s2.56 |s2,50000 $17,500.00 | 52.56 | $2,650.00| $18,550.00
Friday, October 30,2015 Del Rio, Texas (Football 2 56 $2,495.00 $4,990.00 56 $2,675.00 | $11,770,000.00 55/56 $1,935.00 $3,870.00 56 $3,555.50 $7,111.00 52-56 | $1,850.00] $3,700.00 | 52-56 | $2,000.00| $4,000.00
*Play Off Game Tentative(McAllen, Tx-Band & $2,700.00 $2,581.00
Friday, November 13,2015 Cheer/Dance) 7 56 S $18,900.00 56 T $34,327,300.00 55/56 $2,775.00 $19,425.00 56 $3,780.50 | $26,463.50 52-56 | $1,500.00| $10,500.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $11,550.00
Friday , November 13, 2015 Play Off Game Tentative (McAllen, Tx-Football, 2 56 $2,495.00| $4,990.00 56 $2,581.00| $9,807,800.00 55/56 $1,785.00] $3,570.00 56 $3,780.50| $7,561.00 52-56 | $1,500.00f $3,000.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $3,300.00
*Play Off Game Tentative(McAllen, Tx-Band &
Friday, November 20, 2015 Cheer/Dance) 7 56 $2.700.00 $18,900.00 56 $2.581.00 $34,327,300.00 55/56 $2.775.00 $19,425.00 56 $3.780.50 $26,463.50 52-56 $1,500.00 $10,500.00 | 52-56 $1,650.00 $11,550.00
Friday, November 20, 2015 Play Off Game Tentative (McAllen, Tx-Football) 2 56 $2,495.00 $4,990.00 56 $2,581.00 $9,807,800.00 55/56 $1,785.00 $3,570.00 56 $3,780.50 $7,561.00 52-56 | $1,500.00| $3,000.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00 $3,300.00
*=Attending Football Games
UNITED HIGH SCHOOL
DATES DESTINATION QrY.
Friday, September 4,2015 Mission, Texas(Band & Cheer/Dance] 9 56 $2,700.00 | $24,300.00 56 | $2,487.50 | $42,536,250.00 55/56 $2,775.00 $24,975.00 56 $3,555.50 | $31,999.50 52-56 | $1,500.00] $13,500.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00] $14,850.00
Friday, September 4,2015 Sharyland, Texas(Football 2 56 $2,700.00 $5,400.00 56 | $2,487.50 | $9,452,500.00 55/56 $1,785.00 $3,570.00 56 $3,555.50 $7,111.00 52-56 | $1,500.00] $3,000.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $3,300.00
Friday, September 18,2015 McAllen, Texas(Band & Cheer/Dance) 9 56 $2,700.00| $24,300.00 NA 55/56 $2,775.00 $24,975.00 56 $3,780.50 | $34,024.50 52-56 | $1,500.00| $13,500.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $14,850.00
Friday, September 18,2015 McAllen, Texas Rowe(Football 2 56 $2,495.00 $4,990.00 56 | $2,581.00 | $9,807,800.00 55/56 $1,785.00 $3,570.00 56 $3,780.50 $7,561.00 52-56 | $1,500.00] $3,000.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $3,300.00
Friday, October 9,2015 Del Rio, Texas(Band & Cheer/Dance] 9 56 $2,495.00| $22,455.00 NA 55/56 $2,925.00 | $26,325.00 56 $3,555.50 | $31,999.50 | 52-56 |$1,850.00] $16,650.00 | 52-56 | $2,000.00] $18,000.00
Friday, October 9,2015 Del Rio, Texas (Football 2 56 $2,495 $4,990.00 N/A 55/56 $1,935.00| $3,870.00 56 $3,555.50| $7,111.00 52-56 | $1,850.00| $3,700.00 | 52-56 | $2,000.00| $4,000.00
San Antonio, Texas(Marching) or See below for other
Saturday, October 10,2015 city-but same day ° 56 $2,250.00| $20,250.00 NA 55/56 $2,775.00| $24,975.00 56 $3,443.00 $30,987.00 52-56 $1,500.00 $13,500.00 | 52-56 $1,650.00 $14,850.00
McAllen, Texas(Marching)see notes above ° 56 $2,700.00] $24,300.00 NA 55/56 $2,775.00 $24,975.00 56 $3,780.50 $34,024.50 52-56 $1,50000 $13,500.00 | 52-56 $1,650.00 $14,850.00
Friday, October 23,2015 Eagle Pass, Texas (Band & Cheer/Dance) 9 56 $2,250.00| $20,250.00 56 $2,300.00] $36,225,000.00 55/56 $2,540.00| $22,860.00 56 $3,555.50| $31,999.50 52-56 | $1,500.00| $13,500.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $14,850.00
Friday, October 23,2015 Eagle Pass, Texas (Football 2 56 $2,250.00| $4,500.00 56 $2,300.00| $8,050,000.00 55/56 $1,550.00| $3,100.00 56 $3,555.50| $7,111.00 52-56 | $1,500.00| $3,000.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $3,300.00
Friday & Saturday, Oct. 30- 9
31,2015 Bands of America Marching Contest 56 $2,250.00| $20,250.00 $2,337.50| $39,971,250.00 55/56 $2,775.00| $24,975.00 56 $3,443.00| $30,987.00 52-56 | $1,500.00| $13,500.00 | 52-56 | $2,650.00| $23,850.00
*Play Off Game Tentative(McAllen, Tx-Band & 9
Friday, November, 13,2015 Cheer/Dance) 56 $2,700.00| $24,300.00 $2,581.00| $44,135,100.00 55/56 $2,775.00| $24,975.00 56 $3,780.50| $34,024.50 52-56 | $1,500.00| $13,500.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $14,850.00
Friday, November 13, 2015 Play Off Game Tentative(McAllen, Tx-Football) 2 56 $2,495.00 $4,990.00 56 $2,581.00 $9,807,800.00 55/56 $1,785.00 $3,570.00 56 $3,780.50 $7,561.00 52-56 | $1,500.00| $3,000.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $3,300.00
*Play Off Game Tentative(McAllen, Tx-Band &
Friday, November 20, 2015 Cheer/Dance) 9 56 $2,700.00 | $24,300.00 56 $2,581.00 | $44,135,100.00 55/56 $2,775.00 $24,975.00 56 $4,505.50 | $40,549.50 52-56 | $1,500.00| $13,500.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $14,850.00
Friday, November 20,2015 Play Off Game Tentative(McAllen, Tx-Football) 2 56 $2,495.00 $4,990.00 56 $2,581.00 [ $9,807,800.00 55/56 $1,785.00 $3,570.00 56 $3,780.50 $7,561.00 52-56_ | $1,500.00( $3,000.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $3,300.00
Alexander High School
DATES [oesTivaTioN QrY,
Friday, September 25,2015 San Angelo, Texas (Band & Cheer/Dance) 7 56 $3,800.00 | $26,600.00 56 $2,300.00 $16,100.00 55/56 $4,240.00 $29,680.00 56 $4,905.50 | $34,338.50 52-56 | $2,500.00] $17,500.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $11,550.00
Friday, September 25,2015 San Angelo, Texas (Football 2 56 $3,800.00 $7,600.00 56 $3,797.00 $7,594.00 55/56 $3,250.00 $6,500.00 56 $4,905.50 $9,811.00 52-56 | $2,500.00| $5,000.00 | 52-56 | $2,650.00| $5,300.00
San Antonio, Texas(Marching) or See below for other
Saturday, October 10,2015 city-but same day 7 56 $2,250.00 | $15,750.00 56 $2,300.00 $16,100.00 55/56 $2,775.00 | $19,425.00 56 $3,191.00 | $22,337.00 | 52-56 |$1,500.00| $10,500.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $11,550.00
McAllen, Texas(Marching)see notes above 7 56 $2,750.00| $19,250.00 NA 55/56 $2,775.00 $19,425.00 56 $3,530.50 | $24,713.50 52-56 | $1,500.00] $10,500.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $11,550.00
Friday & Saturday, Oct. 30-
31,2015 Bands of America Marching Contest 7 56 $2,250.00 | $15,750.00 56 $2,300.00 $16,100.00 55/56 $2,775.00 $19,425.00 56 $3,193.00 | $22,351.00 52-56 | $1,500.00| $10,500.00 | 52-56 | $2,650.00| $18,550.00
Friday, November 13,2015 *Play Off Game Tentative(McAllen, Tx-Band &
Cheer/Dance) 7 56 $2,700.00 | $18,900.00 56 $2,581.00 $18,067.00 55/56 $2,775.00 $19,425.00 56 $3,530.50 | $24,713.50 52-56 | $1,500.00| $10,500.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $11,550.00
Friday, November 13,2015 Play Off Game Tentative(McAllen, Tx-Football) 2 56 $2,495.00 $4,990.00 56 $2,581.00 $5,162.00 55/56 $1,785.00 $3,570.00 56 $3,780.50 $7,561.00 52-56 | $1,500.00| $3,000.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $3,300.00
Friday, November 20,2015 *Play Off Game Tentative(McAllen, Tx-Band &
Cheer/Dance) 7 56 $2,700.00 [ $18,900.00 56 $2,581.00 $18,067.00 55/56 $2,775.00 $19,425.00 56 $3,530.50 | $24,713.50 52-56 | $1,500.00| $10,500.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $11,550.00
Friday, November 20,2015 Play Off Game Tentative(McAllen, Tx-Football) 2 56 $2,495.00 $4,990.00 56 $2,581.00 $5,162.00 55/56 $1,785.00 $3,570.00 56 $3,780.50 $7,561.00 52-56 | $1,500.00| $3,000.00 | 52-56 | $1,650.00| $3,300.00
Friday & Saturday, Oct. 30-3,2015

Notes:

USHS-Nov. 13, 2015 $1,500 1 day

trip one day a bus $1,650.




