
United Independent School District

Awards/Trophies/Ribbons

RFP 022-2015

Laredo,Tx Laredo, Tx Laredo,Tx Laredo,Tx Portsmouth, RI Lago Vista,Tx
Oklahoma, 

OK
Laredo,Tx San Antonio,Tx Greenville, OH Hauppauge, NY Laredo, Tx

Net 20% 50% 0% 0% 10% 10% 0-30% 20% 5% 10%

Net

5% off all orders(10% 

off orders over $500; 

15% off orders over 

$1,000)

10% 36% 0% 0% N/A 10% 0-30% NA NA 10%

Net 0% 50% 0% 0% N/A 10% 0-30% NA NA 10%

$10.00 No Bid $8.00 $5.95 No Bid No Bid

$15.50 / 

Item# 76-

0034E

N/A $9.95

$12.65 quoted 5"x 7" 

Neff PLDQP digital with 

engraving plate

$16.95 $20.00

$25.00 N/A $28.00 $13.95 No Bid No Bid
$28 / Item#76-

0034C
$20.00 $37.95

$13.52 Neff PLDQP digital with 

engraving plate
$24.95 $30.00

$10.00 $9.99 $8.00 $5.95 No Bid No Bid

$15.50 / 

Item# 76-

0034E

$10.00 8.95
$12.65 Quoted 5"x7" Neff 

PLDQP
$16.95 $35.00

$12.00 $10.99 $12.00 $6.50 No Bid No Bid

$15.50 / 

Item# 76-

0034E

$12.50 $9.95 $12.65 Neff PLDQP $14.95 $35.00

$14.00 $14.99 $15.00 $6.99 No Bid No Bid

$15.50 / 

Item# 76-

0034E

$15.00 $11.95
$13.08 Quoted a 8"x8" Neff 

PLDQP
$21.95 $35.00

$35.00               

to                  

$40.00

$24.99 $35.00 $12.95 No Bid No Bid

$37.25 / 

Item# 76-

0034B

$25.00 $43.95 $15.88 Neff PLDQP $34.95 $40.00

$50.00 $32.99 quoted 12 x 15 $54.00 $13.95 No Bid No Bid

$37.25 / 

Item# 76-

0034B

$30.00 $48.95
$18.16 Quoted a 11" x 14" Neff 

PLDQP
$47.95 $40.00

$65.00 $39.99 $65.00 $14.95 No Bid No Bid

$53.50 / 

Item# 73-

0025

$45.00 $54.95
$22.84 Quoted a 12" x 16" Neff 

PLDQP
$55.95 $45.00

15% 5% off all orders 20% 10% 0% 0% 10% 10% 0-30%
20%(RB100-not shown in 

catalog)
5% 10%

15% 5% off all orders 10% 10% 0% 0% N/A 10% 0-30% NA NA 10%

15% NA 0% 10% 0% 0% N/A 10% 0-30% NA NA 10%

$0.40

Qty 1-99 $.72 

Qty 100-499 $.66 

Qty 500-599 $.56 

Qty 1000+ $.51

$0.95 

Depending 

on qty

$0.38

Qty 100-499 $.43 

For larger quantities 

please call vendor.

Qty: 100-499= 

$0.74 ea. / Qty 

of 500-

999=$.50 ea/ 

Qty of 1000 

&up $0.44 ea.

$0.75 $0.60

Qty of 100 =$0.66 

ea  Qty of 250= 

$0.56ea /Qty of 500 

= $0.54 ea/ Qty of 

1000= $0.50 ea.

Qty 100 minimum $.45 

each/call for larger qty price 

breaks.

$0.47 $1.35

% OFF SHELF PRICE

% OFF LIST PRICE

A. 2X8" Flat top pinked 

bottom satin ribbon to read 

(custom ribbon with event 

card and string)

Postive 

Promotions

Smart 

Promtional

PLAQUES 

% OFF CATALOG PRICE

% OFF SHELF PRICE 

% OFF LIST PRICE

A. 4 ½ X 6 Wood plaque  

with black plate and gold 

lettering:

B. 8 X 10 Walnut plaque with 

brushed gold Bottom & Gold 

lettering:

C. 4 X 6   Complete with 

sublimation lettering  & 

district logo

D.  5 X 7   Complete with 

sublimation lettering & district 

logo

E. 6 X 8   Complete with 

sublimation lettering & district 

logo

F. 9 X 12  Complete with 

sublimation lettering & district 

logo

G. 10 X 13 Complete with 

sublimation lettering & district 

logo

H. 12 x 15 Complete with 

sublimation lettering, frame 

for picture & district logo-gold 

photo tape down, a size 5x6.

RIBBONS

Location

% OFF CATALOG PRICE

VENDORS 
Awards 

Masters

Big Bob's Trophies 

Plus

Ed' 

Trophies

Hamilton 

Trophies
Hodges Badge,Co.

House of 

Ribbons

Jostens 

Awards

K & M 

Sports

Monarch Trophy 

Studio
Neff Motivation



United Independent School District

Awards/Trophies/Ribbons

RFP 022-2015

Postive 

Promotions

Smart 

Promtional
VENDORS 

Awards 

Masters

Big Bob's Trophies 

Plus

Ed' 

Trophies

Hamilton 

Trophies
Hodges Badge,Co.

House of 

Ribbons

Jostens 

Awards

K & M 

Sports

Monarch Trophy 

Studio
Neff Motivation

20% NA 20% 55% 0% N/A 10% 10% 0-30% No Bid 5% 10%

20%

5% off all orders(10% 

off orders over $500; 

15% off orders over 

$1,000)

10% 55% 0% N/A N/A 10% 0-30% No Bid NA 10%

20% NA 0% 55% 0% N/A N/A 10% 0-30% No Bid NA 10%

$18.00-$20.00-

(18"-20"/one 

column $8.00.

N/A N/A $3.98 No Bid N/A
$5.70 / Item# 

77-0008-C
$17.50 $9.95 No Bid $15.64 $6.50

NAME PLATES

20% NA 20% 50% 0% N/A 10% 10% 0-30% No Bid No Bid 10%

20%

5 % off all orders(10% 

off orders greater, 

15% off all orders 

over $1,000)

10% 35% 0% N/A N/A 10% 0-30% No Bid No Bid 10%

20% NA 0% 50% 0% N/A N/A 10% 0-30% No Bid No Bid 10%

$18.00 $20.00 $25.00 $9.98 N/A N/A $25.00 $15.00 $14.95 NA No Bid $10.00

CERTIFICATES

$0.60 

ea.(quantities 

of 100 or 

more)

No Bid $4.50

Pack of 100 

$3.00 

Pack of less 

$3.50

No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.50 each N/A

Qty 100 $2.08

Qty 250 $1.32

Qty 500 $1.24

No Bid $1.10 each

20% 5% 20% 10% N/A 0% No Bid 10% N/A 20% No Bid 10%

20% 5% 10% 10% N/A 0% No Bid 10% N/A NA No Bid 10%

20% NA 0% 10% N/A 0% No Bid 10% N/A NA No Bid 10%% OFF LIST PRICE

% OFF LIST PRICE

A. 9" Double pedestal trophy 

with 3 x 3 marble stand with a 

soccer (2-colum trophy just 

with a 3 x3 marble on top and  

a soccer figure).

% OFF CATALOG PRICE

% OFF SHELF PRICE

% OFF LIST PRICE

Price for removable 

nameplate

Price for removable 

nameplate w/holder

8X10 One color premium foil 

certificate athletic (sport) 

horizontal layout/silver foil

% OFF CATALOG PRICE

% OFF SHELF PRICE

$5.0014.00$            $8.00 $20.00 $4.98 N/A N/A $15.00 $5.00 $7.95 No Bid No Bid

A. 2"X10" Plastic nameplates 

with district logo on left  hand 

side aluminum holder for 

nameplate,in gold with black 

lettering with logo

TROPHIES

% OFF CATALOG PRICE

% OFF SHELF PRICE



United Independent School District

Awards/Trophies/Ribbons

RFP 022-2015

Postive 

Promotions

Smart 

Promtional
VENDORS 

Awards 

Masters

Big Bob's Trophies 

Plus

Ed' 

Trophies

Hamilton 

Trophies
Hodges Badge,Co.

House of 

Ribbons

Jostens 

Awards

K & M 

Sports

Monarch Trophy 

Studio
Neff Motivation

$6.15/a pkg of 

30
No Bid $25.00

Pack of 100 

$4.49 

Pack of less 

$4.75

No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.50 each N/A

Qty 100 $1.28 

Qty 250 $.74

Qty 25 $.58

No Bid No Bid

20% NA 20% 10% N/A 0% No Bid 10% N/A 20% No Bid 10%

20% 5% 10% 10% N/A 0% No Bid 10% N/A NA No Bid 10%

20% NA 0% 10% N/A 0% No Bid 10% N/A NA No Bid 10%

RUSH SERVICE NA

$10-$15 N/A N/A N/A

Varies depending on 

purchase call vendor 

for charges.

$50.00 No Bid None Varies TBD at time needed

Call vendor.Charges 

will apply  based on 

weight of shipment.

$50.00

$5.00 N/A N/A 20%

Varies depending on 

purchase call vendor 

for charges.

$30.00 No Bid None Varies TBD at time needed

Call vendor.Charges 

will apply  based on 

weight of shipment.

$35.00

Net Regular 

Price
N/A N/A 10%

Varies depending on 

purchase call vendor 

for charges.

$10.00
Depending on 

product
None Varies TBD at time needed

Call vendor.Charges 

will apply  based on 

weight of shipment.

$0.00

Medals

 DNMS No Bid DNMS DNMS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.25 DNMS No Bid DNMS

20% NA 20% 50% 0% 0% 10% 10% 0-30% 20% No Bid 10%

20%

5% off all orders

10 % off order >$500

15% off order >$1,000

10% 36% 0% 0% N/A 10% 0-30% NA No Bid 10%

20% 0% 50% 0% 0% N/A 10% 0-30% NA No Bid 10%

0.60$                 N/A

$36 to $30 

per item: 

Sandblast 

work

1.99$                   No Bid
$.15 per letter 

or space
5.00$               5.00$           $1.00

Qty 31 or more laser labels-

engraving not available on custom 

medals. Qty 1-30 $16.50 for labels 

flat rate.

No Bid $1.50

% OFF LIST PRICE

Please provide pricing for 

engraving "Property of UISD"

8X10 Gray leatherette 

certificate; athletic (sport)  

horizontal layout/black print & 

logo

% OFF CATALOG PRICE

% OFF SHELF PRICE

% OFF LIST PRICE

NEXT DAY 

1-2 Days

3-5 Days

M-UILMD-SE-G01, Gold 

Medal. Pre-attached 

Red/White/Blue Ribbon 

Drape.

% OFF CATALOG PRICE

% OFF SHELF PRICE


