UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
GRADUATION SUPPLIES

RFP 001-2015

VENDORS [ Graduation Source [ Herff Jones [ Senior Class Graduation Products South Texas Balfour, LLC
Description Qty | Price Ext. | Item Number | Price | Ext. | Item Number | Price Ext. | Item Number Price | Ext. | Item Number
Section I. Percentage Discounts | |
% Off Catalog Price [ N/A [ N/A [ N/A N/A
% Off List Price [ N/A | N/A [ N/A N/A
Section Il. Rental -Staff gowns only
Bachelor Gowns 345 $99.95 | $34,482.75 *See Notes $16.15 $5,571.75 No bid $0.00 $15.75 $5,433.75 *See Notes
Bachelor Hoods 345 $29.95 | $10,332.75 *See Notes $16.15 $5,571.75 No bid $0.00 $15.15 $5,226.75 *See Notes
Master Gowns 95 $99.95 | $9,495.25 *See Notes $16.75 $1,591.25 No bid $0.00 $16.30 $1,548.50 *See Notes
Master Hoods 95 $34.95 | $3,320.25 *See Notes $16.95 $1,610.25 No bid $0.00 $15.70 $1,491.50 *See Notes
Doctorate Gowns 10 $149.95| $1,499.50 *See Notes $18.20 $182.00 No bid $0.00 $17.55 $175.50 *See Notes
Doctorate Hoods 10 $39.95 $399.50 *See Notes $18.50 $185.00 No bid $0.00 $17.30 $173.00 *See Notes
Section Ill. Purchase - Staff & Student
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Cap & Gown Unit for student 100 $12.95 | $1,295.00 | Includes Tassel $35.50 $3,550.00/ Brfchure No bid $0.00 $39-542 $3,900.00 - $4,200.00
$37.95 custom $3,795.00 (custom)
Bachelor Gowns 345 $99.95 | $34,482.75 $19.65 $6,779.25 No bid $0.00 $144-$280 |$49,680.00-$96,600.0C
Bachelor Hoods 345 $30.95 | $10,677.75 $19.50 $6,727.50 No bid $0.00 $87-$151 $30,015.00-$52,095.0C
Master Gowns 95 $99.95 $9,495.25 $23.85 $2,265.75 No bid $0.00 $171-$309 |$16,245.00-$29,355.0C
Master Hoods 95 $30.95 $2,940.25 $20.55 $1,952.25 No bid $0.00 $97-$167 $9,215.00-$15,865.00
Doctorate Gowns 10 $175.95| $1,759.50 $29.30 $293.00 No bid $0.00 $385-$595 $3,850.00-$5,595.00
Diplomas 3000 | $1.95 | $5,850.00 Th?;:‘ff;”h $3.54 $10,620.00 No bid $0.00 $3.60-34.77 |$10,800.00-514,310.00| ** See Notes
Diploma Covers, Acetate & Envelopes 3000 $4.95 | $14,850.00 $5.98 $17,940.00 No bid $0.00 $6.77-$7.50 |$20,310.00-$22,500.0C
$6.95 one
side $18,765.00 . . .
DAP Stoles 2700 $7.95 $21,465.00 Embroidered $7.65 $20,655.00 $11.00 $29,700.00 STL-STOOL-CUST $13.00 $35,100.00 2 ply Satin Embroidered
Two sides

Salutatorian Stoles 4 $7.95 $31.80 2 sides Embroidered $7.65 $30.60 $13.00 $52.00 STL-STOOL-SAL $23.50 $94.00
Valedictorian Stoles 4 $7.95 $31.80 |2 sides Embroidered| $7.65 $30.60 $13.00 $52.00 STL-STOOL-VAL $23.50 $94.00
Double Honor Cords 1300 No Bid $0.00 $5.00 $6,500.00 $5.70 $7,410.00 CRD-THN-DBL-BRGD $7.00 $9,100.00
Single Honor Cords 1300 No bid $0.00 $3.00 $3,900.00 $2.85 $3,705.00 CRD-THN-BRGD $3.50 $4,550.00
Multi Colored Single Honor Cords 100 no price $0.00 $3.25 $325.00 $4.45 $445.00 CRD-THN-MULT $4.50 $450.00
DAP Seals 2700 | no price $0.00 n/c $0.00 No bid $0.00 $0.20 $540.00
Salutatorian Seals 4 no price $0.00 n/c $0.00 No bid $0.00 n/c $0.00
Valedictorian Seals 4 no price $0.00 n/c $0.00 No bid $0.00 n/c $0.00
Sash with Graduation Medals 350 $7.95 $2,782.50 $3.95 $1,382.50 No bid $0.00 $2.75-$7.95 $962.50-$2,782.50
Graduation Seal for Magnet School 350 no price $0.00 n/c $0.00 No bid $0.00 $0.60 $210.00
Honor Society Patches 600 no price $0.00 $5.00 $3,000.00 No bid $0.00 $5.75 $3,450.00
Honor Society Diploma Seals 600 no price $0.00 n/c $0.00 No bid $0.00 $0.20 $120.00
Blue Hoods (Honor Society) 600 $9.95 $5,970.00 $4.85 $2,910.00 $14.95 $8,970.00 *See notes $14.70 $8,820.00
Gold Hoods (Top 10%) 300 $9.95 $2,985.00 $4.85 $1,455.00 $11.95 $3,585.00 **See notes $14.70 $4,410.00

Set up Fee (if applicable) $0.00 NR $0.00 NR

SPECIAL NOTES

*No Rental available Price reflects to Purchase

- 4-6 weeks processing on all
and customized products
- 7-10 days delivery after PO

collegiate regalia

issued

-Adequate lead time for Student orders sent via mail, fax,
email or phone is 35 days

-Electronic Orders sent is 25 days

-Faculty orders is 30 days prior to the delivery date for those
containing standard items (i.e. cap, gown & tassel)

-Faculty hoods, non standard items and custom items
require at least 60 days prior to delivery date.

-No charge restocking fee: credit given on all returns-unused
apparel.

*LT. Blue V-neck stoles w/gold embroidery
- Academic Torch on Front
**Plain Gold V-neck (no embroidery)

Delivery- In stock cords (10 days), Custom Stoles (30-40 days)

* Diploma Pricing 2015

* Deduct $2.00 from Gown price if no Cap & Tassel is needed

** United Diploma Sell: $3.60 Cover Sale: $6.50
**United HS Magnet Diploma Sell: $4.20

**United South Diploma Sell: $4.50 Cover Sell: $7.50
**B Johnson Diploma Sell: $4.01 Cover Sell: $6.77
**Alexander Diploma Sell: $4.01 Cover Sell: $6.77

**Alexander Magnet Diploma Sell: $4.77




