
Section I.

Vendor Henry Schein, Inc.
Nashville Medical & 

EMS Products, Inc.
Quill Corporation

School Health 

Corporation

School Kids 

Healthcare
School Nurse Supply

William V. MacGill & 

Co.

% Off Catalog Price 15% 40% 15% 11% 0% 8% 5-7%

% Off List Price NA NA 0% NA 21% NA NA

% Off Shelf Price NA NA 0% NA 0% NA NA

Notes:
15% for items not on 

the bid.

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

RFP 2014-095

NURSING SUPPLIES

Please call vendor to 

receive a detailed list of 

catalog discount 

exclusions by product 

number (SKU).

21% discount on all 

furniture purchases, but 

are responsible for all 

freight charges on these 

items. 21% may not apply 

for the purchase of all 

training manikins, please 

contact Chad Carlson for 

clarification-1-866-588-

0686.



Section II.

VENDORS

  DESCRIPTION Unit Price

Brand / Amt 

per BX/PKG/ 

CS

Unit 

Price

Brand / Amt 

per  BX/PKG/ 

CS

Unit Price

Brand /Amt 

per BX/PKG/ 

CS

Unit Price

Brand /Amt 

per BX/PKG/ 

CS

Unit Price

Brand /Amt 

per 

BX/PKG/CS

Unit Price
Brand /Amt per 

BX/PKG/CS
Unit Price

Brand /Amt per 

BX/PKG/CS

Extra Large 50/pk Fabric $4.18
#2677345-

50/Pk
$2.49

Kentron 

#880124- 

50/Box

$4.38
SH#32120- 

50/Box
$3.84

Dynarex#3614- 

50/Bx
$5.06

Pro 

Advantage#51

30-50/Bx

$4.36
Economy#75102- 

50/Box

Fingertip  Band-Aids 

Flexi Fabric 100/pk 

Regular size

$1.38
HSI  100/BX 

1 x 3"
$2.89

Kentron 

#880752-

100/Box

$4.87
SH#32231- 

100/Box
$3.46

Dynarex#3617- 

100/Bx
$5.47

Pro 

Advantage#53

05-100/BX

$5.34
Economy#6430- 

100/Box

Fingertip  Band-Aids 

Flexi Fabric 100/pk 

Large size

$1.26
HSI 100/BX 

3/4 x 3"
$3.19

Kentron 

#880753-

100/Box

$3.90

Flex-Band 

#32153- 

50/Box

$3.96
Dynarex#3618- 

100/Bx
$6.57

Dynarex#5310-

100/BX
$6.55

Economy#6440- 

100/Box

Knuckle  Band-Aids Flexi 

Fabric 100/pk 
$2.17 HSI  100/BX $2.99

Kentron#880

153-100/Box
$4.15

SH#32230- 

100/Box
$3.52

Dynarex#3619-

100/Bx
$5.51

Pro 

Advantage#53

00-100/Bx

$4.27
Economy#6425-

100/Box

Regular Size Band-Aids 

1500/cs Fabric
$16.65

Kentron 

#880113-

1500/cs

$32.78
SH#32076- 

1500/Box
$32.08

White 

Cross#16310

0- 1300/cs

$34.04

Pro 

Advantage#50

30-1500/case

$34.74
Economy#9160-

1500/cs

 2" X 5 Yards- Roll $2.71
HSI 10/ Box- 

2 x4 .5 yds
$0.27

Kentron#670

722-Roll
$0.40

SH#31006- 

Each
$0.27

Medsource#0

620- Roll
$0.62

Dynarex#1521

0-Each
$0.62

Economy#6021-

Roll

 3" X 5 Yards- Roll $3.40
HSI 3x4.5 yd- 

10/Box
$0.33

Kentron#670

723-Roll
$0.50

SH#31007- 

Each
$0.39

Medsource#0

630-Roll
$0.72

Dynarex#1521

1-Each
$0.73

Economy#6031-

Roll

 4" X 5 Yards -Roll $4.56
HSI 4x4.5 

yds 10/Box
$0.39

Kentron#670

724-Roll
$0.74

SH#31008- 

Each
$0.52

Medsource#0

640- Roll
$0.96

Dynarex#1521

2-Each
$0.97

Economy#6041-

Roll

6" X 5 Yards - Roll $6.41
HSI 6x4.5 

yds- 10/Box
$0.59

Kentron#670

726-Roll
$1.14

SH#31009- 

Each
$0.76

Medsource#0

660-Roll
$1.42

Dynarex#1521

3-Each
$1.43

Economy#6061-

Roll

1" - Pack of 5 Rolls $5.35 3m-1" $1.65
Kentron#690

921- 5PK
$6.53

3m- 

5/PK(100635 

Pk)

$8.35
Coban#3102

2- 5/PK
$4.70

Coban#1581-

Roll($0.94)
$6.85

#15810($1.37 

)Each
$6.75 Coban#1581-5/Pk

2" - Pack of 5 Rolls $9.75 3m- 2"  5/pk $2.95
Kentron#690

922-5/Pk
$11.00

Coban#3101

4- 5/PK
$8.60

Coban#1582-

Roll($1.72)
$11.90

#15820-($2.38 

Each)
$11.60 Coban#1582-5/Pk

3" - Pack of 5 Rolls $12.40 3m -5/pk $4.95
Kentron#690

923-5/PK
$15.85

Coban#3101

5- 5/PK
$10.80

Coban#1583-

Roll($2.16)
$14.20

#15830($2.84-

Each)
$13.90 Coban#1583-5/Pk

4" - Pack of 5 Rolls $15.25 3m -5/pk $5.85
Kentron#690

924-5/PK
$16.20

Coban#3101

6- 5/PK
$13.55

Coban#1584- 

Roll($2.71)
$18.80

#15840($3.76 

Each)
$16.70 Coban#1584-5/Pk

2" - bag of 12 $2.70 HSI -12/Box $0.99

Kentron 

#440002- 

12/Box

$1.73
SH#27545- 

12/Bag
$1.10

Dynarex#3102- 

12/Pk
$4.86

Flexicon#1550

5-12/Pkg
$2.77

Duform#75122-12 

1bg

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
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Nursing Supplies

Henry Schein, Inc.
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BAND-AIDS

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No BidNo Bid

ACE BANDAGES/DRESSINGS

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

COBAN

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

ELASTIC GAUZE BAND.

No Bid
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3" x 3" - 100 per bx $3.81
HIS -  3x3-

12 Ply
$2.59

Kentron#331

201-100/Box-

12 ply

$3.43

SH#27543- 

100/Box(12 

ply)

$2.84
Dynarex#3353- 

100/Bx-12 Ply
$5.01

Dynarex#1691

0-100/Bx- 12 

Ply

$4.41
Economy#8110- 

100/Bx 2 ply

Medium 2 x 3- 10 per bg 

/ 100 per bx
$5.86

Derm 2x3- 

100/Box
DNMS

Kentron#772

301-100/Box
$8.37

SH#27529- 

100/Box
$8.30

TELFA#1961-

100/Bx
$6.39

White 

Cross#8350-

100/Bx

$5.94
Curad#95200- 

100/Bx

Large 3x4- 10 per bg / 

100 per bx
$7.47

Derm 

100/Box
DNMS

Kentron#773

401-100/Box
$13.10

SH#27530- 

100/Box
$19.30

TELFA#7643- 

100/Bx
$12.97

White 

Cross#8360- 

100/Bx

$9.76
Curad#95210- 

100/bx

Adult (10.75 TO 15.75) $7.45
Medsource 

Ea.
$7.19

Kentron#777

701- Each
$15.35

SH#56134-

Each
$10.66

ADC#775-

11AN-Each
$14.85

Briggs 

Healthcare#40

011-Each

$22.79
Economy#10650- 

Each

Pediatric (7" TO 10.75) $7.45
Medsource 

Ea.
$6.99

Kentron#777

703-Each
$17.12

SH#56133-

Each
$10.66

ADC#775-

9CN- Each
$14.85

Briggs 

Healthcare#40

015-Each

$22.79
Economy#10660-

Each

Large Adult (13.75 TO 

19.5)
$8.46

Medsource 

Ea.
$8.09

Kentron#777

702- Each
$18.24

SH#56135-

Each
$10.66

ADC#775-

12XN- Each
$21.61

Briggs 

Healthcare#40

016-Each

$27.02
Economy#10670-

Each

Gauge - Replacement -

Mabis Healthcare 

Aneriod Manometer 

Model 05-230-020

$16.10

Brand/Model 

as specified 

#41315

DNMS
Economy#15600-

Each

Bulb-Tycos A Welch 

Allyn Co. 5088-01 Latex 

bulb and standard value 

Ea.

$11.52
Medline Bid-

112055 MED
$5.05 56166

Electronic-Adult (10.75 to 

15.75)
$39.00

Kentron#791

305A-Each
$39.44

ADC#A6021- 

Each

Electronic-Pediatric (7" 

to 10.75)
$39.00

Kentron#791

305P-Each

No BidNo Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No BidNo Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Ply

No Bid

TELFA PADS

No Bid

No Bid

BLOOD PRESSURE CUFFS - PROFESSIONAL SPHYGMONAMOMETERS

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid 

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



Section II.

VENDORS

  DESCRIPTION Unit Price

Brand / Amt 

per BX/PKG/ 

CS

Unit 

Price

Brand / Amt 

per  BX/PKG/ 

CS

Unit Price

Brand /Amt 

per BX/PKG/ 

CS

Unit Price

Brand /Amt 

per BX/PKG/ 

CS

Unit Price

Brand /Amt 

per 

BX/PKG/CS

Unit Price
Brand /Amt per 

BX/PKG/CS
Unit Price

Brand /Amt per 

BX/PKG/CS

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

RFP2014-095

Nursing Supplies

Henry Schein, Inc.
Nashville Medical & 

EMS Products,Inc.
Quill Corporation School Health Corporation School Kids Healthcare School NurseSupply, Inc. William V. MacGill & Co.

BAND-AIDS

Envirocide Refill - 1 

gallon
$26.88

Envirocide  

Gal * 

Hazmat*

$27.26
Envirocide 

#34194-Gal
$25.10

Envirocide#30

124- Gal
$26.91 #18262-Gallon $26.52

Envirocide#71341-

Each

Envirocide Spray Bottle - 

24 oz ea.
$9.22

Envirocide*

Hazmat*
$9.05

Envirocide#5

0062- 24 oz
$8.73

Envirocide#30

024- 24 oz Ea.
$9.46

#18261-24 oz- 

Bottle
$7.83

Envirocide#71339-

Each

Disposable Specular 

2.75mm Pediatric
$1.38

Welch Allyn 

#53021- 34/tb
$1.01

Welch 

Allyn#52432- 

34/SLV

$1.47

Welch-

Allyn#32130-

34/Pkg

$1.44
W.Allyn#52432-

34/tube

Feminine Gards - 250 /cs 

Size 4
$49.13

Hospital 

SPC #4 

Maxi

$54.32
Naturelle#22

003- 250/cs
$41.60

Gards#4-

#147A- 250/cs
$54.05

Naturelle#2400

4-250/case
$54.33

Naturelle#147- 

250/cs

Ear Ease single $8.13

Ear 

Ease#37016-

Each

$6.41

Ear 

Ease#1246-

Each

$8.27 #12642- $9.07
Ear Ease#3870-

Each

Eye Pads - 50 per bx $5.25
Kentron#883

360- 50/Box
$7.27

Pukal#27397- 

50/Box
$4.14

Dynarex#3360- 

50/Bx
$8.23

Dynarex#1826

4-50/Bx
$6.65

Economy#9750- 

50/bx

Lister Bandage Scissors - 

5 1/2" 
$0.99

Kentron#K11

44-Each
$0.89

SH#36223-

Each
$0.73

SKHC#81050-

Each
$2.71

Zulco#34485-

Ea.
$2.23

Economy#3094-

Each

Foreceps / Magnifying 

Glass - 3 1/2"
$3.19

Kentron#K12

57M-Each
$1.35

SH#36229-

Each
$3.47

SKHC#E2470-

Each
$6.43

Zulco#34205-

Each
$4.93

Economy#6360-

Each

Splinter Foreceps - 4 

1/2" fine point
$0.89

Kentron#K12

57-Each
$0.78

SH#36228- 

Each
$0.39

SKHC#73000

0- Each
$1.79

Zulco#34170-

Each
$1.39

Economy#6060-

Each

Pen Lights Disposable 

w/pupil gauge  6/pkg
$3.15

Kentron#404

060-6/pk
$5.83

SH#90650-

6/PK
$4.59

EMP#32762-

6/Pkg
$8.08

BV 

Medical#25360-

6/Pkg

$7.24
Economy#6020-

6/Pk

Cotton Balls -Non sterile 

Med. 500 per bg
$4.95

Kentron#440

010-500/Bag
$2.04

Covidien#300

11-500/bag
$1.57

Kendall#2600- 

500/BG
$2.84

Kendall#14144- 

500/Bag
$2.86

Economy#19155-

500/1bag

Safety Pins - Asst. steel 

50 per pkg
$2.19

Kentron#SFP

101-50/Bag
$1.15

Dyno#90618-

50/PK
$2.29

Graham 

Field#36250-

90/Pkg

$1.62
Economy#4C590-

50/Pk

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

DISINFECTANTS

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No BidNo Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid
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BAND-AIDS

Face Shields -  Laerdal 

Resusci 35/bx 
$12.69

Laerdal#5504

6- 36/PK
$9.56

Laerdal#1512

00- 36/Roll

Prestan Professional 

CPR-AED Training 

Manikin(with CPR 

Monitor) Family Pack 

Light Skin NUPP-FM-

500M-Set

$459.75

Prestan 

Family Pack-

Light Skin

$378.58
Prestan PP-

FM-500M -Set
$495.00

CPR Training 

Manikin Family 

Pack Light 

Skin(Ship from 

MFG)Item#Z-

500M / Each
Prestan Professional 

CPR-AED Training 

Manikin(with CPR 

Monitor) Family Pack 

Medium Skin NUPP-FM-

500 MS -Set

$459.75

Prestan 

Family Pack-

Medium Skin

$378.58

Prestan PP-

FM-500M-MS-

Set

$495.00

CPR Training 

Manikin Family 

Pack Medium 

Skin(Ship from 

MFG)Item#Z-

500MS/Each
Face Shields-Lung 

Bags(Prestan 

Professional)Adult / 

10/Pack

$4.41
55205 10 Pkg 

A/C Prestan
$3.88

Prestan PP-

ALB-10- 

10/Pk

$4.55
Prestan/10/Pkg 

Item#57509

Face Shields-Lung 

Bags(Prestan 

Professional) Adult /  

50/Pack

$17.76
55206 50 Pkg 

A/C Prestan
$15.29

Prestan PP-

ALB-50-/ 

50/Pk

$18.35

Prestan/ 

50/Pkg 

Item#57510

$18.55

Prestan Manikins, 

50/box sold as 

50/Pkg only-

Item#36771
Face Shield Lung 

Bags(Prestan 

Professional)Child- 

10/Pack

$4.41
55242-10 

Pkg Prestan
$3.64

Prestan PP-

CLB 10-10/Pk
$4.27

Prestan/ 

10/Pkg-

Item#57530

Face Shield Lung 

Bags(Prestan 

Professional)Child- 

50/Pack

$16.87
55243-50 

Pkg-Prestan
$14.58

Prestan PP-

CLB-50-50/Pk
$17.43

Prestan/ 

50/Pkg-

Item#57531

$17.62

Prestan Manikins 

50/Box-50/Pkg 

only-Item#11957

Face Shield Lung 

Bags(Prestan)Infant- 

10/Pack

$4.41
55226-10 

Pkg Prestan
$3.41

Prestan PP-

ILB-10- 10/Pk
$4.09

Prestan/ 

10/Pkg-

Item#57512
Face Shield Lung 

Bags(Prestan 

Professional)Infant-

50/pack

$15.98
55227-50 

Pkg Prestan
$13.76

Prestan PP-

ILB-50- 50/Pk
$16.51

Prestan/ 

50/Pkg-

Item#57513

$16.69

Prestan Manikins 

50/Pkg only-

Item#75302

ActFast Anti-Choking 

Trainer-5/Pack
$460.09

55277-5Pk 

Anti choking 

trainer BlU

$411.75
ActFast AFB-

5/Pk
$612.75

Anti-Choking red 

trainer vest-

Item#14165/Each 

Alcohol Preps - 100 per 

bx
$1.69

Kendall#5750-

200/Box
$1.65

SH#49251-

200/Bx
$0.85

Dynarex#D11

14- 100/Bx
$2.47

Covidien#1120

5-200/Bx
$3.05

Economy#29600-

100/Bx

Dispatch Disinfectant 

Spary Bottle - 22 oz
$8.72

Dispatch#500

65- 22oz
$9.15

Clorox#10250-

22 oz Btl.
$8.14

Dispatch#68965-

Each

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

CPR / FA KIT

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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Powered Small  Latex 

Free - 100 per bx
$4.08

Baldur 

100/Box
$3.50

Pacifica#V10

60
$2.29

Ambitex - 

100 per Box
$4.24

Dynarex#213

06 - 100/Bx
$3.29

Dynarex#SVG

1005 100/Bx
$5.78

Pro 

Advantage#22

081-100/Box

Powered Medium Latex 

Free - 100 per bx
$4.08

Baldur 

100/Box
$3.50

Pacifica#V10

70
$2.29

Ambitex- 100 

per Box 
$4.24

Dynarex#213

07- 100/Bx
$3.29

Dynarex#SVG

100M- 100/Bx
$5.78

Pro 

Advantage#22

082- 100/Box

Powered Large Latex 

Free  - 100 per bx
$4.08

Baldur 

100/Box
$3.50

Pacifica#V10

80
$2.29

Ambitex- 100 

per Box 
$4.24

Dynarex#213

08 - 100/Bx
$3.29

Dynarex#SVG

100L- 100/Bx
$5.78

Pro 

Advantage#22

083-100/Box

Powered X-Large Latex 

Free - 100 per bx
$4.08

Baldur 

80/Box
$3.50

Pacifica#V10

90
$2.29

Ambitex - 

100 per Box 
$4.24

Dynarex#213

10- 100/Bx
$3.29

Dynarex#SVG

100XL - 

100/Bx

$5.78

Pro 

Advantage#22

084-100/Box

Nonpowered Small Latex 

Free- 100 per bx
$4.10

Criterion 

100/Box
$2.90

Pacifica#VF1

060
DNMS

Ansel 100 

per Box
$3.21

SH# 21603- 

100/Bx
$2.94

Dynarex#SPF

100S- 100/Bx
$6.43

Pro 

Advantage#23

081-100/Box

$5.44
Economy#13130-

100/Bx

Nonpowered Medium 

Latex Free- 100 per bx
$4.10

Criterion 

100/Box
$2.90

Pacifica#VF1

070
DNMS

Ansel 100 

per Box 
$3.21

SH# 21604- 

100/Bx
$2.94

Dynarex#SPF

100M-100/Bx
$6.43

Pro 

Advantage#23

082-100/Box

$5.44
Economy#13131-

100/Bx

Nonpowered Large Latex 

Free - 100 per bx
$4.10

Criterion 

100/Box
$2.90

Pacifica#VF1

080
DNMS

Ansel 100 

per Box 
$3.21

SH# 21605- 

100/Bx
$2.94

Dynarex#SPF

100L- 100/Bx
$6.43

Pro 

Advantage#23

083- 100/ Box

$5.44
Economy#13132-

100/Bx

Nonpowered X-Large 

Latex Free - 100 per bx
$4.10

Criterion 

90/Box
$2.90

Pacifica#VF1

090
DNMS

Ansel 100 

per Box
$3.21 SH# 21682- $2.94

Dynarex#SPF

100XL- 

100/Bx

$6.43

Pro 

Advantage#23

084-100/Box

$5.44
Economy#13133-

100/Bx

GLOVES

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



Section II.

VENDORS

  DESCRIPTION Unit Price

Brand / Amt 

per BX/PKG/ 

CS
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Price

Brand / Amt 
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CS
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Brand /Amt 

per BX/PKG/ 
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BX/PKG/CS

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

RFP2014-095

Nursing Supplies

Henry Schein, Inc.
Nashville Medical & 

EMS Products,Inc.
Quill Corporation School Health Corporation School Kids Healthcare School NurseSupply, Inc. William V. MacGill & Co.

BAND-AIDS

Gel Pack - Small 4" X 6" 

(Ea.)
$0.57 HIS - Ea. $0.57

Kentron#570

057-Each 5" 

x 7"

$0.44
SH# 37181- 

Each
$0.62

Thermakool#T

K46- Each
$1.18

Jack 

Frost#13110- 

Each

$0.70
Economy#51053-

Each

Gel Pack - Large 4 1/2" 

X 10" (Ea.)
$1.68

Therma Kool 

6" x 9"
$0.99

Kentron#570

069-Each 6" 

x 9"

$0.80
SH# 37182- 

Each
$1.67

Jack 

Frost#80304A-

Each

$1.83

Jack 

Frost#13120-

Each

$1.72
Economy#18040-

Each

Instant Kool Press 4" X 

6" (Ea.)
$0.65

Therma Kool 

4" x 6" 
$0.39

Kentron#561

112 -Each 5" 

x 7"

$0.62
InstaKool#37

131- Each
$0.47

Kwik 

Kold#1038- 

Each

$0.75

Therma 

Kool#23524-

Each

$0.73
InstaKool#60109-

Each

Instant Hot Press 6" X 8"-

24 per case
$11.32

Goldstar 6" x 

9"
$15.60

Kentron#562

111-24/CS 6" 

x 9"

$20.62
Instaheet#37

278- 24/cs
$7.89

Dynarex#1301- 

24/cs
$24.38

Therma 

Kool#23522-

24/case

$21.95
InstaFleet#68241-

24/cs

Heating Pads Electric 

Moist/Dry (Ea.)
$17.20

Mastex 

Moist
$14.44

Conair - 

Each
$17.30

Cara#35001- 

Each
$10.47

SKHC#23370-

Each
$17.71

Cara#36422-

Each
$18.18 Economy#51-Each

Kleenex - 125 per bx / 48 

bxs per cs
DNMS

Kleenex - 

125/Box 
$58.59

Kleenex - 48 

box/case
$74.60

Kleenex#212

99- 48/cs
$75.44

Kleenex#2302

26-48 

Boxes/case

$76.80
Kleenex#2160-

48/cs

Kleenex - 144 per bx / 36 

bxs per cs
50.04

Morcal - 

144/Box
$38.06

Generic#213

96- 36/cs
DNMS

Delicate 

Touch#34517

5- 36 Bx/cs

$94.68
Kleenex#74866-

160/bx & 36/cs

Bactine - 5 oz pump 

bottle (Ea.)
$5.81 Bayer 5 oz $6.51

Bactine#5003

5- 5 oz
$5.93

Bactine#3311

289- Each
$5.88

#18136- 5oz. 

Btl
$5.29

Bactine#1253-

Each

Bengay - 4 oz (Ea.) $6.88

J &J $3.44 

for a 2 oz 

Hazmat

$9.72
#18466-$4.86 

for a 2 oz tube
$9.28

Bengay#1377-

$4.64 for a 2 oz

Carmex - 1/4 oz per jar 

7.5 gram (Ea.)
$1.13 Carma .25 $0.98

Carmex#431

67- 1/4 oz
$1.46

#18202- 7.5g 

Jar
$1.20

Cerimex#9016-

Each

Caladryl - 6 oz / 6 bottles 

per box
$29.58 J & J 6/box $32.70

Caladryl#433

75- $5.45 for 

a 6 oz

$27.84

Caladryl#1265

933- $4.64 

Each

$34.14
#18195-6oz. 

$5.69 per Btl
$33.36

Caladry#1386-

$5.56 per bottle

Anbesol - .31 oz liquid $5.00
Anbesol .41 

oz
$6.37

Anbesol#340

06- .41 oz
$5.05 #18085-.31 oz $5.38

Anbesol#1231-

Each

Silver Solution 1 oz tube $6.46
Curad#13339-

Each

Vicks Vapor Rub $5.47 Vicks#74948-Each

HOT / COLD COMPRESSORS

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

OINTMENTS

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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VENDORS
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per BX/PKG/ 

CS
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Brand / Amt 
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CS
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BX/PKG/CS
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Brand /Amt per 

BX/PKG/CS

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

RFP2014-095

Nursing Supplies

Henry Schein, Inc.
Nashville Medical & 

EMS Products,Inc.
Quill Corporation School Health Corporation School Kids Healthcare School NurseSupply, Inc. William V. MacGill & Co.

BAND-AIDS

Otoscope $69.00
Kentron#999

998 Each
$89.38 Briggs-Each $91.05

Riestor#5300 

Each
$46.15

ADC#5211-

Each
DNMS

Welch-

Allyn#25070-Each

Strips  Accu Chech Adv. - 

50 per bx

Lancets Ref: Softclix 

sterile - 200 per bx
$27.69

Softelix#3618

2- 200/Bx
$21.89

Softclix#3608

742- 200/Bx
$31.90

Economy#5967-$ 

15.95 for a 100/bx

Round Batteries - 2 per 

pkg
DNMS

Duracell 

Alkane 2 per 

pkg.

$2.72
Energizer#90

406- 2/PK
$3.02

Energizer#551

58-Each

Rid Shampoo 2 oz & 1 

plastic lice comb kit 
$8.41

Bayer 2 oz 

Hazmat
$8.22

RID#340611- 

2 oz
$8.12

RID#1131085- 

Each
$7.49 #21410 $7.57 Rid#1701-Each

Dial Refill - 1 gallon (Ea.) $12.47 Dial Gal DNMS Dial Each $18.63
Dial#34073 - 

Gal
DNMS

Dial#88047-

each
$23.45 #18260-Gal $18.87 Dial#1483-Each

Dial Pump Bottles - 7 1/2 

oz (Ea.)
$2.55 Dial  7.5 oz DNMS

Soft Soap- 

Each
$2.25 Dial Each $2.65

Dial#34007- 

7.5 oz
$2.34

Dial#80761- 

Each
$2.99

#18245-7 1/2 

oz Btl
$2.77 Dial#1481-Each

SPLINTS/SLINGS

Finger Splints - 3/4" x 10' 

roll
$5.82

Protecto#H-

610- Each
$11.13

Protecto#2611

6-Each
$8.84

Economy#1946-

Each

Finger Splints - 3/4" x 20' 

roll
$8.24

Protecto#200

11- RL
$8.24

Protecto#H-

620- Each
$14.25

Protecto#2611

8-Each
$11.86

Economy#1945-

Each

Basswood Splint - 

18"x3"x1/8" - 12 per pkg
$10.07

Graham Field 

#20006- 

12/PK

$11.91
Protecto#2617

0-12/Pkg
$8.31

Economy#1941-

12/Pk

Armslings - 

bandage/safety pin 12 

per pkg

$3.48
Kentron#404

056-12/PK
$5.52

SH#27549- 

12/Pk
DNMS

Tetra#1201M- 

12/Bx
$7.99

Dynarex#2611

4-12/Box
$7.92

Economy#1060-

12/Pk

OTOLARYNGOLOGY

No Bid No Bid

BLOOD GLUCOSE KIT

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

SHAMPOO

No Bid No Bid

SOAPS

No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

RFP2014-095

Nursing Supplies

Henry Schein, Inc.
Nashville Medical & 

EMS Products,Inc.
Quill Corporation School Health Corporation School Kids Healthcare School NurseSupply, Inc. William V. MacGill & Co.

BAND-AIDSSOLUTIONS

Rubbing Alchohol - 16 oz 

/ 12 per cs 
DNMS

Swan 16 oz 

*Hazmat*
$16.68

Kentron#RA7

777-12/Case
$14.28

Vi-Jon#34042- 

12/cs
$19.44

Swan#98003- 

12/cs
$19.68

Swan#18070- 

12 oz Btl
$17.76

Economy#1218-

12/cs

Bactine - 4 oz squeeze 

bottle (Ea.)
$4.44

Bactine#3432

6- 4 oz
$4.29

Bactine#2399

343- Each
$4.22

#18130-4 oz. 

Btl
$3.62

Bactine#1250-

Each

Campho Phenic - 3/4 oz 

bttle (Ea.)
$4.61

Campho#434

00- 3/4 oz

Hydrogen Peroxide - 8 

oz  (Ea.)
$0.49 HSI- 8 oz $0.89

Medique#257

08 - Each
$0.60

Vi-Jon#34011- 

8oz
$0.69

Leader#87134-

Each
$0.54

Swan#18455-8 

oz Btl
$0.54

Economy#1564-

Each

Hydrogen Peroxide - 

Spray 2 oz (Ea.)
$1.79

Waterdel 2 

oz
$1.89

Medique#257

06-Each-4oz
$1.68

Water-

Jel#34414- 2 

oz

$1.47
Safetec#S530

01- Each
$2.62

Water 

Jel#22032-2 oz 

Btl

$2.44
Economy#21067-

Each

Sting Kill - 10 wipes per 

bx / 10 bxs per cs
$11.28

Pacckit 

10/Box
DNMS

SW801 10 

bag/case
$10.80

Acue 

United#4900

7- 10/cs

$8.20

Safetec#S520

15- $0.82 for 

a 10/Bx

$13.70

Certified 

Safety#21250- 

$1.37 for a 

10/Box

$11.80

Sting 

Relief#13314-

100/cs

Sting Relief Spray bottle 

(ORMD) (Ea.)
$1.76

Safetec#S520

01- Each
$3.63

Certified 

Safety#21350- 

2 oz Btl

$2.98

Sting 

Relief#21133-

Each

Eye Wash - 4 oz. Screw 

Off top (Ea.)
$1.82 Medic 4 oz $2.09

Medique#198

18-Each
$1.80

Physicians 

Care- Each
$1.95

SH#34105- 4 

oz
$1.74

Major#100-3  

Each
$2.75

Nortech#18275-

4 oz Btl
$2.77

Economy#1492-

Each

Fully Medicated First Aid 

Ointment - 1 oz 

(Bacitracin Zinc 

Ointment) (Ea.)

$1.44 HSI - 1 oz $2.19
Dynarex#117

3-Each
$2.00

Dynarex#430

09- 1 oz
$1.56

Dynarex#1128- 

Each
$3.21

Dynarex#1811

5-Each
$2.87

Economy#1248-

Each

Chloraseptic - 6 oz pump 

Cherry flavor (Ea.)
$5.04 Protec 6 oz $5.86

Chloraspetic#

34107- 6 oz
$5.38

Chloraseptic#

1332022- 

Each

$5.78 #18235- $5.84
Chloraseptic#1330

6-Each

TAPE

Clear Tape - 1/2" x 

10yrds - 24 rolls per bx
$8.59 HSI-24/Box $5.79

Kentron#705

305-24/Box
$18.15

3M 24 rolls 

per 

box(Surgical 

Tape)

$6.37
Dynarex#3571- 

24Roll/Bx
$10.99

Dynarex#1727

5-24/Box
$9.02

Economy#81100-

24/Bx

Clear Tape - 1" x 10yrds - 

12 rolls per bx
$8.59 HSI-12/Box $5.79

Kentron#705

311-12/Box
$11.69

Medline 12 

Rolls per 

box(Surgical 

tape)

$7.29
SH#28278- 

12/Bx
$6.37

Dynarex#3572- 

12Roll/Bx
$10.99

Dynarex#1727

6- 12/ Box
$9.02

Economy#81111-

12/Bx

Cloth Tape - 1/2" x  

10yrds latex free - 24 

rolls per bx

$9.18 HSI-24/Box $6.99
Kentron#705

205-24/Box
$8.76

SH#28280- 

24/Bx
$7.74

Dynarex#3561- 

24 Roll/Bx
$11.49

Dynarex#1715

0-24/Box
$9.95

Economy#71100-

24/Bx

Cloth Tape - 1" x 10yrds  

latex free - 12 rolls per 

bx

$9.18 HSI-12/Box $6.99
Kentron#705

211-12/Box
$8.76

SH#28281- 

12/Bx
$7.74

Dynarex#3562- 

12 Roll/Bx
$11.49

Dynarex#1715

2-12/Box
$9.95

Economy#71111-

12/Bx

No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

RFP2014-095

Nursing Supplies

Henry Schein, Inc.
Nashville Medical & 

EMS Products,Inc.
Quill Corporation School Health Corporation School Kids Healthcare School NurseSupply, Inc. William V. MacGill & Co.

BAND-AIDS

Thermoscan Machine w/ 

Security Station Ref: Pro 

4000

$79.00
Kentron#999

999-Each
$261.65

Welch-

Allyn#13087- 

Each

$229.08 #36620-Each $239.95
Braun#25008-

Each

Electronic Digital 

Thermometer
$2.49 DT3333-Each $2.58

SH#13095- 

Each
$4.12

Briggs#15600- 

Each
$6.39

Mabis#8601-

Each
$4.98

Economy#45748-

Each

Electronic Digital 

Thermometer 

Replacement battery

$0.50
Energizer#13

014- Each
$1.18

Energizer#860

2-Each
$0.98

Economy#45738-

Each

3000 EZ Filac 

Thermometer
$188.75

Filac#13107- 

Each
$176.47

FILAC#50400

0-Each
$183.08 #12411-Each $184.14 Filac#50400-Each

Thermometer Probes -

PC200 for the Pro-

4000;Thermoscan 

machines;Brand -Welch 

Ally Braun 200 per bx / 

800 per cs

DNMS

Welch-Allyn 

#05075-800 

Pro 4000

$55.67

Welch-

Allyn#21393- 

800/cs

$53.36

Thermoscan#

55560B- 

800/cs

$54.51
#36660- Welch-

Allyn 800/case
$58.60

Braun#50752-

($14.65 a 200/Box

Filac Probes - 3000 EZ-

Ref#202020, Lot#129631 

for the Filac 3000 EZ 

machine/Tyco-

Healthcare Kendall / 500 

per bx - 10 bx per cs

$20.47
Filac #13106-

500/Bx
$132.50

Filac#202020-

5000/cs
$16.79

Filac- #12409-

500/Box
$16.46

Filac-3000 

#202020-500/Pkg- 

Ea.

Filac Probes - F-1500 for 

the Filac 1500 EZ 

machine / Ref# 8884-

221000 /Tyco-Healthcare 

Kendall /  500 per bx - 10 

bx per cs

$31.93

Filac 

115297MED-

500 ea box

$20.38
#21081 Filac 

500/Bx
$170.50

Filac#221000-

5000/cs
$19.50

#22100-Filac 

Probe covers,500 

per box(For F-

1500)/

Steri-Temp (cover for 

digital thermometer oral 

disposal / TDI products) 

100 /bx 50bx per cs 

$129.50

MABIS-

100/BX-

50/Bx/CS

$17.84

#21052-

Sheaths TIDI 

500/bx for 

electronic 

thems

$127.88
Tidi/ 5000/case 

#8045
$136.50

#15618-Digital 

Thermometer 

Probe covers 

100/Box($2.73/Bo

x)

Medicine Cups - 100 

tubes - 5000 per cs
$33.89

Kentron#MC1

01-

5000/Case

$46.31
Medline 

5000/PK
$52.14

Medline#214

06- 5000/cs
$40.00

Dynarex#D80

000- 5000/cs
$72.68

Pro Advantage 

#229016-

5000/case

$71.00
Economy#1401-

5000/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid

THERMOMETER SUPPLIES

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

CUPS

No Bid
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

RFP2014-095

Nursing Supplies

Henry Schein, Inc.
Nashville Medical & 

EMS Products,Inc.
Quill Corporation School Health Corporation School Kids Healthcare School NurseSupply, Inc. William V. MacGill & Co.

BAND-AIDS

Ambu Resusitator - with 

oxygen reservoir bag 

(Ea.)

DNMS
Kentron#779

500-Each
DNMS

Curaplex#301-

C1500- each
$22.77

Ambu#57486- 

Ea.
DNMS

Ambu#246011Eac

h

Child Mask Adapter (Ea.) DNMS
Kentron#381

120-Each
$4.16

Ambu#251004-

Each

Audiometer - Welch 

Allen (Ea.)
DNMS

Ambor 65DA 

Ea.
$1,361.29

Welch 

Allyn#28200-

Each

Balance Scale  w/ Height 

Measurement with 

casters (Ea.)

$184.18 Detecto $252.72

Health-O-

Meter#58003- 

Each

$195.29

Health O 

Meter#402LB

WH- Each

Cots - hardwood legs 

300 lbs capacity  (Ea.)
$470.50

Denton 3620 

Ea.
$345.35

SH#24962- 

Each
$349.00

WMC#32170-

Ea.

Adapta Hi / Lo Platforms 

(Ea.)

Eye Wash Station - 32 

oz. (Ea.)
$12.86

Sperian#420

62- 32 oz
$25.66

Lavoptik#24-

300-Each
$36.34

Honeywell#194

20-Ea.
$9.02

Economy#25530-

Each

Good-Lite Vision Tester 

Cabinet (Ea.)
$202.91

Good-

Lite#52574- 

Each

$204.60
Goodlite#60192-

Each

Good-Lite Vision Tester 

Stand (Ea.)
$112.69

Good-

Lite#52367- 

Each

$98.80
Goodlite#705000- 

Each

Single Door, single lock 

wall mount cabinet (steel 

w/plexiglass window) 

27"x 18"x 8" (Ea.)

Double Door / Double 

lock Narcotic Cabinet 

(Ea.)

$454.34
MPD#24377- 

Each
$256.68

Harlott#75131-

Ea.

Aluminum Portable 

Stretcher (Ea.)
$219.00

Kentron#883

315 - Each
$819.27

Ferno#58012- 

Each
$358.82

Medsource#M

S-SCP123- 

Each

$216.60
Junkin#75237-

Each

SCHOOL CLINIC START-UP KIT

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid
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UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

RFP2014-095

Nursing Supplies

Henry Schein, Inc.
Nashville Medical & 

EMS Products,Inc.
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BAND-AIDSStereoptic Vision Tester - 

w/ HOTV slide & 

peripheral test Ref: 

Optec 5000

$2,630.58
Optec#52736- 

Each
$1,899.00

Steriooptical#5

5210- Ea.
$1,894.99

Optec#83310-

Each

Curtains DNMS

Medline#141

00- 68" x 82"-

Each

DNMS
Winco#27300- 

Each

Trashcan with lid - 

Stainless Steel w/ Foot 

Press 5.3 gal

DNMS
Rubbermaid 

3.5 Gal
$125.29

Detecto#240

06- Each

Wheelchair w/ Leg Lifts - 

18in. Seat
$251.99

Medline 

Each
$211.18

SH#10029- 

Each
$247.48

Graham 

Field#294914-

Ea.

$246.05
Economy#7567-

Each

Stainless steel cart $248.31
Lakeside w/ 

shell
$180.35

Lakeside 

Each
$241.75

Lakeside#24

012- Each
$232.75

Economy#4219-

Each

Trauma Dressing roll 

Ref: Kerlix (Ea.)
$0.67

Kentron#444

666 Each
$1.58

Kerlix#27022- 

Each
$0.65

Dynarex#3161- 

each
$2.70 Kerlix#6715-Each

6” Q-Tips – Long 100/bx $0.34
SH#99306- 

100/Pkg
$0.36

Dynarex#4302- 

100/Pkg
$0.59

Dynarex#1410

5-100/Pkg
$0.60

Economy#80606-

100/1bg

3” Q-Tips – Short  100/bx $0.29
SH#99303-

100/Pkg
$0.24

Dynarex#4301-

100/Pkg
$0.55

Dynarex#1420

5-100/Pkg
$0.55

Economy#80303-

100/1bg

Plain non-sterile 

Applicator sticks 1000/bx
$2.87 HSI-6" $2.25

Kentron#451

200-

1000/Box

$9.95
Kendall 

1000/Box
$2.21

Dukal#90985-

1000/Bx
$1.85

Dukal#D9000-

1000/Bx
$4.22

Pro 

Advantage#21

440-1000/Box

$3.71
Economy#5616-

1000/1 bx

Wound Closure Strips 

–Ref: 3M Sterile 
DNMS 3m-1/843 $0.49

Dynarex#3523- 

3/Pkg
$1.93 3M#15412-3/Pk

Reversible Tumbling 

E/Snellen 10’ Distance 

Acuity Chart State 

Mandated Prevent 

Blindness Texas (Ea.)

$15.54

Good-

lite#52062- 

Each

HOTV set (Ea.) $27.11

Good-

lite#52082- 

Each

$32.20

Precision 

Vision#662018- 

Ea.

$34.88
Goodlite#6004-

Each
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BAND-AIDSReversible Tumbling 

E/Snellen 20’ Distance 

Acuity Chart State 

Mandated Prevent 

Blindness Texas (Ea.)

Nurse assist clipboard 

(Ea.)
DNMS

Prestige 

Medical#83309- 

Ea.

Non-Sterile Tongue 

Depressors 5 ½ X 5/8 

500/bx

$3.35
Kentron#450

525-500/Box
$3.66

Dynarex#908

66- 500/Bx
$3.39

Dynarex#4311-

500/Bx
$5.33

Dynarex#1451

0-500/Box
$5.38

Economy#711-

500/bx

Non-sterile Tongue 

Depressors 6 x ¾ 500/bx
$3.59

Kentron#450

675- 500/Box
$4.09

Dynarex#908

67-500/Bx
$3.63

Dynarex#4312-

500/Bx
$5.38

Dynarex#1445

0- 500/Box
$5.43

Economy#7105-

500/bx

CPR Respiratory 

Breathing Mouth Piece  

(Ea.)

DNMS
Kentron#809

920- Each
DNMS

Microshield#

55038-Each
$3.49

Economy#75097-

Each

Biohazard Container – 1 

quart (Ea.)
DNMS

Kentron#412

274R- Each
$2.61

Covidien#908

37- Each
$1.69

Bemis#10003

0-Each
$2.62

Kendall#39210- 

Ea.
$2.50

Economy#6495- 

Each

Stethoscope-single not 

dual (Ea.)
$2.09

Kentron#711

411- Each
$4.88

SH#57107-

Each
$2.53

ADC#660N-

Each
$6.39

BV 

Medical#42400-

Ea.

$5.53
Economy#430149

0-Each

Sundry Jars Plastic Set 

of 5 jars with lids (Set)
$16.29 Mabis 5/Set $19.11

SH#46013-

Set
$16.88

Briggs#39802-

Set
$22.54

Graham 

Field#38120-

Ea.

$22.78
Economy#8275-1 

Set

Thermal Blanket – 66” x 

90” White Cotton (Ea.)
$13.34 Cattox - Ea. $17.26

SH#48001-

Blue-Each
$19.78

R & R 

Textile#24615-

Ea.

$19.30
Economy#7630-

Each

Toothbrushes Ages 2-5 

12/pk
$16.44

Sunstar#470

57 Critters- 

12/Pk

$12.00
SKHC#TB-25-

100/Pkg
$2.76

Economy#13208-

12/Pk

Toothbrushes- Ages 4-12   

12/pk
$16.44

Sunstar#470

58 Spinners- 

12/Pk

$12.00
SKHC#TB-32-

100/Pkg
$11.71

Economy#21680-

12/Pk

Towels 15” X 25” 12/pk $7.87
SH#48021-

12/Pk
$12.88

Economy#7005-

12/Pk

Towels 20” X 40”   (Ea.) $15.40

SH#48024-

12/Pk($1.28 

per towel)

$3.95

R&R 

Textile#24570-

Ea.

$3.12
Economy#7010-

Each
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BAND-AIDS

Toothsavers (Ea.) DNMS

EMT 

Toothsaver#4

7005- each

DNMS
SLT00B0-

144/Pkg
DNMS

Economy#4739- 

200/Pk

Gauze Scissors 8 inch 

(Ea.)
$1.99

Kentron#K11

45-each
$2.98

SH#36033-

Each
$1.47

Lister#81060-

Each
$4.37

Zulco#34540-

Ea.
$4.41

Economy#1971-

each

Protec containers 1 

gallon  (Ea.)
$5.91

Pro-

tec#90081- 

Each

$7.06
Protec#61000-

040-Each
$4.32

Economy#6496-

each

Flashlight- Mini-Mag with 

pocket clip (Ea.)
$8.47

Mini-

Mag#90089-

Each

$9.25

Mag-

Lite#M2A016-

Each

$14.00
Mini Mag#65480-

each

Replacement bulb for 

Mini Mag  (Ea.)
$1.53

Mini-

Mag#90210- 

2/Pk

$1.50

Mag-

Lite#LM2A001-

2/Pkg

$2.59
Mini Mag#65481-

each

AAA Batteries pk $1.76
Duracell 

4/PK
$2.51

Energizer#90

037- 2/Pk
$0.36

Energizer#EN

92-Each
$3.57

Enenergizer#2

5119-4/Pkg
$2.78

Energizer#6386-

2/Pk

AED Batteries (Ea.) $248.81

Cardiac 

Science#542

35- Each

$94.70
Philips#M507

0A-Each

AED Pads Adult (Ea.) DNMS
Kentron#T10

0- Pair
$34.10

Cardiac 

Science#541

19-Pair

$38.38
Philips#M507

1A-each

AED Pads Pediatric DNMS
Kentron#T10

0-PEDS- Pair
$78.97

Cardiac 

Science#541

20- Pair

$61.93
Philips#M507

2A-Each

AED Trainer $138.94
Preston#543

85-Each
$210.59

Philips#M508

5A-Each

AED Cabinet with Alarm $74.60
SH#54454-

Each
$148.82

Philips#98980

3-Each
$201.48

Heartstation#8

7191-Ea.
$207.10

Trimline#12319-

each

Cabinet Wall AED 

w/Alarm Cardiac 

#RC5300

$262.82 1178806 $172.72 #54231 $275.08 #87190 $283.10 #12320

Pulse Oximeter Fingertip $44.00
Kentron#500

300C- each
$37.69

Medquip 

Each
$57.50

SH#53249-

Each
$23.53

Bejing 

Choice#MD30

0C2-each

$50.14

Southeastern 

Medical#89443-

Ea.

$44.64
Economy#30031-

each

Pulse Oximeter Pediatric 

Fingertip
$44.00

Kentron#500

300C- each
$168.09

Nonin#53186-

Each
$27.06

Bejing 

Choice#MD30

0C53-Each

$80.50 #89445 $92.07
Economy#30033-

each

Gooseneck Exam Lamp $61.85 Brandt Each $86.60

SH#24083-

Each(Adjusts 

from 53" to 

78"

$74.98

Graham 

Field#31610-

Ea.-52"to 78"

$106.45

Economy#74918-

each(Base 

Diameter 11", 

Height 54" to 74")

Control Solution for 

Blood Glucose -(Control 

solution 2 vial Hi/Low 

Accu-Check Aviva 

Comfort Curve 

Ref#12030411001

$13.84

Comfort 

Curve#34372- 

Each

$8.65

Accu-Check 

Aviva 

3676020-2/Bx
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BAND-AIDSAdult/Child Manikin and 

Infant Manikin Combo 

set

DNMS
NASCO#551

38-Kit
DNMS

CPR 

Prompt#TPAK

700-Set

$151.05
CPR 

Prompt#75127-Set

EpiPen Trainer $4.59
SH#90313-

Each
$5.82

Dey/Mylan#65

0051 Each
$7.31 #12756 $6.46

Epi.Tmr#4962-

each

Nickie Special Needs 

Training Manikin 

Tracheostomy training 

(Ea.)

$589.00 Nickie-Ea.

Syringes (Ea.)

Diabetic Kit For UDCA 

Training (Ea.)

Refrigerator Ref: GE 

Space maker (Ea.)

Refrigerator with Freezer 

Ref: Avanti  (Ea.)
DNMS

Avanti#96326-

each

Refrigerator/Freezer 

Thermometer (Taylor 

Precision 

Products/Ref#5925 FC 

item# 2T704(Ea.)

$11.38
SH#15008-

Each
$4.55

 Miljoco 

#55946-Ea.
$4.59

Economy#138107

9-each

Seco Stadiometer (Ea.) $190.15
Seca#58084- 

Each
$183.08 #40222-Ea. $164.52 Seca#21400-each

Ice Maker (Ea.) $205.57

Magic 

Chef#35067-

Each

Giant Toothbrushing 

Model (Ea.)
DNMS

SH#90092-

Each
$32.15 #36640-Ea. $42.78

Economy#3348-

each

Mobi Changer (Ea.)

Blow Dryer (Ea.) $21.29
Helen of 

Troy Each

Scoliometer (Ea.) $62.88
Orthopedic 

S Ea.
$49.70

Scoliometerr

#61024-

Each(School 

Health-

Brand)

$37.65
SKHC#5280-

Each
$44.11 #34628-Ea. $44.55

Economy#5280-

each

SECA BMI Calculator 

(Ea.) 
$49.64

Seca#61305-

each
$28.98 #34640-Ea. $36.87 Seca#491-each
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BAND-AIDS
AED (Ea.) $1,058.76

Defibtech 

*Hazmat*
$1,328.07

Cardiac 

Science#541

93-Each

$796.47
Philips#M506

6A-Each

Pill Crushers $4.08 Briggs-Each $2.09
HealthEnt#90

073-Each
$4.12

ACU-

Life#PC12-

Each

$5.51
Acu-

Life#37520-Ea.
$5.29

Economy#65120-

each

Pill Counter with Spatula $6.19

Health 

Ent#90245-

Each

$7.31 #54500-Ea. $7.66
Economy#65133-

each

Pill Cutter $2.39 Briggs-Each $2.09

Health 

Ent#90178-

Each

$4.36

ACU-

Life#PS12E-

Each

$7.31 #36545-Ea $5.57
Economy#65133-

each

Life Size Heart Model DNMS

Learning 

Resources 

Each

$64.14
SH#12652-

Each
DNMS #73080-Ea.

Giant Ear Model DNMS

Learning 

Resources 

Each

DNMS
SH#12139-

Each
$45.95 #73075-Ea

Human Eye Model DNMS

Learning 

Resources 

Each

DNMS
SH#12138-

Each
$47.38 #73069-Ea

Brain with Arteries Model $55.80
SH#12944-

Each
$50.55 #73072-Ea.

Replacement Lungs CPR 

Model-CPR Prompt / 

Infant Face Shield lungs 

# FSLBG202 / 50 Pack

$48.02

#55128-

FaceShield/L

ung Bags 

Adult/Child 

100/Pkg

DNMS

CPR 

Prompt#FLSB

G202- 100/Pk

Replacement Lungs CPR 

Model-CPR Prompt 

/Infant Face Shield Lungs 

#FSLBG203 / 50 Pack

$43.57

#55130-

FachShield/L

ung Bags 

Infant 

100/Pkg

$34.55

CPR Prompt 

FSLBG203-

100/Pk

$16.69 #75302

Baby Wipes  (Ea.) $2.38 PDI 80/Box $3.22
Innovative 

100/Ea.
$2.46

Nice N 

Clean#49110-

80/Pk

$2.11

Nice N 

Clean#M233X

T-80/Pkg

$3.94
PDI#18106-

80/Tub
$3.66

Nice N 

Clean#6580-

80/Pkg

Purell Instant Hand 

Sanitizer (Ea.)
$3.43

Purell 8 oz 

*Hazmat*
$3.38

Purell Each- 

8oz
$2.39

Purell#34404-

4 oz
$4.46

Purell#3659-

12-Each/ 12 

oz

$5.51
#18762-12 oz 

Btl
$4.91

Purell#965912-12 

oz

Refill 1000 ml(case 8) 

Hand sanitizer
$80.45

Purell with 

Aloe 1000 

mL 8/cs 

*Hazmat*

$79.76

Purell#34338-

$9.97 for one 

1000 ML

$76.40

#18751-$9.55  

for one 

1000ML

$67.52
Purell#215608- 

8/cs= 1000ml

Baby Shampoo Bottle - 

Ea.
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BAND-AIDS

Control of Communicable 

Diseases in Man 2014
DNMS

SH#11097 

Each
DNMS #95536-Ea. DNMS

CCD Man.#29876-

each

Drug Identification Bible  

2014-2017 edition

EMT-Emergency Medical 

Treatment 2014
DNMS

SH#11074-

Each
DNMS #82123-Ea.

Individualized Healthcare 

Plans for the School 

Nurse (Most updated 

edition)

DNMS
SH#11331-

each
DNMS #81010-Ea. DNMS

HIP#23753-each 

(published 2005)

Merck Manual updated 

2014-2017
$84.05

Inglnex 19th 

edition(publi

shed in 

2011)

DNMS
Merck#11006-

Each
DNMS #82109-Ea. $90.67

Merck#2107-each 

(publication 2011)

Managing Infectious 

Diseases 2014-2017
DNMS

SH#11352-

Each
DNMS #96034-Ea. DNMS

Mg ID#299050-

each

Nursing Drug 

Handbook/Lippincott’s 

Nursing Drug Guide 

2014-2017

$33.66
MOSB7 27th 

edition
$89.37

Lippincott#10

00166-Each
$36.34 #82101-Ea. $40.92

Lippincott#28571-

each

PDR Guide to drug 

interactions, side effects 

& indications 2012-2015

DNMS
PDR#11047-

Each
$83.64 PDR#2101-each

Nursing Diagnosis 2014-

2017 Drug Handbook
DNMS

SH#11905-

Each
DNMS #82115-Ea. DNMS #2155-each

Pocket Guide to 

Pediatric Assessment
DNMS

Mosby#1176

3-Each

Mosby's Pediatric 

Assessment (Most 

updated edition)

DNMS
Mosby#1176

3-Each
DNMS #84211-Ea.

Nursing Diagnoses 2014-

2017
$41.13

SH#11058-

Each
$34.50 #96043-Ea.

Tabers Cyclopedic 

Dictionary 2014-2017
DNMS

Tabers#1100

5-Each
DNMS #82119-Ea. DNMS Tabers#2106-each

The New School Health 

Handbook 2014-2017
DNMS

SH#11038-

Each
DNMS #80112-Ea.

Dermatology DD - Deck $61.03
SH#11796-

Each
$48.71 #96942-Ea. $45.10 DDX#29921-each

Pediatric Dermatology 

DDX- Deck
$50.74

SH#11916-

Each
$48.71 #96946-Ea. $52.22 DDX#13020-each
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No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



Section II.

VENDORS

  DESCRIPTION Unit Price

Brand / Amt 

per BX/PKG/ 

CS

Unit 

Price

Brand / Amt 

per  BX/PKG/ 

CS

Unit Price

Brand /Amt 

per BX/PKG/ 

CS

Unit Price

Brand /Amt 

per BX/PKG/ 

CS

Unit Price

Brand /Amt 

per 

BX/PKG/CS

Unit Price
Brand /Amt per 

BX/PKG/CS
Unit Price

Brand /Amt per 

BX/PKG/CS

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

RFP2014-095

Nursing Supplies

Henry Schein, Inc.
Nashville Medical & 

EMS Products,Inc.
Quill Corporation School Health Corporation School Kids Healthcare School NurseSupply, Inc. William V. MacGill & Co.

BAND-AIDSDVD – Handwashing for 

School
$62.53

Marsh 

Media#1611-

Each

DNMS
Economy#75057-

each

DVD – Bloodborne 

Pathogen
$61.86

Marsh 

Media#16091-

Each

$63.93 #89042-Ea.

DVD – Scoliosis $61.77

Marsh 

Media#16100-

Each

$63.93 #32509-Ea. DNMS
Economy#92181-

each

DVD –We’re Growing 

Up!  English
$71.16

Marsh 

Media#16204-

Each

DVD –Straight Talk 

About Sexual Choices 

and Consequences  

English

$63.93 #32512-Ea.

DVD –Straight Talk 

About Sexual Choices 

and Consequences  

Spanish

$63.93 #62312-Ea

DVD –Whatsa Hygiene?  

English
$62.40

Marsh 

Media#16113-

Each

DVD –Tobacco: What 

About It? English
$63.93 #32516-Ea. $46.00

Economy#92281-

each

DVD –Tobacco: What 

About It?  Spanish
$63.93 #62316-Ea.

DVD –Head Lice: An 

Itchy Problem  English
$61.82

Marsh 

Media#16098-

Each

$63.93 #32505-Ea. $48.27
Economy#92191-

each

DVD –Head Lice: An 

Itchy Problem  Spanish
$63.93 #62305-Ea.

No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid



Section II.

VENDORS

  DESCRIPTION Unit Price

Brand / Amt 

per BX/PKG/ 

CS

Unit 

Price

Brand / Amt 

per  BX/PKG/ 

CS

Unit Price

Brand /Amt 

per BX/PKG/ 

CS

Unit Price

Brand /Amt 

per BX/PKG/ 

CS

Unit Price

Brand /Amt 

per 

BX/PKG/CS

Unit Price
Brand /Amt per 

BX/PKG/CS
Unit Price

Brand /Amt per 

BX/PKG/CS

UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

RFP2014-095

Nursing Supplies

Henry Schein, Inc.
Nashville Medical & 

EMS Products,Inc.
Quill Corporation School Health Corporation School Kids Healthcare School NurseSupply, Inc. William V. MacGill & Co.

BAND-AIDSVideo-CPR/FA/AED 

Instructor Video

CPR/FA/AED 

Workbooks

Drug Education Series of 

Posters 
$142.60 #73106-Ea.

Peanut & Nut Free Zone 

Signs
$3.59

SH#26093-

Each
$10.07 #96097-Ea. $3.71

Economy#14061-

each(Peanut Free)

Nut-Free Zone Sign DNMS
SH#26096-

Each
$10.07 #96080-Ea. $3.71

Economy#14062-

each

Bully Free Classroom 

Poster 
$5.75 #96073-Ea.

Bully Free Zone Poster $6.36
SH#12890-

Each
$5.75 #96074-Ea. $6.24

Economy#12473-

each

Stickers-"I had my vision 

checked today" (Roll)
DNMS

SH#90203-

Each(100 

stickers per 

roll)

$8.46

Economy#130096-

roll (500 per 

package and 

2"round)

Stickers-"I had my 

hearing checked today"
DNMS

SH#90204-

Each(100 

stickers per 

roll)

$8.46

Economy#130095-

each500 per 

package and 

2"round

Notes:

No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

Reference Quote# QT0033216

* DNMS: Does not meet specifications.

15% for items not on the 

bid.

Reference Guide catalog 

is printed once a year. 

Catalog pricing is not a 

guaranteed. However, 

the pricing on our 

website www.quill.com is 

current. 

Reference School Health 

Bid#2867249

UISD will receive a 21% 

discount on all furniture 

purchases, but are 

responsible for all freight 

on these items. The 21% 

discount may not apply  for 

the purchase of all training 

manikins, pleae contact 

Chad Carlson for 

clarification at 1-866-588-

0686.

8% Catalog discount off 

our current School Nurse 

catalog prices.Exclusions 

from 8%-Furniture/Capital 

Equipment(please call for 

quotes).Payment terms Net 

30. Minimum order 

requirements-

None,Effective dates of 

discount-12 months from 

award date(option to 

extend for (2) one year 

periods.Reference# 

RFP2014-095.

No Bid


