UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT

STUDENT STANDARDIZED DRESS

RFP 2014-055

The Sports Center of

Vendor Backpack Gear, Inc. Bazzar International, LLC Class Uniforms, Inc. P-Bis, Inc. School Medical Uniforms Laredo
Boys Pant Set -
. DNMS 38.00 36.50 30.00 40.00 29.00
(Pant & Shirt) $ $ § $ $
Boys Short Set
. DNMS *$32.00 32.50 27.75 40.00 27.00
(Short & Shirt) $ $ $ $ $
Girls Pant Set
X DNMS 39.00 34.50 31.50 40.00 31.00
(Pant & Shirt) $ $ $ $ $
Girls Skort Set .
. DNMS No Bid 36.50 30.50 40.00 27.00
(Skort & Shirt) $ $ $ $
Adult Boys Pant Set
X DNMS 50.00 44.50 1.00 40.00 36.00
(Pant & Shirt) $ $ $4 $ $
Adult Boys Short Set . .
DNM No Bid No B 36.00 40.00 32.00
Short & Shirt S © 5! o Bid $ $ $
Adult Girls Pant Set .
. DNMS No Bid 44.50 39.00 40.00 37.00
(Pant & Shirt) $ $ $ $
Adult Girls Skort Set . . .
. DNMS No Bid 43.50 38.00 No Bid No Bid
(Skort & Shirt) $ $
Brand DNMS Dickies/Noki/Pink Latte Classroom/DfE:Ezi:Elz Gear/Port Classroom/Donmoor Classroom/Cherokee/Dickies/French Toast/Lee Dickies/Gilden/Jerzee
Discount DNMS 0% 15% 0% 0% 0%
Three (3) locations
One (1) location One (1) location One (1) location 3210 Loop 20 #B2 One (1) location
502 W. Calton 8917 Molly Dr. Ste. #1 4501 McPherson Rd #4 4520 San Bernardo STE 114
Locations DNMS 502 Flores Ave. Laredo, Texas 78041 Laredo, Texas 78045 5517 McPherson Rd #11 956-717-3323
956-568-2164 956-753-2527 956-722-5189 956-712-2525/956-791-5757/712-1300 956-717-3325 FAX
bargaintshirt@aol.com class.uniforms@gmail.com pbisinc@gmail.com discountuniforms@yahoo.com the.sports.center@hotmail.com
M-SAT. 9:30 AM 6:30 PM M-F 10AM-6PM M-SAT 10 AM -7 PM M-SAT. 10 AM - 7 PM M- F 10:00 AM - 6:00 PM
SUN SAT 10AM-3PM M-S 10 AM - 7 PM (July and August) [ Sun 12:00 Noon-5 PM(Only at 4501 McPherson Location) SAT 12 PM -4 PM
Hours of Operations DNMS )
11 AMTO 4 PM Sun 12:00 Noon -5 PM(Augu‘st & Sept. at 3210 Loop 20
Location)
Hector Villarreal
Contact Persons DNMS Mike Esfandi Gerardo Pena Patricia Lugo and Patricia Ramirez Dean Tabrizy Jessica Garcia

956-206-5471 956-324-6538

Prices above are for a most expensive complete regular size set

* Bazaar- Boy Short Set is based on a youth shirt $14 + $18 child short sizes 4 to 14. No bid on youth or adult short.
*DNMS:Does not meet specifications.

OVERALL TABULATION
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