
United Independent School District

Charter Bus Services

RFP 2014-059
Section I. Same Day Trips

Vendors

DOT #/MC#

Bus Fleet
Regular Bus 

8

Regular 

Buses 18

Regular 

Buses 23

Regular 

Buses 6

Regular 

Buses 21

Headquarters

DESTINATION
Regular Bus

Handicap 

Bus

Seat 

CAP.
Regular Bus

Handicap 

Bus Seat CAP.
Regular Bus Handicap Bus

Seat 

CAP.
Regular Bus

Handicap 

Bus

Seat 

CAP.
Regular Bus

Handicap 

Bus

Seat 

CAP.

Charter Bus Services

Bill's Sparkling Charter Cougar Bus Lines Daisy Charters & Shuttles Imperial Bus Co. Kerville Bus/Coach USA

537119 / 268020 1127893 / 459987 397239 / 226521 1261610 / 492765 136534 / 27530

Handicap Bus 0 Handicap Buses 2 Handicap Buses 3 Handicap Buses 0 Handicap Buses 36

Corpus Christi,Tx Laredo, Texas San Antonio, Texas San Antonio, Texas San Antonio, Texas

SAN ANTONIO $1,800.00 No Bid 57 $1,290.00 $1,790.00 50-56 $1,844.00 $1,844.00 56 $1,800.00 NA 49-57 $1,950.00 $1,950.00 55

CORPUS CHRISTI $1,700.00 No Bid 57 $1,290.00 $1,790.00 50-56 $1,844.00 $1,844.00 56 $1,800.00 NA 49-57 $1,950.00 $1,950.00 55

BROWNSVILLE $2,300.00 No Bid 57 $1,490.00 $1,990.00 50-56 $2,047.00 $2,047.00 56 $2,150.00 NA 49-57 $2,350.00 $2,350.00 55

MCALLEN $1,800.00 No Bid 57 $1,290.00 $1,790.00 50-56 $1,844.00 $1,844.00 56 $1,800.00 NA 49-57 $1,950.00 $1,950.00 55

KINGSVILLE $1,600.00 No Bid 57 $1,290.00 $1,790.00 50-56 $1,844.00 $1,844.00 56 $1,650.00 NA 49-57 $1,950.00 $1,950.00 55

EAGLE PASS $1,600.00 No Bid 57 $1,290.00 $1,790.00 50-56 $1,844.00 $1,844.00 56 $1,650.00 NA 49-57 $1,950.00 $1,950.00 55

AUSTIN $2,500.00 No Bid 57 $1,490.00 $1,990.00 50-56 $2,264.00 $2,264.00 56 $2,260.00 NA 49-57 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 55

NEW BRAUNFELS $2,100.00 No Bid 57 $1,390.00 $1,890.00 50-56 $1,893.00 $1,893.00 56 $2,100.00 NA 49-57 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 55

HOUSTON $3,150.00 No Bid 57 $2,500.00 $3,000.00 50-56 $2,761.00 $2,761.00 56 $2,950.00 NA 49-57 $2,975.00 $2,975.00 55

DALLAS No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,600.00 $3,100.00 50-56 $3,587.00 $3,587.00 56
*$3750

NA 49-57 $4,040.00 $4,040.00 55

DEL RIO $2,100.00 No Bid 57 $1,390.00 $1,890.00 50-56 $1,844.00 $1,844.00 56 $1,950.00 NA 49-57 $1,950.00 $1,950.00 55

UVALDE $1,600.00 No Bid 57 $1,290.00 $1,790.00 50-56 $1,844.00 $1,844.00 56 $1,650.00 NA 49-57 $1,950.00 $1,950.00 55

EL PASO No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,500.00 $4,000.00 50-56 $4,812.00 $4,812.00 56 *$4900 NA 49-57 $5,580.00 $5,580.00 55

ALICE $1,600.00 No Bid 57 $1,290.00 $1,790.00 50-56 $1,844.00 $1,844.00 56 $1,800.00 NA 49-57 $1,950.00 $1,950.00 55

HARINGEN $2,200.00 No Bid 57 $1,390.00 $1,890.00 50-56 $1,844.00 $1,844.00 56 $1,900.00 NA 49-57 $2,035.00 $2,035.00 55

LA JOYA $1,600.00 No Bid 57 $1,290.00 $1,790.00 50-56 $1,844.00 $1,844.00 56 $1,650.00 NA 49-57 $1,950.00 $1,950.00 55

SINTON $1,800.00 No Bid 57 $1,290.00 $1,790.00 50-56 $1,844.00 $1,844.00 56 $1,800.00 NA 49-57 $1,950.00 $1,950.00 55

GREGORY PORTLAND $1,850.00 No Bid 57 $1,290.00 $1,790.00 50-56 $1,844.00 $1,844.00 56 $1,800.00 NA 49-57 $1,950.00 $1,950.00 55

ROMA $1,500.00 No Bid 57 $1,290.00 $1,790.00 50-56 $1,844.00 $1,844.00 56 $1,650.00 NA 49-57 $1,950.00 $1,950.00 55

EDCOUCH ELSA $1,950.00 No Bid 57 $1,290.00 $1,790.00 50-56 $1,844.00 $1,844.00 56 $1,820.00 NA 49-57 $1,950.00 $1,950.00 55

San Angelo $3,100.00 No Bid 57 $2,500.00 $3,000.00 50-56 $2,880.00 $2,880.00 56 $2,475.00 NA 49-57 $3,085.00 $3,085.00 55

Victoria $2,200.00 No Bid 57 $1,390.00 $1,890.00 50-56 $1,865.00 $1,865.00 56 $1,800.00 NA 49-57 $1,975.00 $1,975.00 55

Notes:

Long distance trips:10 hrs driving- 

Driver can only be on duty  for as per 

DOT rules . Stops should be every 3 

hrs. District is expected to pick-up trash, 

will provide trash bags and paper 

towels.. Etc.

Driver should not exceed 10 hrs driving per day.  If 

exceeds 10 hrs driver may rest number of hours or a 

second driver will be provided. 

20 Regular Buses with 56  Capacity and 3 

Regular buses with a 40  Capacity 

sitting.We adhere to the FMCSA"Hours of 

Service" rule. Maximum of 10 hours driving 

and/or 15 hours on duty before the driver 

Must have at least 9 hours off. On long trips 

we allow drivers 5 minute breaks every 2.5 to 

3 hours as they feel needed.  Same day trips: 

Pricing for same day trips are based on 12 to 

24 hours. When the actual trip times are set 

the pricing will be adjusted down to reflect 

the correct times. Overnight trips: pricing is 

based on 48 hours. When the actual trip 

times are set the pricing will be adjusted 

down to reflect the correct times. Can not 

committee to Band Cheer Trips but call if we 

can help out.  Pricing is reflected on the 

"Same Day Trips" and "Overnight Trips" in 

the bid.

* Two Day Trip.Driver has 10 hrs driving 

time with 5 hrs on duty combine of 15 hrs 

with 8 hrs consecutive off duty every 24 

hours. Have 24/7 phone line & 24/7 Road 

Assistance service through out. 

Maximum of 10 hours of actual 

consecutive driving hours within one 

scheduled periof or 500 

miles(whichever comes first)but no to 

exceed 15 hours n duty(all within one 

scheduled period)



United Independent School District

Charter Bus Services

RFP 2014-059
Section I. Same Day Trips

Vendors

DOT #/MC#

Bus Fleet

Headquarters

DESTINATION

Charter Bus Services

SAN ANTONIO

CORPUS CHRISTI

BROWNSVILLE

MCALLEN

KINGSVILLE

EAGLE PASS

AUSTIN

NEW BRAUNFELS

HOUSTON

DALLAS

DEL RIO

UVALDE

EL PASO

ALICE

HARINGEN

LA JOYA

SINTON

GREGORY PORTLAND

ROMA

EDCOUCH ELSA

San Angelo

Victoria

Notes:

Regular 

Buses 15

Regular 

Buses 36

Regular 

Buses 38

Regular 

Buses 2

Regular 

Buses 12

Regular Bus
Handicap 

Bus

Seat 

CAP.
Regular Bus Handicap Bus

Seat 

CAP.
Regular Bus

Handicap 

Bus

Seat 

CAP.
Regular Bus

Handicap 

Bus

Seat 

CAP.

Regular 

Bus
Handicap 

Bus

Seat 

CAP.

Charter Bus Services

OK Tours!! Star Shuttle, Inc. Transportes Regiomontanos Tornado Tours, Inc. Zima Real

570178 / 277375 660715 / 309567 1250587 / 489322 991034 / 418249 1764020 / 644733

handicap Buses 0 Handicap Buses 4 Handicap Buses 2 Handicap Buses 0 Handicap Buses 3

San Antonio, Texas San Antonio, Texas Laredo, Texas San Antonio, Texas Houston, Texas 

$2,250.00 NA 56 $2,799.00 $2,799.00 56 $1,500.00 $1,650.00 50-57 $1,500.00 $1,850.00 50-56 $1,350.00 $1,850.00 50-56

$2,250.00 NA 56 $2,799.00 $2,799.00 56 $1,500.00 $1,650.00 50-57 $1,500.00 $1,850.00 50-56 $1,350.00 $1,850.00 50-56

$2,700.00 NA 56 $3,178.00 $3,178.00 56 $1,600.00 $1,750.00 50-57 $1,850.00 $2,250.00 50-56 $1,750.00 $2,250.00 50-56

$2,700.00 NA 56 $3,119.00 $3,119.00 56 $1,500.00 $1,650.00 50-57 $1,500.00 $1,850.00 50-56 $1,350.00 $1,850.00 50-56

$2,000.00 NA 56 $2,799.00 $2,799.00 56 $1,500.00 $1,650.00 50-57 $1,500.00 $1,850.00 50-56 $1,350.00 $1,850.00 50-56

$2,250.00 NA 56 $3,353.00 $3,353.00 56 $1,500.00 $1,650.00 50-57 $1,500.00 $1,850.00 50-56 $1,350.00 $1,850.00 50-56

$2,795.00 NA 56 $2,799.00 $2,799.00 56 $1,600.00 $1,750.00 50-57 $1,850.00 $2,250.00 50-56 $1,750.00 $2,250.00 50-56

$2,495.00 NA 56 $2,799.00 $2,799.00 56 $1,550.00 $1,700.00 50-57 $1,500.00 $1,900.00 50-56 $1,400.00 $1,900.00 50-56

$3,450.00 NA 56 $2,799.00 $2,799.00 56 $1,900.00 $2,050.00 50-57 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 50-56

$4,475.00 NA 56 $3,721.00 $3,721.00 56 $2,150.00 $2,300.00 50-57 $2,650.00 $2,650.00 50-56 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56

$2,495.00 NA 56 $3,487.00 $3,487.00 56 $1,600.00 $1,750.00 50-57 $1,850.00 $2,250.00 50-56 $1,750.00 $2,250.00 50-56

$2,075.00 NA 56 $2,799.00 $2,799.00 56 $1,500.00 $1,650.00 50-57 $1,500.00 $1,850.00 50-56 $1,350.00 $1,850.00 50-56

$5,895.00 NA 56 $6,816.00 $6,816.00 56 $2,500.00 $2,650.00 50-57 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 50-56 $3,400.00 $3,400.00 50-56

$1,825.00 NA 56 $2,799.00 $2,799.00 56 $1,500.00 $1,650.00 50-57 $1,500.00 $1,850.00 50-56 $1,350.00 $1,850.00 50-56

$2,700.00 NA 56 $2,977.00 $2,977.00 56 $1,550.00 $1,700.00 50-57 $1,850.00 $1,950.00 50-56 $1,450.00 $1,950.00 50-56

$2,700.00 NA 56 $3,262.00 $3,262.00 56 $1,500.00 $1,650.00 50-57 $1,500.00 $1,900.00 50-56 $1,400.00 $1,900.00 50-56

$2,250.00 NA 56 $2,799.00 $2,799.00 56 $1,500.00 $1,650.00 50-57 $1,500.00 $1,850.00 50-56 $1,350.00 $1,850.00 50-56

$2,250.00 NA 56 $2,799.00 $2,799.00 56 $1,500.00 $1,650.00 50-57 $1,500.00 $1,850.00 50-56 $1,350.00 $1,850.00 50-56

$2,700.00 NA 56 $3,270.00 $3,270.00 56 $1,500.00 $1,650.00 50-57 $1,500.00 $1,800.00 50-56 $1,300.00 $1,800.00 50-56

$2,400.00 NA 56 $2,977.00 $2,977.00 56 $1,550.00 $1,700.00 50-57 $1,500.00 $1,850.00 50-56 $1,350.00 $1,850.00 50-56

$3,800.00 NA 56 $3,665.00 $3,665.00 56 $1,850.00 $2,000.00 50-57 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 50-56

$2,250.00 NA 56 $2,799.00 $2,799.00 56 $1,550.00 $1,700.00 50-57 $2,100.00 $2,350.00 50-56 $1,850.00 $2,350.00 50-56

All drivers are allowed to drive up to 10 

hrs (600) miles per day. If  a driver 

exceeds, driver is dispatch half day and 

a hotel is provided for switch to another 

driver. Breaks every 3 hours.

Our policy is 8 hr drive with 8 rest. Stops 

on continious driving. Always have on 

available bus on standby in case of 

emergency before and during the trip.

We send two drivers for long trips.  If 

Handicap lift is needed they get the 

charter bus from Zima Real-total of buses 

they may provide together is 6).

For long trips we send two drivers.



United Independent School District

Charter Bus Services

RFP 2014-059

Charter Bus Services

Section II. Overnight Trips

Vendors

DOT #/MC#

BUS FLEET
Regular Bus 

8

Regular 

Buses 18

Regular 

Buses 23

Regular 

Buses 6

Regular 

Buses 21

Headquarters

DESTINATION
Regular Bus

Handicap 

Bus

Seat 

CAP.
Regular Bus

Handicap 

Bus Seat CAP.
Regular Bus

Handicap Bus

Seat 

CAP.
Regular Bus

Handicap 

Bus

Seat 

CAP.
Regular Bus

Handicap 

Bus

Seat 

CAP.

50-56

50-56

50-56

50-56

50-56

50-56

50-56

50-56

50-56

50-56

50-56

50-56

50-56

50-56

50-56

50-56

50-56

Bill's Sparkling Charter Cougar Bus Lines Daisy Chartes & Shuttles Imperial Bus Company Kerville Bus/Coach USA

537119/268020 1127893/459987 397239 / 226521 1261610 / 492765 136534 / 27530

Handicap Bus 0 Handicap Buses 2 Handicap Buses 3 Handicap Buses 0 Handicap Buses 36

Corpus Christi,Tx Laredo, Texas San Antonio, Texas San Antonio, Texas San Antonio, Texas

SAN ANTONIO $3,200.00 No Bid 57 $1,790.00 $2,290.00
50-56

$3,104.00 $3,104.00 56 $2,400.00 NA 49-57 $3,295.00 $3,295.00 55

CORPUS CHRISTI $3,100.00 No Bid 57 $1,790.00 $2,290.00
50-56

$3,104.00 $3,104.00 56 $2,400.00 NA 49-57 $3,295.00 $3,295.00 55

BROWNSVILLE $3,400.00 No Bid 57 $1,990.00 $2,490.00
50-56

$3,104.00 $3,104.00 56 $2,600.00 NA 49-57 $3,445.00 $3,445.00 55

MCALLEN $3,200.00 No Bid 57 $1,790.00 $2,290.00
50-56

$3,104.00 $3,104.00 56 $2,400.00 NA 49-57 $3,295.00 $3,295.00 55

KINGSVILLE $3,200.00 No Bid 57 $1,790.00 $2,290.00 50-56 $3,104.00 $3,104.00 56 $2,400.00 NA 49-57 $3,295.00 $3,295.00 55

EAGLE PASS $3,200.00 No Bid 57 $1,790.00 $2,290.00 $3,104.00 $3,104.00 56 $2,400.00 NA 49-57 $3,295.00 $3,295.00 55

AUSTIN $3,400.00 No Bid 57 $1,990.00 $2,490.00 $3,104.00 $3,104.00 56 $2,700.00 NA 49-57 $3,295.00 $3,295.00 55

NEW BRAUNFELS $3,300.00 No Bid 57 $1,890.00 $2,390.00 $3,104.00 $3,104.00 56 $2,550.00 NA 49-57 $3,295.00 $3,295.00 55

HOUSTON $3,500.00 No Bid 57 $3,000.00 $3,500.00 $3,104.00 $3,104.00 56 $3,200.00 NA 49-57 $3,445.00 $3,445.00 55

DALLAS $4,040.00 No Bid 57 $3,200.00 $3,700.00 $3,587.00 $3,587.00 56 $3,750.00 NA 49-57 $4,340.00 $4,340.00 55

DEL RIO $3,300.00 No Bid 57 $1,890.00 $2,390.00 $3,104.00 $3,104.00 56 $2,400.00 NA 49-57 $3,295.00 $3,295.00 55

UVALDE $3,200.00 No Bid 57 $1,790.00 $2,290.00 $3,104.00 $3,104.00 56 $2,400.00 NA 49-57 $3,295.00 $3,295.00 55

EL PASO $5,440.00 No Bid 57 $4,000.00 $4,500.00 $4,812.00 $4,812.00 56 $4,900.00 NA 49-57 $5,935.00 $5,935.00 55

ALICE $3,100.00 No Bid 57 $1,790.00 $2,290.00 $3,104.00 $3,104.00 56 $2,400.00 NA 49-57 $3,295.00 $3,295.00 55

HARLINGEN $3,300.00 No Bid 57 $1,890.00 $2,390.00 $3,104.00 $3,104.00 56 $2,400.00 NA 49-57 $3,295.00 $3,295.00 55

LA JOYA $3,200.00 No Bid 57 $1,790.00 $2,290.00 $3,104.00 $3,104.00 56 $2,400.00 NA 49-57 $3,295.00 $3,295.00 55

SINTON $3,100.00 No Bid 57 $1,790.00 $2,290.00 $3,104.00 $3,104.00 56 $2,400.00 NA 49-57 $3,295.00 $3,295.00 55

GREGORY PORTLAND $3,100.00 No Bid 57 $1,790.00 $2,290.00 $3,104.00 $3,104.00 56 $2,400.00 NA 49-57 $3,295.00 $3,295.00 55

ROMA $3,100.00 No Bid 57 $1,790.00 $2,290.00 $3,104.00 $3,104.00 56 $2,400.00 NA 49-57 $3,295.00 $3,295.00 55

EDCOUCH ELSA $3,300.00 No Bid 57 $1,790.00 $2,290.00 $3,104.00 $3,104.00 56 $2,400.00 NA 49-57 $3,295.00 $3,295.00 55

San Angelo $3,400.00 No Bid 57 $3,100.00 $3,600.00 $3,104.00 $3,104.00 56 $3,350.00 NA 49-57 $3,445.00 $3,445.00 55

Victoria $3,300.00 No Bid 57 $1,890.00 $2,390.00 $3,104.00 $3,104.00 56 $2,400.00 NA 49-57 $3,295.00 $3,295.00 55

Notes:
Based on 24 hours;will need to 

pay for driver's hotel.



United Independent School District

Charter Bus Services

RFP 2014-059

Charter Bus Services

Section II. Overnight Trips

Vendors

DOT #/MC#

BUS FLEET

Headquarters

DESTINATION

SAN ANTONIO

CORPUS CHRISTI

BROWNSVILLE

MCALLEN

KINGSVILLE

EAGLE PASS

AUSTIN

NEW BRAUNFELS

HOUSTON

DALLAS

DEL RIO

UVALDE

EL PASO

ALICE

HARLINGEN

LA JOYA

SINTON

GREGORY PORTLAND

ROMA

EDCOUCH ELSA

San Angelo

Victoria

Notes:

Charter Bus Services

Regular 

Buses 15

Regular 

Buses 36

Regular 

Buses 38

Regular 

Buses 2

Regular 

Buses 12

Regular Bus
Handicap 

Bus

Seat 

CAP.
Regular Bus Handicap Bus

Seat 

CAP.
Regular Bus

Handicap 

Bus

Seat 

CAP.
Regular Bus

Handicap 

Bus

Seat 

CAP.
Regular 

Bus

Handicap 

Bus

Seat 

CAP.

OK Tours!! Star Shuttle, Inc. Transportes Regiomontanos Tornado Tours, Inc. Zima Real

570178 / 277375 660715 / 309567 1250587 / 489322 991034 / 418249 1764020 / 644733

handicap Buses 0 Handicap Buses 4 Handicap Buses 2 Handicap Buses 0 Handicap Buses 3

San Antonio, Texas San Antonio, Texas Laredo, Texas San Antonio, Texas Houston, Texas 

$3,010.00 NA 56 $2,699.00 $2,699.00 56 $2,600.00 $2,900.00 50-57 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56 $2,250.00 $2,500.00 50-56

$3,010.00 NA 56 $2,699.00 $2,699.00 56 $2,600.00 $2,900.00 50-57 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56 $2,250.00 $2,500.00 50-56

$3,475.00 NA 56 $3,078.00 $3,078.00 56 $2,700.00 $3,000.00 50-57 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56 $2,350.00 $2,500.00 50-56

$3,475.00 NA 56 $3,019.00 $3,019.00 56 $2,600.00 $2,900.00 50-57 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56 $2,250.00 $2,500.00 50-56

$2,795.00 NA 56 $2,699.00 $2,699.00 56 $2,600.00 $2,900.00 50-57 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56 $2,250.00 $2,500.00 50-56

$3,010.00 NA 56 $3,253.00 $3,253.00 56 $2,600.00 $2,900.00 50-57 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56 $2,250.00 $2,500.00 50-56

$3,555.00 NA 56 $2,699.00 $2,699.00 56 $2,700.00 $3,000.00 50-57 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56 $2,350.00 $2,500.00 50-56

$3,255.00 NA 56 $2,699.00 $2,699.00 56 $2,650.00 $2,950.00 50-57 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56 $2,350.00 $2,500.00 50-56

$4,210.00 NA 56 $2,699.00 $2,699.00 56 $3,000.00 $3,300.00 50-57 $3,100.00 $3,100.00 50-56 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 50-56

$5,235.00 NA 56 $3,621.00 $3,621.00 56 $3,250.00 $3,550.00 50-57 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 50-56 $3,300.00 $3,300.00 50-56

$3,255.00 NA 56 $3,387.00 $3,387.00 56 $2,700.00 $3,000.00 50-57 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56

$2,835.00 NA 56 $2,699.00 $2,699.00 56 $2,600.00 $2,900.00 50-57 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56 $2,250.00 $2,500.00 50-56

$6,655.00 NA 56 $6,716.00 $6,716.00 56 $3,600.00 $3,900.00 50-57 $4,850.00 $4,850.00 50-56 $4,750.00 $4,750.00 50-56

$2,585.00 NA 56 $2,699.00 $2,699.00 56 $2,600.00 $2,900.00 50-57 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56 $2,250.00 $2,500.00 50-56

$3,460.00 NA 56 $2,877.00 $2,877.00 56 $2,650.00 $2,950.00 50-57 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56 $2,350.00 $2,500.00 50-56

$3,460.00 NA 56 $3,162.00 $3,162.00 56 $2,600.00 $2,900.00 50-57 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56 $2,350.00 $2,500.00 50-56

$3,210.00 NA 56 $2,699.00 $2,699.00 56 $2,600.00 $2,900.00 50-57 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56 $2,250.00 $2,500.00 50-56

$3,010.00 NA 56 $2,699.00 $2,699.00 56 $2,600.00 $2,900.00 50-57 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56 $2,250.00 $2,500.00 50-56

$3,010.00 NA 56 $3,170.00 $3,170.00 56 $2,600.00 $2,900.00 50-57 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56 $2,150.00 $2,500.00 50-56

$3,160.00 NA 56 $2,877.00 $2,877.00 56 $2,650.00 $2,950.00 50-57 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56 $2,250.00 $2,500.00 50-56

$4,560.00 NA 56 $3,565.00 $3,565.00 56 $2,950.00 $3,250.00 50-57 $3,100.00 $3,100.00 50-56 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 50-56

$3,010.00 NA 56 $2,699.00 $2,699.00 56 $2,650.00 $2,950.00 50-57 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 50-56 $2,500.00 $2,750.00 50-56


