UNITED INDEPENDENT SCHOOL DISTRICT
MAGAZINES & PERIODICALS

RFP 024-2015

VENDORS Avanti Enterprises Magazine Subscriptions PTP Plank Road Publishing W.T. Cox Information Services
PERCENTAGE DISCOUNTS
% Off Shelf Price No Bid No Bid 0% N/A
% Off List Price 22% No Bid 0% *20 % off discountable items
% Off Catalog Price No Bid 0-15-30 % 0% *20 % off discountable items
DESCRIPTION Item# Price Item# Price Item# Price Item# Price
Time Magazine 0040-781X $60.90 29194 $29.38 No Bid No Bid *SER-001D836E $76.13
Animal Wellness 1751-7311 $24.00 Ceased No Bid No Bid No Bid SER-001F04A1 $19.20
. )
School Library Journal 0362-8930 $159.95 28063 $111.30 No Bid No Bid "PKG-28352b Print + $136.99
Digital/Non- discountable
* - - -
Sports lllustrated for Kids 1042-394x $25.56 28382 $23.76 No Bid No Bid SER-001DB3DA-Non $31.95
discountable
New Good Apple Newspaper Online order 0884-688x |  Free Ceased No Bid No Bid No Bid SER-001EFCO2 Discontinued
National SER-001DD89C/now titled
National Geographic World NGWO05 $15.96 | Geographic for $15.26 No Bid No Bid . o $19.96
Kids National Geographic Kids
& * i
Discovery 0419-4098 $23.00 13208 $14.00 No Bid No Bid SER-001F78ED/*Print + $15.20
Online + Archive
& * 1
Texas Park & Wildfire TPWO7 $18.00 29136 $13.97 No Bid No Bid SER 001%7:'3;1! Print + $9.60
- * i
Wall Street Journal Mon-Sat 0009-500D | $269.00 32004 $413.40 No Bid No Bid PKG-277194/*Print + $413.40
Digital/*non-discountable
School Days-online subscription Online order-SD-065 Free Ceased No Bid No Bid No Bid SER-287288/0Online Free On-line
Teaching Pre K thru 8th Online order-0891-4508 Free Ceased No Bid MK8-SD26 $109.95 Ceased-SER-001DE66C Ceased




