United Independent School District
RFP 2014-111
Cablng and Network Equipment for New Elementary

Section |l New Elemenary
Router Insight Public Sector Sequel Data
Eligible Unit  Eligilbe [Ineligible Unit| Ineligible Eligible Unit Eligilbe Ineligible | Ineligible
Item Name Description Quantity Cost Installation Cost Installation Total Cost Installation | Unit Cost | Installation Total
TOTALS $2,805.08 $855.00|  $3,660.08 NO BID
Total for Section II $3,660.08
Section lll
VG310 Insight Public Sector Sequel Data
Eligible Unit| Eligilbe | Ineligible Unit] i Eligible Unit| Eligilbe | Ineligible | Ineligible
Item Name Description Quantity Cost Installation Cost Total Cost Installation | Unit Cost | Installation |  Total
TOTALS $2,066.81 $765.00|  $2,831.81 NO BID
Total for Section IIl $2,831.81
Section IV
CORE SWITCH Insight Public Sector Sequel Data
Eligible Unit| Eligilbe |Ineligible Unit| Ineligible Eligible Unit| Eligilbe | Ineligible | Ineligible
Item Name Description Quantity Cost Installation Cost Installation Total Cost Installation | Unit Cost | Installation |  Total
TOTALS $27,994.05| $1,175.00 $29,169.05| $24,028.82  $3,979.80 $28,008.62
Insight Public Sector Sequel Data
Eligible Unit| Eligilbe |Ineligible Unit| Ineligible Eligible Unit| Eligilbe | Ineligible | Ineligible
Item Name Description Quantity Cost Installation Cost Installation Total Cost Installation | Unit Cost | Installation |  Total
TOTALS $79,528.05]  $2,840.00 $82,368.05| $72,252.42 $400.00 $72,652.42
IDF EDGE SWITHES (1 IDF WITH TWO Stacks of 9 3850 STACKABLE SWITCHES)
Insight Public Sector Sequel Data
Eligible Unit| Eligilbe |Ineligible Unit| Ineligible Eligible Unit| Eligilbe | Ineligible | Ineligible
Item Name Description Quantity Cost Installation Cost Installation Total Cost Installation | Unit Cost | Installation |  Total
TOTALS $79,528.05| $2,840.00 $82,368.05| $72,252.42 $400.00 $72,652.42
Total Section V. $193,905.15 Total Section V $173,313.46
Section V: UPS
Insight Public Sector Sequel Data
Eligible Unit| Eligilbe |Ineligible Unit| Ineligible Eligible Unit|  Eligilbe | Ineligible | Ineligible
Item Name Description Quantity Cost Installation Cost. Installation Total Cost Installation | Unit Cost | Installation Total
SUS00ORTAU TRIP-LITE MODEL-——---4U UPS SYSTEM 3] $9,966.75 $525.00 $10,491.75]  $3,472.00 $185.00 $0.00 $0.00[ $10,971.00
SV161-1D1 Leviton Switches PDU SV161-1D1 8 $7,139.52 $320.00|  $7,459.52 $944.00 $30.00 $0.00 $0.00[  $7,792.00
TOTALS $9,966.75 $525.00|  $7,139.52 $320.00|  $17,951.27| $4,416.00 $215.00 $0.00 $0.00| $18,763.00
Total for Section V $17,951.27 Total for Section V $18,763.00
Section VI: Access Points
Insight Public Sector Sequel Data
Eligible Unit Eligilbe |Ineligible Unit| Ineligible Eligible Unit Eligilbe Ineligible Ineligible
Item Name Description Quantity Cost Installation Cost. Installation Total Cost Installation | Unit Cost | Installation Total
802.L1ac CAP w/CleanAlr; 3x4:355; Int $85,680.00
AIR-CAP27021-A-K9 Ant; A Reg Domain $24,144.75| $7,762.00 $31,906.75
802.11n AP Low Profile Mounting Bracket
AIR-AP-BRACKET-1 (Default) $0.00.
Cisco 2700 Series Combined Unified and
SWAP2700-CMB-A1-K9 Autonomous (xxxxx) SW $0.00
Ceiling Grid Clip for Aironet APs -
AIR-AP-T-RAIL-R Recessed Mount (Default) $0.00
TOTALS $24,144.75|  $7,762.00 $31,906.75
Total for Section VI $31,906.75 Total for Section VI $85,680.00
Section VII: Telecom
Insight Public Sector Sequel Data
Eligible Unit Eligilbe [Ineligible Unit| Ineligible Eligible Unit Eligilbe Ineligible | Ineligible
Item Name Description Quantity Cost Installation Cost. Installation Total Cost Installation | Unit Cost | Installation Total
CISCO UNIFIED IP PHONE 8961
CP-8961-CK9= STANDARD-VOIP PHONE $378.00 $23.10 $401.10
Cisco SMARTnet extended service
Con-snt-cp8961k9 agreement $21.02 $21.02
CP-7942G= CISCO UC PHONE 7942 $10,576.13 $980.90  $11,557.03 NoOBID
SMARTNET 8X5XNBD Cisco Unified IP $558.45 $558.45
CON-SNT-CP7942 Phone 7942
TOTALS $12,537.60

Total for Section VII

$12,537.60




Section VIII: Streaming Video
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Requested Items

9301-1100E000

XPS 9000 Standard Definition Encoding
Appliance. One channel with HDMI, YPbPr
Component, SDI, or Composite video inputs.
Education Pricing.

$5,371.78

$1,355.00

$6,726.78

NO BID

8000-0223

VBRICK H.264 DISTRIBUTED MEDIA ENGINE
(DME) XPS 7550 - Provides media
redistribution, transformation, VoD content
serving & storage. Limited to 500 Mbps live
throughput and up to 35 concurrent streams.
Includes VBrick provided server.

$6,745.13

$6,745.13

NO BID

7500-0260

VBRICK H.264 DISTRIBUTED MEDIA ENGINE
(DME) VBMIX FEATURE LICENSE - Allows
VBrick Mix iPad application to stream to DME.
Requires DME 3.1.7 or higher software or
hardware. On DME 7530, allows up to 5
simultaneous streams, on DME 7550, allows
up to 10 simultaneous streams and on DME
7570, allows up to 20 simultaneous streams.

$2,451.06

$2,451.06

NO BID

VBCARE-GOLDPLUS

VBCARE TECHNICAL SUPPORT SERVICE -
GOLD PLUS COVERAGE - VBrick's VBCARE
Gold Plus Technical Support Service offering
provides Help Desk Support during Business
Hours, access to self-service support portal
(Case submission, Knowledge Base, FAQs,
RMA tracking, Documentation and Training
Portal), updates to covered software,
technical and release bulletins, and quarterly
newsletter. Full details of the program are
available at: www.vbrick.com/support. Gold
Plus Technical support explicitly does not
cover services such as Feasibility studies,
Installation services, or Integration services.
These are optionally provided under VBrick's
Professional Services offerings.Software
support pricing is 15% of list price per year of
eligible Software products. One and Three
year options available. 1st year Hardware
support (Firmware Releases, Remote
troubleshooting, RMA Service) included in the
product purchase price. Subsequent years are|
10% of list price per year of eligible Hardware
products. One and Three Year options
available.

$1,379.43

$1,379.43

NO BID

PS-TRAIN-STSUB-E

Small Team Annual subscription to VBrick
University for up to 10 named users.
Subscription term runs 12 months from login
for the first team user and provides access to
on-line training content for VBrick Products,
job aides and instructor support for training
content.

$6,047.03

$6,047.03

NO BID

TOTALS

$21,994.43

$1,355.00

$23,349.43

AV Equipment for Streaming Video

Vendor will install, train, and program the following AV equipment and insure that all parts work in conjunction with the Vbrick unit. Camcorder unit must have
connection for both an external Microphone as well as an internal microphone. All cables to connect units end to end will be included on quote.
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SON-HDRPJ340/B

SONY HD CAMCORDER w EXTERNAL
MICROPHONE JACK

$453.95

$453.95

 TRIPOD-MIC & CBLS

P920 CAM TRIPOD, SHU-PG58 HH MIC,
DESK TOP MIC STAND, SONY CAM AV
CBLE, 10FT XLR & 3RCA CABLE & HDMI
(CABLE FOR HD RECORDING

$26.69

$26.69

DVD/VCR-T

TOSHIBA DVD/VCR COMBO

$108.97

$108.97

BAL-85892

BALT ADJ UTILITY CART- 26-42"H W/
ELECT

$162.55

$162.55

TOTALS

$752.16

$752.16

NO BID

Total for Section XIIl

$24,101.59




